IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE THIRTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT IN AND FOR HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY, FLORIDA CIVIL DIVISION

In re:

Laser Spine Institute, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2762
CLM Aviation, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2764
LSI HoldCo, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2765
LSI Management Company, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2766
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2767
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cincinnati, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2768
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2769
Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2770
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2771
Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2772
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2773
Medical Care Management Services, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2774
Spine DME Solutions, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2775
Total Spine Care, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2776
Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2777
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2780
Assignors,	Consolidated Case No.
3	2019-CA-2762
to	
Soneet Kapila,	Division L
Assignee.	

TENTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A. FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL FOR ASSIGNEE FOR THE PERIOD OF NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024

TO CREDITORS AND OTHER INTERESTED PARTIES NOTICE OF OPPORTUNITY TO OBJECT AND REQUEST A HEARING

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that, pursuant to Section 727.111(4) of the Florida Statutes, the Court may consider the relief requested in this motion without further notice or hearing unless a party in interest files an objection within 21 days from the date this paper is served. If you object to the relief requested in this paper, you must file your objection with the Clerk of the Court Clerk of Court for Hillsborough County, Florida at 800 E. Twiggs Street, Tampa, Florida 33602 (or electronically if electronic filing is required), and serve a

copy on the assignee's attorney, <u>Scott A. Stichter, Esquire, at 110 E. Madison St., Suite 200, Tampa, FL 33602</u>, and any other appropriate person.

If you do not file an objection within the time permitted, the Assignee and the Court will presume that you do not oppose the granting of the relief requested in the paper.

STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A. ("Stichter Riedel"), pursuant to the Order Granting Assignee's Motion for Order Establishing Procedures for Monthly and Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals, dated May 28, 2019 (the "Interim Compensation Order"), respectfully applies for allowance of compensation for services rendered as counsel to the Assignee in the amount of \$195,541.00, and reimbursement for expenses incurred in the amount of \$2,247.64, for a total allowance of \$197,788.64, for the period of November 1, 2023, through June 30, 2024 (the "Allowance Period"). In support of its request, Stichter Riedel states the following:

Background

- 1. On March 14, 2019, Laser Spine Institute, LLC¹ ("LSI") executed and delivered an assignment for the benefit of creditors to the Assignee. The Assignee filed a Petition with the Court on March 14, 2019, commencing an assignment for the benefit of creditors proceeding pursuant to Chapter 727 of the Florida Statutes (the "LSI Assignment Case").
- 2. Simultaneous with the filing of the LSI Assignment Case, the Assignee filed fifteen other Petitions commencing assignment for the benefit of creditors proceedings for 15 affiliates of LSI: LSI Management Company, LLC; Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC; CLM Aviation, LLC; Medical Care Management Services, LLC; LSI HoldCo, LLC; Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center

2

¹ On April 8, 2019, the Court entered an order administratively consolidating this case with the assignment cases of the following entities: LSI Management Company, LLC; Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC; CLM Aviation, LLC; Medical Care Management Services, LLC; LSI HoldCo, LLC; Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cincinnati, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC; Total Spine Care, LLC; and Spine DME Solutions, LLC.

of Cincinnati, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC; Total Spine Care, LLC; and Spine DME Solutions, LLC (collectively, with the LSI Assignment Case, the "Assignment Cases").

- 3. On May 28, 2019, the Court entered the Order Granting Assignee's Motion for Order Establishing Procedures for Monthly and Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (the "Interim Compensation Order").
- 4. The Interim Compensation Order authorized the professionals to file interim fee applications every 120 days, with the first interim fee application being filed on or after June 30, 2019, representing fees and costs incurred from March 14, 2019, through June 30, 2019.
- 5. Pursuant to Orders entered by the Court on May 15, 2020, August 24, 2020, October 13, 2020, August 31, 2021, December 14, 2021, September 14, 2022, June 19, 2023, and January 3, 2024, Stichter Riedel received payments for fees and costs incurred through October 31, 2023, totaling \$2,340,525.53.
- 6. No payment has been made to Stichter Riedel for fees and costs incurred during the Allowance Period.

Description of Services and Benefits

- 7. Stichter Riedel was authorized by this Court to represent the Assignee as general counsel in the Assignment Cases.
- 8. During the Allowance Period, Stichter Riedel expended a total of **423.0** hours in rendering necessary and beneficial legal services to the Assignee and is owed fees in the amount of **\$195,541.00**.

- 9. Stichter Riedel incurred \$2,247.64 in expenses during the Allowance Period.
- 10. Copies of Stichter Riedel's time entries for the services rendered² and a detailed list of the expenses are attached hereto as **Composite Exhibit A.**

WHEREFORE, Stichter Riedel respectfully requests that the Court allow compensation to Stichter Riedel in the amount of \$195,541.00 for professional services rendered during the Allowance Period and reimbursement of Stichter Riedel's expenses in the amount of \$2,247.64 incurred on behalf of the Assignee during the Allowance Period, for a total allowance of \$197,788.64, and authorizing payment in the amount of \$197,788.64.

/s/ Scott A. Stichter

Scott A. Stichter (FBN 0710679) Stichter, Riedel, Blain & Postler, P.A. 110 E. Madison Street, Suite 200 Tampa, Florida 33602

Telephone: (813) 229-0144 Email: <u>sstichter@srbp.com</u> Counsel for Assignee

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct copy of the foregoing Application has been furnished on this 31st day of July, 2024, by the Court's electronic system to all parties receiving electronic service, and by either U.S. mail or electronic mail to the parties listed on the Limited Notice Parties list attached.

/s/ Scott A. Stichter
Scott A. Stichter

4

² The Assignee has been involved, and continues to be involved, in mediations and is subject to mediation confidentiality requirements. In addition, the Assignee is involved in other litigation. In order to protect privileged or potentially privileged attorney-client or work product information and in order to comply with mediation confidentiality requirements, some entries are redacted. Should any privileged or confidential information be inadvertently disclosed in the Application, the Assignee reserves the right to challenge any use of such information in any proceeding.



TAMPA • FORT MYERS • PENSACOLA • DESTIN

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR. RUSSELL M. BLAIN JODI DANIEL DUBOSE DANIEL R. FOGARTY MATTHEW B. HALE BARBARA A. HART ELENA PARAS KETCHUM STEPHEN R. LESLIE AMY DENTON MAYER CHARLES A. POSTLER HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II MARK F. ROBENS SCOTT A. STICHTER ALMAROSA C. TORRES DON M. STICHTER 1929 - 2019 RICHARD C. PROSSER 1950 - 2017 SUSAN HEATH SHARP 1954 – 2021 G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER 1948 – 2023

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

July 31, 2024

INVOICE

Kapila-Laser Spine Kapila & Company 1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316

Matter: 1

Kapila-Laser Spine Client: 13857

For Professional Services Rendered:

10/17/2023	HER	Review of email from Jonathan Sbar regarding	1.20
11/01/2023	HER	Review of revised version of the to Jonathan Sbar, Paul Battista, Greg Garno, and Bob Rocke regarding same; follow-up emails	0.70
11/01/2023	HER	Review of email from Jennifer Altman regarding subpoena of Soneet Kapila in Texas adversary proceeding	0.40
11/01/2023	SAS	Review of email from Battista enclosing letter providing for appeal fee; exchange of email with Battista regarding court approval issues; and review of follow-up emails from Sbar and Rocke	0.40
11/01/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy discussing claim review	0.20
11/01/2023	SAS	Review of email from review of follow-up email from Harley Riedel to co-counsel	0.20
11/02/2023	HER	Continued review and analysis of and memo regarding same to co-counsel; emails with Jon Sbar regarding same	1.20
11/02/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Sbar regarding status of St. Louis settlement	0.10

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200 Tampa, Florida 33602 T 813.229-0144

F 813-229-1811

1533 Hendry Street- Suite 300 F Myers, Florida 33901-1009 T 239.939.5518 F 239.939.5568 41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111 Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669 T 850.637.1836 F 850.791.6545 4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40 Destin, Florida 32541-9306 T 850.460.7676 F 850.424-6604

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 2
11/02/2023	SAS	Review of Akerman's notice of appearance regarding SLG's appeal	0.20
11/02/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar from Harley Riedel; and review of emails	0.40
11/03/2023	HER	Telephone contact with email to Jonathan Sbar regarding same	0.60
11/03/2023	SAS	Dictated draft of motion to modify terms of counsel's engagement; dictated email to co-counsel enclosing draft of motion	1.20
11/05/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.40
11/06/2023	HER	Preparation for and and participation in conference call	1.00
11/06/2023	HER	Brief conference with Stichter regarding claims pool and potential interim distribution	0.30
11/06/2023	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding claims pool and distribution issues	0.30
11/06/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar regarding status of	0.10
11/06/2023	SAS	Further review of claims chart; review of email from Sbar regarding claims review process; dictated response; review of email from Sbar; dictated response to Sbar; and telephone conference with McCoy	0.70
11/06/2023	SAS	Review of emails regarding	0.20
11/06/2023	SAS	Continued work on claim issues, including telephone conference with Alpert; follow-up telephone conference with McCoy; exchange of emails with Alpert; dictated email to Kapila; exchange of emails with Alpert regarding Med Pro's claim; telephone conference with Sbar; conference with Harley Riedel; review of Med Pro's claim; and telephone conference with McCoy	1.30
11/06/2023	SAS	Dictated notice of appearance on SLG appeal	0.20
11/06/2023	SAS	Participated in call with follow-up call with Sbar	1.70
11/07/2023	HER	Brief conference with Scott Stichter regarding yesterday's call	0.10
11/07/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.40
11/07/2023	SAS	Brief conference with Harley Riedel regarding yesterday's call; review of emails from Kapila and Sbar	0.30
11/07/2023	SAS	Review of email from Garno approving form of motion to modify terms of counsel's engagement; dictated response; review of email from Rocke; and dictated email enclosing final draft of motion with exhibits	0.40
11/08/2023	HER	Review of proposed order in EFO matter and conference with Scott Stichter regarding same; email to Bob Rocke	0.50
11/08/2023	SAS	Finalized motion to modify terms of counsel's engagement for filing with court	0.10
11/08/2023	SAS	Review of draft order denying motion for partial summary judgment; review of case law; and telephone conference with Rocke	0.80
11/08/2023	SAS	Review of email from	0.20
11/08/2023	SAS	Conference wtih Harley Riedel regarding EFO summary judgment issues; review of follow-up emails from Harley Riedel and Rocke	0.20
11/08/2023	SAS	Dictated email to counsel regarding filing of motion to modify; review of follow- up emails	0.20
11/10/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.30

⁴¹ North Jefferson Street-Suite 111 Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669 T 850.637.1836 F 850.791.6545

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 3
11/12/2023	HER	Review of email from	1.60
11/12/2023	HER	work on response thereto Review of emails from Jonathan Sbar and Jennifer Altman; review of emails	0.30
11/12/2023	SAS	from Soneet Kapila and Paul Battista regarding same Review of emails from	0.30
11/13/2023	HER	Numerous items of electronic correspondence; analysis of issues raised	1.00
11/13/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila and Battista review of files; and dictated response enclosing information regarding executing of receipts and disbursements	0.20
11/13/2023	SAS	Review of further emails regarding litigation issues; dictated response; review of follow-up emails; and brief conference with Harley Riedel	0.30
11/14/2023	HER	Conference call with client and legal team regarding pending litigation matters	0.70
11/14/2023	HER	telephone contact with Jonathan Sbar	0.60
11/14/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Kapila regarding pending matters	0.20
11/14/2023	SAS	Participated in portion of call with Kapila, Rocke, Sbar, Battista and Harley Riedel regarding	0.70
11/14/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding invoices; dictated email regarding preparation of fee application	0.20
11/15/2023	HER	electronic correspondence	0.70
11/15/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding dictated response; and review	0.30
		of email form Rocke	
11/15/2023	SAS	Review of email from review of response from Kapila	0.20
11/16/2023	HER	electronic communications; email same to counsel for their review and revisions	4.50
11/16/2023	SAS	Review of emails regarding and review of revised affidavit	0.60
11/16/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila regarding	0.20
11/16/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding review of file; and dictated response	0.20
11/16/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding Phillips settlement agreement; review of emails from Kapila and Garno	0.30
11/16/2023	SAS	Exchange of follow-up emails with Sbar regarding Phillips settlement issues	0.20
11/17/2023	HER	Continued	1.10
44/47/0000	HED		0.40
11/17/2023	HER	Review of email from Jennifer Altman regarding distribution questions; numerous follow-up emails regarding same	0.40
11/17/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar review of email from Harley Riedel review of files; and dictated email to Harley Riedel	0.40
11/17/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding settlement issues; dictated response; review of email from Sbar; dictated response; dictated email to Sbar enclosing latest draft of St. Louis settlement pleadings; and review of email from Sbar	0.40

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 4
11/17/2023	SAS	Review of email from Kapila	0.40
11/17/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Sbar enclosing draft of St. Louis settlement documents	0.10
11/17/2023	SJ	Receipt of and download CT Service of Process, draft response letter and forwarding to Scott Stichter, finalize and mail same	0.30
11/18/2023	SAS	Review and revision of Assignee's fee application and KapilaMukamal fee application; dictated email to Kapila regarding fee application issues; review of email from Kapila; and dictated response	0.50
11/19/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.10
11/19/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila	0.20
11/19/2023	SAS	Begin drafting Stichter Riedel fee application	2.30
11/20/2023	HER	Continued work on electronic	2.00
		correspondence regarding same	
11/20/2023	HER	Work on SRBP fee application	0.40
11/20/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding accounting issues	0.10
11/20/2023	SAS	Review of email from Battista to Guso regarding St. Louis settlement issues and enclosing revisions to pleadings	0.20
11/20/2023	SAS	Dictated draft of motion to approve compromise with Clinton Phillips; dictated email to co-counsel enclosing draft of settlement agreement	0.70
11/20/2023	SAS	Review of emails enclosing review of email from Kapila	0.40
11/20/2023	SAS	Dictated draft of motion to approve compromise with Wolff Parties; dictated draft of order granting compromise; and dictated email to co-counsel enclosing drafts of motion and order	0.80
11/20/2023	SAS	Dictated further revisions to Kapila and KapilaMukamal fee applications; dictated email to McCoy enclosing drafts	0.40
11/20/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar enclosing comments on Phillips compromise motion; dictated response; review of email to Garno; and review of email from Sbar to Phillips' counsel enclosing draft of compromise motion	0.30
11/20/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar enclosing revisions to Wolff parties settlement documents; dictated response; review of follow-up email from Sbar; and exchange of emails with Sbar regarding service issues	0.40
11/20/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy and finalized fee application for filing with court	0.20
11/21/2023	HER	Work on SRBP fee application, including redaction of items to protect mediation and other privileged communications; electronic correspondence regarding same and regarding summary of receipts and disbursements	1.20
11/21/2023	HER	Emails with Soneet Kapila	0.40
11/21/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy enclosing chart summary receipts and disbursements; review of follow-up emails from Kapila and Harley Riedel; review of email from McCoy; dictated response; and dictated email to Alpert regarding status of MedPro information	0.50
11/21/2023	SAS	Continued work on Stichter Riedel fee applications; exchange of emails with Harley Riedel; and finalized fee application for filing with court	2.20
11/21/2023	SAS	Finalized Wolff Parties compromise motion for filing with court	0.40
11/21/2023	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro issues; dictated response	0.10

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 5
11/21/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding questions on disbursements; review of email from McCoy enclosing revised chart; dictated email to Sbar regarding professional fees; and review of email from Sbar	0.40
11/21/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Battista and Guso enclosing executed signature pages for St. Louis settlement agreement; dictated response; and review of emails from Battista and Guso	0.20
11/21/2023	SJ	Receipt and download CT service of process	0.20
11/22/2023	HER		3.00
11/22/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding St. Louis settlement motion; dictated response; finalized settlement motion for filing with court; review of email from Guso regarding filing of motion; dictated response; exchange of emails regarding service of motion; and dictated email to client and co-counsel enclosing filed motion	0.60
11/22/2023	SAS	Review of email regarding available hearing dates; dictated email to Kapila; exchange of emails with Kapila; finalized notice of hearing; and dictated email to Kapila regarding same; and review of email from Kapila	0.40
11/22/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Harley Riedel and Kapila	0.60
11/24/2023	SAS	Dictated email to counsel regarding Phillips settlement motion; exchange of emails with Holder and Sbar; dictated email to Guso regarding status of signature pages; and review of email from Guso	0.40
11/27/2023	HER	Review of and reply to email ; emails with litigation team and client regarding same;	1.40
11/27/2023	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding status of reviewing lawsuits; dictated response; and exchange of emails with McCoy	0.20
11/27/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel to counsel regarding	0.10
11/28/2023	HER	Review of email	1.10
11/28/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Waterway and Sbar enclosing signature pages for Phillips compromise motion; dictated response; and finalized compromise motion for filing with court	0.50
11/28/2023	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro issues	0.10
11/29/2023	HER	Review and analysis of	1.50
11/29/2023	HER	Review of email from client and engarding electronic correspondence regarding	0.50
11/29/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding	0.10

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 6
11/29/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding exchange of emails with Sbar regarding Texas Capital claims issues; and review of follow-up emails	0.50
11/29/2023	SAS	Exchange of emails with Gerber regarding Texas Capital claim issues; dictated email to Kapila and Riedel regarding call with Gerber	0.20
11/29/2023	SAS	Review of email regarding filing of Phillips compromise motion	0.10
11/30/2023		Review of email from Scott Stichter regarding his call with Toby Gerber	0.10
11/30/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding	0.20
11/30/2023	SAS	Review of emails regarding scheduling a meeting with Bailey's counsel	0.20
11/30/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Gerber regarding Texas Capital claims issues; dictated email to co-counsel and Kapila discussing call with Gerber; and review of follow-up emails	0.50
11/30/2023	SAS	Review of emails from review of follow-up email from Kapila	0.30
12/01/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding potential meeting with Bailey group	0.40
12/01/2023	SAS	Dictated draft of order on motion to approve supplemental terms for employment of Venable and Rocke McLean; dictated email to counsel enclosing draft of order	0.40
12/02/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Battista, Garno, and Sbar approving form of order; dictated email regarding uploading order	0.20
12/02/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding	0.20
12/03/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Alpert regarding status of MedPro reviewing claims; review of response; and dictated follow-up email	0.20
12/04/2023	SAS	Dictated correspondence to chambers submitting order on motion to approve supplemental terms	0.20
12/04/2023	SAS	Further review of files regarding claims issues	0.30
12/04/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with McCoy regarding claims	0.40
12/05/2023	HER	Review of and reply to email from Jonathan Sbar detailed email to team	1.20
12/05/2023	SAS	Review of files regarding D&O settlement; dictated email to McCoy regarding insider claims	0.50
12/05/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding claims review issues and pending matters	0.20
12/05/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding insider claims; dictated response	0.20
12/06/2023	HER	Review of docket and recent order	0.10
12/06/2023	HER	Emails and telephone conference with Jon Sbar	0.70
12/06/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel discussing review of email from Kapila; and review of emails from Harley Riedel and Kapila; review of email from Sbar; and	0.60
12/06/2023	SAS	Review of order approving supplemental terms of employment for Venable and Rocke McLean	0.10
12/06/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding claims issues; dictated response	0.10
12/07/2023	HER	Emails regarding rescheduling of creditor call	0.10

12/07/2023 SAS Review of claims filed by insiders; dictated email to Sbar discussing claims filed by Grammen, Esping, and St. Louis; dictated email to Sbar discussing such claims; and dictated email to Sbar discussing Wilson claims. 12/07/2023 SAS Initial review of Bailey Group's designation of appellate record 0.40 review of email from McCoy regarding vendor claims; dictated response; 0.40 review of email from McCoy regarding vendor claims; dictated response 0.10 review of email from McCoy regarding unliquidated claims: dictated response 0.10 Review of emails from Rocke and Sbar regarding insider claims 0.40 reliable states of the service of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated email to Alpert regarding Med Pro issues 0.10 regarding designation of the service of files; dictated email to Alpert regarding Med Pro issues 0.10 regarding designation of the service of files and email regarding designation of the service of files and email regarding designation of files and email regarding designation for call with client and co-counsel regarding claims allowance; review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 0.30 review of emails from Kaplia; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kaplia regarding claims issues; review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 0.30 review of emails from Kaplia; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kaplia regarding daims issues; review of femalls with McCoy and Kaplia regarding daims issues; review of emails from Kaplia; dictated emails on call on claims objections; conference with McCoy and telephone conference with McCoy and telephone conference with McCoy and telephone co	Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 7
12/07/2023 SAS Review of email from McCoy regarding vendor claims; dictated response; review of email from McCoy enclosing claims; and dictated response 0.40 12/07/2023 SAS Review of email from McCoy regarding uniquidated claims; dictated response 0.10 12/07/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke and Sbar regarding insider claims 0.20 12/08/2023 SAS Telephone conference with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar 0.10 12/08/2023 SAS Review of insider claims charts; dictated response 0.10 12/09/2023 SAS Review of insider claims charts; dictated response 0.10 12/09/2023 SAS Review of insider claims charts; dictated response 0.10 12/10/2023 HER Electronic correspondence 0.30 12/11/2023 HER Work on regarding Med Pro issues 1.50 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel regarding same; 0.40 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel regarding claims allowance; review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 0.30 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Kapi	12/07/2023	SAS	filed by Grammen, Esping, and St. Louis; dictated email to Sbar discussing	0.80
review of email from McCoy enclosing claims; and dictated response 0.10 12/07/2023 SAS Review of email from McCoy regarding unliquidated claims; dictated response 0.20 12/08/2023 HER Review of email from Rocke and Sbar regarding insider claims 0.20 12/08/2023 SAS Review of email from Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar 12/08/2023 SAS Review of insider claims charts; dictated response 0.10 12/09/2023 SAS Dictated emails to Alpert regarding Med Pro issues 0.10 12/10/2023 SAS Review of email from regarding Med Pro issues 0.10 12/10/2023 SAS Review of email from regarding same; 0.30 12/11/2023 HER Electronic correspondence regarding same; 0.30 12/11/2023 HER Serview of email from Sbar and Kapila Review of Email from Kapila regarding expenses paid by TCB Review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB Review of emails from Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of email from Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila Review of claims chart in preparation for call on claims objections; conference with Harley Riedd regarding same 0.40 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar in preparation for call on claims objections; conference with Harley Riedd regarding same 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar in preparation for with McCoy and Kapila regarding dalams issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding dalams issues; review of electronic correspondence, 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 10 client 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding same 10.20 review of emails from Rocke and Sbar Review of subponen served o	12/07/2023	SAS	Initial review of Bailey Group's designation of appellate record	0.40
12/07/2023 SAS Review of email from Rocke and Sbar regarding insider claims 0.20 12/08/2023 HER Review of email service of email from Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Coverage and the property of the pro	12/07/2023	SAS		0.40
12/08/2023 HER Review of email 0.40 12/08/2023 SAS Telephone conference with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding Med Pro issues 0.10 12/09/2023 SAS Dictated email to Alpert regarding Med Pro issues 0.30 12/10/2023 HER Electronic correspondence 1.50 12/11/2023 HER Work on 1.50 12/11/2023 Work on 1.50 12/11/2023 HER Work on 1.50 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel regarding same; 1.50 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel regarding claims allowance; review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila 1.50 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of emails from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila 1.2/11/2023 SAS Review of claims chart in preparation for call on claims objections; conference with Harley Riedel regarding same 1.2/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar 1.2/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 1.0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; of electronic correspondence, 1.2/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 1.2/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated emails 1.2/12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated emails 1.2/12/12/12/12/12/12/12/12/12/12/12/12/12	12/07/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding unliquidated claims; dictated response	0.10
12/08/2023 SAS Telephone conference with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; review of files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding dealth issues 0.10 12/09/2023 SAS Review of insider claims charts; dictated response 0.10 12/10/2023 HER Electronic correspondence 0.30 12/10/2023 SAS Review of email from regarding Med Pro issues 0.30 12/11/2023 HER Work on regarding regarding same; 0.30 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel regarding claims allowance; review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding to client 0.40 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar including numerous (twelve) items of electronic correspondence. 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding dealpro issues 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding lealms issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke regarding lealms issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke regarding lealms issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke regarding lealms issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar	12/07/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Rocke and Sbar regarding insider claims	0.20
files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar 12/09/2023 SAS Review of insider claims charts; dictated response 0.10 12/09/2023 SAS Dictated email to Alpert regarding Med Pro issues 0.10 12/10/2023 HER Electronic correspondence 0.30 12/10/2023 SAS Review of email from regarding regarding same; 0.30 12/11/2023 HER Work on 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails regarding expenses paid by TCB 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; 0.30 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with Harley Riedel regarding same 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from McCoy; and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of electronic correspondence, 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictat	12/08/2023	HER	Review of email	0.40
12/09/2023 SAS Dictated email to Alpert regarding Med Pro issues 0.10 12/10/2023 HER Electronic correspondence 0.30 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from regarding 0.30 12/11/2023 HER Work on and emails regarding same; conference call with client and co-counsel 1.50 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel regarding claims allowance; review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 0.40 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila 0.30 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emalls with McCoy and Kapila 0.30 12/11/2023 SAS Review of claims chart in preparation for call on claims objections; conference with Harley Riedel regarding same 0.50 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from McCoy; and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy 0.50 12/11/2023 SAS Review CT invoices for statutory representation, forwarding to client 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/202	12/08/2023	SAS	files; dictated emails to Rocke and Sbar regarding claims issues; and follow-	0.60
12/10/2023 HER Electronic correspondence 0.30 12/10/2023 SAS Review of email from regarding 0.30 12/11/2023 HER Work on and emails regarding same; 1.50 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel regarding claims allowance; review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila 0.30 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with Harley Riedel regarding same 12/11/2023 SAS Telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from Sbar 0.10 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding MedPro issues 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding talms issues; dictated response; and 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/08/2023	SAS	Review of insider claims charts; dictated response	0.10
12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from and emails regarding same; 1.50 12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel regarding claims allowance; review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of emails from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila regarding same 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims objections; conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding same 12/11/2023 SAS Review of claims chart in preparation for call on claims objections; conference with McCoy of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding to client 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar including numerous (twelve) items of electronic correspondence, 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 2.20 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 3.30 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status	12/09/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Alpert regarding Med Pro issues	0.10
12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel conference with client and co-counsel conference with conference with conference	12/10/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.30
12/11/2023 HER Conference call with client and co-counsel regarding claims allowance; review of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila	12/10/2023	SAS	Review of email from regarding	0.30
of files and email regarding expenses paid by TCB 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila 0.30 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila 12/11/2023 SAS Review of claims chart in preparation for call on claims objections; conference with Harley Riedel regarding same 12/11/2023 SAS Telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar 0.10 12/11/2023 SAS Review CT invoices for statutory representation, forwarding to client 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of email regarding CT invoices 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of email regarding CT invoices SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/11/2023	HER		1.50
12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sabra and Kapila 0.30 12/11/2023 SAS Review of email from Kapila regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila; dictated email to more conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar 0.10 12/11/2023 SJ Review CT invoices for statutory representation, forwarding to client 0.40 12/12/2023 HER Continued including numerous (twelve) items of electronic correspondence, 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Robar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding MedPro issues 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/11/2023	HER		0.40
review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila 12/11/2023 SAS Review of claims chart in preparation for call on claims objections; conference with Harley Riedel regarding same 12/11/2023 SAS Telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar 0.10 12/11/2023 SJ Review CT invoices for statutory representation, forwarding to client 0.40 12/12/2023 HER Continued 1 including numerous (twelve) items of electronic correspondence, 1.2/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 1.2/12/2023 SAS Review of email regarding CT invoices 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 1.2/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/11/2023	SAS		0.30
with Harley Riedel regarding same 12/11/2023 SAS Telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up email from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar 12/11/2023 SJ Review CT invoices for statutory representation, forwarding to client 12/12/2023 HER Continued including numerous (twelve) items of electronic correspondence, 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Telephone conference with Alpert regarding MedPro issues 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of email regarding CT invoices 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/11/2023	SAS	review of email from Kapila; dictated email to McCoy; and exchange of emails	0.30
12/11/2023 SAS Telephone conference with McCoy; and Kapila regarding claims issues; review of follow-up emails from McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy 12/11/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar 0.10 12/11/2023 SJ Review CT invoices for statutory representation, forwarding to client 0.40 12/12/2023 HER Continued including numerous (twelve) items of electronic correspondence, including numerous (twelve) items of electronic correspondence, 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Telephone conference with Alpert regarding MedPro issues 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of email regarding CT invoices 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/11/2023	SAS		0.40
12/11/2023 SJ Review CT invoices for statutory representation, forwarding to client 12/12/2023 HER Continued including numerous (twelve) items of electronic correspondence, 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 12/12/2023 SAS Telephone conference with Alpert regarding MedPro issues 12/12/2023 SAS Review of email regarding CT invoices 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.40	12/11/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues; review	0.50
12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 0.40 12/12/2023 SAS Telephone conference with Alpert regarding MedPro issues 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of email regarding CT invoices 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/11/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar	0.10
of electronic correspondence, 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding 12/12/2023 SAS Telephone conference with Alpert regarding MedPro issues 12/12/2023 SAS Review of email regarding CT invoices 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status	12/11/2023	SJ	Review CT invoices for statutory representation, forwarding to client	0.40
12/12/2023 SAS Telephone conference with Alpert regarding MedPro issues 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of email regarding CT invoices 0.10 12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/12/2023	HER		2.20
12/12/2023SASReview of email regarding CT invoices0.1012/12/2023SASReview of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar0.2012/13/2023HERReview of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails0.3012/13/2023HEREmails with Jon Sbar regarding status0.20	12/12/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar, Banez, and Kapila regarding	0.40
12/12/2023 SAS Review of emails from Rocke regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/12/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Alpert regarding MedPro issues	0.10
review of emails from Rocke and Sbar 12/13/2023 HER Review of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails 0.30 12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/12/2023	SAS	Review of email regarding CT invoices	0.10
12/13/2023HERReview of subpoena served on TCB; review and reply to related emails0.3012/13/2023HEREmails with Jon Sbar regarding status0.20	12/12/2023	SAS		0.20
12/13/2023 HER Emails with Jon Sbar regarding status 0.20	12/13/2023	HER		0.30
			•	
	12/13/2023			0.10

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 8
12/13/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke and Sbar regarding claims review and distribution issues; telephone conference with McCoy regarding claims review issues	0.70
12/13/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke regarding SLG appeal issues	0.20
12/14/2023	DRF	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding unliquidated medical malpractice claims; revision to draft objection	0.30
12/14/2023	HER	Research of law on claim issue; review and revision of proposed objection to unliquidated claims; brief conference with Scott Stichter regarding same	0.60
12/14/2023	HER	Client emails	0.20
12/14/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar, Harley Riedel, and Kapila regarding subpoena served on Texas Commerce Bank	0.20
12/14/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding submitting orders on settlements; review of docket; dictated response; finalized order for submission to court; and review of letter submitting order	0.50
12/14/2023	SAS	Review of revisions to	0.20
12/14/2023	SAS	Dictated draft of objection to unliquidated medical malpractice claims; conference with Dan Fogarty regarding same; review of Dan Fogarty's revisions; dictated further revisions; and conference with Harley Riedel	1.10
12/14/2023	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro issues; dictated response; and dictated email to Rocke and Sbar	0.20
12/14/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Cusack regarding Bailey Group's request for an extension to file brief; dictated email to co-counsel; dictated email to Akerman lawyers; and exchange of follow-up emails	0.50
12/15/2023	HER	Numerous emails and participation in 11:00 a.m. conference call; follow-up; participation in 3:00 p.m. conference call	1.70
12/15/2023	SAS	Review of further email request for extension of time to file brief; left message for Cusack; dictated follow-up emails to counsel; and review of follow-up emails	0.40
12/15/2023	SAS	Dictated draft of objections to employee claims and officers' indemnification claims	1.40
12/15/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with co-counsel and Bailey counsel regarding pending matters and claims issues; review of follow-up emails	1.10
12/15/2023	SAS	Review of files; dictated email to Altman regarding enclosing requested documents	0.20
12/15/2023	SAS	Review of email from Jurgens regarding completing the administration of WARN Act class; review of email from Barack; and dictated email to Kapila and McCoy forwarding emails	0.20
12/16/2023	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding Sims objection; dictated response	0.10
12/16/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Alpert regarding MedPro documents; review of email from Alpert; review of follow-up email from Alpert enclosing documents; and initial review of documents	0.60
12/16/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding settlement issues; dictated response; review of email from Sbar; review of files; dictated email to Sbar regarding Phillips and Hamburg settlements; review of emails from Rocke regarding settlement orders; and dictated response	0.40
12/17/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila regarding documents received from MedPro; review of email from Kapila; dictated email to Sbar regarding documents received from MedPro; review of response; and dictated email to Laura Marzano regarding organizing MedPro documents	0.30

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 9
12/18/2023	HER	Further revision of email to Jonathan Sbar regarding same; electronic correspondence regarding back-up materials	0.70
12/18/2023	SAS	Review of emails regarding recently entered orders	0.10
12/18/2023	SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano regarding review of Med Pro documents; review of preliminary draft of chart; and follow-up conference with Laura Marzano	0.40
12/18/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding Hamburg settlement offer; dictated response; and finalized Hamburg order for submission to court	0.30
12/18/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding claims issues; dictated response; review of follow-up emails from Rocke and Sbar; and dictated response	0.50
12/18/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Sbar regarding claims issues; dictated follow-up email to Sbar enclosing claims chart	0.20
12/18/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Alpert regarding Med Pro issues; dictated email to Alpert enclosing requested information	0.20
12/19/2023	SAS	Review of email from	0.20
12/19/2023	SAS	Review of order granting Hamburg settlement; review of follow-up emails regarding Hamburg order	0.20
12/19/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sellers regarding wire transfer instructions; dictated email to Kapila	0.10
12/19/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Cusack regarding request for extension to file brief; dictated email to Sbar and Fiore regarding agreement to a 60 day extension; and review of email from Fiore	0.30
12/20/2023	HER	Review of email from	0.30
12/20/2023	LAM	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding claim objection issues	0.20
12/20/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar enclosing draft of response to Altman regarding claims issues; dictated revisions; dictated email to Sbar enclosing revisions; and review of emails from Sbar	0.50
12/20/2023	SAS	Review of revisions to objections to the Esping claim; dictated email to counsel enclosing draft of objections; and review of email from Kapila	0.30
12/20/2023	SAS	Further conference with Laura Marzano regarding review of MedPro documents	0.20
12/20/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy enclosing wire transfer instructions; dictated email to Sellers enclosing wire transfer instructions	0.20
12/21/2023	LAM	Draft objection to Wilson claim	0.40
12/21/2023	LAM	Draft objection to Grammen claim	0.10
12/21/2023	LAM	Draft objection to St. Louis claim	0.30
12/21/2023	SAS	Further review of MedPro documents; dictated revisions to chart discussing MedPro documents; and dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing email discussing chart; and review of emails from Sbar and Kapila	2.20
12/21/2023	SAS	Dictated email to McCoy and Kapila discussing medical malpractice clalims not resolved by MedPro; review of email from McCoy	0.90
12/21/2023	SAS	Review of email from	0.10
12/21/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila and Sbar regarding draft of objection to indemnification claims	0.20

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	10
12/21/2023	SAS	Review of email from Capuano regarding issues with St. Louis order; dictated email to Rocke; review of email from Rocke; dictated email to Capuano; and review of response	(0.30
12/21/2023	SAS	Review of email from Garno regarding Espring claim objection; dictated revisions to objection; dictated email enclosing revised objection and discussing other objections to be filed; and conference with Laura Marzano regarding drafting objections to claims	(0.40
12/22/2023	HER	Work on finalization of	C	0.50
12/22/2023	SAS	Review of email from Weiss enclosing medical malpractice claims; conference with Laura Marzano regarding claims and claims objections; and further review of claims	(0.60
12/22/2023	SAS	Finalized Phillips compromise order for filing with court	C	0.30
12/22/2023	SAS	Review of emails from	(0.20
12/23/2023	SAS	Review of motion to extend time to file appeal brief	(0.10
12/27/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding HIPAA request for medical records	C	0.30
12/27/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence; document review	C	0.60
12/27/2023	SAS	Further review of malpractice claims; dictated follow-up email to Alpert discussing open items with regards to certain unresolved medical malpractice claims and enclosing documents	(0.60
12/27/2023	SAS	Revision of objections to indemnification claims filed by Wilson, St. Louis, and Grammel; dictated email to co-counsel enclosing drafts and discussing open issues	(0.40
12/27/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding patient document request; dictated response; and dictated email to McCoy	(0.30
12/27/2023	SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano regarding objection to resolved medical malpractice claims; review of email regarding service list; dictated response; and exchange of emails with Weiss regarding obtaining additional copies of claims	(0.30
12/27/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar and Kapila	C	0.20
12/27/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding patient's request for medical records; dictated response; and dictated email to McCoy	C	0.30
12/28/2023	HER	Review of and reply to email from Jonathan Sbar and acceptance	(0.40
12/28/2023	HER	Review of notice of unclaimed funds; email to Soneet Kapila and Kevin McCoy	C	0.30
		regarding same	_	
12/28/2023	JHR	Research of Unclaimed Funds State of Florida for Laser Spine Institute		0.90
12/28/2023	LAM	Draft objection to Sheila Keith claim		0.40
12/28/2023	SAS	Review of emails from and review of follow-up email	(0.20
12/28/2023	SAS	Dictated draft of objections to claims that have been settled or dismissed; conference with Laura Marzano regarding finalizing list of claims; and dictated email to McCoy enclosing draft of claims objection and discussing open issues	(0.80
12/28/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding former patient's request for medical records	C	0.10

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	11
12/29/2023	HER	Review email from Soneet Kapila regarding unclaimed funds	(0.10
12/29/2023	HER		(0.10
12/29/2023	SAS	Dictated drafts of orders for Tuesday's hearings; dictated email to McCoy and Kapila enclosing drafts of orders	(0.90
12/29/2023	SAS	Dictated draft of motion to amend order granting St. Louis compromise motion; dictated draft of order granting motion to email; dictated draft of amended order granting compromise motion; and dictated email to Rocke enclosing drafts	•	1.40
12/29/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding preparation of exhibit to objection to resolved malpractice claims	(0.10
12/29/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel to Kapila regarding LSI unclaimed funds held by State of Florida; review of email from Kapila	(0.20
12/29/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke regarding St. Louis issues; follow-up call with Rocke and Sbar regarding same	(0.30
12/29/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding St. Louis pleadings; telephone conference with Rocke; and dictated email to Capuano	(0.20
12/29/2023	SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano regarding objection to claims issues	(0.20
01/02/2024	HER	Work on including telephone call with Jonathan Sbar at 11:15 a.m.,	3	3.20
01/02/2024	HER	participation in Zoom video meeting at 3:00 p.m.; numerous emails Review of emails between Soneet Kapila and Lara Fernandez regarding status and timeline	(0.20
01/02/2024	HER	Review of and reply to email from Jonathan Sbar	(0.30
01/02/2024	LAM	Enter case assignments to the settled medical claimants list	(0.60
01/02/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding St. Louis issues; dictated email to Capuano; review of email from Capuano; finalized pleadings for filing with court; and dictated follow-up email to Rocke	(0.50
01/02/2024	SAS	Review of pleadings in preparation for hearing; review of email from McCoy approving form of orders; review of email from Kapila regarding today's hearing; and dictated response	(0.70
01/02/2024	SAS	Review of email from Fernandez regarding case administration issues; dictated response; and review of follow-up emails from Fernandez and Kapila	(0.20
01/02/2024	SAS	Attended hearing on fee applications; finalized orders for uploading to court; and finalized letter submitting orders	(0.60
01/02/2024	SAS	Review of email from Weiss enclosing information for resolved medical malpractice claims; conference with Laura Marzano regarding same	(0.20
01/02/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Rocke discussing outcome of today's hearing; exchange of email with Rocke; and dictated letter to Judge Farfante enclosing orders	(0.30
01/02/2024	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding review of email from Sbar and review of follow-up emails	(0.20
01/03/2024	HER	Review of electronic correspondence regarding same	(0.30
01/03/2024	SAS	Review of order granting Phillips compromise motion	(0.10

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 12
01/03/2024	SAS	Review of orders entered by court granting fee applications; dictated email to Kapila enclosing orders; and exchange of emails with Kapila	0.20
01/03/2024	SAS	Review of amended order granting St. Louis compromise; exchange of emails with Rocke; and review of emails from Rocke and Capuano regarding due date for settlement payment	0.30
01/03/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Rocke regarding payments under various settlement agreements; review of email from Rocke	0.20
01/03/2024	SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano regarding settlement of medical malpractice claims; review and revision of list of creditors on Exhibit A	0.40
01/03/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar	0.10
01/04/2024	SAS	Review of claims filed by Nees; dictated draft of objection to Nees' claims; and dictated order on objection to Nees' claims	0.80
01/04/2024	SAS	Dictated further revisions to objection to resolved medical malpractice claims; further review of claims for service issues; and dictated order on objection to claim	0.60
01/04/2024	SAS	Review of unresolved medical malpractice claims; dictated memo to file discussing claims	1.10
01/05/2024	HER	Review of EFO order granting summary judgment to defendants on fraudulent transfer issue; numerous emails regarding same	0.80
01/05/2024	HER	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding indemnification issues	0.20
01/05/2024	LAM	Draft Objection to the claim of William B. and Gayla D. Schafer	0.20
01/05/2024	SAS	Dictated objection to Sheila Keith's claim; dictated email to McCoy enclosing draft and discussing open issues with regards to other unliquidated malpractice claims; and review of email from Kapila	0.50
01/05/2024	SAS	Review of email from Wischmeier regarding distribution issues; dictated response; review of claims register; and dictated email to McCoy regarding Bailey claims	0.30
01/05/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Kapila regarding objection to claims issues	0.10
01/05/2024	SAS	Dictated objection to claims filed by Nees; dictated order disallowing Nees' claims; and dictated email to McCoy enclosing drafts of motion and order	0.60
01/05/2024	SAS	Dictated email to McCoy regarding claims objection issues; telephone conference with McCoy regarding same; finalized objections to resolved medical claims and Nees claims; and dictated email to Altman regarding claims objection issues	0.40
01/05/2024	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding Bailey claims; dictated email to Wischmeier regarding Bailey claims	0.20
01/05/2024	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding indemnification claims	0.20
01/06/2024	HER	Numerous emails regarding	0.30
01/06/2024	SAS	Review of emails regarding filing of claims objections and deadlines to respond to objection	0.10
01/06/2024	SAS	Review of Judge Farfante's opinion granting summary judgment; review of follow-up emails from Kapila, Rocke, Sbar, Garno, Battista, and Harley Riedel	0.60
01/06/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar review of email from Battista	0.20
01/07/2024	SAS	Review of further emails regarding summary judgment order; dictated response; and review of email from Kapila	0.20

Matter:	1	Bill # 60869	Page 13
01/07/20)24 SA	Review of dictated email to counsel and Kapila	0.40
01/08/20)24 HE	R Participation in all hands conference call regarding	0.80
01/08/20)24 HE	Review of email from Jonathan Sbar regarding	0.40
01/08/20)24 SA	Participated in conference call with Garno, Battista, Rocke, Harley Riedel, and Kapila regarding	0.80
01/09/20)24 HE		0.20
01/09/20)24 HE		0.20
01/09/20)24 SA	Review of emails from Altman regarding claims issues; exchange of emails with Altman; and conferences with Harley Riedel regarding call with Altman	0.90
01/09/20)24 SA	Telephone conference with Sbar regarding pending matters and litigation issues	0.40
01/09/20)24 SA	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding claims objection issues	0.20
01/10/20)24 HE	R Further work on issues related to and multiple related emails;	0.90
01/10/20)24 SA	Review of emails from Dicks and Qualls regarding deadline to file SLG appeal brief	0.20
01/10/20	024 SA		0.30
01/10/20)24 SA		0.60
01/10/20)24 SA	•	0.10
01/10/20)24 SA	Review of email from Sbar	0.10
01/10/20)24 SA	Review of email from Dan Fogarty regarding creditor inquiry; dictated response	0.20
01/11/20)24 HE		1.00
01/11/20	024 SA	Dictated draft of objection to Alexander's claim; dictated email to McCoy enclosing draft of objection; review of email from McCoy; and finalized objection for filing with court	0.60
01/11/20)24 SA	,	0.20
01/12/20)24 HE	Preparation for and participation in 1:00 p.m. zoom meeting	0.70
01/12/20)24 SA	Review of emails	0.20
01/12/20			0.30
01/15/20)24 SA		0.10

Matter:	1		Bill # 60869	Page	14
01/16/20	024	DRF	Receive and reply to e-mail from Harley Riedel regarding	(0.20
01/16/20	024	HER	Work on	1	1.20
01/16/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding review of email from Dan Fogarty; dictated response; and review of email from Dan Fogarty	C	0.30
01/16/20	024	SAS	Further exchange of emails with Harley Riedel and Dan Fogarty regarding	C	0.20
01/16/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Alpert discussing other medical malpractice claims and enclosing additional settlement documents	C	0.40
01/17/20	024	HER	Work on	C	0.50
01/17/20	024	LAM	Researching current addresses of attorney for the Amended Certficiate of Service for the Omnibus Objection to Settled Claims.	(0.30
01/17/20	024	LAM	Draft Amended Certificate of Service of Omnibus Objection to Resolved Medical Malpractice Claims	(0.40
01/17/20	024	SAS	Review of returned mail for objection to resolved medical malpractice claims; conference with Laura Marzano regarding updating addresses and objecting to resolved medical malpractice claims	C	0.30
01/17/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Albert providing updates on medical malpractice claims and review of enclosed documents	(0.40
01/17/20	024	SJ	Review emails of CT service of process and download same	C	0.20
01/18/20	024	HER	Electronic correspondence	C	0.10
01/18/20	024	LAM	Create spreadsheet for claim objections for settled claims	C	0.70
01/18/20	024	LAM	Draft Second Omnibus Claim Objection and Order for same for attorney review; finalize, file and serve same	(0.80
01/18/20	024	SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano regarding amended certificate of service for objection and second omnibus objection; review of second omnibus objection; and follow-up conference with Laura Marzano	(0.30
01/18/20	024	SAS	Finalized second objection to resolved medical malpractice claims	C	0.20
01/19/20	024	HER	Review email from review of documents executed by Soneet Kapila; follow-up	C	0.60
01/19/20	024	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar, Harley Riedel, Battista, and Kapila regarding	C	0.30
01/19/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding need to obtain signature on settlement agreement; exchange of emails with Harley Riedel; dictated email to Sbar; review of email from Sbar regarding and telephone conference with Sbar regarding same	(0.40
01/20/20	024	HER	Electronic correspondence	C	0.20
01/20/20		SAS	Review of dictated draft of order granting Holland & Knight compromise; dictated email to	1	1.10
01/20/20	024	SAS	Dictated email regarding deadlines to respond to objections to claims	C	0.10
01/21/20	024	HER	Electronic correspondence	C	0.20
01/21/20	024	SAS	Review of email from the second second second dictated response	(0.10
01/22/20	024	HER	Numerous (eighteen) items of electronic correspondence document review	1	1.00

Matter:	1	Bill # 60869	Page	15
01/22/20	024 S	AS Review of emails from Sbar and Rosen regarding filing issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Sbar and Harley Riedel	(0.30
01/22/20)24 S	Review of email from Sbar; dictated response; and	(0.30
01/22/20	024 S	Review of emails from Kapila, Sbar, and Harley Riedel dictated response; and review of emails from	(0.50
01/22/20	024 S	Finalized Holland & Knight compromise motion for filing with court; telephone conference with Sbar regarding form of documents; comiled exhibits to motion; follow-up call with Sbar; conference with Susan Jeffcoat; review of motion and exhibits; dictated email enclosing form of motion to be filed; review of response; and review of email regarding filing of motion		1.10
01/22/20	024	J Assemble HK settlement motion and exhibits, forwarding to Scott Stichter, finalize and file same	(0.40
01/23/20	024 H	Review of and reply to email from Jonathan Sbar regarding review of multiple follow-up emails	(0.40
01/23/20)24 S	Review of email from Sbar review of email from Harley Riedel; dictated response; review of emails from Rocke and Garno; and	(0.40
01/23/20	024 S	Review of email from Rocke regarding exchange of emails with Rocke	•	0.10
01/23/20	024 S	Review of emails from Sbar and Rocke regarding scheduling of hearing; telephone conference with Sbar and Rocke; and conference with Harley Riedel	(0.30
01/24/20	024 H	Review of emails; Telephone conference with Jon Sbar; brief conference with Scott Stichter		1.10
01/24/20	024 S	Review of emails from Sbar and Battista regarding	(0.10
01/24/20	024 S	Review of email from Sbar regarding telephone conference with Sbar; and exchange of emails with Sbar and Harley Riedel	(0.20
01/25/20	024 S	AS Review of email regarding scheduling a hearing on H&K compromise motion	(0.10
01/25/20	024 S	AS Review of email from Rocke regarding motion to stay lawsuits pending appeal; telephone conference with Rocke regarding same	(0.30
01/26/20)24 H	Preparation for and participation in 2:00 p.m. zoom call with Jonathan Sbar, Hugh Ray, Jennifer Altman, et al; follow-up communications regarding scheduling of hearing, notice and other issues		1.60
01/26/20	024 S	AS Review of email regarding available hearing dates; dictated email to co- counsel regarding availability for hearings	(0.20
01/26/20	024 S	AS Dictated emails to McCoy regarding objection to claims issues	(0.20
01/26/20		Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding dictated response; and exchange of emails with Harley Riedel regarding same	(0.20
01/26/20	024 S	AS response; and review of email from Battista	(0.20
01/27/20)24 H	Numerous emails regarding compromise issues and hearing	(0.40

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 16
01/27/2024	SAS	Review of email from Wischmeier regarding distribution issues; dictated	0.20
01/27/2024	SAS	response Continued work on matters related to scheduling hearing,	0.80
01/28/2024	HER	Numerous items of electronic correspondence regarding	0.30
01/28/2024	SAS	Review of email from	0.40
01/28/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat regarding patient record requests	0.10
01/29/2024	HER	Numerous items of electronic correspondence regarding	0.70
01/29/2024	SAS	Exchange of emails with Susan Jeffcoat regarding creditor requests for records	0.20
01/29/2024	SAS	Review of email regarding scheduling of hearing on H&K compromise motion;	0.30
		dictated email to Kapila and co-counsel regarding scheduling of hearing; and exchange of emails with Kapila	
01/29/2024	SAS	Review of correspondence regarding renewal of domain name; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy; review of email from Kapila; and review of email from McCoy regarding abandonment of intellectual property	0.30
01/29/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Sbar and Harley Riedel regarding exchange of emails with Harley Riedel and Sbar regarding scheduling order with Battista, Harley Riedel, Kapila, and Sbar	0.60
01/29/2024	SAS	Review of notice of hearing on Holland & Knight's compromise motion	0.10
01/29/2024	SAS	Review of email from Schutz regarding Holland & Knight compromise motion; review of files; and dictated email to Schutz enclosing filed motion	0.20
01/29/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Harley Riedel and Altman regarding Holland & Knight compromise issues; review of email from Altman's office regarding scheduling of court reporter for hearing; dictated response; and review of follow-up emails	0.30
01/29/2024	SJ	Draft letters in response to medical records subpoenas and forwarding to Scott Stichter	0.40
01/30/2024	HER	Work on and communications regarding	0.50
01/30/2024	LAM	Receipt of and review of additional claims	0.40
01/30/2024	SAS	Review of response to requests for medical records	0.20
01/30/2024	SAS	Dictated update to claims objection memo	0.30
01/30/2024	SAS	Review of email from Wischmeier regarding distribution issues and Laserscopic claims; review of files; and dictated response	0.30
01/30/2024	SAS	Review of email from Weiss enclosing copies of proofs of claims; dictated emails to Laura Marzano; and conference with Laura Marzano regarding same	0.20
01/30/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding dictated response; review of follow-up email from Sbar; telephone conference with Sbar; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbar; and review of follow-up email from Sbar	0.50

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	17
01/31/2024	HER	Review of pleadings filed with Court; review of email from Damien Prosser requesting a 10-day extension to reply; communications with team regarding same and responsive email granting extension; email to Jennifer Altman regarding agreed schedule for Bailey objection and Assignee response; review of reply from Hugh Ray, III and follow-up with Bailey counsel; further emails regarding issues and scheduling, Texas Commerce Bank position	1	.30
01/31/2024	SAS	Initial review of former patient claims and former employee claims; dictated email to Weis and McCoy regarding reclassifying certain claims	0	.40
01/31/2024	SAS	Finalized order on objection to Nees' claim	0	.20
01/31/2024	SAS	Review of email from Prosser requesting an extension of time to file objections to H&K compromise motion; dictated email to co-counsel forwarding request; review of email from Sbar; dictated response to Prosser; and dictated email to co-counsel forwarding email to Prosser	0).30
01/31/2024	SAS	Review of email from Ray agreeing to briefing schedule and requesting draft of order approving compromise; and exchange of emails with Harley Riedel regarding same; and review of email from Harley Riedel to Ray	0	.30
01/31/2024	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding indemnification claims; review of email from Weiss; and dictated response	0	.20
01/31/2024	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding issues related to objecting to indemnification claims	0).20
01/31/2024	SAS	Review of email from and conference with Harley Riedel	0	.20
01/31/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Harley Riedel and Altman regarding H&K issues	0	.20
01/31/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with	0	.30
01/31/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Gerber regarding	0	.40
01/31/2024	SAS	Initial review of Bailey Group's revisions to settlement order; dictated email to Sbar, Rocke, and Harley Riedel regarding call with Gerber	0	.40
01/31/2024	SJ	Finalize and mail out records response letters	0	.20
02/01/2024	HER	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding	0	.10
02/01/2024	HER	Review and analysis of and analysis of and follow-up emails regarding same	1	.50
02/01/2024	SAS	Review of order disallowing Nees' claims	0	.10
02/01/2024	SAS	Review of emails from conference with Harley Riedel		.40
02/01/2024	SAS	regarding same Conference with Harley Riedel ; review of email from	0	.20
02/01/2024	SAS	Harley Riedel to Sbar Review of email from Prosser regarding Holland & Knight issues, dictated response	0).10
02/01/2024	SAS	Review of email from Weiss regarding indemnification claims; dictated response	0).10
02/02/2024	HER	Work throughout the day on	2	2.40
		more than twenty items of electronic correspondence, internal		

conferences, and work on proposed scheduling motion and order

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	18
02/02/2024	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding stipulation to extend time to object;	0).70
		initial drafts of motion to extend time to object and order extending time to object		
02/02/2024	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel enclosing	0).20
02/02/2024	SAS	Review of further emails from dictated response; dictated further revisions to motion and order fixing deadlines; and dictated email to Sbar and Harley Riedel enclosing drafts	0).60
02/03/2024	SAS		0).40
02/03/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Prosser regarding Holland & Knight issues	0).10
02/04/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Rocke regarding motion to stay	0).10
02/05/2024	DRF	Conference with Scott A. Stichter; revision, review draft claims objections	0	0.20
02/05/2024	HER		0).90
02/05/2024	LAM	Review proofs of claims for Kenneth Jones, Sheila Keith, Thomas Toppel, Rodney Strohl, Clifford and Teresa Hattenhauer, Robert Kimble for the Estate of Sharon Kimble, Farris Tapp, Leon and Angenette Wickizer, and Kenneth Winkler; conference with Scott Stichter; draft Objection to each claim, finalize, file and serve each claim	10).70
02/05/2024	SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano regarding claims objection issues	0	.20
02/05/2024	SAS	Exchange of emails with Prosser's office regarding Holland & Knight issues	0	0.20
02/05/2024	SAS	Review and revision of objection to medical malpractice claims filed by Schaffer and Brown; conference with Dan Fogarty regarding same	0	0.30
02/05/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding status of filing motion to stay lawsuits pending appeal	0).10
02/05/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding filing of joint motion; telephone conference with Harley Riedel; dictated email to Altman; review of email from Altman; and finalized motion for filing with court	0).30
02/05/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar enclosing review of email from Rock; and dictated response	0).20
02/05/2024	SAS	Further exchange of emails with Prosser's office regarding Holland & Knight issues	0).20
02/06/2024	SAS	Finalized order on objection to Alexander's claim for filing with court	0	.20
02/06/2024	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding	0	0.30
02/06/2024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila	0).20
02/06/2024	SAS	Review of email from Weiss regarding indemnification claims	0	0.10
02/06/2024	SAS	Review of email from Prosser regarding Holland & Knight issues; dictated email to Harley Riedel; and review of email from Altman regarding Holland & Knight issues	0).20
02/06/2024	SAS	Finalized order disallowing Alexander claim for submission to court	0).20
02/07/2024	DRF	Conference with Scott A. Stichter regarding HIPPA issues; revise claim objection draft regarding same	0).40

Matter:	1	Bill # 60869	Page 19
02/07/20	24 HER	Electronic correspondence regarding brief conference with Scott Stichter regarding same	0.40
02/07/20	24 LAM	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding claims objection issues	0.10
02/07/20	24 SAS	Dictated objection to Guerro claim; further review of claims filed by former employees ad former patients; and dictated update to claims chart	0.90
02/07/20	24 SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano regarding objection to medical practice claims; conference with Dan Fogarty regarding same	0.30
02/07/20	24 SAS	Review and revision of motion to stay; dictated email to Rocke enclosing revisions; and telephone conference with Rocke regarding finalizing motion	0.80
02/07/20	24 SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke regarding conference with Harley Riedel regarding call with Rocke	0.30
02/07/20	24 SAS	Review of emails from Sbar, Rocke, Garno, and Kapila regarding review of email from	0.30
02/08/20	24 HER	Work throughout the day on	2.00
02/08/20	24 HER	Review of and reply to email from	0.10
02/08/20	24 SAS	Review of email from Schutz regarding appeal issues	0.10
02/08/20		Review of emails from Capuano regarding St. Louis payment; review of follow- up emails from Sbar and Kapila confirming receipt of payment	0.20
02/08/20	24 SAS	Review of email from Sbar to Rosen; review of follow-up emails from Rocke, Harley Riedel, and Kapila; conference with Harley Riedel regarding settlement issues; and review of further email from Rosen	0.30
02/08/20	24 SAS	Telephone conference with	0.60
02/09/20	24 HER	Participation in noon conference call	0.70
02/09/20	24 HER	Review of email from Jennifer Altman	0.10
02/09/20	24 HER	Review of emails and materials regarding claims	0.30
02/09/20	24 LAM	Gather exhibits, finalize and serve the objections to claims of Kenneth Winkler and William B. and Gayla D. Schafer	0.10
02/09/20	24 SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano regarding claims objection issues	0.20
02/09/20	24 SAS	Dictated revisions to objection to Brown's claim; dictated email to McCoy discussing objection and handling medical information attached to the claim	0.30
02/09/20	24 SAS	Review of email from Guso regarding claims issues; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy; and exchange of emails with Kapila and McCoy	0.30
02/09/20	24 SAS	Participated in call with	0.80
02/10/20	24 SAS	Review of order sustaining objection to Alexander's claim	0.10
02/10/20	24 SAS	Review of Kimble claim; dictated email to Martinez-Monfort regarding Kimble claim	0.20
02/10/20	24 SAS	Review of motions to appear pro hac by Rosen and Rozen	0.10
02/10/20	24 SAS	Review of email from McCoy enclosing updated claims summary; dictated email to Guso enclosing claims summary; and exchange of emails with Guso	0.30
02/12/20	24 DRF	Conference with Scott A. Stichter regarding claims objections, review, revise objection footnote regarding disclosure issues	0.40

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	20
02/12/2024	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding claims objection issues; dictated response; and review of follow-up email from McCoy	(0.20
02/12/2024	SAS	Review of email from Martinez-Monfort regarding resolution of Kimble claim; dictated response; conference with Laura Marzano regarding claims objection issues; dictated objection to Kimble's claim; finalized order on objection to resolved malpractice claims; finalized objections to Schafer claim and Winkler claim; dictated objection to claim with estimated amounts; conference with Dan Fogarty regarding claim objection issues; and exchange of emails with Martinez-Monfort regarding Kimble claim issues		1.40
02/12/2024	SAS	Finalized correspondence to court submitting order on objection to resolved medical malpractice claims	(0.20
02/13/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding need to schedule a hearing on motion to stay; dictated response; review of open hearing dates; and dictated email to Rocke enclosing available hearing dates	(0.30
02/13/2024	SAS	Review of orders granting motions to appear pro hac vice	(0.10
02/14/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Martinez-Monfort enclosing drafts of objection and order on Kimble claim; review of email from Martinez-Monfort approving form of pleadings	(0.20
02/14/2024	SAS	Dictated follow-up email to Rocke regarding hearing date for motion to stay; review of email from Rocke; conference regarding coordinating the scheduling of a hearing; review of email regarding scheduled hearing; and dictated response	(0.30
02/14/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding preparing notice of hearing; review of notice of hearing	(0.10
02/14/2024	SAS	Review of email from	(0.30
02/14/2024	SAS	Dictated order on second omnibus objection to resolved claims; finalized for submission to court	(0.20
02/15/2024	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding	(0.50
02/15/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman requesting deposition dates	(0.10
02/15/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar	(0.30
02/16/2024	HER	Participation in conference call with client and co-counsel regarding		1.00
02/16/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman requesting continuance of hearing	(0.10
02/16/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar review of follow-up emails; telephone conference with Kapila, Sbar, and Harley Riedel; and review of follow-up email from Sbar as to scheduling dates	(0.70
02/16/2024	SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano regarding objection to claims	(0.20
02/16/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar to Altman regarding deposition scheduling issues; review of response from Altman; review of	(0.60
02/16/2024	SJ	Review CT invoices and letter regarding PA, circulate same	(0.30
02/17/2024	HER	Review of	2	2.00

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	21
02/17/2024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding deposition scheduling issues;	(0.70
00/47/0004	0.4.0	motion to continue; and review of follow-up emails		
02/17/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with	1	1.20
02/18/2024	HER	Emails with Soneet Kapila and Jon Sbar	(0.20
02/18/2024	SAS	Review of order granting second omnibus motion to resolved claims	(0.10
02/18/2024	SAS	Review of email from	(0.30
02/19/2024	HER	Review of Bailey notice of hearing for February 26; numerous emails	(0.70
02/19/2024	SAS	Conferences with Laura Marzano regarding finalizing objection to claims; finalized objections for filing with court	(0.70
02/19/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman to Sbar regarding scheduling of depositions and scheduling of hearing on motion to continue	(0.20
02/19/2024	SAS	Review of notice of hearing on motion to continue; review of email from Kapila	(0.10
02/19/2024	SAS	Review of email dictated email to Harley Riedel and Sbar; and telephone conference with Sbar	(0.40
02/19/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar	(0.20
02/19/2024	SAS	Review of email dictated response; and exchange of follow-up emails; and	(0.20
02/20/2024	HER	Review of emails between Scott Stichter and Damien Prosser regarding possible joinder in Bailey motion to continue	(0.20
02/20/2024	HER	Review of email from Jennifer Altman advising that Bailey intends to file a motion to strike the declaration of Soneet Kapila; emails regarding same; telephone conference with Scott Stichter; review of motion to strike; follow-up	1	1.20
02/20/2024	SAS	Exchange of emails with Prosser regarding Holland & Knight issues; telephone conference with Prosser; dictated email to co-counsel and Kapila regarding call with Prosser; and review of follow-up email from Sbar	(0.60
02/20/2024	SAS	Review of emails from telephone conference with Sbar; and review of follow-up emails	(0.30
02/20/2024	SAS	Review of motion to appear pro hac filed by counsel for Esping and Gammen	(0.20
02/20/2024	SAS	Review of telephone	(0.30
02/20/2024	SAS	conference with Harley Riedel; and dictated response Review of joinder motion to continue filed by EFO; review of malpractice plaintiff's joinder in motion to continue; review of motion to strike affidavit;	1	1.10
02/21/2024	HER		1	1.50
	SAS	Review of email from telephone	,	1.30

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 22
02/21/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar, Kapila, and Garno dictated response; and review of follow-up emails	0.20
02/21/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Sbar	0.40
02/21/2024	SAS	conference with Harley Riedel regarding same Telephone conference with follow-up conference with Harley Riedel	1.00
02/22/2024	HER	Tollow-up conference with Harley Riedel	1.00
02/22/2024	SAS	Dictated update to memo regarding objection to medical malpractice claims	0.40
02/22/2024	SAS	Review of emails from conference with Sbar regarding same; and review of follow-up emails	0.50
02/22/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman;	0.20
02/22/2024	SAS		0.90
02/22/2024	SAS	Review of follow-up emails enclosing	0.70
02/22/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with	0.50
02/22/2024	SAS	Review of cross-notice of hearing on motion to continue	0.10
02/22/2024	SAS	Review of order granting Bell's motion to appear pro hac vice	0.10
02/22/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar and Altman regarding outstanding discovery	0.20
02/23/2024	HER	Review of and reply to emails regarding	0.30
02/23/2024	SAS	Review of email from McCoy enclosing Strohl trial scheduling order; review of file; and dictated response	0.20
02/23/2024	SAS	Continued work on	1.20
02/23/2024	SAS	Review and revision of objections to Toppel and Keith claims; conference with Laura Marzano; and dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing memo discussing filed malpractice claims	0.60
02/23/2024	SAS	Review of response in support of motion to stay	0.20
02/23/2024	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding Monday's hearing; dictated letter to chambers enclosing hearing binder	0.40
02/23/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Prosser regarding litigation issues	0.10
02/24/2024	SAS	Exchange of emails with Sbar regarding litigation issues; review of files; and exchange of emails with Sbar regarding SLG appeal issues	0.30
02/25/2024	HER	Numerous emails regarding	0.40
02/25/2024	SAS	Review of emails in preparation for Monday's hearings	1.30
02/26/2024	HER	Numerous emails;	1.20
02/26/2024	HER	Follow-up to	2.10

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 2	23
02/26/2024	SAS		0.2	20
00/06/0004	CAC	dictated response	0.0	
02/26/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila, Sbar, Battista, and Garno regarding SLG appeal issues	0.2	:0
02/26/2024	SAS	Preparation for hearing,	2.6	0
		review of email from Altman; review of		
		follow-up emails; dictated response; review of emails from Altman; and dictated email to co-counsel regarding Altman's emails		
02/26/2024	SAS	Participated in call	0.6	0
02/26/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Garno and Sbar review of email from Rosen	0.2	<u>'</u> 0
02/26/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding SLG appeal issues; review of motion to dismiss appeal; and dictated email to Rocke regarding attempt to discuss with Yessin and Cusack	0.3	;O
02/26/2024	SAS	Review of emails from	0.3	0
02/27/2024	HER	Numerous emails regarding settlement hearing, issues, and strategy	1.2	9:0
02/27/2024	SAS	Review of emails from review of	0.4	θ.
		email from Altman; review of files; review of email from Rocke regarding yesterday's		
		hearing; and dictated response		
02/27/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar, Altman, and Kapila regarding deposition scheduling issues; exchange of emails with Sbar regarding hearing on motion for protective order	0.4	.0
02/27/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Yessin regarding SLG appeal; dictated email to Sbar and Rocke regarding call with Yessin and procedures for dismissing appeal	0.3	0
02/27/2024	SAS	Review of emails regarding scheduling of hearing, preparing a notice of hearing	0.2	20
02/27/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke and Dicks regarding preparation of joint stipulation; review of email from Rocke enclosing notice of dismissal; telephone conference with Rocke; and dictated email to Yessin	0.4	-0
02/27/2024	SAS	Review of emails from counsel	0.4	0
02/27/2024	SAS	Review of email from Yessin regarding intent to dismiss appeal; dictated email	0.2	20
02/28/2024	HER	to Rocke; and review of follow-up emails from Rocke and Dicks Receipt and review of numerous emails	0.4	10
02/28/2024	LAM	Revewing claims of William Duncan, George Brown, Pemla Shonholtz,	7.7	
02/20/2024	L/ (IVI	Reynaldo Guerrero, and Tracy Hudson, and drafting objections and proposed orders on same for each, and gathering all exhibits needed to filing.	77	Ü
02/28/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Sbar regarding	0.8	10
02/28/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Bell regarding litigation issues	0.2	20

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 24
02/28/2024	SAS	Continued work on issues with Yessin regarding dismissal of SLG appeal, including exchange of emails with Yessin; exchange of emails with Sbar and Holder; exchange of follow-up emails with Yessin; review of filed notice of dismissal; dictated emails to counsel enclosing notice of dismissal; and review of follow-up emails	0.80
02/28/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke to Dicks regarding SLG issues	0.10
02/28/2024	SAS	Review of email from	0.70
02/28/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Sbar	0.20
02/28/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar and Altman regarding scheduling of Kapila's deposition	0.20
02/28/2024	SAS	Review of order dismissing SLG appeal; dictated email to Kapila and counsel enclosing order	0.20
02/29/2024	HER	Review of pleadings and electronic correspondence	0.40
02/29/2024	SAS	Review of Laserscopic Claimant's request to schedule an evidentiary hearing; review of email from Altman to chambers; review of emails from Sbar and Chambers regarding scheduling of hearing on motion for protective order and deposition issues;	0.60
02/29/2024	SAS	Review of drafts of objection to former patient claims; dictated revisions; and conference with Laura Marzano regarding further revisions	0.30
02/29/2024	SAS	Review of further emails regarding scheduling a hearing on motion for protective order and request for evidentiary hearing	0.30
02/29/2024	SAS	Review of emails from	0.20
02/29/2024	SAS	Initial review of transcript from hearing on motion to continue;	0.40
03/01/2024	ACT	Pull the Breland case from Westlaw for Scott Stichter	0.10
03/01/2024	HER	Review of filed response and numerous emails	0.30
03/01/2024	SAS	Review of Parties' joinder in request for evidentiary hearing; dictated revisions to response;	0.80
03/01/2024	SAS	Further review of emails from review of Laserscopic Claimant's notice of taking deposition; and dictated email to Altman regarding court reporter for Monday's hearings	0.30
03/01/2024	SAS	Review of follow-up emails regarding finalizing response in opposition; finalized response for filing with court	0.50
03/01/2024	SAS	Finalized hearing binder and correspondence to court enclosing hearing binder	0.60
03/01/2024	SAS	Further review of and revision of objection to claims filed by former patients; conference with Laura Marzano; and finalized objections for filing with court	0.40
03/02/2024	HER	Emails and telephone conference	0.00
03/02/2024	HER	Review of email from Jennifer Altman	0.10
03/03/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding scheduling of depositions	0.10
03/03/2024	SAS	Further research and review of pleadings in preparation for hearing	1.10

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	25
03/04/2024	HER	Preparation for (including telephone conference with Scott Stichter, participation in conference call with co-counsel, electronic correspondence) and attendance at 3:00 hearing; follow-up	:	2.30
03/04/2024	SAS	Review of emails to Sbar and Kapila recently filed pleadings; and telephone conference with Harley Riedel regarding today's hearing	(0.80
03/04/2024	SAS	Dictated draft of objection to claim of former client; conference with Laura Marzano regarding status of filing objections to former patient claims	(0.60
03/04/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar, Altman, and Kapila regarding deposition scheduling issues	(0.20
03/04/2024	SAS	Participtated in call with	(0.80
03/04/2024	SAS	Further preparation for hearing; attended hearing	(0.90
03/04/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Fernandez regarding outcome of today's hearing	(0.10
03/05/2024	HER	Review of electronic correspondence	(0.40
03/05/2024	SAS	Work on litigation issues, including review of emails from counsel regarding scheduling of hearing; review of emails with chambers regarding scheduling of hearing;	(0.60
		dictated response; dictated email to Sbar regarding preparing a notice of hearing; and review of response		
03/05/2024	SAS	Review of email from creditor regarding status of making distributions; dictated response	(0.10
03/05/2024	SAS	Review of email from	(0.20
03/05/2024	SAS	Review of email from	(0.20
03/06/2024	HER			1.00
03/06/2024	LAM	Review claims by Deborah Bernat, Tanya Brinson, Laurie Grubb, Nicole Norton and Tammy Wooten. Draft Objection and proposed order on same. Gather exhibits, finalize, file and serve.	•	4.10
03/06/2024	SAS	Review of correspondence and order on objection to Schaffer's claim for submission to court	(0.10
03/06/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Harley Riedel		1.40
03/06/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with attorney regarding amounts owed to Laser Spine to be paid from insurance settlement; dictated email to Gerber	(0.20
03/06/2024		Review of email from dictated response		0.10
03/07/2024		Finalized objections to employee claims		0.40
03/07/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman enclosing revisions to order;	(0.30
03/07/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Sbar	(0.30

Matter:	1	Bill # 60869	Page	26
03/08/202	24 HER	Participation in 2:00 p.m. conference call	(0.00
03/08/202	24 SAS	Begin research on		1.10
03/08/202	24 SAS	Review of emails regarding cancellation of hearing; telephone conference with Rocke; and review of notice of withdrawal of cancellation of hearing	(0.30
03/08/202		Exchange of emails with Rocke regarding hearing binder; finalized hearing binder and cases; and dictated letter to court enclosing hearing binder	(0.40
03/08/202	24 SAS	Telephone conference with	(0.80
03/08/202	24 SAS	Review of files in preparation for call	(0.30
03/09/202	24 SAS	Review of emails from Sbar and Altman regarding	(0.30
03/10/202	24 HER	Review of proposed order and related electronic correspondence	(0.30
03/10/202		Review of email from court reporter enclosing invoice; dictated email regaarding same		0.10
03/10/202		Review of email from Sbar		0.10
03/10/202	24 SAS	Review of email from	(0.40
03/10/202	24 SAS	Review of email from Gerber regarding account receivables issues; dictated response	(0.20
03/11/202	24 SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke regarding today's hearing; review of files in preparation for hearing; attended hearing; and exchange of emails with Rocke following hearing regarding preparation of order	(0.90
03/11/202	24 SAS	Review of email from	(0.10
03/11/202	24 SAS	Review of email from Capuano regarding fraudulent transfer lawsuits	(0.10
03/11/202	24 SAS	Review of order sustaining objection to Schafer's claim	(0.10
03/12/202	24 SAS	Dictated update to claims objection chart; dictated email to McCoy enclosing chart	(0.40
03/12/202	24 SAS	Dictated draft of order on motion to stay; dictated email to Rocke enclosing draft or order	(0.70
03/12/202	24 SAS	Review of emails from Rocke enclosing revision to order on motion to stay; dictated response; review of email from Garno; and exchange of emails with Rocke and Garno	(0.30
03/13/202	24 HER	Review of email from EFO's Texas counsel regarding deposition of Soneet Kapila;	(0.40
03/13/202	24 HER	Review of email from	(0.10
03/13/202	24 SAS	Finalized draft of order on motion to stay; dictated email to counsel enclosing draft of order	(0.20
03/13/202	24 SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel	(0.30
03/14/202	24 HER	Electronic correspondence	(0.30
03/14/202	24 SAS	Review of email from Capuano enclosing revisions to order on motion to stay; dictated email to Rocke; review of email from Dougherty enclosing further revisions; review of emails from Rocke; Garno, and Waggoner; and telephone conference with Rocke	(0.60

Matter:	1	Bill # 60869	Page 27
03/14/20)24 SA	Review of emails from Garno and Sbar regarding dictated response; and	0.30
03/14/20)24 SA	·	0.30
	, .,		3.33
03/15/20)24 AC	To Research assignee deposition	0.40
03/15/20		3	0.50
00, 10, 20		follow-up email from Sbar enclosing further revisions; and review of follow-up emails from Sbar, Kapila, and Rozen	0.00
03/15/20)24 SA	S Review of orders disallowing claims; finalized correspondence to court submitting order	0.30
03/15/20)24 SA	S Review of correspondence from Sbar and Altman to chambers submitting competing orders on motion for protective order	0.20
03/15/20)24 SA	S Finalized order on motion for stay; dictated correspondence to chambers submitting order	0.20
03/15/20)24 SA	S Review of order on motion for protective order entered by court	0.10
03/15/20)24 SA	S Review of emails regarding dictated responses	0.20
03/15/20)24 SA	S Review of order entered by court granting motion to stay	0.10
03/18/20)24 DF	Conference with Scott A. Stichter	0.20
03/18/20)24 LA	M Research the correct addresses for Farris Kenneth Tapp and Kenneth Winkler; draft amended certificate of service and have claim objections reserved	1.30
03/18/20)24 SA	S Review of email from	0.40
03/18/20)24 SA	Review of second objection to claim filed by Stancil; finalized objection to Stancil claims	0.30
03/18/20)24 SA	S Review of recently entered orders disallowing claims; dictated revisions to claims memo	0.40
03/18/20)24 SA	S Conference with Laura Marzano regarding filing amended certificate of service for returned mail	0.20
03/19/20)24 DF	RF Research regarding	1.00
03/19/20)24 SA	S Review of Toppel order; finalized correspondence to court submitting order	0.10
03/19/20)24 SA		0.40
00/40/00	0.4	and dictated response	0.00
03/19/20)24 SA	S Review of correspondence from Keith responding to objection to claim; dictated email to McCoy enclosing and discussing objection; review of email from McCoy; dictated response; and review of follow-up email from McCoy	0.60
03/20/20)24 DF		0.10
03/20/20)24 HE	R	0.60
03/20/20)24 SA	Review of email from Sbar regarding availability for hearing on motion to intervene;	0.10
03/20/20)24 SA	S Review of order granting motion to stay	0.10
03/20/20)24 SA	S Review of order disallowing Toppel claim	0.10
03/20/20)24 SA	S Conference with Dan Fogarty	0.30
03/21/20)24 DF	Conference with Scott A. Stichter, Harley E. Riedel	0.40
03/21/20)24 DF	Further conference with Scott A. Stichter	0.40

⁴¹ North Jefferson Street-Suite 111 Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669 T 850.637.1836 F 850.791.6545

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 28
03/21/2024	DRF	Work on	2.10
03/21/2024	HER	Further research on and internal conference conference with Stichter and Fogarty regarding same	0.70
03/21/2024	SAS	Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding	0.90
03/22/2024	DRF	Conference with Scott A. Stichter; revise	1.10
03/22/2024	SAS	Review of opposition to motion to intervene	0.40
03/22/2024	SAS	Conferences regarding cancelling March 27 hearing	0.10
03/22/2024	SAS	Review and revision of memo conference with Dan Fogarty regarding same	1.10
03/23/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rosen to chambers regarding rescheduling hearing on motion to intervene	0.20
03/24/2024	SAS	Review of	0.60
03/25/2024	HER	Review of emails regarding same	0.40
03/25/2024	HER	Review of email to Scott Stichter regarding same and review of his email circulating memo to other counsel	0.40
03/25/2024	SAS	Dictated notice of cancellation of hearing	0.10
03/25/2024	SAS	Dictated email to	0.20
03/25/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding Hamburg collections issues; dictated response; and exchange of emails with Rocke	0.20
03/25/2024	SJ	Download CT service of process, draft subpoena response letters and forwarding to Scott Stichter	0.50
03/26/2024	HER	Receipt and review of correspondence	0.20
03/26/2024	SAS	Review of Holland & Knight's cross-notice of hearing	0.10
03/26/2024	SAS		1.10
03/26/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke regarding Hamburg collection issues	0.20
03/27/2024	HER	Electronic correspondence and internal conference regarding	0.30
03/27/2024	SAS	Dictated further updates to memo discussing claims objection	0.30
03/27/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding Hamburg collection issues; telephone conference with Rock; conference with Harley Riedel; review of email from Rocke to Kapila; and exchange of emails with Rocke and Kapila	0.50
03/27/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding next week's hearings; dictated response; and review of email from Sbar	0.20
03/27/2024	SAS	Review of information on property appraiser's website; dictated email to Rocke and Kapila	0.20
03/27/2024	SAS	Review of follow-up email from Sbar	0.10
03/27/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Sbar	0.50
03/27/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Rosen and Chambers regarding scheduling of hearing on motion to intervene	0.20
03/27/2024	SAS	Review of emails regarding	0.40
03/28/2024	SAS	Continued work on Hamburg collection issues, including exchange of emails with Rocke; and conference with Susan Jeffcoat	0.40

⁴¹ North Jefferson Street-Suite 111 Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669 T 850.637.1836 F 850.791.6545

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 29
03/28/2024	SAS	Review of further revisions to review of emails from Rozen and Sbar discussing revisions	0.60
03/29/2024	ВМВ	Review of Pinellas County Tax Collector, Pinellas County Property Appraiser information with regard to subject homestead property; research online regarding location of property; call with Pinellas County Building Department regarding same; call (voicemail) to City of Tarpon Spring regarding same; call to local surveyor regarding determination of subject property; call with Pinellas County Property Appraiser regarding same; review of Pinellas County taxing districts, land use designations; research regarding property designation; conference with Scott A. Stichter; draft summary of research and findings	3.40
03/29/2024	HER	Review of	0.60
03/29/2024	LAM		0.50
03/29/2024	SAS	Further review of Hamburg documents in preparation for call; telephone conference with Rocke regarding Hamburg collection issues; dictated email to Kapila regarding same; and conference with Michael Bachman regarding Hamburg homestead issues	0.60
03/29/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar	0.40
03/29/2024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding preparation of hearing binder and filing response; dictated response	0.20
03/29/2024	SAS	Review of email from finalized for filing with court	0.60
04/01/2024	ACT	Print out cases for Scott A. Stichter	0.30
04/01/2024	BMB	Review and revise draft email to client; review of updates from City of Tarpon Springs; email to client	0.90
04/01/2024	SAS	Review of email regarding Wednesday's hearings; dictated response	0.10
04/01/2024	SAS	Review of email from Michael Bachman regarding Hamburg collection issues; dictated email to Michael Bachman; review of email from Michael Bachman to Kapila; exchange of emails with Rocke and Kapila	0.60
04/01/2024	SAS	Review of Holland & Knight's reply to response in opposition to motion to intervene	0.40
04/01/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Sbar regarding Wednesday's hearings	0.40
04/01/2024	SAS	Exchange of emails with Sbar regarding hearing binder; preparation of hearing binder; telephone conference with Sbar's office; multiple conferences regarding binder; and review of emails	1.60
04/01/2024	SJ	Finalize and mail subpoena response letters	0.20
04/02/2024	BMB	Review of client financials and summary; call with Soneet Kapila and Scott A. Stichter; review of motion and settlement agreement	1.40
04/02/2024	HER	Preparation for April 3 hearing on H& K compromise,	1.20
04/02/2024	SAS	Review of Hamburg documents in preparation for call with Kapila; telephone conference with Kapila and Michael Bachman; and dictated email to Rocke	0.40
04/02/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke regarding Hamburg issues	0.20
04/02/2024	SAS	Review of case law;	0.80

Matter:	1		Bill # 60869	Page	30
04/02/20)24	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel	(0.20
04/02/20)24	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding Hamburg issues	(0.10
04/03/20)24	BMB	Review of settlement papers	(0.30
04/03/20)24	HER	Preparation for and attendance at hearing; follow-up		1.80
04/03/20)24	SAS	Review of Gammen's and Esping's objection to compromise motion	(0.20
04/03/20)24	SAS	Attended hearings; review of emails following hearing; and dictated response		1.70
04/04/20)24	LAM	Review, finalize, and submit cover letter with the proposed orders sustaining objection to the claims of George Brown, William Duncan, Reynaldo Guerrero, Tracey Hudson, Pamela Shanholtz, Debroah Bernat, Tonya Brinson, Laurie Grubb, Nicole Norton, and Tammy Wooten	ı	0.60
04/04/20)24	SAS	Review of draft of orders disallowing claims; finalized correspondence submitting orders to court	(0.40
04/05/20)24	DRF	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding litigation issues	(0.20
04/05/20)24	SAS	Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding litigation issues	(0.20
04/05/20)24	SAS	Begin drafting objection to Picha's claim	(0.70
04/05/20)24	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding pending matters	(0.10
04/08/20)24	HER			1.00
			emails with legal team regarding same		
04/08/20)24	SAS	Review of email enclosing telephone conference with Sbar	(0.50
04/08/20)24	SAS	Review of emails from counsel regarding review of revised order; dictated response; review of follow-up emails; and	(0.60
04/08/20)24	SAS	Telephone conference with Hamburg counsel regarding amounts owed under judgment; dictated email to Rocke and Kapila; review of email from Rocke; review of email from Kapila; and review of email from Rocke	(0.60
04/09/20)24	HER	Electronic correspondence	(0.40
04/09/20)24	HER	Review of Court orders on claim objections	(0.20
04/09/20)24	SAS	Review of emails from counsel regarding	(0.30
04/09/20	024	SAS	Finalized letters for submission to court; finalized correspondence submitting	(0.20
			orders		
04/10/20)24	HER	Review of	(0.50
04/10/20)24	SAS	electronic correspondence regarding same Review of recently entered order disallowing claims; dictated update to claims		0.40
0.4/4.0/00	20.4	0.4.0	chart		0.00
04/10/20		SAS	Review of further emails regarding		0.20
04/11/20		SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding		0.10
04/11/20)24	SAS		(0.50
04/11/20)24	SAS	Review of correspondence from Altman to chambers submitting order; and review of correspondence from		0.30
04/12/20)24	SAS	Sbar to chambers submitting order Review of order entered by Court granting Holland & Knight compromise	(0.30
04/16/20)24	SAS	motion; review of follow-up emails Review of Hamburg agreement; dictated email to Kapila enclosing and	(0.40
			discussing Hamburg RV listing agreement		

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	31
04/16/2024	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding CT invoices	(0.10
04/16/2024	SJ	Review CT invoices for statutory representation and forwarding to KapilaMukamal	(0.20
04/17/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke regarding		
04/17/2024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding Hamburg issues	(0.10
04/17/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke regarding litigation issues	(0.20
04/18/2024	HER	Review email from and telephone conference with Scott Stichter regarding	(0.90
04/18/2024	SAS	Review of files; telephone conference with Harley Riedel	(0.80
04/18/2024	SAS	Review of correspondence to chambers submitting order denying motion to intervene	(0.20
04/19/2024	HER	Further work on review related emails	(0.50
04/19/2024	LAM	Edit claim objections for Ali, Shall, and Picha	(0.60
04/19/2024	SAS	Review of correspondence from chambers submitting proposed order denying motion to intervene	(0.10
04/19/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke regarding dictated dictated follow-up email to Rocke enclosing documents; and dictated email to Harley Riedel	(0.50
04/22/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke enclosing Brannock Berman engagement letter	(0.50
04/22/2024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding Hamburg issues; dictated email to Kerr regarding RV issues	(0.20
04/22/2024	SAS	Dictated revisions to Shall claim objection; dictated objections to Picha and Ali claims; dictated email to McCoy regarding objection to Picha claim; review of email from McCoy regarding objection to Picha claim; review of email from McCoy; and finalized objections for filing with Court	•	1.70
04/22/2024	SAS	Review of files; dictated email to McCoy and Kapila regarding claim objection issues	(0.40
04/23/2024	SAS	Dictated motion to employ Brannock Berman; dictated email to Rocke enclosing draft of motion	(0.80
04/23/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Rocke and Kapila regarding Brannock Berman retention issues; telephone conference with Rocke	(0.30
04/23/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Capuano and Rocke regarding filing of notices of entry of stay order in adversaries; review of order; dictated email to Rocke; and exchange of emails with Rocke	(0.40
04/24/2024	SAS	Dictated draft of notice of filing stay order; dictated email to Rocke enclosing draft of notice	(0.60
04/24/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke approving form of notice; dictated response; and finalized notices to be filed in state court lawsuits	(0.60
04/24/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke approving form of Brannock Berman motion to employ	(0.10
04/25/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila and Rocke discussing finalizing Brannock Berman engagement letter; dictated email to counsel enclosing draft of motion; review of email from Kapila; and dictated response	(0.50

Matter:	1		Bill # 60869	Page	32
04/25/20	024	SAS	Review of further emails from Rocke and Kapila regarding Brannock Berman retention issues	(0.20
04/26/20	024	SAS	Conference with Alpert regarding MedPro claims issues	(0.20
04/29/20	024	SAS	Review of emails from Capuano, Capuano's office, and Rocke McLean regarding Jill St. Louis settlement payment	(0.30
04/29/20	024	SAS	Dictated email to McCoy and Kapila discussing MedPro claims issues	(0.20
04/29/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke to Garno regarding Brannock Berman engagement letter; review of email from Garno	(0.10
04/29/20	024	SJ	Draft subpoena response letters and forwarding to Scott Stichter	(0.20
04/30/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding Hamburg issues; dictated response; and dictated email to Hamburg's counsel	(0.20
04/30/20	024	SAS	Finalized correspondence responding to records requests	(0.20
04/30/20	024	SAS	Review of emails from Rocke and Garno regarding Brannock Berman retention issues; review of follow-up email from Brannock's office	(0.20
04/30/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Hamburg's counsel; dictated response	(0.10
05/02/20	024	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy regarding objection to claims issues; review of files; dictated response; review of emails from McCoy regarding objection to late filed claims; dictated response; and exchange of emails with Kapila regarding same	(0.90
05/02/20	024	SJ	Finalize subpoena response letters and mail out	(0.20
05/03/20	024	SAS	Dictated email to Rocke regarding Brannock Berman retention issues; exchange of emails with Rocke regarding obtaining fully executed engagement letter; and finalized retention pleadings for filing with court	(0.70
05/03/20	024	SAS	Review of emails from Altman and Sbar regarding distribution issues; dictated email to Sbar	(0.20
05/03/20	024	SAS	Finalized notice of filing Keith response for filing with Court	(0.20
05/04/20	024	HER	Review of emails from Jonathan Sbar and Jennifer Altman regarding Bailey	(0.20
05/04/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding distribution issues; dictated email to Kapila regarding same	(0.20
05/05/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding Hamburg issues	(0.10
05/05/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding distribution issues; dictated response; and review of follow-up email from Kapila; and dictated response	(0.30
05/06/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding distribution issues; dictated response; and exchange of emails with McCoy and Kapila	(0.20
05/06/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding distribution issues; dictated response	(0.10
05/06/20	024	SAS	Review of files; dictated email to McCoy regarding distribution issues; and review of response from McCoy	(0.30
05/06/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Weiss forwarding Sam Bailey's voicemail; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy; and review of email from Kapila	(0.20
05/06/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Kerr regarding Hamburg issues	(0.10
05/07/20	024	LAM	Create Certificate of Service for Objection to Late Claims	•	1.30
05/07/20	024	SAS	Work on objections to late filed claims, including dictated draft of objection; dictated email to Kapila's office regarding need to receive addresses for claimants; and dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing draft of objection	(0.70
05/07/20	024	SAS	Exchange of emails with Kapila and McCoy regarding distribution issues	(0.20
05/07/20	024	SAS	Review of emails from Sellers and Rocke confirming receipt of St. Louis' settlement payment	(0.10

Matter:	1		Bill # 60869	Page	33
05/07/20	24 S	SAS	Dictated email to Kerr regarding Hamburg issues	(0.20
05/07/20	24 S	SAS	Review of emails from Weiss and Marzano regarding late filed claims objection; dictated response to Laura Marzano; and review of email from Laura Marzano	(0.20
05/08/20	24 S	SAS	Review of email from Kapila enclosing charts regarding distributions and claims summary; review of files in preparation for call	(0.40
05/08/20	24 S	SAS	Review of revisions to objection to late filed claims; dictted email to McCoy regarding revisions to exhibit listing late claims	(0.30
05/08/20	24 S	SAS	Telephone conference with Kapila and McCoy regarding distribution issues; telephone conference with Altman regarding distribution issues; dictated email to Kapila and co-counsel regarding call with Altman; and follow-up call with Kapila		1.10
05/08/20	24 S	SAS	Dictated draft of motion to pay contingency fee in connection with Holland & Knight compromise; dictated email to Rocke enclosing draft of motion	(0.90
05/08/20	24 S	SAS	Dictated email to McCoy and Kapila regarding Hamburg issues	(0.10
05/09/20	24 L	AM	Finalize, file and serve Objection to Late Filed Claims	•	1.40
05/09/20	24 S	SAS	Review of email from Weiss enclosing corrected exhibit for objection to late filed claim; dictated response; dictated email to Laura Marzano; conference with Laura Marzano regarding finalizing objection for filing; and finalized objection		0.40
05/09/20	24 S	SAS	Review of email from Rocke enclosing revisions to motion to pay contingency fee; dictated revisions and dictated email to counsel enclosing revised draft	(0.30
05/09/20	24 S	SAS	Review of email from Garno and Battista enclosing dictated response; and review of email from Sbar	(0.30
05/09/20	24 S	SAS	Review of files; dictated email to Weiss and McCoy regarding SLG claim; dictated email to Weiss to McCoy regarding medical malpractice claims; and dictated email to Weiss and McCoy regarding vendor claims	(0.80
05/09/20	24 S	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila regarding	(0.40
05/00/00	04				0 00
05/09/20		SAS	Review of email from Weiss regarding objection to claim issue		0.20
05/09/20	24 S	SAS	Dictated email to co-counsel regarding discussion of objection to indemnification claims		0.40
05/10/20	24 S	SAS	Dictated email to Alpert regarding MedPro issues	(0.20
05/10/20	24 S	SAS	Review of email from Weiss regarding malpractice claim issues; dictated response	(0.20
05/11/20	24 S	SAS	Review of email from Wischmeier regarding distribution issues; dictated response	(0.20
05/11/20	24 S	SAS	Review of email from Wischmeier regarding distribution issues; review of file; and dictated responses discussing same and enclosing requested documents	(0.30
05/11/20	24 S	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro issues; dictated response	(0.20
05/12/20	24 S	SAS	Review of follow-up email to Wischmeier regarding distribution issues	(0.20
05/13/20	24 H	IER	Review of order quashing subpoena and related email	(0.10
05/13/20	24 S	SAS	Review of email from Kerr regarding Hamburg issues; review of email from Kapila; dictated response; and review of follow-up email form Kapila	(0.30
05/13/20	24 S	SAS	Telephone conference with Wischmeier regarding distribution issues and status of case	(0.30

Matter:	1		Bill # 60869	Page	34
05/14/2	024	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding finalizing motion to pay contingency fees; dictated response; review of follow-up email; dictated revisions to motion; and finalized motion for filing with court	1	0.50
05/14/2	024	SAS	Dictated email to Kerr regarding Hamburg issues		0.10
05/14/2	024	SAS	Review of email from Wischmeier regarding distribution issues; dictated response	ı	0.20
05/16/2	024	SAS	Review of emails regarding responses filed by parties to late filed objections; dictated email to McCoy	1	0.20
05/17/2	024	SAS	Review of email from Wischmeier regarding distribution issues; dictated response	ı	0.20
05/18/2	024	SAS	Review of follow-up email from Wischmeier regarding distribution issues		0.10
05/20/2	024	LAM	Review, finalize and submit Proposed Orders on Claim Objections to Shall, Ali & Picha	ı	0.40
05/20/2	024	SAS	Finalized orders on objections to claims for submission to court		0.20
05/21/2	024	SAS	Review of orders disallowing claims; dictated email to McCoy, Kapila, and Weiss enclosing orders	1	0.20
05/21/2	024	SAS	Review of responses to late filed claim objection from Gregory and Core Facility service; dictated email to McCoy	ı	0.30
05/21/2	024	SAS	Telephone conference with Kerr regarding Hamburg issues	1	0.20
05/23/2	024	HER	Electronic correspondence	1	0.10
05/23/2	024	SAS	Telephone conference with McCoy regarding manner of handling responses to late filed objections to claims	1	0.20
05/23/2	024	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila regarding filing of fee applications; review of response; and exchange of emails with Kapila	ı	0.30
05/23/2	024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding Brannock retention issues; review of files; and dictated email to Rocke	ı	0.20
05/28/2	024	SAS	Dictated order granting application to employ Brannock Berman; finalized order and correspondence submitting order	I	0.80
05/29/2	024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding Hamburg issues; dictated response; and review of email from Rocke	ı	0.20
05/30/2	024	MBH	Receipt and review of email from Scott A. Stichter regarding collection issues; emails with Scott A. Stichter; review file	ı	0.30
05/30/2	024	SAS	Review of email from Battista regarding review of file; dictated response enclosing documents; and review of follow-up email from Battista	1	0.30
05/30/2	024	SAS	Conference with Alma Torres regarding indemnification claims research; review of files regarding supporting documents; and follow-up conference with Alma Torres	1	0.30
05/30/2	024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding Hamburg collection issues; telephone conference with Kerr; and dictated email to Kapila regarding call with Kerr and discussing actions which could be taken	I	0.30
05/30/2	024	SAS	Review of correspondence from Rueben Johnson responding to objection to late filed claims	I	0.20
05/30/2	024	SAS	Review of order granting application to employ Brannock and Berman		0.10
05/30/2	024	SAS	Telephone conference with Kapila regarding Hamburg issues; review of follow- up email; and exchange of emails with Matt Hale regarding collection issues	ı	0.30
05/30/2	024	SAS	Review of email from Battista regarding professional retention issues; dictated response	ı	0.20

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	35
05/31/2024	ACT	Research for indemnification,		0.90
05/31/2024	HER	Review of email from Steve Brannock regarding EFO appeal; initial research of law and follow-up emails regarding same		1.20
05/31/2024	MBH	Research issues regarding proceedings supplementary; draft and send summary email; conference with Scott A. Stichter regarding collection issues	•	1.60
05/31/2024	МВН	Receipt and review of emails regarding collection issue; research collection issues and RV; conference with Scott A. Stichter; receipt and review of documents		1.50
05/31/2024	SAS	Work on Hamburg collection issues, including review of email from Kapila; review of files; dictated response to Kapila responding to open issues and enclosing documents; exchange of emails with Matthew Hale enclosing and discussing document; review of email from Matthew Hale regarding execution remedies; dictated response; and review of email to Matt Hale to Kapila		1.20
05/31/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar and Brannock regarding appeal issues; research regarding same; conference with Harley Riedel; and continued response	•	1.20
05/31/2024	SJ	Receipt of CT service of process, download and save same	(0.20
06/01/2024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding Hamburg issues; dictated response	(0.10
06/02/2024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding Hamburg issues	(0.10
06/02/2024	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding appeal issues; dictated response	(0.30
06/03/2024	ACT	Meeting with Matt B. Hale on writ of garnishment, draft the motion and order.	•	1.10
06/03/2024	МВН	Review notes and research prior to call with Soneet Kapila; call with Mr. Kapila and Scott A. Stichter; brief call with Bob Rocke; draft and send email to Alma Torres regarding project	(0.70
06/03/2024	MBH	Conference with Alma Torres regarding proceeding supplementary	(0.40
06/03/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Matt Hale regarding today's call; review of files in preparation for call; telephone conference with Matt Hale and Kapila regarding Hamburg issues; telephone conference with Rocke and Matt Hale; and follow-up	(0.50
06/03/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila's office and Rocke regarding SLG payment	(0.10
06/03/2024	SAS	Dictated order on objection to late filed claims	(0.60
06/03/2024	SAS	Dictated notice regarding receipt of responses to objections to late filed claims	(0.20
06/03/2024	SAS	Dictated draft of order granting motion to approve payment of contingency fees in connection with Holland & Knight compromise	(0.70
06/03/2024	SAS	Dictated extensive revisions to objections to indemnification claims filed by Perry, Esping, Grammen, St. Louis, and Wilson	•	1.70
06/03/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Altman regarding objection to claims and distribution issues	(0.20
06/03/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Altman regarding distribution issues; review of files; and dictated email to Altman	(0.30
06/03/2024	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding CT invoices	(0.10
06/03/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Altman regarding distribution issues; review of files; dictated email to Altman enclosing claims information; and dictated email to Kapila and counsel regarding call with Altman; and review of responses	(0.50
06/03/2024	SJ	Review CT invoices and forwarding to KapilaMukamal	(0.40
06/04/2024	ACT	Begin draft to commence proceeding supplemental	(0.90

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page 36
06/04/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila and Battista approving draft of order on motion to pay contingency fees	0.10
06/04/2024	SAS	Finalized notice of responses to late filed claims	0.20
06/04/2024	SAS	Finalized order on objection to late filed claims; finalized correspondence to court	0.20
06/05/2024	ACT	Met with Matt B. Hale to discuss the proceeding supplemental and complete draft for review	1.70
06/05/2024	MBH	Work on proceedings supplementary papers	1.40
06/05/2024	SAS	Review of orders sustaining objection to late filed claims	0.10
06/05/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Rocke and Sbar	0.30
06/06/2024	SAS	Review of email from King regarding claims issues	0.10
06/07/2024	SAS	Review of email regarding filing late filed claim	0.10
06/10/2024	ACT	Research for indemnification and statute of frauds	0.90
06/10/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding indemnification claims; dictated response; and review of response from Altman	0.20
06/10/2024	SAS	Review of email from Alma Torres enclosing indemnification research; review of case law	0.40
06/10/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding status of order on motion to pay contingency fees; dictated response; and review of follow-up email from Rocke	0.20
06/10/2024	SAS	Review of order granting motion for authority to pay contingency fees	0.10
06/11/2024	MBH	Review and revise motion for proceedings supplementary to Hamburg and related exhibits and order	3.10
06/11/2024	SAS	Review of email from Brannock regarding appeal issues; review of email from Garno; and dictated response enclosing additional research	0.40
06/12/2024	LAM	Finalize, file, and serve Claim Objections to Perry, Gremmen, St. Louis, Wilson, & Esping	1.90
06/12/2024	MBH	Research ex parte filing rules and issues; draft and send email to Laura Marzano; conference with Ms. Marzano	0.50
06/12/2024	SAS	Conference with Leskanic regarding fraudulent transfer appeal issues; review of emails from Brannock regarding appeal issues	0.60
06/12/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Alpert regarding MedPro issues	0.20
06/12/2024	SAS	Review of Hamburg supplementary pleadings; conference with Matt Hale regarding revisions; review of revised documents; and follow-up conference with Matt Hale	0.70
06/12/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding distribution issues; dictated response; dictated email to Kapila regarding Altman's emails; review of follow-up email from Altman; and further exchange of emails with Kapila and McCoy	0.60
06/12/2024	SAS	Further exchange of emails with Altman regarding distribution issues; dictated email to Ray regarding distribution issues	0.30
06/12/2024	SAS	Conference with Laura Marzano and finalized objection to indemnification claims for filing with court	0.80
06/12/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Gerber regarding TCB claims allowance issues	0.10
06/13/2024	MBH	Work on proceedings supplementary	0.70

Matter:	1		Bill # 60869	Page	37
06/13/20	024	SAS	Review of files in preparation for call; telephone conference with McCoy and Kapila regarding claims issues and distribution issues	(0.60
06/13/20	024	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding proceedings supplementary; review of follow-up email from Matt Hale to Kapila	(0.20
06/13/20	024	SAS	Exchange of emails with Ray regarding distribution issues; telephone conference with Ray regarding distribution issues	(0.40
06/13/20	024	SAS	Exchange of emails with Manns and Gerber regarding distribution issues; telephone conference with Manns and Gerber regarding distribution issues	(0.40
06/13/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding contact from Sam Bailey; dictated response; and review of response from Kapila	(0.20
06/13/20	024	SAS	Review of updated claims chart; dictated email to Weiss, Kapila, and McCoy regarding claims to be revised; and exchange of emails with McCoy, Kapila and Weiss	(0.60
06/14/20	024	MBH	Receipt and review of email from Soneet Kapila; conference with Laura Marzano; review and compile documents for filing	(0.50
06/14/20	024	MBH	Finalize and file motion for proceedings supplementary	(0.90
06/14/20	024	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding claims issues; dictated response; and review of follow-up emails	(0.20
06/14/20	024	SAS	Telephone conference with Alpert regarding MedPro claims issues	(0.20
06/14/20	024	SAS	Telephone conference with McCoy and Weiss regarding claims issues; review of files; and dictated follow-up emails to McCoy and Weiss enclosing documents	•	1.10
06/14/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Alpert enclosing MedPro claims information; dictated email to Weiss and McCoy forwarding Alpert's email	(0.20
06/14/20	024	SAS	Review of emails regarding Hamburg proceedings supplementary	(0.20
06/14/20	024	SAS	Telephone conference with Hardy regarding request for medical records; review of file; and dictated email to Hardy enclosing requested information	(0.30
06/14/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Weiss enclosing updated claims summary; review of same; review of email from Kapila enclosing questions on claims summary; review of files; dictated response; review of email from Weiss enclosing updated claims summary; dictated response; and review of follow-up emails from Kapila; review of files in preparation for call with Kapila and Weiss; and telephone conference with Kapila and Weiss	•	1.70
06/14/20	024	SAS	Conference with Susan Jeffcoat regarding medical records for patients in other states; dictated email to McCoy regarding same; and review of email from McCoy	(0.30
06/14/20	024	SAS	Review of case law; dictated email to Brannock discussing fraudulent transfer cases	(0.60
06/16/20	024	SAS	Review of email from King enclosing late filed claim	(0.20
06/17/20	024	SAS	Review of emails from Brannock, Rocke, Garno and Harley Riedel regarding extending time to file brief; dictated response; and review of follow-up emails	(0.40
06/17/20	024	SAS	Review of Bryant's proof of claim; dictated objection to Bryant's claim; finalized objection for filing with court	(0.60
06/17/20	024	SAS	Telephone conference with Tessane regarding request for medical records	(0.10
06/17/20	024	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke	(0.20
06/17/20	024	SAS	Review of email from Brannock discussing fraudulent transfer case law	(0.30
06/17/20	024	SJ	Draft response letters to medical records subpoenas and forwarding to Scott Stichter	(0.30

Matter: 1		Bill # 60869	Page	38
06/18/2024	SAS	Review of email from Battista	0).20
06/18/2024	SAS	Dictated draft of email to Kapila discussing distribution issues; dictated email to Harley Riedel enclosing draft of memo; review of email fom Harley Riedel; and conference with Harley Riedel	1	.10
06/18/2024	SAS	Review of email from Leskanic regarding appellate research issues	0	.20
06/18/2024	SJ	Draft subpoena response letter and forwarding to Scott Stichter	0).20
06/19/2024	SAS	Review of email from Murchison and Kapila regarding Sheila Keith claim; dictated response	0).20
06/19/2024	SAS	Review of email from Rocke	0).10
06/19/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding distribution issues; dictated email to Kapila forwarding Altman's email; and review of email from Kapila	0).20
06/19/2024	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel enclosing revisions to draft email discussing distribution issues; conference with Harley Riedel; review of email from Harley Riedel to Kapila; and review of email from Kapila	0).40
06/19/2024	SAS	Review of email from Brannock regarding appeal brief	0).10
06/20/2024	SAS	Finalized correspondence to parties responding to requests for medical records	0).20
06/20/2024	SAS	Conference with Susan Jeffcoat regarding handling of medical records from other states; dictated email to McCoy; review of email from McCoy; and telehone conference with individual regarding request for medical records	0).40
06/20/2024	SJ	Finalize and mail subpoena response letters	0	.20
06/21/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding distribution issues; dictated response; and exchange of emails with Ray and Altman	0	0.30
06/21/2024	SAS	Review of email to Kapila regarding discussing open claims issues; dictated response; and exchange of email with Kapila and McCoy).20
06/21/2024	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding indemnification claims; dictated response discussing filed objections; and review of email from Altman).20
06/24/2024	SAS	Review of email from Leskanic providing comments on appeal brief).20
06/24/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Donica regarding objection to St. Louis indemnification claim).20
06/25/2024	SAS	Review of email from Donica regarding objection to St. Louis claim; dictated response; review of follow-up email; and telephone conference with Donica).30
06/25/2024	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding receipt of H&K settlement payment; dictated email to Battista).20
06/25/2024	SAS	Exchange of emails with McCoy regarding claim review issues).20
06/25/2024	SAS	Review of emails from Susan Jeffcoat and Kapila regarding CT invoices).20
06/25/2024	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke	0).30
06/25/2024	SAS	Continued work on claims and distribution issues, including review of files; telephone conference with Ray and Altman; and telephone conference with McCoy and Weiss	1	.20
06/25/2024	SAS	Follow-up call with Rocke	0	0.30
06/26/2024	SAS	Dictated email to Manns and Gerber regarding TCB claim issues	0	.20
06/26/2024	SAS	Review of files regarding treatment of Highwoods rejection damage claim; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy discussing settlement with Highwoods; and review of email from Kapila	0).40

Matter: 1	Bill # 60869	Page 39
06/27/2024 S	Review of email from Capuano regarding objection to indemnification claims; dictated email to Ray and Altman regarding Capuano's request for extension; telephone conference with Capuano; and review of email from Altman	0.40
06/27/2024	Review of emails from Sbar and Kapila regarding Holland & Knight documents requests	0.30
06/27/2024	Review of email from Altman regarding Texas litigation;	0.20
06/27/2024	Further telephone conference with Rocke	0.20
06/28/2024	Dictated further revisions to motion for interim distributions; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing draft and discussing open issues	0.60
06/28/2024	SAS Review of email from Altman regarding indemnification claims; dictated response	0.20
06/30/2024	SAS Review of emails from counsel regarding appeal issues; dictated response; and review of follow-up email	0.30
06/30/2024 S	Review of email from Young regarding status of review of claims and distributions to creditors; dictated response	0.20
	Total Professional Services Rendered	\$195,541.00
For Disbursements	Incurred:	
11/21/2023	Photocopies of Compromise Motion with the Wolff Parties	\$14.85
11/22/2023	Photocopies of Compromise Motion and Notice of Hearing - Jill St. Louis	\$33.60
12/18/2023	Postage of Compromise Orders	\$5.91
01/02/2024	Postage of Motion for Amended Order St. Louis	\$3.48
01/03/2024	Postage of Fee Orders	\$3.48
01/05/2024	Postage of Claim Objection - Nees	\$2.79
01/05/2024	Postage of Claim Objection -Malpractice parties	\$8.19
01/12/2024	Postage of Claim Obj-Alexander	\$0.87
01/17/2024	Postage of Objection to Malpractice creditors Order	\$2.76
01/23/2024	Postage of Approve Settlement Motion	\$12.28
01/29/2024	Postage of Notice of Hearing on H&K Settlement	\$2.56
01/31/2024	Postage of Subpoena letters	\$2.56
02/05/2024	Postage of Motion to Fix Deadline	\$2.56
02/13/2024	Postage of Schafer Claim Objection	\$3.76
02/14/2024	Postage of Malpractice Claims Order	\$1.92
02/14/2024	Postage of Notice of Hearing	\$2.56
02/16/2024	Postage of Order on 2nd Omnibus Objection to Claims	\$1.28
02/22/2024	Postage of State Court Objections to Claims	\$13.59
02/23/2024	Postage of Opposition to Continuance	\$4.80
02/23/2024	Postage of Objection to Claims	\$3.98
02/27/2024	Postage of NOH	\$3.20
02/27/2024	Postage of Distribution Check	\$0.64
110 East Madison Street-Sul Tampa, Florida 33602 T 813.229-0144		dary Drive-Suite 40 da 32541-9306 676

Matter: 1 Bill # 60869 Page 40

For Disbursements Incurred:

02/28/2024	Postage of Motion for Protective Order	\$2.56
03/01/2024	Postage of opposition response	\$11.32
03/08/2024	Postage of Objections to Claims	\$4.16
03/11/2024	Veritext, LLC-7230610 Job 6441999 on 3/4/24 Laser Spine Inst., LLC Hrg Hearing transcript	\$175.00
03/11/2024	Postage of Claim Objection Order	\$1.28
03/19/2024	Postage of Amended COS of Claims Objections	\$3.39
03/19/2024	Postage of Stancil Claim Objection	\$0.88
03/20/2024	Postage of Toppel Order	\$2.56
03/29/2024	Postage of Reply in Support of Settlement Order	\$17.08
04/01/2024	Postage of Subpoena letters	\$3.20
04/01/2024	Thomson Reuters - West-850017475 Online/software subscription charges	\$1,513.90
04/10/2024	Postage of Claim Objection Orders	\$8.96
04/22/2024	Postage of Claim Objections x 3	\$7.29
05/01/2024	Thomson Reuters - West-850158347 Online/Software subscription charges	\$41.05
05/02/2024	Postage of Subpoena letters	\$1.28
05/03/2024	Postage of Motion to Employ Professionals	\$3.52
05/03/2024	Postage of Notice re Keith Claim Objection Response	\$0.64
05/09/2024	Postage charges	\$28.83
05/14/2024	Photocopies	\$2.70
05/14/2024	Postage of Contingency Fee Motion	\$5.76
05/29/2024	Photocopies of Brannock Berman order	\$0.90
05/29/2024	Postage of Brannock Berman Order	\$2.56
06/01/2024	Thomson Reuters - West-850311743 Online/Software subscription charges	\$215.03
06/04/2024	Postage of Notice of Claim Objection Response	\$1.92
06/05/2024	Photocopies of order sustaining objection to late filed claims	\$18.00
06/05/2024	Postage of Late Filed Claims Order	\$20.11
06/11/2024	Photocopies of contingency fee order	\$1.35
06/11/2024	Postage of Contingency Fee Order	\$2.56
06/12/2024	Postage of Objection to Claims	\$15.03
06/17/2024	Postage of Claim Objection - Bryant	\$0.64
06/21/2024	Postage of subpoena response letters	\$2.56
	Total Expense Incurred	\$2,247.64
	D	

Recapitulation

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200 Tampa, Florida 33602 T 813.229-0144 F 813-229-1811 1533 Hendry Street- Suite 300 Myers, Florida 33901-1009 T 239.939.5518 F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111 Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669 T 850.637.1836 F 850.791.6545 4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40 Destin, Florida 32541-9306 T 850.460.7676 F 850.424-6604 Matter: 1 Bill # 60869 Page 41

	Name	Hours	Amount
	Bachman, Michael	6.00	\$2,550.00
	Fogarty, Dan R.	6.70 0.30	\$2,847.50 \$120.00
	Fogarty, Dan R. Riedel, Harley E.	58.90	\$35,340.00
	Riedel, Harley E.	43.50	\$23,925.00
	Riedel, Harley E.	0.00	\$0.00
	Hale, Matt B.	11.60	\$4,466.00
	Stichter, Scott A.	185.70	\$87,279.00
	Stichter, Scott A.	62.60	\$28,796.00
	Alma C Torres	6.30	\$1,732.50
	Laura Marzano	35.50	\$7,100.00
	Jeffcoat, Susan	4.10	\$1,025.00
	Jeffcoat, Susan	0.90	\$180.00
	Ratliff, Joanne	0.90	\$180.00
	Total For Professional Services Rendered	423.00 Hours	\$195,541.00
	Adjusted Services Total		\$195,541.00
	Professional Services		\$195,541.00
	Disbursements		\$2,247.64
	Total New Charges This Invoice		\$197,788.64
	Previous Balance		\$136,935.83
01-05-2024	Payment - Thank you, Check # 1377		(\$135,121.00)
01-05-2024	Payment - Thank you, Check # 1378		(\$1,814.83)
	Outstanding Balance		\$0.00
	New Charges This Invoice		\$197,788.64
		Total Due	\$197,788.64

Retainer Balance \$16.90

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You