IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE THIRTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT IN AND FOR HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY, FLORIDA **CIVIL DIVISION**

In re:

Laser Spine Institute, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2762
CLM Aviation, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2764
LSI HoldCo, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2765
LSI Management Company, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2766
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2767
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cincinnati, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2768
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2769
Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2770
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2771
Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2772
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2773
Medical Care Management Services, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2774
Spine DME Solutions, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2775
Total Spine Care, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2776
Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2777
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC	Case No. 2019-CA-2780

Assignors,

Consolidated Case No. 2019-CA-2762

to

Soneet Kapila,

Assignee.

Division L

EIGHTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF STICHTER, RIEDEL, **BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A. FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION** AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL FOR ASSIGNEE FOR THE PERIOD OF AUGUST 1, 2022 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2023

TO CREDITORS AND OTHER INTERESTED PARTIES NOTICE OF OPPORTUNITY TO OBJECT AND REQUEST A HEARING

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that, pursuant to Section 727.111(4) of the Florida Statutes, the Court may consider the relief requested in this motion without further notice or hearing unless a party in interest files an objection within 21 days from the date this paper is served. If you object to the relief requested in this paper, you must file your objection with the Clerk of the Court Clerk of Court for Hillsborough County, Florida at 800 E. Twiggs Street, Tampa, Florida 33602 (or electronically if electronic filing is required), and serve a copy on the assignee's attorney, <u>Scott A. Stichter, Esquire, at 110 E. Madison St., Suite 200, Tampa, FL 33602</u>, and any other appropriate person.

If you do not file an objection within the time permitted, the Assignee and the Court will presume that you do not oppose the granting of the relief requested in the paper.

STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A. ("Stichter Riedel"), pursuant to the Order Granting Assignee's Motion for Order Establishing Procedures for Monthly and Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals, dated May 28, 2019 (the "Interim Compensation Order"), respectfully applies for allowance of compensation for services rendered as counsel to the Assignee in the amount of \$102,948.00, and reimbursement for expenses incurred in the amount of \$2,139.97, for a total allowance of \$105,087.97, for the period of August 1, 2022, through April 30, 2023 (the "Allowance Period"). In support of its request, Stichter Riedel states the following:

Background

1. On March 14, 2019, Laser Spine Institute, LLC¹ ("**LSI**") executed and delivered an assignment for the benefit of creditors to the Assignee. The Assignee filed a Petition with the Court on March 14, 2019, commencing an assignment for the benefit of creditors proceeding pursuant to Chapter 727 of the Florida Statutes (the "**LSI Assignment Case**").

2. Simultaneous with the filing of the LSI Assignment Case, the Assignee filed fifteen other Petitions commencing assignment for the benefit of creditors proceedings for 15 affiliates of LSI: LSI Management Company, LLC; Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC; CLM Aviation, LLC; Medical Care Management Services, LLC; LSI HoldCo, LLC; Laser Spine Surgical Center,

¹ On April 8, 2019, the Court entered an order administratively consolidating this case with the assignment cases of the following entities: LSI Management Company, LLC; Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC; CLM Aviation, LLC; Medical Care Management Services, LLC; LSI HoldCo, LLC; Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC; Laser Spine Care, LLC; and Spine DME Solutions, LLC.

LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cincinnati, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC; Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC; Total Spine Care, LLC; and Spine DME Solutions, LLC (collectively, with the LSI Assignment Case, the "Assignment Cases").

3. On May 28, 2019, the Court entered the Order Granting Assignee's Motion for Order Establishing Procedures for Monthly and Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals (the "Interim Compensation Order").

4. The Interim Compensation Order authorized the professionals to file interim fee applications every 120 days, with the first interim fee application being filed on or after June 30, 2019, representing fees and costs incurred from March 14, 2019, through June 30, 2019.

5. Pursuant to Orders entered by the Court on May 15, 2020, August 24, 2020, October 13, 2020, August 31, 2021, December 14, 2021, and September 14, 2022 Stichter Riedel received payments for fees and costs incurred through July 31, 2022, totaling \$2,098,519.55.

6. No payment has been made to Stichter Riedel for fees and costs incurred during the Allowance Period.

Description of Services and Benefits

7. Stichter Riedel was authorized by this Court to represent the Assignee as general counsel in the Assignment Cases.

8. During the Allowance Period, Stichter Riedel expended a total of **218.1** hours in rendering necessary and beneficial legal services to the Assignee and is owed fees in the amount of **\$102,948.00**.

9. Stichter Riedel incurred **\$2,139.97** in expenses during the Allowance Period.

3

10. Copies of Stichter Riedel's time entries for the services rendered² and a detailed list of the expenses are attached hereto as <u>Composite Exhibit A.</u>

WHEREFORE, Stichter Riedel respectfully requests that the Court allow compensation to Stichter Riedel in the amount of **\$102,948.00** for professional services rendered during the Allowance Period and reimbursement of Stichter Riedel's expenses in the amount of **\$2,139.97**, incurred on behalf of the Assignee during the Allowance Period, for a total allowance of **\$105,087.97**, and authorizing payment in the amount of **\$105,087.97**.

/s/ Scott A. Stichter Scott A. Stichter (FBN 0710679) Stichter, Riedel, Blain & Postler, P.A. 110 E. Madison Street, Suite 200 Tampa, Florida 33602 Telephone: (813) 229-0144 Email: <u>sstichter@srbp.com</u> Counsel for Assignee

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct copy of the foregoing Application has been furnished on this 17th day of May, 2023, by the Court's electronic system to all parties receiving electronic service, and by either U.S. mail or electronic mail to the parties listed on the Limited Notice Parties list attached.

> <u>/s/ Scott A. Stichter</u> Scott A. Stichter

 $^{^2}$ The Assignee has been involved, and continues to be involved, in mediations and is subject to mediation confidentiality requirements. In addition, the Assignee is involved in other litigation. In order to protect privileged or potentially privileged attorney-client or work product information and in order to comply with mediation confidentiality requirements, some entries are redacted. Should any privileged or confidential information be inadvertently disclosed in the Application, the Assignee reserves the right to challenge any use of such information in any proceeding.

MASTER LIMITED NOTICE SERVICE LIST September 14, 2022

Assignors and Assignor's Counsel: (via the Court's electronic servicing system)

CLM Aviation. LLC LSI HoldCo, LLC LSI Management Company, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cincinnati, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC Laser Spine Institute, LLC Medical Care Management Services, LLC Spine DME Solutions, LLC Total Spine Care, LLC Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC c/o Nicole Greensblatt, Esq. Kirkland & Ellis, LLP 601 Lexington Avenue New York, NY 10022 Email: ngreenblatt@kirkland.com

Assignee and Assignee's Counsel (via the Court's electronic servicing system)

Soneet Kapila c/o Stichter Riedel, Blain & Postler, P.A. Attn: Edward J. Peterson, Esq. 110 E. Madison Street, Suite 200 Tampa, Florida 33602

Soneet Kapila c/o Genovese Joblove & Battista, P.A. Attn: Greg Garno, Esq. and Paul Battista, Esq. 100 Southeast Second Street, Suite 4400 Miami, Florida 33131 Email: pbattista@gjb-law.com, ggarno@gjb-law.com Soneet Kapila c/o Rocke, McLean & Sbar, P.A. Attn: Robert Rocke, Jonathan Sbar, Andrea Holder 2309 S. MacDill Avenue Tampa, FL 33629 Email: <u>rrocke@rmslegal.com</u>, <u>aholder@rmslegal.com</u>, <u>jsbar@rmslegal.com</u>

Secured Creditors:

CarePayment, LLC (MAIL RETURNED) 5300 Meadow Rd., #400 Lake Oswego, OR 97035

Steris Corporation 5960 Heisley Rd. Mentor, OH 44060

CIT Bank, N.A. 10201 Centurion Pkwy., #400 Jacksonville, FL 32256

Medport Billing, LLC (MAIL RETURNED) 6352 S. Jones Blvd., #400 Las Vegas, NV 89118

U.S. Bank Equipment Finance 1310 Madrid St. Marshall, MN 56258

Maricopa County Treasurer ATTN: John M. Allen 301 W. Jefferson Street, Suite 100 Phoenix, AZ 85003

Those Parties and Attorneys Formally Requesting Notice (via the Court's electronic servicing system unless otherwise noted)

Highwoods Realty Limited Partnership c/o Eric E. Ludin, Esq. Tucker & Ludin, P.A. 5235 16th Street North St. Petersburg, FL 33703-2611 Email: <u>ludin@tuckerludin.com; erin@ludinlaw.com</u>

Terry and Sherry Legg c/o Colling Gilbert Wright & Carter, LLC 801 N. Orange Avenue, Ste. 830 Orlando, FL 32801 Email: JGilbert@TheFloridaFirm.com; RGilbert@TheFloridaFirm.com; CertificateofService@TheFloridaFirm.com

Joe Bailey; Mark Miller; Ted Suhl; Laserscopic Spinal Centers of America, Inc.; Laserscopic Medical Clinic, LLC; Laserscopic Surgery Center of Florida, LLC; Laserscopic Diagnostic Imaging; Laserscopic Spinal Center of Florida, LLC; and Tim Langford c/o Gunster, Yoakley & Stewart, P.A. 401 E. Jackson Street, Ste 2500 Tampa, FL 33602 Email: wschifino@gunster.com (primary) kmather@gunster.com (primary) jbennett@gunster.com (primary) cwarder@gunster.com (secondary) tkennedy@gunster.com (secondary)

Deanna Ali c/o Jessica Crane, Esq. Crane Law, P.A. 13555 Automobile Blvd., Ste 560 Clearwater, FL 33762 Email: Jessica@CraneLaw.com

Heather Emby c/o Jessica Crane, Esq. Crane Law, P.A. 13555 Automobile Blvd., Ste 560 Clearwater, FL 33762 Email: Jessica@CraneLaw.com Deanna Ali c/o Kwall Barack Nadeau PLLC 304 S. Belcher Rd. Ste C Clearwater, FL 33765 Email: <u>rbarack@employeerights.com</u> <u>mnadeau@employeerights.com</u> <u>Jackie@employeerights.com</u>

Heather Emby c/o Kwall Barack Nadeau PLLC 304 S. Belcher Rd. Ste C Clearwater, FL 33765 Email: <u>rbarack@employeerights.com</u> <u>mnadeau@employeerights.com</u> <u>Jackie@employeerights.com</u>

Texas Capital Bank, N.A. c/o Trenam Kemker 101 E. Kennedy Blvd., Ste 2700 Tampa, FL 33602 Primary Email: slieb@trenam.com Secondary Email: mmosbach@trenam.com Tertiary Email: dmedina@trenam.com

DBF-LSI, LLC c/o Michael C. Markham, Esq. 401 E. Jackson Street, Suite 3100 Tampa, Florida 33602 Email: <u>mikem@jpfirm.com</u>; <u>minervag@jpfirm.com</u>

Shirley and John Langston c/o Donald J. Schutz, Esq. 535 Central Avenue St. Petersburg, Florida 33701 Email: <u>donschutz@netscape.net</u>; <u>don@lawus.com</u>

Jared W. Headley c/o Cameron M. Kennedy, Esq. Searcy Denney Scarola, et al 517 North Calhoun Street Tallahassee, Florida 32301 Email: <u>kennedyteam@searcylaw.com</u>; <u>cmk@searcylaw.com</u> Deanna E. Ali c/o Brandon J. Hill, Esq. Wenzel Fenton Cabassa P.A. 1110 N. Florida Avenue, Suite 300 Tampa, Florida 33602 Email: bhill@wfclaw.com; twells@wfclaw.com

MedPro Group c/o Jeffery Warren, Esq. and Adam Alpert, Esq. Bush Ross, P.A. P.O. Box 3913 Tampa, FL 33601-3913 Email: jwarren@bushross.com; aalpert@bushross.com; mlinares@bushross.com; ksprehn@bushross.com

Cosgrove Enterprises, Inc. c/o Walters Levine Lozano & Degrave 601 Bayshore Blvd., Ste 720 Tampa, Florida 33606 Email: <u>hdegrave@walterslevine.com</u>; <u>jduncan@walterslevine.com</u>

Holland & Knight, LLP c/o W. Keith Fendrick, Esq. Post Office Box 1288 Tampa, Florida 33601-1288 Email: <u>keith.fendrick@hklaw.com</u>; <u>andrea.olson@hklaw.com</u>

Kenneth Winkler c/o William E. Hahn, Esq. 310 S. Fielding Ave. Tampa, FL 33606 Email: bill@whahn-law.com; Kelly@whahn-law.com

Ray Monteleone c/o Hill, Ward & Henderson, P.A. 101 East Kennedy Boulevard Bank of America Plaza, Suite 3700 Tampa, Florida 33601-2231 dennis.waggoner@hwhlaw.com; julie.mcdaniel@hwhlaw.com; patrick.mosley@hwhlaw.com; tricia.elam@hwhlaw.com; ghill@hwhlaw.com; jessica.simpson@hwhlaw.com

William Horne and WH, LLC c/o Hill, Ward & Henderson, P.A. 101 East Kennedy Boulevard Bank of America Plaza, Suite 3700 Tampa, Florida 33601-2231 dennis.waggoner@hwhlaw.com; julie.mcdaniel@hwhlaw.com; patrick.mosley@hwhlaw.com; tricia.elam@hwhlaw.com; ghill@hwhlaw.com; jessica.simpson@hwhlaw.com

Robert Kimble, Administrator and Personal Rep of Estate of Sharon Kimble c/o Luis Martinez – Monfort 400 North Ashely Drive, Suite 1100 Tampa Florida 33602 Primary Email: lmmonfort@gbmmlaw.com; litigation@gbmmlaw.com

Weiss Family Management, LLLP c/o V. Stephen Cohen, Esq. 100 North Tampa Street, Suite 1900 Tampa, FL 33602 Primary: scohen@bajocuva.com; <u>lheckman@bajocuva.com</u>

Michael C. Weiss, D.O. Independent Orthopedics, P.A., c/o Weiss Family Management, LLLP 3948 Third Street South, STE 36 Jacksonville, Fl 32250 Cell: (954) 494-7995 Cell: (954) 328-9441 Email: <u>spinedoc@me.com</u>; partyplans2@aol.com Robert P. Grammen William P. Esping James S. St. Louis, D.O. Michael W. Perry M.D., MMPerry Holdings, LLLC EFO Holdings, L.P., EFO Genpar, Inc. EFO Laser Spine Institute, Ltd. BERGER SINGERMAN LLP 350 East Las Olas Boulevard, Suite 1000 Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33301 Email drt@bergersingerman.com; jwertman@bergersingerman.com; guso@bergersingerman.com; fsellers@bergersingerman.com

Cystal and Leonard Tinelli c/o Donald J. Schutz, Esq. 535 Central Avenue St. Petersburg, Florida 33701 Email: <u>donschutz@netscape.net</u>; <u>don@lawus.com</u>

Dr. James St. Louis c/o Herbert Donica, Esq. Donica Law Firm, P.A. 307 South Boulevard, Suite D Tampa, FL 33606 Email: <u>herb@donicalaw.com</u>

Jonathan Lewis c/o Peter A. Siddiqui, Esq. Katten Muchin Rosenman 525 West Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60661-3693 Email: peter.siddiqui@kattenlaw.com

Robert P. Grammen William P. Esping Michael W. Perry, M.D. MMPerry Holdings, LLLC EFO Holdings, L.P. EFO Genpar, Inc. EFO Laser Spine Institute, Ltd. c/o Samuel J. Capuano BERGER SINGERMAN LLP 1450 Brickell Avenue, Suite 1900 Miami, FL 33131 Email: Primary: <u>drt@bergersingerman.com;</u> <u>scapuano@bergersingerman.com;</u> <u>fsellers@bergersingerman.com</u>

Robert P. Grammen William P. Esping Michael W. Perry, M.D MMPerry Holdings, LLLP EFO Holdings, L.P., EFO Genpar, Inc. EFO Laser Spine Institute, Ltd. c/o/ Kenneth W. Waterway BERGER SINGERMAN LLP 350 East Las Olas Blvd., Suite 1000 Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301 Email: kwaterway@bergersingerman.com

Filing # 173347573 E-Filed 05/17/2023 11:45:09 AM

Laser Spine Institute, LLC CLM Aviation, LLC LSI HoldCo, LLC LSI Management Company, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cincinnati, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC Medical Care Management Services, LLC Spine DME Solutions, LLC Total Spine Care, LLC Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC

Assignors,

to

Soneet Kapila,

Assignee.

Case No. 2019-CA-2762 Case No. 2019-CA-2764 Case No. 2019-CA-2765 Case No. 2019-CA-2766 Case No. 2019-CA-2767 Case No. 2019-CA-2768 Case No. 2019-CA-2769 Case No. 2019-CA-2770 Case No. 2019-CA-2771 Case No. 2019-CA-2772 Case No. 2019-CA-2773 Case No. 2019-CA-2774 Case No. 2019-CA-2775 Case No. 2019-CA-2776 Case No. 2019-CA-2777 Case No. 2019-CA-2780

Consolidated Case No. 2019-CA-2762

Division L

EXHIBIT A

EIGHTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A. FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL FOR ASSIGNEE FOR THE PERIOD OF AUGUST 1, 2022, THROUGH APRIL 30, 2023

Client Name: Kapila-Laser Spine Matter Caption: Kapila-Laser Spine

Date	Initials	Description		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	
Activity Co	de Category:	Case Administration				
08/01/2022	SAS	Dictated email to Fernandez regarding cash c estimated monthly and annual expenses; revi from Fernandez		0.20	\$460.00	
08/03/2022	EJP	Calls and work on employment applications		1.00	\$450.00	
08/04/2022	EJP	Work on motion to expand engagement		0.50	\$450.00	
08/08/2022	SAS	Review of email from Lamb regarding status of compromise order	of approval of	0.10	\$460.00	
08/08/2022	SAS	Review of email from Schutz as to Langston a compromise order; dictated response; and ex emails with Schutz		0.20	\$460.00	
08/08/2022	SAS	Review of notice cancelling hearing		0.10	\$460.00	
08/08/2022	SJ	Review Lile engagement letter, draft motion to forwarding to Edward Peterson	employ and	0.40	\$200.00	
08/09/2022	SAS	Review of email from Schutz enclosing revision compromise order; telephone conference with regarding revisions to order; dictated revisions email to counsel enclosing revised draft of order	i Schutz s; and dictated	0.70	\$460.00	
08/09/2022	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy, Gerber, Schutz approving form of revised order; dictated resp		0.30	\$460.00	
08/09/2022	SAS	Review of email from Gerber regarding state dictated response; and further exchange of er		0.20	\$460.00	
08/09/2022	SAS	Telephone conference with Gerber regarding litigation matters and compromise order	state court	0.30	\$460.00	
08/10/2022	SAS	Review of email from Gerber regarding Langs claims issues	ton and Tine ll i	0.20	\$460.00	
08/10/2022	SAS	Review of email from McCoy enclosing Kapila KapilaMukamal invoices; review of email to E Peterson; and dictated response		0.20	\$460.00	
08/10/2022	SAS	Exchange of emails with Kapila regarding filin applications; dictated email to Fenstermacher review of responses; and dictated follow-up e	and Bachman;	0.40	\$460.00	
08/10/2022	SAS	Finalized order granting Tinelli and Langston dictated cover letter to chambers enclosing pr		0.20	\$460.00	
08/11/2022	SAS	Dictated draft of Kapila and KapilaMukamal fe	e applications	0.50	\$460.00	
08/11/2022	SAS	Review of order granting Tinelli and Langston motion; dictated email to Lamb and McLaughl order; and review of emails from Lamb and M	in enclosing	0.20	\$460.00	
08/11/2022	SJ	Emails, work on motion to expand scope of er forwarding to Edward Peterson	mployment and	0.90	\$200.00	
08/12/2022	EJP	Work on motion to expand engagement; ema correspondence regarding fee application	il	1.50	\$450.00	
08/12/2022	SAS	Begin drafting Stichter Riedel fee application; emails with Edward Peterson	exchange of	1.70	\$460.00	
08/12/2022	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing KapilaMukamal and Kapila fee application; re from Kapila and McCoy; and dictated revision application	view of emails	0.30	\$460.00	
08/15/2022	EJP	Work on response to subpoena		0.50	\$450.00	
08/15/2022	SAS	Finalized Kapila and KapilaMukamal fee appli filing with court	cations for	0.30	\$460.00	
08/15/2022	SJ	Emails, organize exhibits to employment moti	on	0.20	\$200.00	
08/16/2022	EJP	Work on subpoena response and motion to ea	xpand services	1.00	\$450.00	
Stichter, Rie	del, Blain & Po	stler, P.A. R	eport ID: 100034	5/16/2023 1:26 PM		Page 1 of 20

		Time by Activity Code Caley	01165	
08/16/2022	SJ	Work on Rocke/McLean expansion of employment motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson; download and review CT Service of Process	0.90	\$200.00
08/17/2022	EJP	Work on motion to expand engagement	0.30	\$450.00
08/17/2022	HER	Review of draft motion to expand engagement	0.20	\$550.00
08/18/2022	EJP	Work on motion to expand engagement	0.50	\$450.00
08/18/2022	HER	Continued work on fee applications; brief conference with Scott Stichter regarding same	0.50	\$550.00
08/18/2022	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding fee applications	0.20	\$460.00
08/19/2022	HER	Review of emails regarding engagement letter and attachments and revisions	0.20	\$550.00
08/19/2022	SAS	Finalized Stichter Riedel fee application for filing with court	2.10	\$460.00
08/22/2022	SAS	Review of District Court order abating WARN Act litigation; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing and discussing order	0.30	\$460.00
08/23/2022	SAS	Exchange of emails with Cabassa and Barack regarding WARN Act issues; follow-up call with Cabassa	0.40	\$460.00
08/23/2022	SJ	Work on motion to expand scope of employment, emails	0.30	\$200.00
08/24/2022	EJP	Work on motion to expand engagement	0.50	\$450.00
08/24/2022	SJ	Review CT Invoices for statutory representation and forwarding to KapilaMukamal	0.40	\$200.00
08/29/2022		Dictated email to Kapila regarding call with Cabassa; exchange of emails with Kapila regarding same	0.40	\$460.00
08/29/2022	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same	0.20	\$200.00
08/30/2022	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding State of Ohio collection letter; dictated response	0.20	\$460.00
08/31/2022	DRF	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding WARN Act issues; telephone call with Scott Stichter, Soneet Kapila and K. McCoy regarding same	0.50	\$400.00
08/31/2022	SAS	Review of files in preparation for call with client; conference with Dan Fogarty regarding issues to discuss during call; and telephone conference with Kapila, Dan Fogarty, and McCoy regarding WARN Act issues	0.60	\$460.00
08/31/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa regarding WARN Act issues; dictated response; and review of email from Cabassa	0.20	\$460.00
08/31/2022	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of process, review and download	0.20	\$200.00
09/01/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa regarding WARN Act issues; dictated response; telephone conference with Cabassa; dictated email to Kapila regarding call with Cabassa; and review of email from Kapila	0.50	\$460.00
09/05/2022	SAS	Dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat regarding need to respond to Ohio Department of Treasury	0.10	\$460.00
09/06/2022	SAS	Exchange of emails with Susan Jeffcoat regarding letter to be sent to Ohio Department of Taxation; review of letter; and conference with Susan Jeffcoat	0.20	\$460.00
09/06/2022	SJ	Exchange of emails and conference with Scott Stichter regarding Ohio Department of Taxation	0.20	\$200.00
09/07/2022	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat to McCoy and Kapila regarding Ohio Department of Taxation	0.10	\$460.00
09/09/2022	SJ	Emails, review file regarding Steris notice and claim, forwarding of COS to Edward Peterson	0.20	\$200.00
09/11/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa regarding WARN Act issues; dictated response	0.10	\$460.00
09/12/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa regarding WARN Act issues; dictated response	0.10	\$460.00
09/12/2022	SAS	Exchange of emails regarding Laser Spine fee application	0.60	\$460.00
Stichter, Ried	del, Blain & Pos	Stler, P.A. Report ID: 100034	5/16/2023 1:26 PM	

		orders; dictated orders on Kapila, KapilaMukamal, and Stichter Riedel fee applications; and dictated email to Kapila		
09/13/2022	DRF	and McCoy enclosing drafts of orders Conference with Scott Stichter regarding calls with Kapila	0.20	\$400.00
09/13/2022	SAS	and Cabassa regarding WARN Act issues Telephone conference with Kapila regarding call with Cabassa; conference with Dan Fogarty regarding call with Kapila	0.20	\$460.00
09/13/2022	SAS	Telephone conference with Cabassa regarding WARN Act issues; conference with Dan Fogarty regarding call with Cabassa	0.20	\$460.00
09/13/2022	SAS	Review of email from McCoy approving terms of fee orders; dictated letter to court submitting fee orders	0.20	\$460.00
09/14/2022	SAS	Review of emails regarding scheduled hearing on September 15; conferences regarding same	0.10	\$460.00
09/14/2022	SJ	Review CT Service of Process and download same; review file and forwarding of Lile employment motion to Edward Peterson	0.30	\$200.00
09/15/2022	SAS	Review of fee orders; dictated email to McCoy and Kapila enclosing fee orders; and review of email from Kapila	0.20	\$460.00
09/15/2022	SAS	Review of notice cancelling hearing	0.10	\$460.00
09/16/2022	EJP	Work on motion to employ	0.50	\$450.00
09/16/2022	SJ	Work on Lile employment and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.40	\$200.00
09/17/2022	EJP	Work on Lile employment application	0.50	\$450.00
09/19/2022	EJP	Calls with Jon Sbar and work on motion to employ Lile	1.00	\$450.00
09/19/2022	SAS	Review of correspondence to creditors regarding medical records subpoena	0.20	\$460.00
09/19/2022	SJ	Receipt and download CT Service of process, draft subpoena response letters and forwarding to Scott Stichter; work on Lile employment and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.70	\$200.00
09/20/2022	EJP	Work on motion to approve expanded engagement and calls with creditors	1.50	\$450.00
09/20/2022	SJ	Finalize subpoena response letters and mail	0.30	\$200.00
09/21/2022	EJP	Work on motion to expand scope of employment	1.00	\$450.00
09/21/2022	SAS	Exchange of emails with Cabassa regarding WARN Act issues; telephone conference with Cabassa regarding same	0.20	\$460.00
09/21/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa; dictated response; telephone conference with Kapila; and follow-up email to Cabassa	0.20	\$460.00
09/21/2022	SJ	Emails, work on motion to expand employment, finalize, file and serve same	0.90	\$200.00
09/22/2022	SAS	Review of motion to expand scope of retention of Genovese Joblove and Rocke McLean	0.20	\$460.00
09/26/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa enclosing WARN Act plaintiff's counter-offer; dictated email to Kapila; and review of email from Kapila	0.20	\$460.00
09/28/2022	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila regarding WARN Act negotiation	0.10	\$460.00
10/05/2022	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila regarding WARN Act issues; review of email from Kapila; and dictated response	0.20	\$460.00
10/05/2022	SAS	Review of correspondence from Ohio Department of Taxation	0.10	\$460.00
10/05/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa regarding WARN Act settlement discussions; dictated response; review of reply from Cabassa; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy; and exchange of emails with Kapila	0.30	\$460.00
10/05/2022	SJ	Receipt and download CT service of process and circulate	0.20	\$200.00
Stichter, Rie	del, Blain & Po	stler, P.A. Report ID: 100034	5/16/2023 1:26 PM	

		same			
10/07/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa regarding W settlement negotiations; dictated response	ARN Act	0.20	\$460.00
10/10/2022	SJ	Emails, revise Lile employment motion and Edward Peterson	forwarding to	0.20	\$200.00
10/11/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa regarding W settlement discussions; dictated response; email from Cabassa		0.20	\$460.00
10/11/2022	SAS	Telephone conference with Cabassa regard settlement discussions	ing WARN Act	0.20	\$460.00
10/13/2022	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding WAF negotiations	RN Act	0.10	\$460.00
10/13/2022	SAS	Review of notice of cancellation of hearing		0.10	\$460.00
10/13/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding WA settlement issues; dictated email to Kapila of forwarding emails received from Cabassa a	discussing and	0.40	\$460.00
10/13/2022	SJ	Receipt and download CT Service of Proce same	ss and circulate	0.30	\$200.00
10/17/2022	SJ	Finalize, file and serve motion to employ Lil	e	0.50	\$200.00
10/18/2022	SJ	Receipt and download CT Service of Proce same	ss and circulate	0.20	\$200.00
10/19/2022	SAS	Review of Notice of Voluntary Dismissal file state court litigation	d in Langston	0.20	\$460.00
10/19/2022	SAS	Review of discovery propounded by State c conference with Schutz's office regarding s		0.30	\$460.00
10/20/2022	SAS	Review of email from Cabassa regarding W discussions; dictated response	ARN Act	0.20	\$460.00
10/26/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding WA dictated email to Kapila forwarding Barack's exchange of emails with Kapila		0.30	\$460.00
10/31/2022	DRF	Emails regarding		0.20	\$400.00
10/31/2022	HER	Emails with Texas Capital bank counsel, SF Soneet Kapila regarding Don Schutz issues conference with Scott A. Stichter regarding	; brief	0.70	\$550.00
10/31/2022	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding D	on Schutz issues	0.20	\$460.00
11/01/2022	HER	Communications with co-counsel regarding question; research of files and location and transcript, follow-up		0.80	\$550.00
11/01/2022	SJ	Emails, review file, and forwarding of plead Peterson	ings to Edward	0.40	\$200.00
11/02/2022	EJP	Work on motion to compel		1.50	\$450.00
11/02/2022	HER	Review of email from Scott Stichter regarding	ng	0.10	\$550.00
11/02/2022	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel to Kapi with Gerber; review of response from Kapila response; and exchange of emails with Kap	a; dictated	0.40	\$460.00
11/03/2022	EJP	Work on motion to compel		0.50	\$450.00
11/03/2022	SJ	Work on motion to compel insurance and for Edward Peterson	prwarding to	0.20	\$200.00
11/04/2022	HER	Email to Edward Peterson regarding propose Compel Turnover	sed Motion to	0.10	\$550.00
11/04/2022	SJ	Work on motion to compel		0.20	\$200.00
11/07/2022	EJP	Continued work on motion to compel		0.50	\$450.00
11/08/2022	EJP	Calls with creditors		0.50	\$450.00
11/09/2022	EJP	Work on issues involving second second conference with Harley Riedel	including	1.00	\$450.00
11/09/2022	HER	Review and analysis of issues related to		2.00	\$550.00
Stichter, Rie	del, Blain & Pos	stler, P.A.	Report ID: 100034	5/16/2023 1:26 PM	

			and			
		communications with Edward J. Peterson				
11/10/2022	EJP	Emails regarding	and emails w	vith	1.00	\$450.00
11/10/2022	HER	Review of draft Edward J. Peterson email to Mr. Peterson	to client and	reply	0.30	\$550.00
11/10/2022	SJ	Emails, review file regarding second forwarding to Edward Peterson and Robe	and rt Rocke		0.20	\$200.00
11/11/2022	EJP	Conference with Harley Riedel on various	issues		0.50	\$450.00
11/11/2022	HER	Conference with Edward Peterson regard matters	ing pending		0.50	\$550.00
11/12/2022	EJP	Review of opinion of Texas court			0.50	\$450.00
11/13/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding W dictated response	ARN Act issu	es;	0.20	\$460.00
11/16/2022	SAS	Exchange of emails with court reporter	garding scheo	luled	0.20	\$460.00
11/18/2022	SJ	Download and save CT service of proces	S		0.20	\$200.00
11/21/2022	EJP	Review of correspondence			0.30	\$450.00
11/22/2022	SJ	Receipt and download CT Service of Proc	cess		0.20	\$200.00
11/29/2022	EJP	Calls with Jon Sbar			0.50	\$450.00
11/30/2022	SAS	Exchange of emails from Cabassa regard issues	ing WARN Ac	t	0.20	\$460.00
11/30/2022	SAS	Review of email from Schutz regarding cr issues; dictated response; and review of f from Schutz			0.30	\$460.00
12/02/2022	SJ	Review of CT invoices, organize and forw KapilaMukamal	arding to		0.30	\$200.00
12/05/2022	SAS	Telephone conference with Cabassa rega issues; dictated email to Kapila regarding			0.20	\$460.00
12/05/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack accepting se dictated email to McCoy and Kapila; telep with McCoy; and telephone conference w	hone confere		0.40	\$460.00
12/06/2022	SAS	Dictated email to Rocke and Battista rega WARN Act issues	rding settling		0.10	\$460.00
12/06/2022	SAS	Review of emails from Barack regarding V settlement; exchange of emails with Barac conference with Barack		one	0.40	\$460.00
12/10/2022	EJP	Prepare for hearings			0.50	\$450.00
12/11/2022	EJP	Prepare for hearing			0.50	\$450.00
12/12/2022	EJP	Prepare for and attend hearing			1.00	\$450.00
12/12/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack enclosing se agreement and pleadings to be filed with exchange of emails with Barack			0.20	\$460.00
12/13/2022	DRF	Conference with Scott A. Stichter regardir settlement documentation	ig WARN Act		0.10	\$400.00
12/13/2022	EJP	Work on orders			0.50	\$450.00
12/13/2022	SAS	Dictated email to McCoy and Kapila regar with settlement documents; dictated email of email from Kapila enclosing comments agreement; dictated extensive revisions to agreement; dictated email to McCoy and revised draft of email to Barack and Caba revised draft of agreed settlement agreem email from Kapila; and dictated response; Daniel Fogarty regarding same	I to Barack; re on settlement settlement Kapila enclosi ssa enclosing nent; review of	eview t ing	2.20	\$460.00
12/13/2022	SAS	Review of order expanding scope of Gene	ovese Joblove	e and	0.20	\$460.00
Stichter, Rie	del, Blain & Po	stler, P.A.	Report ID:	100034	5/16/2023 1:26 PM	

		Rocke McLean's employment			
12/14/2022	DRF	Review WARN Act settlement agreement draft		0.20	\$400.00
12/14/2022	HER	Telephone conference		0.10	\$550.00
12/14/2022	SAS	Begin drafting revisions to joint motion to approve to be filed in District Court	e settlement	1.40	\$460.00
12/14/2022	SAS	Review of email from court reporter regarding LS dictated response	I hearing;	0.10	\$460.00
12/14/2022	SAS	Review of email from Kapila approving revisions settlement agreement; dictated email to Barack e revisions to settlement agreement; and exchange with Barack	enclosing	0.20	\$460.00
12/15/2022	DRF	Conference with Scott A. Stichter regarding WAR issues	N Act	0.20	\$400.00
12/15/2022	SAS	Dictated further revisions to joint motion to be file court and revisions to motion to be filed in state of dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing rev review of emails from Kapila and McCoy; confere Dan Fogarty regarding litigation issues; telephone conference with Kapila regarding litigation issues email to Barack and Cabassa enclosing revisions motion and discussing open issues; and exchang with Barack	court; vised draft; ence with e s; dictated s to joint	2.40	\$460.00
12/15/2022	SAS	Review of email from McCoy enclosing employee information	9	0.10	\$460.00
12/15/2022	SAS	Review of order expanding scope of representation Genovese Joblove and Rocke McLean	on of	0.10	\$460.00
12/16/2022	SAS	Review of docket in preparation for call with Bara telephone conference with Barack regarding settl issues		0.50	\$460.00
12/16/2022	SAS	Review and revision of notice to be sent to class dictated email to Barack enclosing revised notice		0.40	\$460.00
12/20/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack enclosing revisions documents; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy f documents; review of changes; dictated email to McCoy discussing changes; review of emails fror and Kapila; and dictated response	forwarding Kapila and	0.80	\$460.00
12/20/2022	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila and McCoy regarding ou call with Barack discussing WARN Act settlement review of email from Kapila		0.30	\$460.00
12/20/2022	SAS	Dictated email to Barack regarding finalizing settl documents; review of response; and exchange of emails		0.20	\$460.00
12/21/2022	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding settlemer review of settlement agreement; and dictated res		0.30	\$460.00
12/23/2022	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and	save	0.20	\$200.00
12/27/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding revisions settlement documents; dictated response; and re follow-up email		0.20	\$460.00
12/28/2022	SAS	Dictated further revisions to settlement agreemer compromise motion to be filed with district court a compromise motion to be filed with state court; di email to McCoy and Kapila; dictated email to Cat Barack enclosing revised documents; review of e Barack enclosing additional documents; and dicta to Barack	and ictated bassa and email from	1.60	\$460.00
12/28/2022	SAS	Review of emails approving revisions; exchange with Barack regarding execution pages; and dicta to Kapila enclosing execution pages		0.30	\$460.00
12/28/2022	SJ	Emails, review file, draft Lile first fee application a forwarding to Edward Peterson	and	0.40	\$200.00
Stichter, Rie	del, Blain & Pos	stler, P.A. Repo	rt ID: 100034 5/	16/2023 1:26 PM	

		Time by Activity	Code Cate	gories		
12/29/2022	SAS	Review of email from Kapila's office enclopage; dictated email to Barack enclosing page			0.20	\$460.00
12/29/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack enclosing d review of report; and dictated response	raft of status report	t;	0.30	\$460.00
12/29/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack enclosing E page; dictated email to Kapila regarding			0.20	\$460.00
12/30/2022	SAS	Review of email from Barack's office rega			0.20	\$460.00
12/30/2022	SAS	Review of filed status report			0.10	\$460.00
01/03/2023	SAS	Review of correspondence regarding dor email to McCoy and Kapila; and review of McCoy and Kapila		d	0.30	\$460.00
01/04/2023	SAS	Preparation of fully executed settlement a of email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing s agreement			0.20	\$460.00
01/04/2023	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding resettlement agreement to include cost nur to Kapila and McCoy		il	0.20	\$460.00
01/04/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Barack regarding status pleadings; review of email from Barack; r enclosing worksheets; and dictated email McCoy forwarding worksheets	eview of emails		0.40	\$460.00
01/05/2023	SAS	Review of email enclosing fully executed agreement; dictated email to Kapila and document; and exchange of emails with	McCoy forwarding		0.30	\$460.00
01/09/2023	SAS	Review of email from Barack enclosing repleadings, dictated response; and preparestellement agreement			0.50	\$460.00
01/09/2023	SAS	Review of motion filed in District Court; d Kapila and McCoy enclosing filed pleadir			0.30	\$460.00
01/10/2023	HER	Review of emails between Jennifer Altma Stichter regarding WARN Act settlement	an and Scott		0.10	\$550.00
01/10/2023	SAS	Dictated final revisions to WARN Act con finalized pleadings for filing with state co email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing file	urt; and dictated		0.40	\$460.00
01/10/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel forwa Altman; dictated response; dictated email of email from Altman; and dictated respo	I to Altman; review		0.50	\$460.00
01/11/2023	HER	Review of electronic correspondence reg settlement	arding WARN Act		0.20	\$550.00
01/11/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila and McCoy forw exchange with Altman; review of email fro dictated response			0.20	\$460.00
01/11/2023	SAS	Review of emails from parties regarding hearings; dictated response; review of er selecting hearing dates; review of notice dictated email to parties regarding date f	nails from parties of hearing; and	t	0.60	\$460.00
01/12/2023	HER	Review of emails between Scott Stichter Altman regarding WARN Act claims	and Jennifer		0.20	\$550.00
01/12/2023	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding V dictated response; review of email from F WARN Act issues; dictated response			0.40	\$460.00
01/12/2023	SAS	Review of email from Shinaberry regarding to website	ng uploading motio	n	0.10	\$460.00
01/19/2023	SJ	Draft subpoena response letters and forv Stichter, finalize and mail letters	varding to Scott		0.80	\$200.00
01/20/2023	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat reg status of certain corporations; review of e Jeffcoat; and review of follow-up email fro	email from Susan		0.20	\$460.00
Stichter, Rie	del, Blain & Pos	tler, P.A.	Report ID: 1000	34 5/1	6/2023 1:26 PM	

		Time by Activity Lode Lategories		
01/20/2023	SAS	Review of follow-up emails from Susan Jeffcoat and Kapila regarding corporate status; dictated response	0.20	\$460.00
01/23/2023	SAS	Review of email from Ray regarding WARN Act issues; dictated response	0.10	\$460.00
01/24/2023	SAS	Review of further emails from Ray regarding litigation issues; dictated response; and review of email from Ray	0.20	\$460.00
01/24/2023	SJ	Emails regarding reinstatement of LSI on sunbiz, review records on sunbiz	0.20	\$200.00
01/25/2023	HER	Brief conference with Scott Stichter and review of emails regarding WARN Act	0.30	\$550.00
01/25/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with McCoy regarding WARN Act litigation issues; conference with Harley Riedel regarding same	0.20	\$460.00
01/25/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Ray regarding WARN Act issues; dictated email to Ray enclosing requested pleadings	0.60	\$460.00
01/25/2023	SAS	Review of email from Ray regarding litigation issues; dictated response; and further exchange of emails	0.20	\$460.00
01/26/2023	HER	Review of email from Scott Stichter regarding WARN Act settlement and his call with Hugh Ray last night: review of follow-up emails regarding same and District Court approval process	0.40	\$550.00
01/26/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila and McCoy discussing outcome of call with Ray; review of email from Kapila; review of District Court docket; dictated email to Barack and Cabassa regarding status of obtaining preliminary approval from District Court; and dictated email to Kapila and McCoy regarding District Court issues	0.70	\$460.00
01/27/2023	SJ	Receipt and review CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20	\$200.00
01/30/2023	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding District Court scheduling issues; dictated response discussing call with Ray; review of notice regarding unclaimed claimed property in Missouri; dictated email to McCoy and Kapila; and review of email from McCoy	0.50	\$460.00
01/31/2023	HER	Receipt and review of electronic correspondence regarding entity issue	0.10	\$550.00
01/31/2023	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding entities that are inactive in CT's records; dictated email to Kapila; review of email from Kapila; dictated response; and dictated email to counsel regarding reviewing corporations	0.60	\$460.00
01/31/2023	SJ	Work on Lile fee application and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.40	\$200.00
02/07/2023	HER	Conference with Scott A. Stichter regarding Conference with Scott A. Stichter regarding review of his email to client regarding same	0.50	\$550.00
02/07/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke	2.20	\$460.00
02/13/2023	SJ	Download CT Service of Process for medical records	0.10	\$200.00
02/22/2023	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and review	0.20	\$200.00
02/27/2023	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding today's hearing; dictated response	0.20	\$460.00
02/27/2023	SAS	Preparation for hearing; telephone conference with Kapila regarding today's hearing	1.20	\$460.00
02/27/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila enclosing outline for argument at today's hearing; review of follow-up emails from Kapila; and dictated response	0.30	\$460.00
041-1-4 Die -	dal Blain 9 Dag	Her DA Boport ID: 100034 5/	6/2022 1.26 DM	

5/16/2023 1:26 PM

			Code Calegories)	
02/27/2023	SAS	Continued preparation for today's hearing;	attended hearing	0.90	\$460.00
02/28/2023	SAS	Dictated draft of order granting WARN Act dictated email to parties appearing at hear of order	settlement; ing enclosing draft	0.90	\$460.00
02/28/2023	SAS	Review of emails from parties approving for	orm of order	0.30	\$460.00
03/01/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with former patient records	regarding patient	0.20	\$460.00
03/01/2023	SAS	Dictated letter to court submitting order appetitement	proving WARN Act	0.30	\$460.00
03/02/2023	SAS	Follow-up call with former patient regarding conference with Susan Jeffcoat	g medical records;	0.30	\$460.00
03/03/2023	SAS	Follow-up call with former patient regarding medical records; dictated email State of FI medical records request		0.30	\$460.00
03/03/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Jusevitch regarding requ patient for records	est from former	0.10	\$460.00
03/03/2023	SJ	Receive and review of CT service of proce save	ss, download and	0.20	\$200.00
03/08/2023	HER	Review of Order Granting Motion for Settle Act Claimants	ement with WARN	0.10	\$550.00
03/08/2023	SAS	Review of order granting WARN Act comp dictated email to Kapila; and review of ema uploading order to website; and dictated en regarding District Court approval issues	ails regarding	0.40	\$460.00
03/10/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with creditor regard assignment cases; review of follow-up ema and dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat		0.30	\$460.00
03/10/2023	SAS	Review of District Court Order conditional WARN Act settlement; dictated email to Ka order and discussing open issues		0.40	\$460.00
03/11/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat regarding creditor lists	amending	0.10	\$460.00
03/13/2023	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding W/ dictated response	ARN Act issues;	0.20	\$460.00
03/13/2023	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regar issues	ding claims	0.10	\$460.00
03/13/2023	SAS	Review of notice of hearing in state court li email from Kapila; dictated response; and from Kapila		0.30	\$460.00
03/13/2023	SAS	Review of email from District Court regardi fairness hearing before magistrate judge; of Barack and Cabassa; review of email from response; and review of emails between B chambers	dictated email to Barack; dictated	0.50	\$460.00
03/13/2023	SJ	Emails, review file and change patient add	ress on matrix	0.20	\$200.00
03/14/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding out court hearing; review of follow-up emails	come of state	0.20	\$460.00
03/14/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Barack and chamber scheduling fairness hearing on WARN Act		0.20	\$460.00
03/15/2023	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy and Battista analysis	regarding claims	0.20	\$460.00
03/15/2023	SAS	Review of email from District Court regarding hearing dates for fairness hearing; dictated review of email from Barack; dictated ema exchange of emails with Barack and Kapila	d email to Barack; il to Kapila; and	0.60	\$460.00
03/16/2023	SAS	Review of additional emails from chambers scheduling fairness hearing		0.20	\$460.00
03/20/2023	SAS	Exchange of emails with Rocke regarding further review of	in	0.50	\$460.00
Stichter, Rie	del, Blain & Pos	stler, P.A.	Report ID: 100034 5/	16/2023 1:26 PM	

Stichter, Riedel, Blain & Postler, P.A.

Report ID: 100034

03/20/2023	SAS	preparation for call; and telephone conference with Rocke Review of email from chambers regarding scheduling of fairness hearing; dictated email to Kapila; and exchange of	0.40	\$460.00
03/23/2023	SAS	emails with Kapila regarding hearing Dictated email to McCoy regarding creditor's change of address; review of email from McCoy	0.20	\$460.00
03/23/2023	SAS	Review of email from Barack requesting social security numbers be provided to settlement administrator; exchange of emails with McCoy; and dictated email to Barack	0.40	\$460.00
03/24/2023	SAS	Review of further emails from Jurgens and McCoy regarding formatting issues with providing information	0.20	\$460.00
03/24/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with settlement administrator regarding method to provide social security numbers; exchange of emails with McCoy; and further exchange of emails with McCoy and settlement administrator	0.40	\$460.00
03/26/2023	SAS	Review of email from Jurgens regarding issues with receiving records; review of email from McCoy	0.20	\$460.00
03/27/2023	SAS	Review of email from McCoy to Jurgens regarding uploading social security information; review of email from Jurgens acknowledging receipt	0.20	\$460.00
03/29/2023	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding Lile fee application; conference with Susan Jeffcoat; dictated email to Rocke; review of email from Rocke; and dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat	0.40	\$460.00
03/29/2023	SJ	Review and organize various CT invoices for statutory representation and forwarding to KapilaMukamal	0.60	\$200.00
03/30/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila and Susan Jeffcoat regarding CT invoices	0.10	\$460.00
03/30/2023	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding availability for fairness hearing; dictated email to Barack; review of email from chambers; and review of notice of hearing	0.30	\$460.00
03/30/2023	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding need to reschedule fairness hearing; dictated response; and dictated email to Kapila regarding proposed dates for rescheduled hearing	0.30	\$460.00
03/30/2023	SAS	Dictated fee application for Lile; finalized fee application for filing with Court	1.10	\$460.00
03/30/2023	SJ	Work on Lile fee notice, finalize and file same	0.20	\$200.00
03/31/2023	SAS	Review of email from Ray regarding Lile fee application; dictated email to Rocke; telephone conference with Rocke; and dictated email to Ray responding to his concerns with Lile fee application	0.70	\$460.00
03/31/2023	SAS	Review of email from Wischmeier regarding distribution issues; dictated response	0.20	\$460.00
03/31/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila regarding WARN Act issues; review of email to Kapila regarding same	0.20	\$460.00
03/31/2023	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding withholding taxes on distributions; dictated response	0.30	\$460.00
04/04/2023	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding notice to be sent to class; dictated revisions to notice; and dictated email to Barack enclosing revised notice and discussing open issues; and review of follow-up email from Barack	0.80	\$460.00
04/05/2023	SJ	Review medical records subpoenas, draft response letters and forwarding to Scott Stichter	0.70	\$200.00
04/06/2023	SJ	Finalize and mail out subpoena response letters	0.50	\$200.00
04/12/2023	HER	Receipt and review of emails regarding fee applications	0.10	\$550.00
04/12/2023	SAS	Exchange of emails with Kapila regarding filing of fee application	0.20	\$460.00
04/13/2023	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila and McCoy regarding Connecticut invoices; review of emails from McCoy and Kapila; and	0.50	\$460.00
Stighton Die	dal Dlain 9 Dag	Bonort ID: 100034 5/	6/2022 1:26 DM	

Report ID: 100034

ItigationItigation04/19/2023SJDownload CT service of process, draft subpoena response letters and forwarding o Scott Stichter0.40\$204/20/2023SASReview and execution of letter to creditors regarding assignment cases0.20\$404/21/2023DRFReceive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel E. Riedel; scott A. Stichter, R. Rocke, and T. Gerber1.00\$404/21/2023SJFinalize and mail out subpoena response letters0.20\$204/26/2023SASReview of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding Delaware annual taxes; review of follow-up emails from Kapila's office0.20\$404/26/2023SASReview of email from Rocke regarding Lile legal fees; dictated response0.20\$404/27/2023SASReview of email from creditor regarding distribution issues0.10\$404/27/2023SASReview of email from creditor regarding distribution issues0.10\$404/27/2023SASReview of status report filed with District Court; review of District Court notice of hearing0.30\$404/27/2023SASDictated email to Kapila regarding Lile fee application;1.20\$4						
Itigation04/19/2023SJDownload CT service of process, draft subpoena response letters and forwarding o Scott Stichter0.40\$204/20/2023SASReview and execution of letter to creditors regarding assignment cases0.20\$404/21/2023DRFReceive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel model; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel medel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel medel medel; receive and response letters0.20\$204/21/2023SJFinalize and mail out subpoena response letters0.20\$204/26/2023SASReview of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding Delaware annual taxes; review of follow-up emails from Kapila's office0.20\$404/26/2023SASReview of email from creditor regarding Lile legal fees; dictated response0.20\$404/27/2023SASReview of email from creditor regarding distribution issues0.10\$404/27/2023SASReview of status report filed with District Court; review of District Court notice of hearing0.30 </td <td>04/12/2022 545</td> <td>04/42/20</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td>0.10</td> <td>\$460.00</td>	04/12/2022 545	04/42/20			0.10	\$460.00
letters and forwarding o Scott Stichter04/20/2023SASReview and execution of letter to creditors regarding assignment cases0.20\$404/21/2023DRFReceive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel conference with Harley E. Riedel call with Harley E. Riedel E. Riedel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel call with Receive A. Receive of email from Cocke regarding Lile legal fees; dicta	04/13/2023 545	04/13/20			0.10	\$460.00
assignment cases04/21/2023DRFReceive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel1.00\$4Image: Conference with Harley E.Riedel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E.Riedel1.00\$4Image: Conference with Harley E.Riedel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E.Riedel1.00\$4Image: Conference with Harley E.Riedel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E.Riedel1.00\$404/21/2023SJFinalize and mail out subpoena response letters0.20\$204/26/2023SASReview of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding Delaware annual taxes; review of follow-up emails from Kapila's office0.20\$404/26/2023SASReview of email from Rocke regarding Lile legal fees; dictated response0.20\$404/27/2023SASReview of email from creditor regarding distribution issues0.10\$404/27/2023SASReview of status report filed with District Court; review of District Court notice of hearing0.30\$404/27/2023SASDictated email to Kapila regarding Lile fee application;1.20\$4	04/19/2023 SJ	04/19/20			0.40	\$200.00
conference with Harley E. Riedel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel call with Harley E. Riedel, Scott A. Stichter, R. Rocke, and T. Gerber04/21/2023SJFinalize and mail out subpoena response letters0.20\$204/26/2023SASReview of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding Delaware annual taxes; review of follow-up emails from Kapila's office0.20\$404/26/2023SASReview of email from Rocke regarding Lile legal fees; dictated response0.20\$404/27/2023SASReview of email from creditor regarding distribution issues0.10\$404/27/2023SASReview of status report filed with District Court; review of District Court notice of hearing0.30\$404/27/2023SASDictated email to Kapila regarding Lile fee application;1.20\$4	04/20/2023 SAS	04/20/20			0.20	\$460.00
04/26/2023SASReview of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding Delaware annual taxes; review of follow-up emails from Kapila's office0.20\$404/26/2023SASReview of email from Rocke regarding Lile legal fees; dictated response0.20\$404/27/2023SASReview of email from creditor regarding distribution issues0.10\$404/27/2023SASReview of status report filed with District Court; review of District Court notice of hearing0.30\$404/27/2023SASDictated email to Kapila regarding Lile fee application;1.20\$4	04/21/2023 DRF	04/21/20	Ri	conference with Harley E. liedel; receive and respond to emails with Harley E. Riedel call with Harley	1.00	\$400.00
annual taxes; review of follow-up emails from Kapila's office04/26/2023SASReview of email from Rocke regarding Lile legal fees; dictated response0.20\$404/27/2023SASReview of email from creditor regarding distribution issues0.10\$404/27/2023SASReview of status report filed with District Court; review of District Court notice of hearing0.30\$404/27/2023SASDictated email to Kapila regarding Lile fee application;1.20\$4	04/21/2023 SJ	04/21/20	023 SJ Fi	inalize and mail out subpoena response letters	0.20	\$200.00
dictated response04/27/2023SASReview of email from creditor regarding distribution issues0.10\$404/27/2023SASReview of status report filed with District Court; review of District Court notice of hearing0.30\$404/27/2023SASDictated email to Kapila regarding Lile fee application;1.20\$4	04/26/2023 SAS	04/26/20		5 5	0.20	\$460.00
04/27/2023SASReview of status report filed with District Court; review of District Court notice of hearing0.30\$404/27/2023SASDictated email to Kapila regarding Lile fee application;1.20\$4	04/26/2023 SAS	04/26/20			0.20	\$460.00
District Court notice of hearing04/27/2023 SASDictated email to Kapila regarding Lile fee application;1.20\$4	04/27/2023 SAS	04/27/20	023 SAS Re	eview of email from creditor regarding distribution issues	0.10	\$460.00
	04/27/2023 SAS	04/27/20			0.30	\$460.00
review of email from Kapila; dictated fee application order; and finalized fee application order for submission to Court	04/27/2023 SAS	04/27/20	re	eview of email from Kapila; dictated fee application order;	1.20	\$460.00
04/28/2023 SAS Review of District Court clerk's minutes from hearing 0.10 \$4	04/28/2023 SAS	04/28/20	023 SAS Re	eview of District Court clerk's minutes from hearing	0.10	\$460.00
04/28/2023 SAS Dictated email to creditor regarding status of distributions 0.10 \$4	04/28/2023 SAS	04/28/20	023 SAS Di	ictated email to creditor regarding status of distributions	0.10	\$460.00
04/28/2023 SAS Review of order granting Lile fees; dictated email to McCoy, 0.20 \$4 Kapila, and Rocke enclosing order; and review of email from McCoy	04/28/2023 SAS	04/28/20	Ka	apila, and Rocke enclosing order; and review of email from	0.20	\$460.00
04/28/2023SASReview of files in preparation for status conference;1.10\$4exchange of emails with Barack's office regarding status conference; attended status conference; and review of email from Kapila1.10\$4	04/28/2023 SAS	04/28/20	e» cc	xchange of emails with Barack's office regarding status onference; attended status conference; and review of email	1.10	\$460.00

Fee Summary

Name	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Stichter, Scott A.	62.40	\$460.00
Peterson, Edward J.	19.60	\$450.00
Jeffcoat, Susan	15.10	\$200.00
Riedel, Harley E.	7.50	\$550.00
Fogarty, Dan R.	2.40	\$400.00
Total for Case Administration	107.00	

	Time by Activity Code Calego	1162	
Activity Code Categor	y: Adv Proceedings/Litigation		
01/26/2022 HER	Work on litigation issues, including Constant of and communications with Soneet Kapila, Dan Fogarty, and Jennifer Altman; Constant of an and and and and and and and and and 	1.50	\$550.00
03/14/2022 HER	Receipt, review and responses to numerous (14) emails regarding litigation issues	0.70	\$550.00
03/15/2022 HER	Receipt and review of electronic correspondence	0.10	\$550.00
05/27/2022 HER	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding his call	0.10	\$550.00
08/01/2022 HER	Review and analysis of communication from mediator	0.60	\$550.00
08/01/2022 HER	Review of numerous emails regarding termination of counsel issues	0.30	\$550.00
08/03/2022 HER	follow-up conference call with co-counsel; electronic correspondence	1.50	\$550.00
08/05/2022 HER	Work on Example issues, including numerous emails, analysis of issues, telephone conference with Jonathan Sbar and Robert Rocke,	1.70	\$550.00
08/08/2022 HER	Continued work on Example issues, including; drafting of and related electronic	1.00	\$550.00
08/09/2022 HER	correspondence Numerous communications with legal team regarding	0.80	\$550.00
08/12/2022 HER	communications	1.00	\$550.00
08/15/2022 HER	Review and finalize Contraction regarding Contraction review and analysis of emails from Contraction review email from Bob Rocke regarding same; conference call with Mr. Rocke and Jon Sbar; further items of electronic correspondence	1.10	\$550.00
08/16/2022 HER		0.90	\$550.00
08/16/2022 HER	Conference call with Bob Rocke and Jonathan Sbar regarding	0.50	\$550.00
08/17/2022 HER	Review of emails from co-counsel	0.30	\$550.00
08/18/2022 HER	Electronic correspondence	0.40	\$550.00
08/19/2022 HER	Conference call with co-counsel at 11:00 a.m.; electronic	1.00	\$550.00
08/22/2022 HER	correspondence regarding Contract of follow-up with co-counsel	0.50	\$550.00
08/23/2022 HER	Emails (more than 15) with client and co-counsel regarding	0.60	\$550.00
08/24/2022 HER	Conference call with Bob Rocke and Jonathan Sbar; follow-up	0.50	\$550.00
08/25/2022 EJP	Calls with Bob Rocke and work on motion	0.50	\$450.00
08/25/2022 HER	Emails with Bob Rocke and Jon Sbar	0.10	\$550.00
08/26/2022 HER	Conference call with	0.70	\$550.00
08/28/2022 HER		0.30	\$550.00
08/29/2022 HER		1.90	\$550.00
08/30/2022 HER	Review and revision of	0.90	\$550.00
08/31/2022 DRF	Document review and communications with Soneet Kapila,	0.10	\$400.00
Stichter, Riedel, Blain &	Postler, P.A. Report ID: 100034	5/16/2023 1:26	PM

Page 12 of 20

08/31/2022	HER	Harley Riedel and Jennifer Altman Work on litigation issues, including document review and communications with Soneet Kapila, Dan Fogarty, and Jennifer Altman; follow	1.50	\$550.00
09/01/2022	HER	up Review and analysis of email from the second second	0.80	\$550.00
09/02/2022	HER	Work on and electronic correspondence	1.50	\$550.00
09/07/2022	DRF	Receive and respond to emails Example 1 emails to Harley E. Riedel, Scott A. Stichter, Edward J. Peterson regarding same	0.30	\$400.00
09/07/2022	HER	Emails with Dan Fogarty regarding	0.30	\$550.00
09/07/2022	HER	and response thereto	2.00	\$550.00
09/07/2022	SAS	Review of emails from Dan Fogarty, Harley Riedel, and	0.30	\$460.00
		Rocke regarding		
09/08/2022	HER		0.30	\$550.00
09/08/2022	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding	0.20	\$550.00
09/13/2022	HER	Multiple emails regarding mediation	0.30	\$550.00
09/14/2022	HER	Multiple items of electronic correspondence (more than 20) with legal team,	0.70	\$550.00
09/15/2022	HER	Participation in 11:00 a.m. conference call with Greg Garno, Paul Batista, Bob Rocke and Jon Sbar; follow-up	0.60	\$550.00
09/16/2022	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.10	\$550.00
09/18/2022	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.20	\$550.00
09/26/2022	EJP	Calls with client, co-counsel and Harley Riedel	0.50	\$450.00
09/26/2022	EJP	Brief conference with Harley Riedel regarding status	0.20	\$450.00
09/26/2022	HER	Review of recent emails; internal conference; participation in 11:00 a.m. conference call with Soneet Kapila, Greg Garno, Paul Batista, Edward Peterson, Harley Riedel, Bob Rocke and Jon Sbar	0.90	\$550.00
09/30/2022	HER	Preparation for and participation in conference call with	0.70	\$550.00
10/04/2022	EJP	Calls with Bob Rocke	0.50	\$450.00
10/10/2022	HER	Review of	0.10	\$550.00
10/11/2022	HER	Review and reply email to Jonathan Sbar	0.20	\$550.00
10/12/2022	DRF	Review documents from	1.20	\$400.00
		telephone call with		
10/17/2022	HER	Review of ECF filing	0.10	\$550.00
10/21/2022	HER	Electronic correspondence; telephone conference with left left voicemail message for Jon Sbar	0.50	\$550.00
10/24/2022	EJP	Calls with Bob Rocke	0.50	\$450.00
10/26/2022	EJP	Review electronic correspondence	0.20	\$450.00
10/26/2022	HER	Emails with Toby Gerber, Scott Stichter and Edward Peterson regarding state court litigation	0.30	\$550.00
		Alex DA Depart ID: 100021 E	146/0000 4-06 DM	

5/16/2023 1:26 PM

		Time by Activity Code Categories		
10/26/2022	SAS	Review of email from Gerber regarding state court litigation issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel	0.30	\$460.00
10/27/2022	EJP	Emails regarding Gerber	0.10	\$450.00
10/27/2022	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.30	\$550.00
10/27/2022	SAS	Review of follow-up emails from Harley Riedel, Edward Peterson, and Gerber regarding state court litigation issues	0.20	\$460.00
10/28/2022	HER	Email to Jon Sbar and Bob Rocke	0.10	\$550.00
10/28/2022	HER	Review of multiple emails regarding	0.30	\$550.00
10/31/2022	HER		0.40	\$550.00
11/01/2022	EJP	Review of emails regarding and prepare for call with Toby Gerber; work on motion to compel	2.00	\$450.00
11/01/2022	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding mediation issues	0.50	\$550.00
11/01/2022	HER	Participation in conference call with Toby Gerber; email to client regarding same	0.70	\$550.00
11/01/2022	SAS	Telephone conference with Edward Peterson, Harley Riedel, and Gerber regarding state court litigation issues	0.40	\$460.00
11/01/2022	SAS	Exchange of emails with counsel regarding scheduling a call to discuss state court issues	0.20	\$460.00
11/01/2022	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding state court litigation issues	0.20	\$460.00
11/02/2022	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding	0.30	\$550.00
11/07/2022	HER	Emails with Edward J. Peterson and Susan Jeffcoat; left voice mail message for and email to	0.40	\$550.00
11/08/2022	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.20	\$550.00
11/09/2022	HER	Multiple communications and work on	0.80	\$550.00
11/14/2022	EJP	Work on various issues	1.00	\$450.00
11/14/2022	HER	Substantial work on	1.10	\$550.00
		participation in conference calls with legal team, and telephone conference with Jon Sbar		
11/15/2022	EJP	Work on various issues	0.50	\$450.00
11/15/2022	HER	Conference calls (two) with co-counsel; communications with Edward Peterson;	1.80	\$550.00
11/21/2022	HER	Review of email from	0.10	\$550.00
11/22/2022	HER	Emails with Soneet Kapila	0.10	\$550.00
11/28/2022	HER	Work on	1.00	\$550.00
11/30/2022	HER	Electronic correspondence with co-counsel and client	0.20	\$550.00
12/02/2022	HER	Conference call with co-counsel and client;	1.20	\$550.00
		telephone conference with Bob Rocke;		
12/03/2022	HER	Email to	0.10	\$550.00
12/04/2022	HER	Email to client and co-counsel regarding results of review of client reply	0.40	\$550.00
12/04/2022	SAS	Review of emails from Harley Riedel, Battista, and Kapila regarding	0.30	\$460.00
12/05/2022	HER	Multiple contacts by email and telephone in	1.20	\$550.00
12/06/2022	HER	Emails and T/C with Bob Rocke; further emails with Mr. Rocke; function of the second	1.30	\$550.00

Report ID: 100034

12/07/2022	HER	Multiple (more than 15) emails regarding	0.80	\$550.00
12/09/2022	DRF	Work on review of	1.70	\$400.00
12/09/2022	HER	Conference call with Bob Rocke and Jon Sbar;	0.40	\$550.00
		related emails		
12/12/2022	DRF	Work on	0.50	\$400.00
12/12/2022	HER	Conference call with	0.90	\$550.00
12/12/2022	MBH	Conference with Daniel R. Fogarty regarding	0.60	\$350.00
12/12/2022	SAS	Review of email from Dan Fogarty regarding draft of review of files; dictated response; and review of	0.30	\$460.00
12/13/2022	HER	emails from Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel	2.30	\$550.00
12/14/2022	DRF	Telephone call with conference with staff regarding production	0.30	\$400.00
12/15/2022	DRF	Prepare letter regarding	1.50	\$400.00
12/15/2022	HER	Participation in 9:00 a.m. conference call with client and litigation counsel regarding status of litigation	0.80	\$550.00
12/16/2022	EJP	Review of	0.50	\$450.00
12/16/2022	HER	Work throughout the day on	2.00	\$550.00
12/20/2022	HER	Review of	0.20	\$550.00
12/20/2022 12/27/2022	HER SAS	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential	0.20 0.20	\$550.00 \$460.00
12/27/2022	SAS	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails	0.20	\$460.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022	SAS DRF	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb,	0.20 0.20	\$460.00 \$400.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022	SAS DRF EJP HER	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb, Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter Exchange of emails with Gerber and counsel regarding	0.20 0.20 0.50	\$460.00 \$400.00 \$450.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022	SAS DRF EJP HER SAS	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb, Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter Exchange of emails with Gerber and counsel regarding scheduling a call Telephone conference with Gerber, Harley Riedel, Edward	0.20 0.20 0.50 0.50	\$460.00 \$400.00 \$450.00 \$550.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022	SAS DRF EJP HER SAS	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb, Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter Exchange of emails with Gerber and counsel regarding scheduling a call	0.20 0.20 0.50 0.50 0.20	\$460.00 \$400.00 \$450.00 \$550.00 \$460.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022	SAS DRF EJP HER SAS SAS	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb, Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter Exchange of emails with Gerber and counsel regarding scheduling a call Telephone conference with Gerber, Harley Riedel, Edward Peterson, and Lieb regarding state court issues Electronic correspondence with	0.20 0.20 0.50 0.50 0.20 0.50	\$460.00 \$400.00 \$450.00 \$550.00 \$460.00 \$460.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 01/04/2023	SAS DRF EJP HER SAS SAS HER	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb, Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter Exchange of emails with Gerber and counsel regarding scheduling a call Telephone conference with Gerber, Harley Riedel, Edward Peterson, and Lieb regarding state court issues Electronic correspondence with	0.20 0.20 0.50 0.50 0.20 0.50 0.30	\$460.00 \$400.00 \$450.00 \$550.00 \$460.00 \$460.00 \$550.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 01/04/2023 01/09/2023	SAS DRF EJP HER SAS SAS HER DRF	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb, Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter Exchange of emails with Gerber and counsel regarding scheduling a call Telephone conference with Gerber, Harley Riedel, Edward Peterson, and Lieb regarding state court issues Electronic correspondence with	0.20 0.20 0.50 0.50 0.20 0.50 0.30 0.50	\$460.00 \$400.00 \$450.00 \$550.00 \$460.00 \$460.00 \$550.00 \$400.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 01/04/2023 01/09/2023 01/09/2023	SAS DRF EJP HER SAS SAS HER DRF HER	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb, Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter Exchange of emails with Gerber and counsel regarding scheduling a call Telephone conference with Gerber, Harley Riedel, Edward Peterson, and Lieb regarding state court issues Electronic correspondence with	0.20 0.20 0.50 0.50 0.20 0.50 0.30 0.50 0.40	\$460.00 \$400.00 \$550.00 \$460.00 \$460.00 \$550.00 \$400.00 \$550.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 01/04/2023 01/09/2023 01/09/2023 01/09/2023	SAS DRF EJP HER SAS SAS HER DRF HER DRF	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb, Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter Exchange of emails with Gerber and counsel regarding scheduling a call Telephone conference with Gerber, Harley Riedel, Edward Peterson, and Lieb regarding state court issues Electronic correspondence with	0.20 0.20 0.50 0.50 0.20 0.50 0.30 0.50 0.40 0.20	\$460.00 \$400.00 \$550.00 \$460.00 \$460.00 \$550.00 \$400.00 \$550.00
12/27/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 12/29/2022 01/04/2023 01/09/2023 01/09/2023 01/10/2023 01/10/2023	SAS DRF EJP HER SAS SAS HER DRF HER	Review of email from Fernandez regarding potential settlement with Schutz; review of follow-up emails Receive and respond to emails with Calls with Toby Gerber Conference call with Toby Gerber and Stephanie Lieb, Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter Exchange of emails with Gerber and counsel regarding scheduling a call Telephone conference with Gerber, Harley Riedel, Edward Peterson, and Lieb regarding state court issues Electronic correspondence with Telephone call with for the mails to litigation group regarding meeting; emails and follow up regarding same Multiple items of electronic correspondence regarding Emails regarding	0.20 0.20 0.50 0.50 0.20 0.50 0.30 0.50 0.40 0.20 0.20	\$460.00 \$400.00 \$550.00 \$460.00 \$460.00 \$550.00 \$550.00 \$400.00 \$550.00

Detail of Professional and Paraprofessional
Time by Activity Code Categories

		Time by Activity Code Categorie	S	
01/23/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding	0.30	\$550.00
01/24/2023	HER	Telephone communications with client and co-counsel; emails	0.50	\$550.00
01/25/2023	HER	Numerous emails regarding	0.50	\$550.00
01/26/2023	HER	Multiple communications	1.20	\$550.00
01/30/2023	HER	Telephone conference with	0.70	\$550.00
01/31/2023	EJP	Participate in conference call with Riedel, Garno, Rocke, Kapila, Battista and Sbar	0.50	\$450.00
01/31/2023	HER		1.30	\$550.00
02/01/2023	HER	Email to Bob Rocke and Jonathan Sbar; review of email from Soneet Kapila	0.20	\$550.00
02/01/2023	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding litigation issues	1.00	\$460.00
02/02/2023	HER	Review of and reply to emails from	0.50	\$550.00
02/03/2023	HER	telephone conference with Mr. Rocke	0.40	\$550.00
02,00,2020			0.10	¢000.00
02/07/2023	HER	Review email from	0.10	\$550.00
02/14/2023	HER	Review of emails from Jonathan Sbar and Jennifer Altman;	0.50	\$550.00
		follow-up emails regarding strategy and issues and scheduling of call		
02/16/2023	HER		1.00	\$550.00
02/17/2023	EJP	Calls regarding	0.50	\$450.00
02/17/2023	HER	Participation in 10:30 a.m. conference call with Jonathan Sbar and Bob Rocke;	1.30	\$550.00
02/20/2023	HER	Status report to client and co-counsel regarding	0.40	\$550.00
02/21/2023	HER	Telephone conference with co-counsel	0.40	\$550.00
02/22/2023	HER	Telephone conference with	0.40	\$550.00
02/22/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding	0.10	\$460.00
02/23/2023	HER	Review of emails from Altman and Sbar	0.20	\$550.00
02/24/2023	HER	Review of and reply to Jonathan Sbar's email regarding	1.10	\$550.00
		email to Bob Rocke and Mr. Sbar regarding same;		
02/27/2023	HER	Emails regarding	0.40	\$550.00
02/27/2023	SAS	Review of email regarding	0.10	\$460.00
03/01/2023	HER	Participation in 2:00 p.m. conference call; numerous emails regarding	1.20	\$550.00
Stichter, Rie	del, Blain & Pos	stler, P.A. Report ID: 100034	5/16/2023 1:26 PM	

Page 16 of 20

		Time by Activity Code Categories		
03/01/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with Battista, Garno, Rocke, Sbar, and Harley Riedel regarding	0.70	\$460.00
		review of follow-up emails		
03/02/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence with	0.30	\$550.00
03/03/2023	HER	Preparation for and participation in conference call with client and legal team	0.60	\$550.00
03/03/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with	0.50	\$460.00
03/03/2023	SAS	Review of emails from	0.50	\$460.00
03/06/2023	HER	Participated in call with	0.40	\$550.00
03/06/2023	SAS	Review of emails regarding litigation issues; participated in call with Sbar, Rocke, Kapila, and Harley Riedel regarding litigation issues	0.60	\$460.00
03/08/2023	HER	Numerous emails with legal team and client	0.40	\$550.00
03/08/2023	SAS	Review of emails from counsel regarding litigation issues	0.20	\$460.00
03/09/2023	HER	Preparation for and participation in 1:30 p.m. conference call	0.90	\$550.00
		with review of follow-up email from		
03/09/2023	SAS	Review of emails from	0.20	\$460.00
03/10/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.40	\$550.00
03/10/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar enclosing	0.50	\$460.00
03/10/2023	SAS	Review of email from Sbar regarding	0.50	\$460.00
03/13/2023	HER	Multiple emails with legal team and client regarding	0.40	\$550.00
03/13/2023	HER	Review of emails from Paul Batista	0.20	\$550.00
03/13/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Sbar and Battista regarding litigation issues	0.20	\$460.00
03/14/2023	HER	Emails with legal team and client regarding	0.40	\$550.00
03/14/2023	SAS	Review of emails from	0.60	\$460.00
		conference with McCoy; review of follow-up emails; and		
03/15/2023	HER	review of emails from Exercise Contract Sector Receipt and review of electronic correspondence	0.10	\$550.00
03/16/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke enclosing	0.60	\$460.00
00,10,2020	0,10	review of Kapila's comments; and further	0.00	φ100.00
03/19/2023	SAS	Research issues related to	0.40	\$460.00
03/20/2023	HER	Review of emails	0.20	\$550.00
03/20/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila and Battista regarding status	0.20	\$460.00
		of		
03/23/2023	HER	Work on extension of	0.40	\$550.00
03/23/2023	SAS	Review of emails regarding	0.20	\$460.00
03/24/2023	HER	Emails regarding	0.30	\$550.00
03/24/2023	SAS	Review of email from Battista forwarding	0.20	\$460.00
03/27/2023	HER	Work on	0.80	\$550.00
Stichter Rie	del. Blain & Pos	stler. P.A. Report ID: 100034 5/	16/2023 1:26 PM	

Report ID: 100034

		conference with Scott Stichter		
03/27/2023	SAS	Review of email from telephone conference with and telephone conference with	0.50	\$460.00
03/27/2023	SAS	Review of emails from	0.50	\$460.00
		review of review of and review of a second		
03/28/2023	SAS	conference with Harley Riedel regarding same Dictated email to Rocke, Harley Riedel, and Sbar regarding call with Trehan	0.30	\$460.00
03/29/2023	SAS	Dictated email to	0.10	\$460.00
03/30/2023	HER	Conference with, and review of subsequent email from Scott Stichter regarding Excerning follow-up emails and telephone conference with Bob Rocke	0.50	\$550.00
03/30/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with conference with Harley Riedel; and dictated email to Rocke, Kapila, Sbar, and Riedel	0.60	\$460.00
03/31/2023	HER	Multiple contacts related work	0.60	\$550.00
03/31/2023	SAS	Review of emails from	0.20	\$460.00
03/31/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Harley Riedel	0.40	\$460.00
		dictated email to Rocke and Sbar; and review of emails from		
03/31/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding conference with Harley Riedel; and dictated email to Rocke	0.30	\$460.00
04/03/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Wischmeier regarding Bailey judgment issues; dictated response; and telephone conference with Wischmeier regarding same	0.40	\$460.00
04/05/2023	SAS	Work on Langston and Tinelli state court litigation issues; review of docket	0.40	\$460.00
04/05/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke enclosing revisions to second review of email from Kapila; and dictated response	0.40	\$460.00
04/06/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding distance of email from dictated response; review of email from Kapila; and review of email from Rocke	0.30	\$460.00
04/10/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke dictated email to Rocke	0.40	\$460.00
04/11/2023	DRF	Conference with Scott Stichter and Matt Hale regarding approval issues	0.20	\$400.00
04/11/2023	MBH	Conference with Scott Stichter and Dan Fogarty regarding approval issues	0.20	\$350.00
04/11/2023	SAS	Review of email from Rocke regarding distance distance distance distance with Rocke; conference with Matt Hale and Dan Fogarty regarding distance distance email to Kapila and McCoy regarding distance distance and distance distan	1.10	\$460.00
04/12/2023	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding sectors telephone conference with Kapila; and dictated follow-up email to Kapila	0.40	\$460.00
04/12/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila regarding	0.20	\$460.00
04/20/2023	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.30	\$550.00

5/16/2023 1:26 PM

		······ · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
04/21/2023	HER	Conference call at 8:55 a.m. with Bob Rocke and Jon Sbar regarding related electronic correspondence	0.60	\$550.00
04/21/2023	HER	Late afternoon emails regarding	0.10	\$550.00
04/21/2023	HER		1.40	\$550.00
04/21/2023	SAS	Review of emails from Harley Riedel and Dan Fogarty regarding litigation issues; review of further emails from Gerber and Riedel	0.30	\$460.00
04/21/2023	SAS	Telephone conference with counsel regarding litigation issues; review of follow-up emails	0.60	\$460.00
04/21/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding litigation issues; review of email from Dan Fogarty regarding	0.30	\$460.00
04/27/2023	HER	Emails regarding status of	0.30	\$550.00
04/28/2023	HER	Emails and conference call with client and co-counsel; email to	0.40	\$550.00
04/28/2023	HER	Telephone conference with sector and email to team regarding same; follow-up	0.60	\$550.00
04/28/2023	SAS	Review of email from Harley Riedel regarding call review of email from Kapila	0.30	\$460.00

Fee Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Riedel, Harley E.	76.10	\$550.00
Stichter, Scott A.	18.40	\$460.00
Peterson, Edward J.	7.90	\$450.00
Fogarty, Dan R.	7.70	\$400.00
Hale, Matt B.	0.70	\$350.00
Total for Adv Proceedings/Litigation	111.10	

Grand Total: 218.10

Detail of Expenses

Client Name: Kapila-Laser Spine Matter Caption: Kapila-Laser Spine

<u>Date</u>	<u>Code</u>	Description	<u>Amount</u>
Photocopies	;		
08/15/2022	COPY	Photocopies of Fee Applications of Kapila and KapilaMukamal	75.60
08/22/2022	COPY	Photocopies of Fee Application	18.15
09/14/2022	COPY	Photocopies of Fee Orders - 7th Interim	3.60
09/22/2022	COPY	Photocopies of Motion to Expand Scope of Representation	22.80
11/01/2022	COPY	Photocopies of hearing notice	5.40
12/13/2022	COPY	Photocopies of certificate of service	2.40
01/10/2023	COPY	Photocopies of WARN Act Compromise Motion	59.40
03/08/2023	COPY	Photocopies of WARN Act Compromise Order	1.20
		Total for Photocopies	188.55
Overnight Co	ourier		
09/20/2022	ONC	Federal Express Corporation - Overnight Courier	20.92
		Total for Overnight Courier	20.92
Other Disbu	rsements		
02/27/2023	OTH	Veritext, LLC-3 - Court Reporter fees	170.02
		Total for Other Disbursements	170.02
Postage			
08/15/2022	POST	Postage for Fee Applications for Kapila and KapilaMukamal	15.84
08/22/2022	POST	Postage for SRBP 7th Fee Application	6.72
09/08/2022	POST	Postage for stay letter	0.57
09/14/2022	POST	Postage for Seventh Fee Orders	2.28
09/20/2022	POST	Postage for Subpoena letters	2.85
09/22/2022	POST	Postage for Motion to Expand Scope of Representation	7.68
10/17/2022	POST	Postage for Application to Employ	3.24
11/01/2022	POST	Postage for Notice of Hearing	2.28
12/13/2022	POST	Postage for employ and expand scope order	2.28
01/10/2023	POST	Postage for WARN Act Compromise Motion	15.36
01/19/2023	POST	Postage for subpoena letters	2.85
03/08/2023	POST	Postage of WARN Act Order	4.20
04/06/2023	POST	Postage of Subpoena Response Ltrs	3.00
04/24/2023	POST	Postage of Subpoena Response Ltrs	1.20
		Total for Postage	70.35
Research			
10/01/2022	RES	Thomson Reuters - West Research	254.84
10/20/2022	RES	Pacer Charges - 3rd Quarter 2022	1.20
12/01/2022	RES	Thomson Reuters - West Research	168.24
12/31/2022	RES	Logikcull-Service Period 12/1/2022 - 12/31/2022	253.50
01/01/2023	RES	Thomson Reuters - West Research	12.35
01/31/2023	RES	Logikcull-Service Period 1/1/2023 - 1/31/2023	250.00
02/28/2023	RES	Logikcull-Service Period 02/01/2023 - 02/28/2023	250.00
03/31/2023	RES	Logikcull-Service Period 03/01/2023 - 03/31/2023	250.00
04/30/2023	RES	Logikcull-Service Period 04/01/2023 - 04/30/2023	250.00
		Total for Research	1,690.13
		Total Expenses:	2,139.97
Stichter, Ried	el, Blain & Po	ostler, P.A. Report ID: 100038 5/17/2023 10:19 AM	Page 1 of 1