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04/02/2021 0.10 SAS

04/02/2021 1.10 
 

 

SAS

04/02/2021 0.20Review of email from Manns regarding bank's credit bid for abandoned 
receivables; review of emails from Edward Peterson and Kapila; and dictated  
response

SAS

04/02/2021 0.20Dictated email to Kastner regarding California litigation; review of email from  
Kastner

SAS

04/05/2021 1.80ESC

04/05/2021 0.30HER

04/05/2021 0.20Review of emails from Fernandez and Edward Peterson regarding scheduling  
of Kapila's deposition

SAS

04/05/2021 0.10Review of email from McCoy regarding deposition preparation; dictated  
response; and review of email from McCoy

SAS

04/05/2021 0.30 SAS

04/05/2021 0.30Telephone conference with Manns regarding pending mattersSAS

04/05/2021 0.80Telephone conference with Kapila and McCoy regarding allocation issuesSAS

04/05/2021 0.20Review of email regarding entry of scheduling order; exchange of emails  
regarding service of order

SAS

04/06/2021 1.00Prep for Bailey trialEJP

04/06/2021 3.70ESC

04/06/2021 2.70 
 

 

HER

04/06/2021 0.20 SAS

04/06/2021 0.90Dictated email to Kapila regarding call with Barack and discussing WARN Act  
claims; exchange of emails with Kapila regarding same

SAS

04/06/2021 0.40Review of email from McCoy enclosing revised exhibit for allocation issues;  
dictated email to Altman and Mazer enclosing revised exhibit; telephone  
conference with Mather; conference with Edward Peterson regarding trial  
issues; and conferences regarding serving order

SAS

04/06/2021 0.30 SAS

04/06/2021 0.50Telephone conference with McCoy, Kapila, and Edward Peterson regarding  
allocation issues; dictated email to Mather

SAS

04/06/2021 0.20Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulateSJ

04/07/2021 1.50Preparation for depositionEJP

04/07/2021 0.20Conference with Scott Stichter regarding allocation issuesEJP

04/07/2021 0.90ESC

04/07/2021 3.00 HER
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04/07/2021 0.30 HER

04/07/2021 0.20 SAS

04/07/2021 0.20 SAS

04/07/2021 1.40 
 
 

 
 

SAS

04/07/2021 0.80Continued work on allocation trial issues; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy;  
review of emails from Kapila and McCoy; and telephone conference with  
McCoy regarding recoveries

SAS

04/07/2021 0.70Review of 506(c) research; conference with Emily ClendenonSAS

04/07/2021 0.40Exchange of emails with Mather regarding allocation issues; exchange of  
emails with Manns regarding allocation issues

SAS

04/07/2021 0.50Dictated motion to extend pre-trial conference reportSAS

04/07/2021 1.20Telephone conference with Mather, Altman, McCoy, and Kapila regarding  
allocation issues; follow-up call with Kapila and McCoy; telephone conference  
with Mather; telephone conference with Edward Peterson; and dictated  
follow-up email to Edward Peterson

SAS

04/07/2021 0.20Review of email from Mather enclosing settlement offer; dictated email to 
Kapila forwarding settlement proposal; and dictated email to Gerber  
forwarding settlement proposal

SAS

04/07/2021 0.20Review of emails from Rocke and Battista regarding Kapila's deposition;  
dictated response

SAS

04/08/2021 1.50 
 

DRF

04/08/2021 4.00EJP

04/08/2021 0.10HER

04/08/2021 0.40Review of emails regarding Bank settlementHER

04/08/2021 0.90 HER

04/08/2021 0.30 MBH

04/08/2021 1.10 
 

SAS

04/08/2021 0.70 
 

SAS

04/08/2021 0.40Review of email from McCoy regarding calculation of revised amounts of  
allocation to incorporate Mather's settlement proposal; telephone conference  
with McCoy; and review of email from Kapila

SAS

04/08/2021 0.70Telephone conference with Kapila, McCoy, and Edward Peterson regarding  
deposition preparation

SAS
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04/08/2021 2.40Attended deposition of Soneet Kapila; follow-up call with Kapila and Edward  
Peterson

SAS

04/08/2021 0.30Telephone conference with Manns regarding Bailey Group settlement  
proposal; dictated email to Kapila regarding call with Manns

SAS

04/09/2021 1.20 
 

HER

04/09/2021 0.20Conference with Harley Riedel regarding outcome of depositionsSAS

04/09/2021 0.30Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Kapila regarding estate funds;  
dictated response; review of follow-up emails; and dictated email to Mazer

SAS

04/09/2021 0.30Review of email from Mather regarding exhibits for trial; conference with Khan  
Whiteside regarding preparing and uploading exhibits

SAS

04/09/2021 0.80Review of email from Mather regarding revisions to joint report; telephone  
conference with Mather regarding trial issues; dictated revisions to joint report;  
dictated email to Mather enclosing draft; telephone conference with Mather;  
and finalized joint report for filing with court

SAS

04/09/2021 0.20Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulateSJ

04/10/2021 0.30Review of email from Scott Stichter regarding allocation trialHER

04/10/2021 0.40 SAS

04/10/2021 2.60Dictated draft of opening statement and direct examination of KapilaSAS

04/10/2021 0.20 SAS

04/11/2021 1.00Preparation for trialEJP

04/11/2021 0.20Review of exhibits to be delivered to courtSAS

04/11/2021 0.20Review of emails from counsel regarding litigation matters; dictated responseSAS

04/12/2021 2.00Prep for trialEJP

04/12/2021 0.30Receipt and review of multiple items of electronic correspondenceHER

04/12/2021 1.30 
 

HER

04/12/2021 1.50 
 

 

HER

04/12/2021 0.20Dictated draft of response to Mather; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy; and  
review of email from McCoy

SAS

04/12/2021 1.10Continued work on litigation issues, including review of depositions; telephone  
conference with McCoy, Edward Peterson, and Kapila; exchange of emails  
with Mather regarding response to questions and exhibits

SAS

04/12/2021 4.10Continued work on trial issues, including dictated revisions to opening  
statement and opening statement and Kapila direct examination; review of  
files; conference with Harley Riedel; exchange of emails regarding finalizing  
opening statement and Kapila direct examination

SAS

04/13/2021 0.50Prep for trialEJP

04/13/2021 3.50 
 

HER
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04/13/2021 0.20 HER

04/13/2021 0.30Work on fee issuesHER

04/13/2021 0.20Conference with Daniel R. Fogarty regarding WARN act claims and researchMBH

04/13/2021 0.80 SAS

04/13/2021 0.30Review of email from Mather enclosing information requests; dictated email to  
Kapila and McCoy; review of email from Kapila; and dictated response

SAS

04/13/2021 0.20Review of email from McCoy regarding amounts collected by assignment  
estates

SAS

04/13/2021 1.60Continued work on litigation issues, including conferences with Edward  
Peterson;  
review and revision of direct testimony and opening statement; dictated emails  
enclosing drafts to clients and counsel;  
exchange of emails with Kapila and McCoy regarding trial preparation

SAS

04/13/2021 0.50Initial review of Schutz's draft objection to settlement; conference with Edward  
Peterson regarding same

SAS

04/13/2021 0.50Telephone conference with McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding collections  
chart and response to Mather

SAS

04/13/2021 0.20Review of emails from counsel regarding D&O issuesSAS

04/13/2021 0.30Review of email from Barak regarding WARN Act claims; review of emails 
from Kapila, Harley Riedel, and Edward Peterson; dictated email to Barak

SAS

04/13/2021 0.20Review of email from Manns to Mather regarding response to Bailey Group's  
counter-offer

SAS

04/14/2021 0.60Work on WARN Act claims issuesDRF

04/14/2021 1.50ESC

04/14/2021 0.30HER

04/14/2021 1.30 HER

04/14/2021 0.40HER

04/14/2021 0.30Review of email from Barack regarding WARN Act litigation; dictated email to 
Harley Riedel and Edward Peterson; and review of emails from Harley Riedel  
and Edward Peterson

SAS

04/14/2021 7.80Preparation for trial; exchange of emails with parties; telephone conference  
with counsel and clients; attended trial; telephone conference with client  
following hearing; and telephone conference with Fernandez regarding  
outcome of hearing

SAS

04/15/2021 3.00Prep for hearing on motion to approve compromiseEJP

04/15/2021 1.50Work on multiple litigation matters, including emails and telephone 
conferences

HER

04/15/2021 0.30 HER

04/15/2021 1.00HER

04/15/2021 0.10Telephone conference with Harley Riedel regarding outcome of trial on  
allocation issues

SAS

04/15/2021 0.10Finalized letter to chambers enclosing D&O pleadingsSAS

04/15/2021 0.20Telephone conference with Manns regarding yesterday's hearingSAS
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04/15/2021 0.10SAS

04/15/2021 0.70 
 

SAS

04/15/2021 1.10Further review of Schutz's objection to D&O compromise motion;  
 

SAS

04/15/2021 0.70Review of email from Schutz regarding Monday's hearing; dictated response;  
telephone conference with Schutz regarding D&O compromise issues;  
dictated email to co-counsel regarding call with Schutz; review of emails;  
dictated response; and review of follow-up emails

SAS

04/15/2021 1.00 SAS

04/16/2021 3.10Conference with Scott Stichter; work on WARN Act response issuesDRF

04/16/2021 4.00Prep for hearing on settlementEJP

04/16/2021 0.50Receipt and review of electronic correspondence regarding 4/19 hearing; brief  
internal conferences regarding same

HER

04/16/2021 0.10Review of electronic correspondence regarding WARN Act claimHER

04/16/2021 0.50Review of Emergency Motion filed by Bailey; follow-upHER

04/16/2021 2.60Dictated draft of proposed order approving compromise; dictated email to 
counsel enclosing draft of order; and dictated email to client enclosing draft of  
order

SAS

04/16/2021 0.10Review of email from Knopik regarding state court litigation; dictated responseSAS

04/16/2021 0.50Dictated email to Barack regarding WARN Act claims; exchange of emails with 
Barack regarding deadline to file a responsive pleading; dictated email to Dan  
Fogarty; and conference with Dan Fogarty and Harley Riedel (portion)

SAS

04/16/2021 0.60Work on D&O issues, including review of emails from Rocke and Battista; 
review of email from Ray enclosing revisions to documents; dictated response  
regarding Monday's hearings; review of emails from counsel regarding trial  
strategy; dictated response; and review of follow-up emails

SAS

04/16/2021 1.10Further review of emails regarding issues reviewed by Bailey Group;  
telephone conference with Edward Peterson, Sbar, Rocke, Kapila, and  
Battista regarding Monday's hearings

SAS

04/16/2021 0.40Conference with Edward Peterson regarding D&O issuesSAS

04/16/2021 0.60Dictated memo to Edward Peterson regarding Langston and Tinelli claims;  
dictated email to Lamb and McLaughlin inquiring as to status of Langston  
appeals; and review of email from Edward Peterson regarding Langston and  
Tinelli claims

SAS

04/17/2021 1.50Preparation for hearing on compromise motionEJP

04/17/2021 0.10HER

04/17/2021 0.40SAS

04/17/2021 0.60Review of emails regarding D&O issues; dictated response discussing  
Schutz's claims

SAS

04/17/2021 0.10Review of email from Lamb regarding status of Langston appealsSAS

04/18/2021 2.50Preparation for hearingsEJP

04/18/2021 0.70Review of comments to draft letter to mediator and revision of sameHER
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04/18/2021 1.80Review of objections filed by Langston and Tinelli and Bailey Group; review of  
motion to continue; telephone conference with counsel regarding tomorrow's  
hearing; and review of email from Sbar enclosing District Court orders

SAS

04/19/2021 2.50Continue work on WARN Act claims issuesDRF

04/19/2021 5.50Prep for settlement hearing and time for sameEJP

04/19/2021 1.20 HER

04/19/2021 2.30Work on matters related to today's hearings; including further review of 
objections; review of emails from Schutz; dictated responses; conferences 
with Edward Peterson; review of emails from counsel; telephone conference  
with Waggoner, Sbar, and Edward Peterson; and follow-up call with Sbar and  
Edward Peterson

SAS

04/19/2021 1.70Dictated revisions to proposed order on motion to approve compromise;  
dictated email to counsel and client enclosing draft; review of responses;  
finalized order for submission; and preparation of authorities for submission to  
court

SAS

04/19/2021 0.30Dictated email to Fernandez and Mather regarding procedures for submitting  
proposed orders; review of emails from Mather and Fernandez; and finalized  
pleadings for filing with court

SAS

04/19/2021 2.10Further preparation for hearing; review of emails; conferences with Edward  
Peterson; attended hearing; telephone conference with Edward Peterson,  
Rocke, and Sbar; and follow-up conference with Edward Peterson

SAS

04/20/2021 0.80Follow up with court on ordersEJP

04/20/2021 2.80 
 

HER

04/20/2021 0.20Review of emails from counsel regarding D&O hearing outcomeSAS

04/20/2021 0.10Review of order from court denying motion to continueSAS

04/20/2021 0.20SAS

04/20/2021 0.10Review of emails regarding cancellation of status conferenceSAS

04/20/2021 0.20Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding draft of letter to chambers  
enclosing order approving compromise; conference with Edward Peterson;  
and review of follow-up emails

SAS

04/20/2021 0.30Emails, review file regarding fee applications, organize fee invoicesSJ

04/20/2021 0.30Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulateSJ

04/21/2021 0.30Conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding WARN Act issues; continued  
work on papers

DRF

04/21/2021 0.70Calls with Soneet KapilaEJP

04/21/2021 3.60 
 

HER

04/21/2021 0.50Review of Laserscopic Claimant's proposed order on motion to compromise; 
review of email to Kapila enclosing orders submitted to chambers

SAS

04/21/2021 0.30Participated in portion of call with litigation counselSAS

04/21/2021 0.20SAS

04/22/2021 3.80Work on answer and affirmative defenses in WARN Act litigation; work on stay 
or abstention motion

DRF
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04/22/2021 0.30HER

04/22/2021 0.30Review file for employee informationMBH

04/22/2021 0.10Review of emails from Susan Jeffcoat and Edward Peterson regarding fee 
application issues

SAS

04/22/2021 0.20SAS

04/22/2021 0.10Review of email from Kapila regarding Bailey Group's proposed order on  
motion to approve compromise; dictated response

SAS

04/22/2021 0.20Exchange of emails with Dan Fogarty regarding WARN Act issuesSAS

04/22/2021 0.80Dictated email to McLaughlin and Lamb regarding outcome of hearing on  
motion to approve compromise of D&O claims; review of email from 
McLaughlin; review of email from Lamb; dictated response; review of email  
from Lamb; and dictated response

SAS

04/22/2021 0.70Review file, fee spreadsheet, draft Fisher Broyles fourth fee application, print  
all fee applications and forwarding to Edward Peterson

SJ

04/22/2021 0.30Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulateSJ

04/23/2021 1.40Continued work on WARN Act pleadings; conference with S. Stichter and E.  
Peterson regarding same

DRF

04/23/2021 0.50Work on fee applicationsEJP

04/23/2021 0.30HER

04/23/2021 0.10HER

04/23/2021 1.20Review of draft of WARN Act pleadings; conference with Dan Fogarty; dictated  
email to Barack regarding complaint to be answered; dictated email to  
Knopick regarding WARN Act issues; exchange of emails with Barack; and 
review of email from Dan Fogarty

SAS

04/23/2021 0.30Telephone conference with Manns regarding Monday's hearingSAS

04/25/2021 0.20Exchange of emails with Knopik and Dan Fogarty regarding WARN Act issuesSAS

04/26/2021 3.30Work on WARN Act issues; conference with Scott A. Stichter; emails with 
Chris Knopik

DRF

04/26/2021 0.40HER

04/26/2021 0.20Exchange of emails with Knopick regarding WARN Act claims; conference 
with Dan Fogarty

SAS

04/26/2021 0.70Review of email from McLaughlin regarding effect of D&O compromise on 
pending litigation; dictated response; and review of email from Lamb

SAS

04/26/2021 0.20Review of emails from Dan Fogarty and Knopik regarding WARN Act claimsSAS

04/27/2021 1.90Telephone call with Scott A. Stichter and Chris Knopik; edit WARN Act claims  
objection; follow up telephone call with Chris Knopik

DRF

04/27/2021 1.00Work on motion to set aside default in district court litigationDRF

04/27/2021 0.40HER

04/27/2021 0.50Work on WARN ACT issuesKW

04/27/2021 0.20Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding response to defaultMJH

04/27/2021 0.20Review of email from Barak regarding entry of clerk's defaults; dictated 
response

SAS

04/27/2021 0.80Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding WARN Act issues; telephone  
conference with Dan Fogarty and Knopik regarding WARN Act issues; and  
follow-up conference with Dan Fogarty

SAS

04/27/2021 0.20SAS

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229-0144
F 813-229-1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 35202-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424-6604

www.srbp.com



Matter: 49265Bill # Page    401

04/27/2021 0.20Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Rocke regarding status of state  
court order

SAS

04/27/2021 0.80Work on fee applications and forwarding to Edward PetersonSJ

04/28/2021 2.50Continued work on motion to vacate default; conference with Scott A. Stichter;  
revise WARN Act pleadings; emails to special counsel regarding pleading  
allegations and positions

DRF

04/28/2021 0.20Review of email from Mather regarding submission of orders; review of email  
from Fernandez; and exchange of emails with Mather and Fernandez

SAS

04/28/2021 0.10SAS

04/28/2021 0.20Review of email from Manns regarding status of orders; dictated responseSAS

04/28/2021 0.50Review and revision of motion to set aside clerk's default; conference with  
Dan Fogarty regarding revisions to pleadings

SAS

04/28/2021 0.10Review of email from Dan Fogarty to Batista and Rocke regarding WARN Act  
issues

SAS

04/29/2021 1.40Conference with S. Stichter; emails to counsel for class reps regarding meet  
and confer; telephone call with S. Stichter and Brandon Hill regarding meet  
and confer in WARN Act litigation; revise WARN Act pleadings

DRF

04/29/2021 0.50Review and revision of draft of objection to WARN Act claims; conference with 
Dan Fogarty

SAS

04/29/2021 0.10Review of email regarding transcript; dictated responseSAS

04/29/2021 0.30Telephone conference with Hill and Dan Fogarty regarding meet and confer  
with respect to pleadings to be filed in District Court and WARN Act issues

SAS

04/30/2021 4.50Finalize WARN Act claim objection and district court documents for filingDRF

04/30/2021 0.10HER

04/30/2021 0.20Conference with Daniel R. Fogarty regarding WARN act issuesMBH

04/30/2021 1.20Review and revisions of District Court pleadings and objection to claim to be  
filed in state court; conference with Dan Fogarty regarding revisions to  
pleadings; and dictated response

SAS

04/30/2021 0.30Review of email from McCoy regarding WARN Act pleadings; dictated 
response; review of email from Cabasso regarding mediation; dictated email  
to Kapila; and review of emails from Kapila and Dan Fogarty regarding WARN  
Act issues

SAS

04/30/2021 0.20Receipt and download CT Service of Process, circulate filingSJ

04/30/2021 0.30Receipt and review of CT Invoices and Delaware tax notices and forwarding to  
Kapila Mukamal

SJ

05/01/2021 0.30EJP

05/03/2021 1.00 HER

05/03/2021 1.00Conference call with S. KapilaKW

05/03/2021 0.20Review of De Lange Financial state court default judgmentSAS

05/03/2021 0.10Dictated email to Cabassa regarding mediation issuesSAS

05/03/2021 0.40Telephone conference with Kapila regarding WARN Act mediation issues;  
conference with Dan Fogarty; and dictated email to Cabassa

SAS

05/04/2021 0.20 BFA

05/04/2021 0.20Call with E-Hounds regarding WARN Act documents and review of database  
regarding same

DRF
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05/04/2021 0.30Calls with counsel for bankEJP

05/04/2021 0.50Work on and communications regarding litigation mattersHER

05/04/2021 0.30Review of emails regarding litigation issuesSAS

05/04/2021 0.20Exchange of emails with Cabassa regarding mediation issues; telephone  
conference with Cabassa

SAS

05/05/2021 0.30 HER

05/05/2021 0.30Review of email from Cabassa enclosing list of mediators; dictated email to 
Kapila; and exchange of emails with Kapila regarding mediation options

SAS

05/05/2021 0.10Review of email from Fernandez regarding pending matters; dictated  
response

SAS

05/05/2021 0.50Review of email from State of Florida enclosing responses to subpoenas;  
review of email from Susan Jeffcoat and McCoy; dictated email to Jusevitch  
regarding service of responses; review of email from Jusevitch; dictated email  
to client; and review of emails from Kapila and McCoy

SAS

05/06/2021 0.40HER

05/06/2021 0.30Review of emails from parties regarding D&O order; dictated response; review  
of follow-up emails; dictated response; and review of further emails

SAS

05/06/2021 0.20SAS

05/06/2021 0.20Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding WARN Act issuesSAS

05/06/2021 0.20Review of emails from Susan Jeffcoat and McCoy regarding DeLange's  
default judgment; dictated response

SAS

05/06/2021 0.10Review of notice of judicial settlementSAS

05/06/2021 0.20Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulateSJ

05/06/2021 0.20Review emails from DOH attaching medical records and responsesSJ

05/07/2021 0.80Work on review of database regarding WARN issuesDRF

05/07/2021 0.50 HER

05/08/2021 0.20Review of emails from Harley Riedel and Batista regarding actions filed by  
Bailey Group

SAS

05/08/2021 0.10Dictated email to Kapila regarding WARN Act mediation issuesSAS

05/08/2021 0.10Dictated email to Kapila regarding WARN Act mediation issuesSAS

05/09/2021 0.10HER

05/09/2021 0.20Review of email from Kapila regarding selection of mediator; dictated email to  
Cabassa

SAS

05/10/2021 0.70Review and revise draft of joint motion to stay WARN Act district court case 
pending mediation; conference with Scott Stichter regarding same; emails to  
counsel for plaintiffs with revisions

DRF

05/10/2021 0.80 HER

05/10/2021 0.20Review of email from Hill regarding motion to stay; conference with Dan  
Fogarty; review of email regarding mediation dates; and dictated response

SAS

05/10/2021 0.20Review of follow-up email enclosing alternative dates for mediation; dictated  
email to Kapila; and dictated email to Hill

SAS

05/10/2021 0.20Review file regarding fee applications and forwarding to Edward PetersonSJ

05/11/2021 0.20Receive and reply to email from  WARN Act plaintiffs counsel regarding 
revisions to motion to stay district court litigation

DRF
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05/11/2021 0.50Work on D and O orderEJP

05/11/2021 0.20Review of email from Dan Fogarty enclosing revisions to motion to stay Ali  
District Court action pending mediation

SAS

05/11/2021 0.20Review of email from Hill enclosing further revisions to motion to stay; review  
of emails from Dan Fogarty approving changes

SAS

05/12/2021 2.10Research and locate Florida and Texas fraudulent transfer complaints in 
cases filed by Jennifer Altman; forward same to Scott Stichter, Edward J.  
Peterson, and Harley Riedel

BFA

05/12/2021 0.30Work on D and O orderEJP

05/12/2021 1.00 HER

05/12/2021 0.50Work on issues related to D&O order, including review of emails with Edward  
Peterson and chambers regarding status of order; review of Edward Peterson  
advising as to status of actions; review of emails from Manns and Edward  
Peterson regarding payment terms; dictated response to Manns regarding  
deadline to pay; and review of emails from Manns, Khan Whiteside, and  
Edward Peterson regarding resubmission of order

SAS

05/12/2021 0.40Review of email from Kapila regarding availability for WARN Act mediation;  
dictated email to Hill enclosing dates; review of filed joint motion to stay  
proceedings; dictated email to Kapila enclosing joint motion to stay; review of  
email from Hall regarding selected date; and dictated email to Kapila  
regarding date selected for mediation

SAS

05/12/2021 0.40Dictated draft of form letter enclosing State of Florida's response to subpoena;  
conference with Susan Jeffcoat regarding serving subpoena

SAS

05/13/2021 0.80Conference calls regarding mediationEJP

05/13/2021 0.50Work on litigation mattersHER

05/13/2021 0.30 SAS

05/13/2021 0.60 
 

SAS

05/14/2021 0.50 
 

BFA

05/14/2021 0.60EJP

05/14/2021 0.30HER

05/14/2021 4.30 
 

 

SAS

05/14/2021 0.30 
 

SAS

05/14/2021 0.20 SJ

05/16/2021 0.10SAS

05/17/2021 0.50Work on D and O orderEJP
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05/17/2021 0.30Review of emails from State of Florida enclosing additional responses to  
subpoenas; conference with Susan Jeffcoat

SAS

05/17/2021 0.10SAS

05/17/2021 0.20Review of email from Schutz regarding procedures for liquidating his clients'  
claims; dictated response; and review of follow-up email from Schutz

SAS

05/17/2021 0.30Review of emails from counsel regarding Thursday's status conferenceSAS

05/17/2021 0.20Review of emails regarding entry of order approving D&O compromise;  
dictated email to Kapila; and review of responses

SAS

05/17/2021 1.00Review DOH emails and affidavit of no records, review file to match up with  
subpoenas, begin drafting subpoena response letters

SJ

05/18/2021 0.30Review of numerous emails from State of Florida enclosing additional  
responses to subpoenas; further conference with Susan Jeffcoat

SAS

05/18/2021 0.30 SAS

05/19/2021 0.20Review of email from Barak regarding WARN Act claimants' intention to seek 
extension of time to respond to objection to claim; dictated response

SAS

05/19/2021 0.10Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding DeLage Landen state court  
filings

SAS

05/19/2021 0.40SAS

05/19/2021 0.20Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulateSJ

05/20/2021 0.50Preparation for hearingEJP

05/20/2021 0.30HER

05/20/2021 0.40Review of email from Hill regarding Bradley conflicts; exchange of emails with  
Edward Peterson and Kapila; dictated email to Hill; review of email from Hill;  
and follow-up emails with Kapila regarding WARN Act mediation issues

SAS

05/20/2021 0.30SAS

05/20/2021 0.30Review of draft order extending time to respond to objection to claims;  
dictated response

SAS

05/21/2021 0.30HER

05/22/2021 0.40Review of email from Batista enclosing EFO's judicial settlement statementSAS

05/24/2021 1.30 
 

HER

05/25/2021 0.50Drafting and circulation of proposed email regarding Bailey issuesHER

05/25/2021 0.20SAS

05/25/2021 0.20Review of status report filed by WARN Act claimants in District CourtSAS

05/25/2021 0.20Review of order entered by District Court granting joint motion to staySAS

05/25/2021 0.20Review of motion for extension of time to respond to WARN Act claimsSAS

05/25/2021 0.20Review of correspondence from Hanley regarding mediation requirementsSAS

05/25/2021 0.10 SAS

05/26/2021 0.40 HER

05/26/2021 0.10 SAS
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05/26/2021 0.40Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding WARN Act claims and mediation;  
telephone conference with Kapila and Dan Fogarty regarding same

SAS

05/27/2021 0.20Conference with S. Stichter; telephone conference with S. Stichter and S.  
Kapila regarding WARN Act mediation

DRF

05/27/2021 0.30EJP

05/27/2021 1.50HER

05/27/2021 0.40Review of email from Hanley's office regarding attendance at mediation;  
dictated email to Kapila; exchange of emails with Kapila; and dictated email to  
Hanley regarding same

SAS

05/28/2021 0.50Emails and telephone conference with Ed Dobbs regarding H & KHER

05/28/2021 0.20Receipt of CT Service of Process and downloadSJ

06/01/2021 1.40HER

06/01/2021 0.90Review of Langston's motion for default; dictated email to McLaughlin  
enclosing D&O compromise order; review of email from McLaughlin; dictated 
email to Kapila enclosing motion and discussing open issues; dictated email to  
Manns and Fernandez enclosing pleadings; and review of emails from Edward  
Peterson, Manns, and Fernandez

SAS

06/01/2021 0.40Conference with Susan Jeffcoat regarding issues related to responding to  
subpoenas and process for future subpoenas; review of recently served  
subpoenas and further conference with Susan Jeffcoat

SAS

06/01/2021 0.20 SAS

06/02/2021 3.10Review database regarding WARN Act documentsDRF

06/02/2021 0.70HER

06/02/2021 0.30HER

06/02/2021 0.50Review of Langston's motion for reconsideration; dictated email to Kapila  
enclosing and discussing pleading

SAS

06/02/2021 0.30Review of email from Paul regarding outstanding bills owed to Dort & Nelson;  
dictated email to Kapila enclosing draft response; exchange of emails with  
Kapila; and dictated response to Paul

SAS

06/02/2021 2.00Emails, conference with Scott Stichter, review file regarding medical records  
subpoenas, begin drafting response letters

SJ

06/03/2021 1.30HER

06/03/2021 1.20 HER

06/03/2021 0.30Review of motion for sanctions filed by insurance company in Langston  
protective suit; dictated email to Kapila regarding same

SAS

06/03/2021 0.30 SAS

06/03/2021 0.20 SAS

06/04/2021 0.80Calls with litigation counselEJP

06/04/2021 0.50HER

06/04/2021 1.60 
 

HER
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06/04/2021 0.60 
 

HER

06/04/2021 0.40 
 

SAS

06/04/2021 0.20 SAS

06/04/2021 0.80 SAS

06/04/2021 0.60 SAS

06/04/2021 0.10 SAS

06/04/2021 0.30Review of email from Paul regarding Dort & Nelson bills; dictated email to  
Kapila enclosing draft response; review of email from Paul; and finalized  
response to Paul

SAS

06/05/2021 1.00 HER

06/05/2021 0.10Review of insurance company's withdrawal of sanctions motion against  
Langston

SAS

06/06/2021 0.80HER

06/06/2021 0.40 SAS

06/06/2021 0.20 SAS

06/07/2021 4.80Continued review of database for WARN Act documents; initial work on 
mediation statement

DRF

06/07/2021 0.60 DRF

06/07/2021 1.00EJP

06/07/2021 5.00 
 

 
 

 

HER

06/07/2021 0.30 SAS

06/07/2021 0.20 SAS

06/07/2021 2.20Work on records subpoena response letters and forwarding to Scott StichterSJ

06/08/2021 1.00Follow up regarding board meeting minutes requests as participated of  
mediation; review minutes/summary; emails to Harley Riedel regarding same

DRF

06/08/2021 2.20EJP

06/08/2021 4.00 
 

HER
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06/08/2021 0.20 SAS

06/08/2021 0.10Review of emails regarding cancellation of hearingsSAS

06/08/2021 0.20 SAS

06/08/2021 0.20SAS

06/08/2021 0.20Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding WARN Act mediation letter; review of  
emails regarding deadline to submit mediation statement

SAS

06/08/2021 1.60Work on medical records response letters, finalize and mail out lettersSJ

06/09/2021 6.10Conference with Scott Stichter; work throughout the day on WARN Act  
mediation statement

DRF

06/09/2021 2.40 
 

 

HER

06/09/2021 0.20 HER

06/09/2021 0.20SAS

06/09/2021 0.30Review and execution to responses to subpoenas for recordsSAS

06/09/2021 0.40Continue drafting medical records subpoena response lettersSJ

06/10/2021 3.90Conference with Scott Stichter regarding WARN Act mediation statement; 
work on statement and attachments; revise per comments received; 
conference with Scott Stichter

DRF

06/10/2021 0.70 DRF

06/10/2021 0.40HER

06/10/2021 0.90 SAS

06/10/2021 0.70Review of revised draft of mediation letter; dictated further revisions and  
conference with Dan Fogarty

SAS

06/11/2021 1.90Revise WARN Act mediation statement; finalize package for mediatorDRF

06/11/2021 1.00 
 

HER

06/11/2021 0.60Review of email from Kapila enclosing further revisions to mediation letter;  
review of email from Dan Fogarty enclosing additional revisions; dictated final  
revisions; and conference with Dan Fogarty

SAS

06/11/2021 0.20 SAS

06/12/2021 0.20HER

06/14/2021 0.20Conference with D. Fogarty regarding WARN Act mediationEJP

06/14/2021 1.50 
 

HER

06/14/2021 0.30 
 

SAS
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06/15/2021 0.40HER

06/16/2021 0.20Emails regarding mediation preparation issues in WARN Act litigationDRF

06/16/2021 0.30Review of email from Dan Fogarty regarding mediation issues; exchange of  
emails with Dan Fogarty and Kapila

SAS

06/17/2021 0.70Telephone call with Scott A. Stichter and S. Kapila regarding WARN Act  
mediation; telephone call with Mark Hanley regarding same

DRF

06/17/2021 0.30HER

06/17/2021 0.40Telephone conference with Kapila and Dan Fogarty regarding Monday's  
mediation and items to discuss with mediator

SAS

06/17/2021 0.20 SAS

06/17/2021 0.10Review of emails from Fernandez and Manns regarding status of allocation  
order

SAS

06/17/2021 0.10Review of email from Dan Fogarty regarding call with HanleySAS

06/18/2021 1.00Prepare draft of agreement form for WARN Act mediation per mediator letterDRF

06/18/2021 0.20HER

06/18/2021 0.10SAS

06/18/2021 0.30 SAS

06/21/2021 6.70Prepare for and attend mediation with WARN Act claimants; review of 
documents and database regarding issues raised at mediation

DRF

06/21/2021 0.50Emails regarding intellectual property; circulation of draft replyEJP

06/21/2021 2.00Meeting with Soneet and calls with courtEJP

06/21/2021 0.20HER

06/21/2021 0.20Review of email from Jennifer Altman to Soneet Kapila regarding purchase of  
LSI marketing/Intellectual property; internal communications regarding same

HER

06/21/2021 4.80Review of documents in preparation for mediation; conference with Dan  
Fogarty and Kapila in preparation for mediation; and participated in mediation

SAS

06/21/2021 0.20Follow-up call with Barack regarding WARN Act issues; dictated email to  
Gerber

SAS

06/21/2021 0.30Telephone conference with Gerber regarding mediation and WARN Act issuesSAS

06/22/2021 0.10Conference with Scott A. Stichter regarding WARN Act settlement issuesDRF

06/22/2021 0.30Emails regarding statusEJP

06/22/2021 0.60 HER

06/22/2021 0.30 HER

06/22/2021 0.20Review of email from Altman regarding Bailey Group's interest in purchasing  
certain assets

SAS

06/22/2021 0.20Review of email from Hanley regarding WARN Act mediation issues; dictated 
response

SAS

06/22/2021 0.40Conference with Harley Riedel regarding WARN Act mediation issues;  
follow-up conference with Dan Fogarty

SAS

06/22/2021 0.30Conference with Harley Riedel and Kapila regarding mediation issuesSAS

06/22/2021 0.10Review of email from Kapila regarding forwarding Altman's email regarding  
interim distributions; review of email from counsel

SAS
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06/23/2021 0.60Review and revise draft letter to Bailey counsel regarding WARN Act issues;  
conference with Scott Stichter regarding same

DRF

06/23/2021 0.80Conference with Scott Stichter and E. Peterson; work on memorandum 
regarding marketing materials

DRF

06/23/2021 0.60 HER

06/23/2021 0.20Receipt and review of proposed email regarding WARN Act issuesHER

06/23/2021 0.30Dictated email to Kapila regarding issues to be resolved in connection with  
Bailey Group's request for interim distribution

SAS

06/23/2021 1.10Dictated draft of email to Altman regarding WARN Act issuesSAS

06/23/2021 0.40Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding Altman email; review of Dan Fogarty's  
revisions; and dictated further revisions

SAS

06/23/2021 0.20 SAS

06/23/2021 0.20Conference with Edward Peterson regarding issues with regard to form of  
order approving Texas Capital compromise

SAS

06/23/2021 0.40Conference with Edward Peterson regarding Bailey Group's offer to buy IP;  
follow-up conference with Edward Peterson and Dan Fogarty

SAS

06/24/2021 0.20Conference with Scott Stichter regarding WARN Act settlement 
communications

DRF

06/24/2021 0.50EJP

06/24/2021 0.30Review email from Soneet Kapila with edits to draft email to Jennifer re:  
WARN Act update and reply by Scott Stichter;; review of revised draft email to  
Jennifer Altman from Edward Peterson re Bailey purchase

HER

06/24/2021 0.40HER

06/24/2021 0.20Dictated email to Hanley regarding mediation issuesSAS

06/24/2021 0.40 SAS

06/25/2021 0.20Receive and respond to emails regarding WARN Act issuesDRF

06/25/2021 0.10HER

06/25/2021 0.50HER

06/25/2021 0.70 
 

SAS

06/25/2021 0.50Review of email from Altman regarding existence of insurance coverage for  
WARN Act claims; review of files; dictated email to Harley Riedel and Kapila;  
review of emails from Harley Riedel, Kapila, Fenstermacher, and Dan Fogarty;  
and dictated email to Altman regarding lack of coverage

SAS

06/25/2021 0.20 SAS

06/25/2021 0.30 SAS

06/26/2021 0.30EJP

06/26/2021 0.20HER

06/26/2021 0.10HER

06/26/2021 0.20 SAS
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06/26/2021 0.30SAS

06/27/2021 0.30Exchange of emails regarding exclusions under insurance policies for WARN 
Act liabilities; review of policies

SAS

06/27/2021 0.20 SAS

06/28/2021 0.30EJP

06/28/2021 1.50EJP

06/28/2021 1.10 SAS

06/28/2021 0.60Dictated email to Altman regarding lack of WARN Act insurance coverage; 
review of email from Altman; dictated email to Kapila; and review of email from  
Kapila and Fenstamacher

SAS

06/28/2021 0.20 SAS

06/29/2021 0.50EJP

06/29/2021 0.20HER

06/29/2021 0.50 HER

06/29/2021 0.40 
 

 

SAS

06/30/2021 0.10Overview Altman objection to WARN Act claimsDRF

06/30/2021 1.00Work on claims review, calls with Soneet, and work on fee applicationsEJP

06/30/2021 2.50  
 

HER

06/30/2021 0.10Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding Bailey Group's filing of  
objection to WARN Act claim

SAS

06/30/2021 0.20Telephone conference with Barack regarding WARN Act issuesSAS

06/30/2021 0.20Review of docket entries regarding granting of motion to stay and motion to  
vacate; dictated email to Kapila forwarding orders

SAS

06/30/2021 0.30Conference with Edward Peterson, call with Edward Peterson and Kevin  
McCoy regarding claims analysis and fee applications, review file,

SJ

06/30/2021 0.40Work on motion to approve Affiliate Insurance settlement and forwarding to 
Edward Peterson

SJ

Total Professional Services Rendered $379,582.50

For Disbursements Incurred:

$9.1506/05/2020 Photocopies of Reply to Langston Objection

$1.8006/19/2020 Photocopies of NOH on SRBP 3rd Fee Appl

$7.2007/10/2020 Photocopies of Motion Abandon Collateral of Texas

$3.0007/10/2020 Postage motion to abate

$3.1507/13/2020 Photocopies of Case Management Order

$3.0007/13/2020 Postage case management order
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For Disbursements Incurred:

$1.8007/24/2020 Photocopies of NOH set for 8-27-2020

$3.6507/24/2020 Postage NOH

$85.0007/27/2020 Anthem Reporting-45712 Reporter Court Appearance 7/16/20 -

$3.7508/03/2020 Photocopies of H&K Order

$167.7008/26/2020 Photocopies of Fee Application Orders

$64.1508/26/2020 Postage fee Apps/order

$43.5009/02/2020 Photocopies of SRBP 4th Fee App

$10.8009/02/2020 Postage SRBP 4th fee application

$2.5509/08/2020 Photocopies of NOH Compromise Motion

$3.5009/08/2020 Postage NOH compromise motion

$23.6709/11/2020 Federal Express Corporation; Overnight Courier to Lindsay A.  
Lamb/Esq./Tampa.

$319.7009/14/2020 Transperfect Translations Intl., Inc.; Deposition Transcript of remote 
hearing proceedings (6/10/20, RB27428).

-$1,504.2009/24/2020 Holland & Knight; Photocopies of Laser Spine Institute files

$8.4010/14/2020 Postage 4th fee orders

$3.9010/20/2020 Postage Assignee Reply to Re

$8.4010/26/2020 Postage Order compromise w/T

$262.6010/30/2020 Anthem Reporting-51779 and 51384 Court Reporters at 9/15/20 hearings  
for Laser Spine with one transcript and one without -

$9.9011/16/2020 Photocopies.

$3.9011/16/2020 Postage charges.

$5.2512/01/2020 Photocopies.

$3.0012/01/2020 Postage charges.

$3.5012/01/2020 Postage of Not-Stat Conference

$0.8001/06/2021 Postage of letter to Indiana DOR

$2.1001/28/2021 Photocopies of NOH 2-18-21

$3.0601/28/2021 Postage of NOH 2.18.21

$40.0002/01/2021 U.S. Bank, N.A.-02012021
For documents subpoened /13857 - -

$2.8502/04/2021 Photocopies of NOH Status Conferences 2021

$3.0602/04/2021 Postage of 2021 hearing scheduled

$0.3002/23/2021 Photocopies of Doc. for Ed Dobbs

$9.9002/24/2021 Photocopies.

$0.4502/24/2021 Photocopies of file

$85.0002/24/2021 Anthem Reporting-54422 Job #114302/13857.............hearing before  
Judge Farfante - Hearing transcript

$3.0602/24/2021 Postage charges.

$2.5503/16/2021 Postage of NOH
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$3.7703/18/2021 Postage of Amended NOH

$165.0003/29/2021 Anthem Reporting-55004
Job #115493 on 3/10/21....13857 - Hearing transcript

$0.5104/01/2021 Postage of Stay Letter

$3.0604/06/2021 Postage of April 14 Trial Order

$1.5004/13/2021 Photocopies of case law

$0.3004/14/2021 Photocopies of Fla. Stat. 727.114

$1.3504/16/2021 Photocopies of case law

$7.3504/19/2021 Photocopies of Cases for D&O Litigation

$168.4504/21/2021 Anthem Reporting-52802 12/3/20 hearing before Judge Stephens  
regarding LaserSpine Institute/Kapila - Hearing transcript

$16.5004/30/2021 Photocopies of Objection to WARN Act Claims

$621.3504/30/2021 Anthem Reporting-55714 & 55757 Evidentiafy Hearing/Judge Farfante for  
LSI......Court Rpts. appearances/ Certified Copy of Soneet Kapila with  
Exhibits etc. - Hearing transcript

$7.3004/30/2021 Postage charges of objection to WARN Act POC's

$1,056.6005/03/2021 Anthem Reporting-56041 and 56102 Court Transcript of Evidentiary Hrg.  
and Court Reporter appearance/LSI - Hearing transcript

$4.5005/20/2021 Photocopies of d&o ORDER

$7.2005/20/2021 Postage of DO Order

$7.2005/20/2021 Postage of Order

$85.0006/02/2021 Anthem Reporting-56927 Job #116560 LSI, LLC, et al/Soneet  
Kapila...Hearing before Judge Farfante - Hearing transcript

$8.1606/08/2021 Postage of subpoena resp. ltrs

$34.1506/21/2021 Samaria Cafe-lunch meeting. Lunch meeting with Messrs. Kaqpila, Fogerty  
and Stichter

$1,725.0006/23/2021 Bradley Arant Boult Cummings LLP-1496684 Mediation...Deanna E. Ali  
and Heather Embry vs. LSI -

$3,639.10Total Expense Incurred
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Recapitulation

Name AmountHours

$450.001.20Bachman, Michael

$23,475.0062.60Fogarty, Dan R.

$62,687.50147.50Peterson, Edward J.

$28,645.0067.40Ketchum, Elena P.

$130,750.00261.50Riedel, Harley E.

$103,673.00241.10Stichter, Scott A.

$9,975.0026.60Ferrell-Anton, Becky

$5,547.0025.80Clendenon, Emily S



$383,221.60

$383,221.60

Disbursements

Professional Services

$157,356.12Previous Balance

$3,639.10

Total Due

$379,582.50

Total New Charges This Invoice $383,221.60

$0.00Outstanding Balance

New Charges This Invoice

$4,475.0017.90Hale, Matt B.

$750.002.50Hooi, Michael J.

$9,020.0045.10Jeffcoat, Susan

$135.001.50Whiteside, Khan

Total For Professional Services Rendered 900.70 Hours $379,582.50

$379,582.50Adjusted Services Total

Payment - Thank you, Check # 6919110-14-2020 ($50,830.32)

Payment - Thank you, Check # 6919210-14-2020 ($38,117.25)

Payment - Thank you, Check # 6919310-14-2020 ($2,091.93)

Payment - Thank you, Check # 6919410-14-2020 ($46,694.20)

Payment - Thank you, Check # 6919510-14-2020 ($19,622.42)

$16.90Retainer Balance

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You
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