Assignee.

Laser Spine Institute, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2762 CLM Aviation, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2764 LSI HoldCo, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2765 LSI Management Company, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2766 Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2767 Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cincinnati, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2768 Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2769 Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2770 Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2771 Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2772 Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2773 Medical Care Management Services, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2774 Spine DME Solutions, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2775 Total Spine Care, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2776 Case No. 2019-CA-2777 Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC Case No. 2019-CA-2780 Consolidated Case No. Assignors, 2019-CA-2762 to Soneet Kapila, Division L

## **COMPOSITE EXHIBIT A**

FIFTH INTERIM APPLICATION OF STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A. FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL FOR ASSIGNEE FOR THE PERIOD OF AUGUST 1, 2020 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2021



## TAMPA | FORT MYERS | PENSACOLA | DESTIN

DON M. STICHTER 1929-2019

RICHARD C. PROSSER

1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR. RUSSELL M. BLAIN **EMILY S. CLENDENON** JODI DANIEL DUBOSE **BECKY FERRELL-ANTON** DANIEL R. FOGARTY MATTHEW B. HALE AMY DENTON HARRIS BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI ELENA PARAS KETCHUM STEPHEN R. LESLIE EDWARD J. PETERSON, III CHARLES A. POSTLER HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II MARK F. ROBENS SUSAN HEATH SHARP SCOTT A. STICHTER G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER OF COUNSEL

## **REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA**

July 19, 2021

## INVOICE

Kapila-Laser Spine Kapila & Company 1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316

Matter: 1

Kapila-Laser Spine Client: 13857

For Professional Services Rendered:

23			
08/01/2020	HER		0.20
08/01/2020	SAS		0.10
00/00/0000	0.4.0		0.40
08/03/2020	SAS	Review of email from Stein regarding appellate brief; dictated response	0.10
08/03/2020	SAS	Review of transcript from Langston hearing on motion for preliminary injunction; dictated revisions to order; and dictated email to Schutz, Waggoner, and Alpert enclosing draft of revised order	0.60
08/04/2020	HER		0.20
08/04/2020	SAS	Review of emails from McLaughlin and Stein regarding insurance issues to be addressed in brief; dictated response; dictated email to Alpert; and exchange of emails with Alpert	0.30

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 2
08/04/2020	SAS	Continued work on Langston injunction order; including exchange of emails with counsel regarding proposed revisions to order; telephone conference with Schutz; telephone conference with Waggoner; review of email from Schutz enclosing draft of letter to chambers; dictated draft of letter to chambers submitting draft of competing order; follow-up call with Schutz; telephone conference with Alpert and McLaughlin; and further telephone conference with Waggoner	1.40
08/04/2020	SAS	Review of email from Schutz enclosing revisions to order; review of email from Alpert; and dictated email to Alpert and Waggoner	0.30
08/04/2020	SAS	Review of email from Stein enclosing revised draft of brief; dictated revisions to brief; dictated email to Stein enclosing revisions; and review of follow-up email from Stein	0.80
08/04/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Alpert regarding litigation issues; review of emails from Lamb and Stein regarding insurance issues; and dictated response	0.30
08/05/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.50
08/05/2020	HER	Conference with Edward Peterson re cash collateral issues; related electronic correspondence	0.30
08/05/2020	HER		0.30
08/05/2020	SAS	Review of email from Lamb regarding Langston response to petition for certiorari; dictated response	0.10
08/05/2020	SAS	Review of proof of claim for medical malpractice claim filed by Sandee Edwards	0.10
08/05/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Schutz regarding Langston order; telephone conference with Waggoner regarding Langston order	0.40
08/06/2020	EJP	Telephone conference with Kapila, McCoy and Harley Riedel regarding cash collateral issues	0.80
08/06/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues, including conference with Harley Riedel regarding same	0.50
08/06/2020	HER	Participation in 11:45 a.m. call with Soneet Kapila, Kevin McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral issues; follow-up	0.80
08/06/2020	HER		0.50
08/06/2020	SAS	Review of email from Alpert enclosing comments on Langston injunction order; dictated revisions to order; and dictated email to Waggoner, Alpert, and McLaughlin enclosing revised order and discussing reason for changes	0.50
08/07/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral stipulation	0.50
08/07/2020	HER		1.20
08/07/2020	SAS	Dictated email to counsel regarding status of receiving comments on Langston order	0.10
08/07/2020	SAS	Review of email from Lamb regarding Tineli litigation; conference with Susan Jeffcoat; dictated email to Lamb; and review of follow-up email from Lamb	0.30
08/09/2020	SAS	Review of email from Waggoner regarding Langston issues; dictated response; and review of email from Waggoner	0.20
08/10/2020	SAS	Dictated letter to Lamb enclosing Tinelli's documents received from CT Corporation; dictated email from Lamb regarding same; and review of email from Lamb	0.30
08/10/2020	SAS	Dictated email to Schutz enclosing revised order	0.10

Matter:	1	Bill # 49265	Page 3
08/11/20	20 EJP	Work on cash collateral stipulation	1.00
08/12/20	20 EJP	Work on cash collateral stipulation and telephone conference with Harley Riedel and Ryan Manns regarding cash collateral order	0.80
08/12/20	20 HER	Preparation for (including review of revised stipulation) and participation in 4:30 p.m. conference call with Ryan Manns and Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral issues	0.60
08/12/20	20 HER		0.50
08/12/20	20 SJ	Receipt of proof of claim and forwarding to Rachel Weiss	0.20
08/14/20	20 HER	Review of email from Ryan Manns and review of attached revised draft of the stipulation	0.30
08/14/20	20 SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
08/16/20	20 SAS	Dictated email to Schutz regarding status of providing comments on Langston distribution order	0.10
08/17/20	20 HER		0.20
08/17/20	20 SAS	Review of email from Schutz approving form of order on Langston motion; finalized order for submission; and review and revision of letter to Judge Stephens submitting order	0.30
08/17/20	20 SAS	Review of order on motion to dismiss Langston complaint	0.20
08/18/20	20 EJP	Calls with Ken Mather	0.50
08/18/20	20 HER	Work on available cash waterfall issues regarding cash collateral	0.20
08/19/20	20 HER	Telephone conference with Bob Rocke regarding litigation.	0.40
08/19/20	20 HER		0.30
08/19/20	20 HER		0.20
08/20/20	20 HER		0.20
08/20/20	20 SJ	Receipt and download CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
08/21/20	20 EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.50
08/21/20	20 HER		0.60
08/21/20	20 HER		1.30
08/24/20	20 EJP	Participated in call with McCoy, Kapila and Riedel regarding cash collateral issues	0.30
08/24/20	20 EJP	Calls with S. Kapila regarding cash collateral	0.50
08/24/20	20 HER	Review of numerous orders entered today; participation in portion of call with Kevin McCoy, Soneet Kapila, and Edward Peterson at 3:30 p.m. regarding cash collateral	0.50
08/24/20	20 HER		0.20
08/24/20			0.20
08/24/20	20 SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same, receipt of original and check and forwarding to Kevin McCoy	0.40
08/24/20	20 SJ	Review CT invoices, email to Soneet Kapila and Kevin McCoy	0.70
08/25/20	20 EJP	Calls with H. Riedel and client regarding cash collateral	0.30

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 4
08/25/2020	) EJP		0.70
08/25/2020	) HER	Multiple items of electronic correspondence regarding cash collateral issues, surcharge, and August 26 hearings; telephone conference with Edward Peterson; participation in conference call with Soneet Kapila, Mr. Peterson, and Kevin McCoy at 4:30 p.m.	1.10
08/25/2020	) SJ	Emails regarding 4th fee application status and review of file	0.20
08/26/2020	) EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	2.50
08/26/2020	) HER	Work on cash collateral issues.	0.80
08/26/2020	) HER		0.40
08/26/2020	) SJ	Work on 4th fee applications and forwarding to Edward Peterson, finalize and file same	2.00
08/26/2020	) SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
08/27/2020	) EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.50
08/27/2020	) HER		1.20
08/27/2020	) HER		0.30
08/27/2020	) SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and chambers regarding continuing hearings	0.20
08/28/2020	) EJP	Emails with Jennifer Altman	0.30
08/28/2020	) HER	receipt and review of revised stipulation for cash collateral and related emails	0.40
08/30/2020	) EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.50
08/30/2020	) SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding bank group's revisions to cash collateral settlement motion; dictated response; and review of follow-up emails	0.30
08/31/2020	) EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	1.00
08/31/2020	) HER		0.20
08/31/2020	) SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral and fee application issues	0.20
08/31/2020	) SAS	Review of email from Lamb regarding documents served by Tenelli; review of email from Susan McKee; and dictated response regarding service of documents on CT Corporation	0.30
08/31/2020	) SJ	Emails, work on SRBP 4th fee application, forwarding of invoices to Edward Peterson	0.50
09/01/2020	) EJP	Work on stipulation, including conference with Scott Stichter and dictated email enclosing revisions	0.50
09/01/2020	) SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing revisions to motion to approve stipulation; and conferences with Edward Peterson	0.30
09/01/2020	) SJ	Work on SRBP fourth fee application and forwarding to Edward Peterson, finalize and file same	0.60
09/02/2020	) HER		0.10
09/02/2020	SAS	Review of pleadings filed in Langston state court litigation	0.10
09/03/2020	) EJP	Work on cash collateral	0.50
09/03/2020	) HER		0.20
09/04/2020	) EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	1.00
09/04/2020	) HER		0.60

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 5
09/04/2020	SJ	Revise cash collateral motion and stipulation, finalize and file same	0.80
09/04/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
09/08/2020	HER		0.20
09/08/2020	HER	Telephone conference with Stuart Markman regarding status of case.	0.20
09/08/2020	SAS	Review of notice of hearing on bank compromise motion	0.10
09/08/2020	SAS	Review of email from Schutz regarding concerns with compromise motion; dictated email to Edward Peterson discussing issues raised by Schutz	0.30
09/08/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate; review emails and Langston amended complaint, draft and file notice of assignment	0.60
09/09/2020	BFA		3.20
09/09/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding issues raised by Schutz	0.20
09/10/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same	0.20
09/11/2020	EJP	Preparation for hearings	1.00
09/11/2020	HER		0.40
09/12/2020	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding Langston issues; dictated response	0.30
09/12/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding next week's hearings; exchange of emails with Edward Peterson	0.30
09/14/2020	EJP	Conferences with Matt Hale and Scott Stichter regarding objections to bank compromise motion; exchange of emails with Scott Stichter and Soneet Kapila regarding same	0.80
09/14/2020	EJP	Telephone conference with Mather regarding tomorrow's hearings; follow-up conference with Scott Stichter	0.40
09/14/2020	EJP	Telephone conference with Stichter, Gerber, Manns and Fernandez regarding tomorrow's hearings; follow-up conference with Stichter	0.50
09/14/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral stipulation and preparation for hearings	4.00
09/14/2020	HER		0.40
09/14/2020	MBH	Conference with Scott Stichter and Edward Peterson regarding settlement objections	0.40
09/14/2020	MBH	Research of law regarding objection to settlement motion	0.80
09/14/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding Schutz's issues to bank compromise motion	0.20
09/14/2020	SAS	Review of Langston's objection to bank compromise motion; conference with Edward Peterson and Matt Hale; review of pleadings; further conference with Matt Hale; and further conference with Edward Peterson	1.70
09/14/2020	SAS	Review of Bailey Group's objection to compromise motion	0.30
09/14/2020	SAS	Review of email from Hill regarding WARN Act issues; dictated response; and telephone conference with Hill regarding pending litigation in the case	0.20
09/14/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding call with Mather and tomorrow's hearings	0.20
09/14/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Kapila regarding tomorrow's hearings; dictated response; and review of follow-up emails from Kapila and McCoy	0.20
09/14/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Gerber, Manns, Fernandez, and Edward Peterson regarding tomorrow's hearings and filed objections; follow-up conference with Edward Peterson	0.50

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 6
09/15/2020	EJP	Preparation for hearing, including calls with appearing counsel and exchange of emails; attended hearings	4.00
09/15/2020	HER		0.50
09/15/2020	SAS	Participated in portion of call with Edward Peterson, Fernandez, Manns, and Schutz regarding today's hearing	0.70
09/15/2020	SAS	Review of follow-up emails from Schutz, Mann, and Edward Peterson; review of Langston's amended objection; conference with Edward Peterson; and emails from Mather, Manns, and Edward Peterson regarding procedures for handling Bailey objection	0.60
09/16/2020	EJP	Work on Declaration	0.50
09/17/2020	SJ	Receipt and review CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
09/17/2020	SJ	Review file, draft TCB compromise order and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.40
09/18/2020	EJP	Work on Declaration	0.30
09/18/2020	HER		0.20
09/21/2020	EJP	Continued work on Declaration	0.30
09/21/2020	HER	Review of electronic correspondence;	0.70
09/22/2020	HER		1.10
09/22/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Manns regarding status of order and Kapila declaration	0.10
09/22/2020	SJ	Review file, draft 4th interim fee orders and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.70
09/23/2020	HER		0.70
09/23/2020	SJ	Revise TCB compromise order and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.20
09/24/2020	EJP	Work on orders from hearings	0.50
09/24/2020	HER		0.30
09/25/2020	HER		0.20
09/25/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
09/27/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.50
09/28/2020	EJP	Dictated and enclosing draft of Kapila Declaration	0.20
09/28/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.30
09/28/2020	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing draft of Kapila Declaration; review of emails from McCoy, Edward Peterson, and Kapila enclosing executed Declaration	0.40
09/28/2020	SAS	Review of motion filed in Langston state court lawsuit to extend time to serve complaint	0.20
09/30/2020	SAS	Review of Langston's notice of appeal	0.20
09/30/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30
10/01/2020	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson to Schutz enclosing draft of bank compromise order; review of email from Schutz enclosing revisions; and dictated email to Edward Peterson discussing Schutz's revisions	0.40
10/01/2020	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding recently commenced garnishment action; dictated response regarding need to file notice in garnishment action	0.20
10/01/2020	SAS	Review of Langstons' request for production to bank	0.20

Matter:	1	Bill # 49265	Page 7
10/04/202	20 EJP	Review of E-mail correspondence with from Schutz enclosing revisions to cash collateral stipulation; exchange of emails with Stichter	0.40
10/04/202	20 SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding revisions to cash collateral stipulation requested by Schutz; review of email from Manns providing additional revisions; review of email from Schutz; and exchange of emails with Edward Peterson	0.40
10/05/202	20 HER		0.30
10/05/202	20 SAS	Review of email from Weiss regarding issuance of Indiana tax warrant; dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat regarding need to prepare a notice	0.20
10/05/202	20 SAS	Review of emails from Weiss and Kapila regarding receipt of product recall notice; dictated response; and review of email from Kapila	0.20
10/05/202	20 SJ	Receipt and review of CT service of process, download and circulate	0.20
10/05/202	20 SJ	Review file and email to CT regarding SRBP becoming registered agent	0.50
10/06/202	20 EJP	Work on order on motion to approve compromise	0.50
10/06/202	20 HER		0.50
10/06/202	20 SAS	Review of email from Mather enclosing Bailey Group's revisions to order approving compromise; dictated response to counsel discussing revisions; and conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	0.40
10/06/202	20 SAS	Review of emails from Manns and Fernandez regarding Bailey Group's revisions to order; dictated revisions to order; conference with Edward Peterson; review of email from Edward Peterson to co-counsel enclosing revisions; and review of follow-up emails	0.70
10/07/202	20 HER	·	0.40
10/07/202		Dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat regarding litigation issues; review of email from Susan Jeffcoat; dictated response; and review of garnishment notice	0.30
10/07/202	20 SJ	Emails, draft notice of assignment in garnishment action and forwarding to Scott Stichter, finalize and file same; draft letter to Indiana DOR regarding filing and forwarding to Scott Stichter; forwarding of procedure for change of registered agent to SRBP to Edward Peterson	0.60
10/08/202	20 EJP	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding Bailey Group's revisions to cash collateral order; review of emails from Manns and Fernandez; dictated revisions; and dictated email enclosing revised order	1.10
10/08/202	20 EJP	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding Bailey Group's revisions to cash collateral order; review of emails from Manns and Fernandez; dictated revisions; and dictated email enclosing revised order	1.10
10/08/202	20 SAS	Review of Manns' revisions to compromise order; dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding same	0.20
10/09/202	20 SAS	Review of status report filed by WARN Act plaintiff	0.10
10/09/202	20 SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson to Mather enclosing revision to order approving compromise	0.10
10/09/202	20 SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
10/12/202	20 EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
10/12/202	20 HER		0.90
10/12/202	20 SAS	Review of email regarding pending state court litigation; dictated response	0.10
10/12/202	20 SAS	Telephone conference with attorney regarding pending garnishment action	0.20

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 8
10/12/2020	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding settlement of Streiter claims; review of emails from McCoy, Kapila, and Edward Peterson; dictated response	0.50
10/13/2020	EJP		2.00
10/13/2020	HER		2.20
10/14/2020	EJP	Work on litigation issues	1.00
10/14/2020	HER		0.50
10/14/2020	SAS	Review of Bailey Group's objection to allocation of expenses in compromise motion; conference with Edward Peterson; and further conference with Edward Peterson regarding form of reply	0.60
10/14/2020	SJ	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding change of registered agent, email to Soneet Kapila and Kevin McCoy regarding same, review file, update chart of CT outstanding invoices and forwarding to Soneet Kapila and Kevin McCoy	1.80
10/15/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
10/15/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	1.00
10/15/2020	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro's settlement with medical malpractice plaintiff; dictated response; conference with Edward Peterson; exchange of emails with Alpert; review of files; dictated email to Edward Peterson enclosing patient receivables list; further conference with Edward Peterson; and review of follow-up emails from Edward Peterson and Mann	0.70
10/15/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
10/16/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
10/16/2020	HER		0.40
10/17/2020	HER		0.40
10/18/2020	HER		0.20
10/19/2020	EJP	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding Laserscope Claimants' objection	0.30
10/19/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.50
10/19/2020	HER		0.50
10/19/2020	SAS	Review and revision of reply to Laserscopic Claimants' objection; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	1.40
10/19/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
10/20/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	1.00
10/20/2020	SAS		0.20
10/20/2020	SAS		0.50
		follow-up conference with Edward Peterson; and review of email regarding filed reply	
10/20/2020	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding waiver of Stichter accounts receivables; exchange of emails with Alpert, Mann, and Edward Peterson	0.40
10/21/2020	EJP	Review of compromise order entered by Court; dictated email to counsel enclosing order	0.20
10/21/2020	EJP	Work on discovery	0.50
10/21/2020	EJP	Conference call with B. Rocker regarding litigation matters and emails	0.50

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 9
10/21/2020	HER		0.10
10/21/2020	MBH	Call with Bob Rock and Andrea Holder	0.20
10/21/2020	SAS	Review of email from Weiss forwarding email from counsel regarding pending Medicare hearing; dictated response; and review of emails from Kapila and Weiss	0.30
10/22/2020	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding entry of compromise order; conference regarding calendaring dates and deadline on order	0.20
10/22/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT past due notices/invoices, forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.20
10/23/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.40
10/23/2020	HER		1.30
10/26/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.80
10/26/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues.	0.30
10/26/2020	HER		1.00
10/26/2020	SAS	Review of email regarding subpoena for deposition of corporate representative served on Kapila; dictated email to Edward Peterson; telephone conference with Edward Peterson; and review of follow-up emails	0.40
10/27/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matter	0.30
10/27/2020	HER		0.20
10/27/2020	MBH		0.70
10/27/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
10/28/2020	MBH		0.50
10/28/2020	MBH		8.40
10/29/2020	HER		1.10
10/30/2020	HER		1.20
10/30/2020	SAS		0.10
10/30/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
10/31/2020	HER		0.20
11/02/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
11/02/2020	ESC		0.20
11/02/2020	HER		0.10
11/02/2020	HER		2.00
11/02/2020	SAS	Review of email from Knopik regarding recently filed lawsuit; exchange of emails with Kapila, Edward Peterson; and Harley Riedel	0.30
11/02/2020	SJ	Research court records for Tinelli lawsuit, download and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.20
11/03/2020	HER	i delice.	0.70

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page	10
11/03/2020	SAS	Review of Tinelli lawsuit; dictated email to Edward Peterson; review of email from Edward Peterson; dictated email to Kapila and Knopik; review of emails from Knopik and Harley Riedel; dictated email to Waggoner; and review of email from Waggoner	1	1.00
11/03/2020	SAS	Review of email regarding status of scheduling a final evidentiary hearing on Bailey Group objection	C	0.10
11/03/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	C	0.20
11/04/2020	EJP	Dictated email to Manns regarding Langston issues; review of email from Manns	C	).20
11/04/2020	ESC		1	1.30
11/04/2020	SAS	Review of notice of dismissal of garnishment action	C	0.10
11/04/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Manns regarding Langston issues	C	0.10
11/05/2020	ESC		2	2.20
11/05/2020	ESC		1	1.80
11/05/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding Manns' email; dictated emails to Manns discussing Langston and Tinelli state court litigation; review of files; and dictated follow-up emails enclosing pleadings	1	1.10
11/06/2020	EJP	Review of emails regarding claims objection deadline; dictated response	C	0.10
11/06/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	C	0.30
11/06/2020	HER		2	2.20
11/06/2020	HER		C	0.60
11/06/2020	SAS	Review of email from Manns regarding Langston issues; dictated response	(	0.20
11/06/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	C	0.20
11/09/2020	HER		(	0.30
11/12/2020	HER		2	2.00
11/12/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.20
11/13/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	(	0.50
11/13/2020	HER		4	1.50
11/13/2020	HER	review of court orders regarding 11/17 hearing	(	0.20
11/13/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding court's scheduling of hearing on Bailey Group's objection to allocation of fees in compromise motion	C	0.20
11/13/2020	SAS	Review of email from Weis enclosing creditor inquiry from Carol Gregory; dictated email to Gregory	C	0.30
11/14/2020	HER		2	2.50
11/14/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Schutz regarding litigation issues; dictated response; and review of email from Schutz	C	0.30
11/15/2020	EJP	and review of email from condiz	1	1.30
11/15/2020	HER			2.80
. 1/ 10/2020	IILIX		2	

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 11
11/16/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
11/16/2020	HER		0.20
11/16/2020	HER		0.10
11/16/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding scheduled dates in connection with trial on compromise motion	0.20
11/16/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Fernandez, Manns, and Edward Peterson regarding claims objection deadline and pleadings filed by Schutz	0.30
11/16/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
11/17/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
11/17/2020	HER		0.40
11/17/2020	MBH		1.10
11/18/2020	BFA		2.30
11/18/2020	HER		0.30
11/18/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30
11/19/2020	BFA		3.00
11/19/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
11/19/2020	EJP		0.40
11/19/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
11/19/2020	EPK		2.80
11/19/2020	HER		1.60
11/19/2020	SAS		0.30
11/19/2020	SAS	Review of email from Waggoner regarding Tinelli litigation against the bank; dictated response; exchange of emails regarding obtaining copies of complaint; dictated to Schutz; review of emails from Schutz enclosing filed pleadings; and dictated email to Schutz	0.40
11/19/2020	SAS	Dictated email to Manns and Fernandez regarding complaints filed by Tinelli and Langston; review of email from Fernandez	0.10
11/20/2020	BFA		2.20
11/20/2020	EPK		6.70
11/20/2020	HER		1.20
11/20/2020	MBH		0.40
11/20/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
11/21/2020	EPK		0.40
11/21/2020	HER		0.80
11/21/2020	SAS		0.90
11/22/2020	HER		0.50
11/23/2020	BFA		3.70

Matter:	1	Bill # 49265	Page	12
11/23/20	)20 EF	K	8	3.00
11/23/20	)20 HE	R	2	2.40
11/23/20	)20 SA	S The state of the	,	1.20
11/23/20	)20 SA	S	(	0.10
11/23/20	20 S	Organize Tinelli and Langston recently filed complaints and pleadings	(	0.30
11/24/20	)20 EJ	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding notice of appeal; exchange of emails with Scott Stichter and Ryan Manns	(	0.40
11/24/20	)20 EJ	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	(	0.50
11/24/20	)20 EF	K	į	5.50
11/24/20	)20 HE	R	3	3.70
11/24/20		and exchange of emails with Edward Peterson		0.40
11/24/20				0.40
11/24/20		, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,		0.10
11/24/20	)20 SA	to Manns; and exchange of emails with Manns and Edward Peterson	(	0.30
11/24/20		issues	(	0.30
11/25/20				0.50
11/25/20	)20 EJ	P Calls with bank counsel regarding litigation issues	(	0.50
11/25/20	)20 EF	K	(	3.20
11/25/20	)20 HE	R	,	1.30
11/25/20	)20 MJ	H Review and respond to E-mail correspondence with from E. Peterson re: response to motion for reconsideration and briefly review motion	(	0.50
11/25/20	)20 SA	S	2	2.60
11/25/20	)20 SA	S Review of statute in preparation for call; telephone conference with Edward Peterson and Manns	(	0.60
11/25/20	020 SA	Review of email from Schutz regarding filing of motion for reconsideration; exchange of emails with counsel regarding scheduling of call; and review of emails from Edward Peterson and Michael Hooi regarding deadline to response to motion for reconsideration	(	0.40
11/25/20	)20 SA		(	0.10
11/25/20				0.20
11/27/20		•		3.50
11/27/20	)20 HE	R	,	1.30
11/27/20	020 SA	S Dictated emails regarding complaint and supplementary procedures filed by Schutz	(	0.20

Matter:	1		Bill # 49265	Page	13
11/27/20	)20	SAS	Review of email from Jeffcoat regarding employment records subpoena; dictated response	(	0.20
11/27/20	)20	SAS	Dictated email to parties regarding pleadings filed by Schutz	(	0.20
11/29/20	)20	HER		(	0.10
11/29/20	)20	SAS	Further review of Langston and Tinelli pleadings; dictated email to Kapila discussing pleadings; and review of email from Kapila	•	1.20
11/29/20	020	SAS		(	0.10
11/30/20	020	EJP	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding call with bank	(	0.20
11/30/20	)20	EJP	Participated in conference call with Stichter, Manns, and Hendriz regarding pleadings filed by Schutz	(	0.40
11/30/20	)20	EJP	Dictated email to counsel regarding available hearing time; review of E-mail correspondence with from Manns; and conference with Stichter	(	0.30
11/30/20	020	EJP	Work on litigation matters		1.00
11/30/20	)20	EPK			
11/30/20	)20	HER			1.20
11/30/20	)20	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding today's call with bank group	(	0.20
11/30/20		SAS	Comprehensive that Zumaru Fotoroom regarding today of oair that barint group		1.10
11/30/20	)20	SAS		(	0.20
11/30/20	)20	SAS	Telephone conference with Manns, Edward Peterson, and Hendrix regarding call regarding pleadings filed by Schutz	(	0.40
11/30/20	)20	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson and Manns regarding court's availability for status conference; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	(	0.30
11/30/20	020	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding employee records subpoena	(	0.10
12/01/20	)20	EJP	Dictated E-mail correspondence with to counsel regarding scheduling of status conference; review of follow-up emails from parties	(	0.40
12/01/20	020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	(	0.50
12/01/20	)20	EPK		2	2.60
12/01/20	)20	HER		2	2.50
12/01/20	)20	HER		(	0.30
12/01/20	)20	SAS			1.10
12/01/20	)20	SAS		(	0.20
12/01/20	)20	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson, Mather, Kapila, and Schutz regarding request to schedule status conference and parties' availability for status conference	(	0.40
12/01/20	)20	SAS	Dictated email to counsel enclosing draft of email to Schutz; dictated draft of motion to schedule status conference		1.20
12/01/20	)20	SAS	Review of emails regarding scheduling of status conference and comments on draft email to Schutz	(	0.30
12/01/20	)20	SAS	Review and revision of drafts of witness lists and exhibit lists	(	0.30

Matter:	1		Bill # 49265	Page	14
12/01/20	020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson, Manns, and Kapila regarding witness and exhibit lists; telephone conference with Kapila regarding status of proceedings	(	0.40
12/01/20	020	SAS	Review of email scheduling status conference; exchange of emails with Edward Peterson regarding status conference	(	0.10
12/01/20	020	SAS	Review of pleadings in appellate case; review of Second District Court of Appeal's order to show cause; exchange of emails regarding appeal issues	(	0.30
12/01/20	020	SAS	Telephone conference with Manns, Fernandez, Gerber, and Edward Peterson regarding Thursday's hearing; dictated follow-up emails; and conference with Edward Peterson	(	0.50
12/01/20	020	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding appeal issues; dictated follow-up emails	(	0.20
12/02/20	020	BMB		(	0.50
12/02/20	020	EJP	Dictated email regarding scheduling of pre-trial hearing on objection	(	0.20
12/02/20	020	EJP	Telephone conference with Scott Stichter regarding pending matters	(	0.20
12/02/20	020	EJP		(	0.50
12/02/20	020	EPK		•	1.50
12/02/20	020	EPK		(	0.40
12/02/20	<b>120</b>	EPK		,	2.80
12/02/20		EPK			2.60 1.50
12/02/20	J20	LIIX			1.50
12/02/20	020	HER		;	3.30
12/02/20	020	SAS			1.00
	-				
12/02/20	020	SAS		•	1.50
12/02/20	020	SAS	Dictated outline of presentation for tomorrow's hearing;	(	0.60
12/02/20	020	SAS		(	0.50
12/02/20	020	SAS	Finalized witness and exhibit list for filing with court regarding trial on objection	(	0.30
12/02/20	020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson regarding scheduling of pre-conference meeting in connection with trial on objection	(	0.10
12/02/20	020	SAS	Review of Langstons' and Tinellis' motion to relinquish jurisdiction filed in appeal; dictated email regarding calendaring expense deadline	(	0.30
12/02/20	020	SAS	3 3 1 1122 222	(	0.10
12/03/20	020	BMB		(	0.70
12/03/20	020	EPK			1.00
12/03/20	020	EPK			1.00

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 15
12/03/2020	EPK		0.50
12/03/2020	HER		0.90
12/03/2020	MBH		0.30
12/03/2020	MBH		0.70
12/03/2020	SAS	Review of email from Mather regarding scheduling of pretrial conference call; review of additional exhibits; and review of email from Manns	0.30
12/03/2020	SAS	Preparation for hearing; telephone conference with Fernandez; review of emails from Fernandez and Manns; attended hearing; and telephone conference with Manns, Gerber, and Fernandez following hearing	1.60
12/03/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Mather regarding issues related to trial and outcome of today's hearing	0.30
12/03/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Barack regarding pending matters in case	0.20
12/03/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Schutz regarding parties' position on dismissal of appeal; dictated response; and review of emails from Mather and Fernandez	0.30
12/03/2020	SAS		0.80
12/03/2020	SAS		0.40
12/03/2020	SAS	Review of order denying motion to relinquish jurisdiction	0.40
12/03/2020	SAS	review of order derrying motion to reiniquish jurisdiction	0.30
12/03/2020	SAS	Dictated email to Mather regarding scheduling of pre-trial scheduling conference; exchange of emails with Mather	0.20
12/03/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
12/03/2020	SJ		0.50
12/04/2020	EJP	Dictated email regarding D&O issues	0.30
12/04/2020	EPK		0.30
12/04/2020	EPK		0.30
12/04/2020	EPK		2.50
12/04/2020	EPK		0.70
12/04/2020	EPK		3.50
12/04/2020	HER		2.50
12/04/2020	MBH		0.40
12/04/2020	MBH		0.40
12/04/2020	SAS		0.20
12/04/2020	SAS		0.80
1210412020	UAU		0.00

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 16
12/04/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Edward Peterson regarding pending matters	0.20
12/04/2020	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding D&O issues; dictated response; dictated email to counsel regarding bank loan memo; review of email from Dan Fogarty; dictated response; and telephone conference with Dan Fogarty	0.30
12/04/2020	SAS		0.30
12/05/2020	HER		0.50
12/05/2020	SAS		0.10
12/05/2020	SAS	Review of files regarding claims addressed by compromise motion	0.40
12/05/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding mediation issues	0.20
12/06/2020	EPK		0.20
12/06/2020	HER		1.10
12/06/2020	SAS	Review of Langston's response to order to show cause	0.40
12/06/2020	SAS		0.20
12/06/2020	SAS		0.50
12/07/2020	EJP		0.50
12/07/2020	HER		6.30
12/07/2020	MBH		0.50
12/07/2020	SAS		0.10
12/07/2020	SAS		0.40
12/01/2020	OAO		0.40
12/07/2020	SAS		0.90
12/07/2020	SAS		0.40
12/07/2020	SAS		0.20
12/07/2020	SAS	Review of email from Mather regarding scheduling of depositions; dictated response; and review of email from Mather	0.20
12/07/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Mather and Edward Peterson regarding final evidentiary hearing on compromise motion; follow-up conference with Edward Peterson	0.40
12/08/2020	EJP		0.20
12/08/2020	HER		12.00

Matter:	1		Bill # 49265	Page	17
12/08/20	020	MBH		(	0.90
12/08/20	020	MBH		(	0.20
12/08/20	020	SAS	Review of emails regarding confidentiality agreement and mediation issues;	(	0.20
12/08/20	020	SAS	dictated response  Review of emails from Manns and Edward Peterson regarding trial on bank	(	0.20
12/08/20	020	SAS	compromise motion  Review of emails from Weiss and Kapila regarding Indiana Department of Revenue collection efforts; dictated response; and dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat	(	0.20
12/08/20	020	SAS	ochood:	(	0.20
12/08/20	020	SAS	Telephone conference with Manns regarding bank compromise trial; conference with Edward Peterson	(	0.30
12/09/20	020	BFA		3	3.10
12/09/20	020	HER		(	0.60
12/09/20	020	HER	Telephone conference with Bob Rocke	(	0.30
12/09/20	020	MBH		(	0.20
12/09/20	020	SAS		(	0.20
12/09/20	020	SAS	Review of Langston's motion to extend time to file brief; dictated email to Edward Peterson	(	0.20
12/09/20	020	SAS		(	0.20
12/09/20	020	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila regarding bank compromise trial; review of email from Kapila	(	0.10
12/09/20	020	SAS	Dictated email to Mather regarding documents for the court to take judicial notice; review of email from Mather	(	0.20
12/09/20	020	SJ	Receipt and review CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.20
12/10/20	020	BFA		3	3.40
12/10/20	020	EJP		(	0.20
12/10/20		EJP			0.30
12/10/20		EPK			0.20
12/10/20	020	HER		,	1.50
12/10/20	020	SAS		(	0.50
12/10/20	020	SAS		(	0.20
12/10/20	020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding pre-trial statement to be filed with	(	0.20
12/10/20	020	SAS	court; dictated email to Mather regarding scheduling a call Review of email from Fernandez regarding next week's trial; dictated response	(	0.10

Matter:	1		Bill # 49265	Page	18
12/11/20	)20 E	ESC		2	2.50
12/11/20	)20 H	HER		(	0.70
12/11/20	)20	SAS	Review of email from Mather regarding litigation issues; dictated response	(	0.10
12/11/20	)20	SAS		(	0.20
12/11/20	)20	SAS	Dictated draft of Joint Prehearing Conference Report; dictated email to Fernandez, Manns, Edward Peterson, and Mather enclosing draft	(	0.60
12/11/20	)20	SAS	Review of Second DCA docket; dictated email to counsel regarding contacting Judge Stephens' chambers; review of emails from Mather and Fernandez, and dictated email to outcome of call with chambers	(	0.30
12/11/20	)20	SAS	Exchange of emails with Polit and McCoy regarding bank compromise trial issues	(	0.20
12/11/20	)20 \$	SAS	Continued work on joint prehearing report, including review of email from Mather enclosing revisions; dictated response; telephone conference with Mather; telephone conference with Manns; and exchange of emails with Mather regarding documents to be included in Exhibit A; and dictated revisions to Exhibit A	(	0.90
12/11/20	)20	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.20
12/12/20	)20 \$	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson, McCoy, and Kapila regarding trial issues; dictated response	(	0.20
12/13/20	)20 I	BFA		•	1.50
12/13/20	)20 H	HER		(	0.20
12/14/20	)20 I	BFA		•	1.40
12/14/20	)20 I	EJP		(	0.30
12/14/20	)20 I	EJP			1.00
12/14/20	)20 I	EJP	Telephone conference with Stichter, McCoy and Kapila regarding bank compromise litigation	(	0.40
12/14/20	)20 E	ESC		•	1.30
12/14/20	)20 H	HER	Brief conferences with Edward J. Peterson regarding cash collateral settlement	(	0.20
12/14/20	)20 H	HER		4	4.40
12/14/20	)20	SAS		(	0.60
12/14/20	)20	SAS	Telephone conference with Edward Peterson, McCoy, and Kapila regarding bank compromise litigation issues	(	0.40
12/14/20	)20 \$	SAS	Review of email from Mather regarding status of court order cancelling bank compromise trial; exchange of emails with Edward Peterson; and review of emails regarding cancellation of hearing	(	0.30

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page	19
12/15/2020	HER		3	3.80
12/15/2020	HER	Work on TCB settlement issues and possible settlement of Bailey objection	ſ	0.40
12/15/2020	MBH	Work of 1 ob section on issues and possible section of balley objection		0.40
12/15/2020	SAS		(	0.20
12/15/2020	SAS		(	0.30
12/15/2020	SAS		(	0.80
12/15/2020	SAS	Review of email from Mather regarding cancellation of trial on bank compromise motion; review of email from Edward Peterson	(	0.10
12/16/2020	HER	compromise motion, review of email from Edward Peterson	2	2.90
12/16/2020	MBH		(	0.30
12/16/2020	SAS	Review of email from Manns regarding tomorrow's appellate oral argument; dictated response	(	0.20
12/16/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Bukas and Matt Hale regarding status of uploading documents designated as confidential by EFO; review of email from Bukas	(	0.20
12/16/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.30
12/17/2020	EJP	Dictated E-mail correspondence with to Stichter and Rocke regarding privilege documents; review of follow-up emails	(	0.30
12/17/2020	HER		(	0.60
12/17/2020	MBH	Call from Suruchi Banez; review emails and files; return call	(	0.30
12/17/2020	SAS		(	0.20
12/17/2020	SAS		(	0.30
12/18/2020	EJP		(	0.30
12/18/2020	HER		(	0.30
12/18/2020	HER		(	08.0
12/18/2020	HER		(	0.40
12/18/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Altman regarding bank compromise motion; review email from Kapila to Altman; and review of further email from Altman	(	0.30
12/18/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.20
12/19/2020	HER			0.30
12/21/2020	EJP		(	0.20
12/21/2020	HER		(	0.20

	Bill # 49265	Page 20
HER		0.30
SAS		0.60
SAS		0.60
HER		0.40
SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding service of Tinelli lawsuit; review of lawsuit; dictated email to Lamb enclosing lawsuit; and exchange of emails with Lamb	0.40
SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.50
HER		0.10
SAS	Watched video recording of Langston oral argument before Second District	0.60
SAS	Dictated email to Edward Peterson, Fernandez, and Manns regarding Langston Second District Court of Appeal argument	0.30
ESC		3.60
HER		2.20
ESC		2.50
HER		1.60
SJ	Receipt of Shaw medical records subpoena via UPS, email to Kevin McCoy	0.30
HER	regarding check for copies and forwarding of check to Kevin McCoy	1.50
TILIX		1.50
SAS	Review of email from Wagner regarding Tinelli litigation: dictated response	0.30
SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
HER		1.50
HER		1.50
SAS		0.30
HER		3.00
SAS		0.70
	SAS SAS HER SAS SJ HER SAS HER SAS HER SAS HER SAS HER SAS	HER SAS  Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding service of Tinelli lawsuit; review of lawsuit; dictated email to Lamb enclosing lawsuit; and exchange of emails with Lamb  SJ Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate HER SAS Watched video recording of Langston oral argument before Second District Court of Appeal  Dictated email to Edward Peterson, Fernandez, and Manns regarding Langston Second District Court of Appeal argument  ESC HER  SJ Receipt of Shaw medical records subpoena via UPS, email to Kevin McCoy regarding check for copies and forwarding of check to Kevin McCoy HER  SAS Review of email from Wagner regarding Tinelli litigation; dictated response SJ Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate HER HER

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 21
01/06/2021	HER		0.20
01/06/2021	SAS	Dictated correspondence to Indiana Department of Revenue regarding issuance of tax warrant	0.50
01/07/2021	ESC		2.30
01/07/2021	HER		5.00
01/07/2021	SAS		1.40
01/07/2021	SAS	Review of email from Manns regarding Langston issues; review of files; and dictated email to Manns enclosing portion of requested documents	0.30
01/08/2021	HER		3.30
01/08/2021	SAS		0.30
01/08/2021	SAS	Continued review of files regarding Langston documents; dictated email to Stein; review of email from Stein; and dictated email to Manns enclosing additional documents	0.50
01/08/2021	SJ	Receipt of CT past due notices and new invoices, update chart and reforwarding of past due notices and current invoices to Soneet Kapila	1.00
01/09/2021	HER		0.70
01/10/2021	HER		1.40
01/11/2021	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy and Susan Jeffcoat regarding CT continuing invoices and change in registered agents	0.20
01/11/2021	SAS	involces and onange in registered agents	0.20
01/11/2021	SAS		0.20
01/12/2021	HER		1.50
01/12/2021	HER		1.80
01/12/2021	SAS		0.60
01/12/2021	SAS	Review of email from Mather regarding status of Langston appeal; review of Second DCA docket; and dictated email to Mather	0.30
01/12/2021	SAS	Review of Second DCA's order dismissing appeal; dictated email to Mather enclosing order	0.20
01/13/2021	EJP		1.00
01/13/2021	HER		0.20
01/13/2021	HER		0.10
01/13/2021	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding Second DCA order and action to be taken	0.20

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page	22
01/13/2021	SAS	Review of emails from Mather, Edward Peterson, and Kapila regarding bank's deficiency claim	(	0.20
01/13/2021	SAS	Review of email from Schutz regarding litigation issues; dictated email to co-counsel; and further review of motion for reconsideration in preparation for call with bank counsel	(	0.50
01/13/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with bank counsel and Edward Peterson regarding Schutz's motion for reconsideration	(	0.30
01/13/2021	SJ	Emails, conference with Edward Peterson, call with Edward Peterson and Kevin McCoy regarding past due invoices, summarize payment arrangement and forwarding to Edward Peterson and Kevin McCoy, forwarding of past due invoices to Adrienne Napoli for payment	,	1.00
01/14/2021	EJP		(	0.50
01/14/2021	HER		(	0.30
01/14/2021	SAS	Review of emails regarding pending matters	(	0.20
01/14/2021	SAS	Review of further emails regarding responding to Bailey Group's request for information as to bank's deficiency claim	(	0.20
01/15/2021	HER		;	3.00
01/15/2021	HER			1.00
01/15/2021	SAS	Dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat and Edward Peterson regarding CT issues; conference with Susan Jeffcoat and Edward Peterson regarding same	(	0.20
01/15/2021	SAS		(	0.30
01/15/2021	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.20
01/18/2021	EJP		(	0.50
01/18/2021	HER		(	0.20
01/20/2021	HER		(	0.40
01/20/2021	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding fee application issues; conference with Susan Jeffcoat	(	0.10
01/20/2021	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.30
01/21/2021	HER		•	1.20
01/22/2021	HER		(	0.30
01/22/2021	HER		2	2.00
01/22/2021	SAS		(	0.60
01/23/2021	HER		(	0.10
01/25/2021	EPK			2.80
01/25/2021	HER		(	3.80
01/25/2021	SAS	Review of email from Waggoner regarding Trells issues; dictated response; and review of follow-up email from Waggoner	(	0.20
01/26/2021	EJP		(	0.50
01/26/2021	EPK		3	3.20

Matter:	1	Bill # 49265	Page	23
01/26/202	21 HER		(	0.70
01/26/202	21 SAS	Telephone conference with Waggoner regarding Tinelli litigation; dictated email to Lamb and McLaughlin; and exchange of emails with Lamb	(	0.40
01/26/202	21 SAS		(	0.10
01/26/202	21 SAS	Review of emails regarding Farfante trial and hearing procedures and schedule of hearings; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing schedule of hearings; and dictated email to Manns, Fernandez, and Gerber enclosing schedule of hearings	(	0.40
01/27/202	21 EJP	Conference with S. Stichter	(	0.30
01/27/202	21 EPK			1.50
01/27/202		Telephone conference with Schutz regarding Tinelli litigation and motion for reconsideration issues; conference with Edward Peterson; and dictated email to Manns, Gerber, and Fernandez		0.60
01/27/202	21 SAS	Telephone conference with Mather regarding issues regarding allocation of fees and costs; conference with Edward Peterson; and dictated email to Manns, Gerber, and Fernandez	(	0.60
01/27/202	21 SAS	Review of emails regarding preparation of draft notice of status conference	(	0.20
01/27/202	21 SAS	Telephone conference with Lamb and McLaughlin regarding Tinelli's litigation	(	0.40
01/27/202	21 SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.30
01/28/202	21 EPK			1.00
01/28/202				1.00
01/29/202	1 HER			1.00
01/29/202	21 SAS	Review of correspondence from insurance company regarding denial of coverage on Tinelli; review of email from Richeimer regarding denial of representation for Holden; conference with Edward Peterson; and review of emails from Richeimer, Alpert, and McLaughlin	(	0.70
01/29/202	21 SAS	Telephone conference with Alpert, Richeimer, and McLaughlin regarding Tinelli	(	0.40
01/31/202	21 EJP	Work on status report		1.00
01/31/202	1 HER		(	0.20
02/01/202	21 EJP	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding outcome of hearing and MedPro issues	(	0.30
02/01/202	21 EJP	Work on status report		1.00
02/01/202	21 SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding outcome of Friday's call and MedPro issues	(	0.20
02/01/202	21 SAS	Telephone conference with Waggoner regarding Tinelli state court litigation	(	0.10
02/01/202	21 SAS	Review of emails regarding scheduling of hearings	(	0.10
02/02/202	21 EJP	Work on status report	(	0.50
02/02/202	1 HER		(	0.50
02/03/202	1 HER		(	0.20
02/03/202	21 SJ	Receipt and review CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.20
02/04/202	21 EJP		(	0.50
02/04/202	21 HER			1.10
02/04/202	21 SAS	Review of emails regarding scheduling of hearings	(	0.20

Matter:	1		Bill # 49265	Page	24
02/05/20	021	EJP	Work on status report		1.00
02/05/20	021	EJP	Work on settlement motion		1.00
02/05/20	021	EJP	Work on motion to approve settlement	(	0.50
02/05/20	021	ESC		(	0.20
02/05/20	021	HER		(	0.40
02/05/20	021	HER	Work on counter-demand in mediation		1.20
02/05/20	021	SAS		(	0.80
02/05/20	021	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding pending litigation	(	0.20
02/05/20	021	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	(	0.20
02/08/20	021	EJP	Work on status report and motion to approve compromise		1.50
02/08/20	021	HER		(	0.60
02/08/20	021	SAS	Review of MedPro's motion to dismiss filed in Tinelli state court litigation; dictated email to Lamb regarding same	(	0.50
02/08/20	021	SAS	Review of email from Kastner regarding judgment and orders entered in California litigation; telephone conference with Kapila; and exchange of emails with Kastner	(	0.60
02/08/20	021	SJ	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding D&O settlement and motion to approve	(	0.20
02/09/20	021	HER		(	0.40
02/09/20	021	SAS	Review and revision of draft of status conference memo		1.40
02/09/20	021	SAS	Telephone conference with Kastner regarding litigation issues	(	0.20
02/09/20	021	SJ	Review CT Corporation invoices and file, emails to Kevin McCoy; receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate		1.20
02/10/20	021	EJP	Work on status report		1.50
02/10/20	021	HER		(	0.20
02/10/20	021	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila regarding call with Kastner	(	0.10
02/10/20	021	SAS	Conference regarding revisions to status report; review of emails from Edward Peterson, Kapila, and Battista regarding status report	(	0.30
02/11/20	021	EJP	Work on status report		1.50
02/11/20	021	HER		(	0.10
02/11/20	021	SAS	Review of email from McCoy enclosing revisions to status report; review of email from Edward Peterson	(	0.20
02/11/20	021	SAS	Review of emails regarding status reports; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	(	0.20
02/12/20	021	EJP	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding WARN Act issues	(	0.20
02/12/20	021	EJP	Work on status report and motion to approve settlement	;	3.00
02/12/20	021	SAS	Telephone conference with Cabassa regarding pending matters in case	(	0.20
02/12/20	021	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding call with Cabassa and WARN Act issues	(	0.20
02/12/20	021	SAS	Conference with Knopik regarding WARN Act issues	(	0.20
02/12/20	021	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson, Manns, Kapila, and Battista regarding Status Report	(	0.20

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 2	25
02/12/2021	SJ	Work on D&O compromise approval motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson	2.5	50
02/13/2021	EJP	Conference call with B. Rocke	0.5	50
02/13/2021	SAS	Review of emails from Rocke and Edward Peterson regarding settlement agreement and settlement appraisal issues; review of draft of settlement agreement	0.4	Ю
02/14/2021	SJ	Revise compromise approval motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.2	20
02/15/2021	EJP	Work on status report and review of settlement agreement	1.5	50
02/15/2021	HER		0.1	0
02/15/2021	HER	Review and revision of draft status report for circulation internally;	0.6	30
02/15/2021	SAS	Review and revision of status report; review of Harley Riedel's revisions; conference with Edward Peterson; review of follow-up emails; review of further revised draft; and review of further emails	1.2	20
02/16/2021	EJP	Dictated emails regarding litigation issues	0.2	20
02/16/2021	EJP	Preparation for status conference	1.0	)0
02/16/2021	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Kapila regarding litigation issues	0.1	0
02/16/2021	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding Thursday's hearings	0.2	20
02/16/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with Manns regarding Thursday's hearings; conference with Edward Peterson regarding call with Manns	0.3	30
02/16/2021	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same	0.2	20
02/17/2021	EJP	Prep for status conference	5.0	00
02/17/2021	SAS	Review of pleadings filed in connection with motion for reconsideration in preparation for call	0.7	'0
02/17/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with Gerber, Manns, Lieb, and Edward Peterson regarding motion for reconsideration scheduled for hearing	0.7	'0
02/17/2021	SAS	Dictated email to Edward Peterson discussing the status of Tinelli and Langston state court litigation	0.4	Ю
02/17/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with Mather and Edward Peterson regarding litigation issues	0.3	30
02/17/2021	SAS		0.3	30
02/17/2021	SJ	Review file, download and print documents and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.3	30
02/18/2021	EJP	Preparation and time for status conference	5.5	50
02/18/2021	HER		0.7	'0
02/18/2021	SAS		1.1	0
02/18/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with Edward Peterson regarding today's hearing	0.2	20

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 26	3
02/18/2021	SAS		1.30	)
02/18/2021	SAS	Review of emails from Schutz and Hendricks regarding today's hearings; telephone conference with Schutz; and telephone conference with Edward Peterson regarding call with Schutz	0.50	)
02/18/2021	SAS	1 eterson regarding can with condiz	0.60	)
02/18/2021	SAS		0.50	)
02/18/2021	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and download same	0.20	
02/19/2021 02/19/2021	HER SAS	Review of email from Lamb enclosing order denying Langston petition; dictated response; dictated email to Waggoner; and dictated email to Kapila	0.40 0.40	
02/19/2021	SAS	and McCoy enclosing opinion	0.30	C
02/19/2021	SJ	Review emails and file, draft trial scheduling order and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.60	)
02/20/2021	HER		0.20	)
02/21/2021	HER		0.20	)
02/21/2021	SAS		0.10	)
02/22/2021	EJP	Calls regarding patient documents	0.50	)
02/22/2021	HER		2.30	)
02/22/2021	SAS	Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding release of writ of garnishment	0.10	0
02/22/2021	SAS		0.10	
02/23/2021	HER		2.50	C
02/23/2021	SAS	Review of email from Waggoner enclosing revisions to settlement agreement, settlement motion, and order granting settlement motion and discussing open issues	0.60	)
02/23/2021	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding Waggoner's revisions to settlement agreement; dictated response	0.20	)
02/24/2021	EJP	Work on settlement motion	0.50	)
02/24/2021	HER	Work on litigation matters	0.50	)
02/24/2021	SAS	Review and revision of court's order scheduling final evidentiary hearing; conference with Edward Peterson; review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing draft of notice of hearing on motion to reconsider; and review of follow-up emails	0.40	)

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page	27
02/24/2021	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	C	).20
02/25/2021	EJP	Work on language for settlement and trial order	C	0.60
02/25/2021	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding status of discussions regarding finalizing settlement agreement and compromise pleadings; dictated insert to settlement agreement; further conference with Edward Peterson; review of email from Edward Peterson to Rocke; and review of emails from Rocke and Sbor	C	0.60
02/25/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with Alpert regarding Tinelli's motion for reconsideration	C	0.20
02/25/2021	SAS	Review of emails from Manns and Edward Peterson regarding trial scheduling order; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same and retention of experts	C	0.30
02/26/2021	SAS		C	).10
02/26/2021	SAS	Review of email from Schutz regarding D&O settlement agreements; dictated response	C	).10
03/01/2021	EJP	Work on trial orders	C	0.30
03/01/2021	HER		1	1.50
03/01/2021	SAS		C	).20
03/01/2021	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	C	0.30
03/02/2021	EJP	Work on research issues regarding settlement	1	1.00
03/02/2021	HER		1	1.90
03/02/2021	HER		C	).70
03/02/2021	HER		C	0.40
03/02/2021	MJH		1	1.80
03/02/2021	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Mather regarding trial scheduling order	C	).10
03/02/2021	SAS		C	).50
03/02/2021	SAS		C	0.50
03/03/2021	EJP	Work on orders and calls	1	1.00
03/03/2021	SAS			).30
03/03/2021	SAS		C	).70
03/03/2021 03/04/2021	SAS EJP	Review of email from Cabassa regarding pending matters; dictated response Work on trial preparation		).10 ).50

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 28
03/04/2021	SAS	Review of email from Mather enclosing questions as to allocation formula; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy	0.30
03/04/2021	SJ	Review invoice from CT for PA statutory representation, review file and forwarding of invoice to Assignee	0.30
03/05/2021	EJP	Prep for trial on allocation issues	2.00
03/05/2021	HER		2.40
03/05/2021	SAS	Review of email regarding preparation of agenda for next week's hearing; conference with Edward Peterson regarding hearing	0.20
03/05/2021	SAS	Review of email from Maloy addressing issues raised by Mather's email; conference with Edward Peterson	0.90
03/05/2021	SAS	Review of documents to be uploaded to court; conference with Edward Peterson	0.20
03/05/2021	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
03/06/2021	EJP	Dictated email regarding Langston issues; review of follow-up emails	0.20
03/06/2021	HER		0.50
03/06/2021	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing draft of correspondence to court; dictated response; review of emails from Hendrix, Fernandez, and Manns regarding same; and review of emails from Hendrix and Schutz regarding preparation of binders for Langston hearings	0.40
03/06/2021	SAS	Review of email from Altman regarding allocation issues; dictated response; and review of email from Mather	0.20
03/08/2021	EJP	Prep for hearings	1.50
03/08/2021	SAS	Dictated email to Kastner regarding status of settlement discussions	0.10
03/08/2021	SAS	Conference regarding finalizing hearing binder to deliver to chambers	0.20
03/08/2021	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Hendrix regarding tomorrow's hearing; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same; and review of emails from Edward Peterson and Kapila	0.30
03/08/2021	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing draft of email to Mather; review of files; dictated email to Edward Peterson enclosing revisions to email; and dictated email to Kapila enclosing draft of response	0.60
03/08/2021	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing draft of email to Mather; review of files; dictated email to Edward Peterson enclosing revisions to email; and dictated email to Kapila enclosing draft of response	0.60
03/08/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with Edward Peterson, Gerber, Fernandez, and Manns regarding Wednesday's hearing	0.50
03/09/2021	HER	Work on D & O settlement issues	1.00
03/09/2021	HER		0.30
03/09/2021	SAS		0.60
03/09/2021	SAS	Review of email from Kapila enclosing revisions to Mather response; dictated further revisions; dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing revisions; and exchange of emails with Kapila and McCoy	0.30

Matter:	1	Bill # 49265	Page	29
03/09/20	021 SA	Telephone conference with Kapila and McCoy regarding Mather response; dictated revisions; dictated email to Gerber and Manns enclosing draft; and review of email from Manns	1	0.50
03/09/20	)21 SA	S Exchange of emails with Schutz regarding tomorrow's hearing		0.10
03/10/20	)21 EJ	Prep for hearing		0.50
03/10/20	)21 EJ	Preparation for hearing and time for same		2.50
03/10/20	)21 EP			0.80
03/10/20	)21 HE	R		1.30
03/10/20	)21 HE	R		1.00
03/10/20	)21 SA	Review of emails from Edward Peterson regarding Judge Farfante's procedures for submitting competing order; review of email from chambers regarding submitting competing order and outcome of today's hearings		0.20
03/10/20	)21 SA		1	0.40
03/10/20	)21 S.	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same		0.20
03/11/20	)21 HE	R		0.50
03/11/20	)21 HE	R		0.40
03/11/20	)21 SA	Review of email from chambers regarding dates for hearings to consider compromise motion	1	0.10
03/11/20	)21 SA	·	1	0.20
03/11/20	)21 SA			0.20
03/12/20	)21 HE	R Review of records regarding Bereczki suit; telephone conference with Dennis Waggoner; emails with client	1	0.80
03/12/20	)21 SA	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Manns regarding submission of competing orders; review and revision of letter to Judge Farfante; and dictated email to Edward Peterson and Manns enclosing draft		0.40
03/12/20	)21 SA	Review of email from Manns approving form of letter to Judge Farfante; finalized letter and attachment for filing with court; conference with Edward Peterson; review of draft email and dictated revisions		0.40
03/12/20	)21 SA	Review of email from Mather regarding allocation issues; exchange of emails with Mather regarding same	ı	0.20
03/12/20	)21 SA	· ·	1	0.20
03/14/20	)21 SA	·		0.10
03/15/20	)21 EJ	Exchange of emails with Rocke regarding compromise order; review of email from Stichter		0.30
03/15/20	)21 EJ	Calls with Soneet		0.50
03/15/20	)21 HE	R		0.40
03/15/20	)21 HE	R		0.60
03/15/20	)21 HE	3	1	0.40

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page 30
03/15/2021	SAS	Review of Mather's correspondence to chambers submitting competing order	0.10
03/15/2021	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding revisions to letter; dictated revisions; and exchange of emails with McCoy	0.40
03/15/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with McCoy, Kapila, and Edward Peterson regarding revisions to Mather response	0.40
03/15/2021	SAS		0.30
03/15/2021	SAS	Review of emails regarding scheduling of hearing date to consider D&O compromise motion	0.10
03/15/2021	SAS		0.30
03/16/2021	HER		0.80
03/16/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with Cabassa regarding status of finalizing D&O compromise motion; dictated responses; and review of email from Cabassa	0.20
03/16/2021	SAS		0.20
03/16/2021	SAS		0.20
03/16/2021	SAS		0.60
03/16/2021	SAS	Review of email from chambers confirming hearing date for D&O compromise motion	0.10
03/17/2021	EJP		0.80
03/17/2021	HER		0.40
03/18/2021	HER		0.50
03/19/2021	HER		0.40
03/19/2021	SAS	Review of email from Sbar enclosing exhibits to settlement agreement; dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding status of finalizing settlement motion; and review of email from Edward Peterson	0.30
03/19/2021	SAS	Review of email from Weiss forwarding U.S. Department of Defense collection email; review of email from Kapila; dictated response; review of follow-up email from Kapila; dictated email to Susan Jeffcoat; dictated email to Weiss; and review of email from Weiss	0.40
03/19/2021	SJ	Emails regarding service list, review file and circulate	0.40
03/22/2021	HER		0.20
03/22/2021	HER		0.10

03/22/2021 **HER** 0.9003/22/2021 **HER** 0.10 1.00 03/23/2021 **EJP** 03/23/2021 1.00 **HER** 03/23/2021 **HER** 1.30 03/23/2021 SAS Review of email from McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding fee application 0.10 Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Susan Jeffcoat regarding 03/24/2021 SAS 0.20 preparation of applications; dictated response **EJP** 03/25/2021 0.30 03/25/2021 SAS Dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding status of finalizing D&O 0.20 settlement agreement; review of email from Edward Peterson; and review of further email from Edward Peterson regarding call with Rocke 03/25/2021 SAS Review of email from Susan Jeffcoat regarding Transworld collection letter; 0.20 review of draft response; and conference with Susan Jeffcoat 03/25/2021 SAS Review of email enclosing executed settlement agreement; review of email 0.20 from Edward Peterson regarding trial draft settlement motion; dictated response; and review of email from Edward Peterson to Sbar 03/25/2021 SJ Emails, review file, draft notice letter to Transworld and forwarding to Scott 0.40 Stichter 03/26/2021 **EJP** 0.50 03/26/2021 **HER** 0.40 03/26/2021 SAS Review of emails from Rocke, Edward Peterson, and Susan Jeffcoat 0.30 regarding filing of D&O compromise motion; conference with Edward Peterson; and review of email from Rocke regarding pleading to be filed with District Court SAS Review of emails from Mather and Edward Peterson regarding status of order 03/26/2021 0.40 scheduling evidentiary hearing; exchange of emails with Edward Peterson and Mather regarding discovery issues 03/26/2021 SAS Conference with Edward Peterson regarding finalizing motion to approve D&O 0.20 compromise; telephone conference with Edward Peterson and Sbar 03/26/2021 SAS Dictated email to Cabassa regarding filing of D&O compromise motion; 0.20 telephone conference with Cabassa SAS 03/26/2021 Review of email regarding outstanding invoices; dictated response 0.10 SAS 03/26/2021 Review of email regarding outstanding invoices; dictated response 0.10 SJ 03/26/2021 Emails, work on D&O compromise motion and exhibits, forwarding to Edward 1.30 Peterson and Scott Stichter, call with Edward Peterson, finalize and file motion 03/29/2021 **HER** 0.20 03/29/2021 SJ Begin work on fifth fee applications, review file, emails, forwarding of drafts to 2.20 **Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter** 03/30/2021 **EJP** Calls with Ken Mather 0.50 03/30/2021 **HER** 0.50 Telephone conference with Barrack regarding WARN Act issues; conference 03/30/2021 SAS 0.30 with Edward Peterson regarding same

Bill # 49265

Matter:

Page

31

Matter: 1		Bill # 49265	Page	32
03/30/2021	SAS	Review of email from Sbar enclosing fully executed contingency fee agreement	(	0.10
03/30/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with Mather and Edward Peterson regarding issues with regards to motion to compromise regarding allocation	(	0.50
03/30/2021	SAS	Review of emails from Harley Riedel regarding fraudulent transfer litigation and privilege issues	(	0.20
03/31/2021	EJP	Prep for trial on Bailey objection	(	0.50
03/31/2021	HER	Receipt and review of electronic correspondence regarding discovery and process re objection to allocation settlement agreement	(	0.30
03/31/2021	HER		(	0.70
03/31/2021	SAS	Work on litigation issues, including dictated email to client and counsel regarding call with Mather; review of responses; dictated response; telephone conference with Kapila regarding deposition dates; conference with Edward Peterson; exchange of emails with counsel coordinating deposition dates; conference with Edward Peterson; dictated revisions to pleadings; and exchange of emails with Kapila and Edward Peterson	•	1.90
03/31/2021	SAS	Further exchange of emails with Mather and Kapila regarding deposition issues	(	0.20
04/01/2021	EJP		(	0.30
04/01/2021	HER		(	0.20
04/01/2021	HER		(	0.40
04/01/2021	HER		(	0.30
04/01/2021	SAS		(	0.70
04/01/2021	SAS	Finalized letter to Transworld responding to demand letter	(	0.10
04/01/2021	SAS	Review and revision of draft of joint pre-trial statement; dictated email		0.40
		enclosing revisions to pre-trial statement		
04/01/2021	SAS	Review of email from Mather regarding order scheduling final evidentiary hearing; conferences regarding obtaining copy of order; and dictated response to Mather	(	0.20
04/01/2021	SAS	Exchange of emails with Mather regarding discovery issues; review of email from Edward Peterson	(	0.20
04/01/2021	SAS		(	0.10
04/01/2021	SJ	Receipt and download CT Service of Process, circulate same	(	0.30
04/01/2021	SJ	Finalize and mail notice letter to Transworld Systems	(	0.20
04/02/2021	EJP	Prep for trial on Bailey objection		1.00
04/02/2021	HER		(	0.10
04/02/2021	SAS		(	0.20
04/02/2021	SAS		(	0.30
04/02/2021	SAS	Telephone conference with Kapila regarding deposition issues	(	0.20