

Laser Spine Institute, LLC
CLM Aviation, LLC
LSI HoldCo, LLC
LSI Management Company, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cincinnati, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC
Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC
Medical Care Management Services, LLC
Spine DME Solutions, LLC
Total Spine Care, LLC
Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC

Case No. 2019-CA-2762
Case No. 2019-CA-2764
Case No. 2019-CA-2765
Case No. 2019-CA-2766
Case No. 2019-CA-2767
Case No. 2019-CA-2768
Case No. 2019-CA-2769
Case No. 2019-CA-2770
Case No. 2019-CA-2771
Case No. 2019-CA-2772
Case No. 2019-CA-2773
Case No. 2019-CA-2774
Case No. 2019-CA-2775
Case No. 2019-CA-2776
Case No. 2019-CA-2777
Case No. 2019-CA-2780

Assignors,

Consolidated Case No.
2019-CA-2762

to

Soneet Kapila,

Division L

Assignee.

COMPOSITE EXHIBIT A

**THIRD INTERIM APPLICATION OF STICHTER, RIEDEL,
BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A. FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL FOR ASSIGNEE FOR
THE PERIOD OF NOVEMBER 1, 2019 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2020**

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

DON M. STICHTER
1929-2019
RICHARD C. PROSSER
1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL DUBOSE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
SCOTT A. STICHTER

G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER
OF COUNSEL

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

June 04, 2020

Soneet Kapila
Kapila-Laser Spine
Kapila & Company
1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316
USA

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Kapila-Laser Spine
Client: 13857
For Professional Services Rendered:

11/01/2019	MBH	Call with Bank group attorneys; receive and review email from Toby Gerber	0.60
11/01/2019	HER	Numerous emails regarding settlement meeting with Waggoner clients	0.50
11/01/2019	HER	Review of email from Toby Gerber to Hugh Ray	0.10
11/01/2019	SHS	Office conference with Edward Peterson; research issue related to liquidating trustee; and draft email to Edward Peterson regarding the same	1.20
11/01/2019	EJP	Work on settlement with Centurion and calls with bank	1.50
11/01/2019	EJP	Work on litigation issues	1.50
11/01/2019	BMB	Review and revise settlement agreement	1.40
11/04/2019	HER	Work on coordination of settlement efforts regarding eleven fraudulent transfer defendants	0.70
11/04/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral issues	0.20
11/04/2019	SAS	Review of records; dictated email to Gerber enclosing all parties asserting claims that are owed accounts receivable and discussing receivables	0.30
11/04/2019	EJP	Preparation for bank meeting, including conference with Scott Stichter	0.50
11/04/2019	EJP	Conference with Michael Bachman regarding Scottsdale lease issues	0.20
11/04/2019	EJP	Preparation for settlement meetings	1.50
11/04/2019	BMB	Correspondence regarding Tampa lease issues	0.30
11/04/2019	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding Scottsdale lease issues	0.20
11/04/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
11/05/2019	HER	Preparation for and participation in 3:00 p.m. conference call regarding strategy and issues for	1.30

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

11/05/2019	SAS	upcoming settlement meeting with Dennis Waggoner; analysis regarding same	0.20
11/05/2019	SAS	Review of correspondence from Rueben Johnson regarding claim against Laser Spine; conference with Susan McKee	0.20
11/05/2019	SHS	Office conference with Edward Peterson regarding liquidation of assets and final report	3.50
11/05/2019	EJP	Preparation for settlement conference	0.20
11/05/2019	EJP	Follow up on cash collateral issues and lease issues	2.50
11/05/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
11/05/2019	BMB	Call with client and Edward J. Peterson regarding Tampa lease, landlord issues; follow up conference with Edward J. Peterson; review of correspondence to lender's counsel regarding same; review of lease	1.10
11/05/2019	BMB	Review of Tampa lease and correspondence regarding same; review of correspondence from counsel for landlord	1.90
11/05/2019	SJ	Revise lease rejection motion for Tampa location and draft notice of abandonment of Tampa location and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.20
11/06/2019	MBH	Review financial documents in advance of settlement conference	0.40
11/06/2019	MBH	Settlement conference with transfer defendants	4.40
11/06/2019	HER	Preparation for and participation in meeting with Dennis Waggoner and Patrick Moseley (with Soneet Kapila, litigation counsel, and Edward Peterson); follow-up	5.40
11/06/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding status bank's approval of MedPro letter; dictated response	0.20
11/06/2019	EJP	Emails regarding ERISA plan; work on motion to reject	0.50
11/06/2019	EJP	Preparation for and time for settlement meeting	6.00
11/06/2019	BMB	Review of letter from counsel for Tampa landlord; discussions with Edward J. Peterson; and review of proposed response	0.40
11/06/2019	SJ	Review file and late claim, forwarding to Rachel Weiss	0.20
11/07/2019	BFA	Meeting with Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel regarding research for LSI	0.40
11/07/2019	HER	Work on fraudulent transfer settlements, including multiple emails and conference with Becky Ferrell-Anton and Edward Peterson regarding research project, and emails regarding joint defense agreement.	1.30
11/07/2019	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding WARN Act issues; dictated response	0.20
11/07/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Gerber regarding MedPro settlement letter	0.20
11/07/2019	EJP	Work on landlord issues	1.00
11/07/2019	BMB	Discussions regarding response to Highwoods; review of comments to same	0.30
11/07/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30
11/07/2019	SJ	Conference with Edward Peterson, review file to begin work on second fee applications	1.40
11/08/2019	HER	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding WARN Act liabilities	0.20
11/08/2019	HER	Review of and reply to email from Jennifer Altman; review of revised Engagement Letter (forwarded to Soneet for review and comment)	0.60
11/08/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Bob Rocke regarding fraudulent transfer settlement issues and status; internal communications regarding same	0.30
11/08/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Barack regarding WARN Act issues and liquidation of WARN Act liabilities; conference with Harley Riedel; and telephone conference with Kapila regarding same	0.60
11/08/2019	BMB	Review of communications regarding Tampa lease	0.20
11/11/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Dennis Waggoner regarding further extension and settlement status; email to client regarding same; telephone contacts with Soneet Kapila, Bob Rocke and Edward Peterson; follow-up.	1.20
11/11/2019	SAS	Dictated draft of email to Barack discussing WARN Act claim issues; dictated email to Edward Peterson and Matt Hale enclosing draft	0.60
11/11/2019	DRF	Call with E. Peterson, Genovese Joblove attorney and Rocke McLain lawyer regarding litigation issues; research and email regarding arbitration	2.70
11/11/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
11/12/2019	HER	Telephone conference with Dennis Waggoner conveying settlement offers for his client group; email to Soneet Kapila and litigation counsel regarding same	0.60

11/12/2019	SAS	Review of correspondence from Pennsylvania Consumer Protection Bureau; conference with Susan McKee	0.20
11/12/2019	SJ	Work on fee applications and forwarding to Edward Peterson	1.50
11/13/2019	HER	Work throughout the day on settlement of fraudulent transfer claims of TKE, Avery, Allen, SLI, Surgen, Gannon, Cooper, Weiss, Gruber, and Prada, including numerous communications by telephone and email with opposing counsel, litigation counsel, and client.	5.00
11/13/2019	HER	Participation in conference call with Bob Rocke, Paul Battista and Greg Garno regarding response to threatened motion to dismiss or for more definite statement; follow-up conference including with Michael Bachman	0.40
11/13/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence regarding budget	0.20
11/13/2019	HER	Review of email from Jennifer Altman regarding employment	0.10
11/13/2019	HER	Review of emails regarding Warnell Franks claim	0.10
11/13/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
11/13/2019	BMB	Review of files and correspondence with regard to board minutes, resolutions, [REDACTED]; discussions with Harley E. Riedel regarding same; email correspondence with litigation counsel regarding same; continue review of files with regard to LSI entities corporate documents	4.90
11/13/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
11/14/2019	HER	Work on bank issues, including electronic correspondence regarding cash collateral and bank issues with client and communications with Edward Peterson regarding same and scheduling of call with bank counsel.	0.80
11/14/2019	HER	Work on proposed settlement of fraudulent transfer actions; emails with Jon Sbar regarding extension of tolling agreement; review of emails and additional documents received from Dennis Waggoner regarding collectability issues.	2.40
11/14/2019	HER	Review of and reply to email from Paul Battista re suit against [REDACTED].	0.20
11/14/2019	HER	Emails with Edward Peterson regarding H&K; further revision of assignee engagement letter (emailed to Soneet Kapila for review); further emails into evening with Mr. Kapila regarding same; review of communications from Jennifer Altman.	1.40
11/14/2019	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding intellectual property issues; conference with Edward Peterson	0.20
11/14/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Alpert regarding Albanese settlement issues	0.20
11/14/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Alpert regarding Monday's hearings; conference with Edward Peterson; and telephone conference with Alpert	0.20
11/14/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
11/14/2019	EJP	Emails with Toby Gerber; preparation for call with Bank	1.50
11/14/2019	BMB	Review of corporate materials with regard to membership and management makeup; compile memorandum summarizing same	2.80
11/14/2019	BMB	Continue review of corporate materials with regard to membership and management makeup; compile memorandum summarizing same	3.60
11/14/2019	SJ	Revise Tampa location lease rejection motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.20
11/15/2019	MBH	Call with bank attorneys; revisions to status report	0.50
11/15/2019	HER	Review of email from Soneet Kapila with attached executed LSI Pillsbury Engagement letter; email to Jennifer Altman attaching final version of engagement letter executed by Mr. Kapila; follow-up.	0.70
11/15/2019	HER	Preparation for (including electronic correspondence) and participation in 3:30 p.m. conference call with bank counsel.	1.30
11/15/2019	SAS	Brief conference with Susan Jeffcoat regarding medical record issues	0.10
11/15/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Edward Peterson, Harley Riedel, and Gerber regarding pending matters	0.50
11/15/2019	SAS	Review of email from Court canceling hearing	0.10
11/15/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Susan McKee, Edward Peterson, Khan Whiteside, and McCoy regarding state court plaintiff's request for documents; conference with Susan McKee; and conference with Khan Whiteside	0.30

11/15/2019	EJP	Emails regarding hearings and calls with patient; preparation for status hearing	2.00
11/15/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
11/15/2019	BMB	Review of corporate materials for all LSI entities; update summary with regard to same	6.20
11/15/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
11/15/2019	SJ	Emails regarding medical records and draft pleadings, conference with Scott Stichter	0.20
11/16/2019	SAS	Review of Class Representative's notice of status of class filed within District Court	0.10
11/16/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert enclosing settlement agreement signed by Albanese	0.10
11/17/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence.	0.10
11/17/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Matt Hale and Edward Peterson regarding WARN Act issues, review of email from Edward Peterson; and finalized email to Kapila enclosing draft of Barack email	0.40
11/17/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert enclosing revisions to Albanese settlement agreement; review of Albanese bankruptcy court pleadings; and dictated email to Kapila enclosing revised documents and discussing open issues	0.50
11/18/2019	MBH	Conference with Michael Bachman regarding corporate governance memorandum	0.20
11/18/2019	MBH	Review and revise status report to be filed with the court; receive and review emails and revisions regarding same	0.30
11/18/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence.	0.30
11/18/2019	SAS	Review of email from chambers regarding cancellation of hearing	0.10
11/18/2019	EJP	Work on providing information to Bailey Group and response to patient requests	1.00
11/18/2019	EJP	Work on status report and preparation for hearing	1.50
11/18/2019	BMB	Review of corporate materials	4.60
11/18/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of attorney general complaints and forwarding to Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter	0.20
11/19/2019	BFA	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding research for settlements [REDACTED]	0.30
11/19/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila and Harley Riedel approving email to Barack; finalized email to Barack	0.20
11/19/2019	EJP	Responses to patient inquiries	0.50
11/19/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
11/19/2019	KW	Call with creditor regarding service of subpoena for medical records and billing records; walk through LSI website regarding Clary document request form and FAQ tabs	0.30
11/19/2019	SJ	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding attorney general complaint by Brian Crawford, review file and forwarding of emails to Edward Peterson	0.20
11/20/2019	HER	Communications with Dennis Waggoner regarding remaining deliverables regarding collectability and review of his reply; email to Soneet Kapila regarding same.	0.40
11/20/2019	HER	Review and analysis of email from Ryan Manns with attached draft proposal regarding bank issues.	0.70
11/21/2019	HER	Further analysis of bank proposal; email to Soneet Kapila regarding same and 11/15 conference; internal communications and further communications with client; email to Ryan Manns and review of his reply; review email from Mr. Kapila.	2.30
11/21/2019	HER	Review of emails and materials received from Dennis Waggoner re: TKE Investments, LLC; numerous communications with co-counsel and client regarding same and further extension of tolling agreement.	1.20
11/21/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding causes of action.	0.10
11/21/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
11/22/2019	MJH	Conference with K. Whiteside regarding responses	0.20
11/22/2019	MBH	Receive and review objection to motion to reject lease; call with Edward Peterson regarding same; review documents regarding same	0.30
11/22/2019	HER	Work on finalization of settlements, including communications with Dennis Waggoner, review and revision of settlement documents; review of additional documents furnished by Mr. Waggoner; emails and conference call with client and co-counsel.	2.20
11/22/2019	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding defense attorney's requests for records	0.20
11/23/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation matters.	0.20

11/23/2019	HER	Review of email from Bruce Shilcutt regarding TCB proposal; electronic correspondence regarding same.	0.20
11/24/2019	HER	Emails regarding litigation.	0.10
11/24/2019	SAS	Review of email from Weiss enclosing Bailey's writ of garnishment filed in Texas; dictated email to Edward Peterson	0.20
11/25/2019	BFA	Research re [REDACTED] review of tolling agreements with SLI Ventures and Gruber Family Holdings; conference with Harley Riedel re same; prepare e mail to Soneet Kapila re same	4.70
11/25/2019	MBH	Review bank proposal; call with Soneet Kapila, Kevin McCoy, and team regarding proposal; receive, review, and comment on email from Harley Riedel regarding same	1.30
11/25/2019	MBH	Receive and review emails regarding settlement agreements; review settlement agreement issues	0.30
11/25/2019	HER	Work on documentation of 50% settlements and TKE 42.5% settlement, including drafting and circulation of proposed email to Dennis Waggoner confirming extension of tolling agreement for 24 hours; finalization and sending of email and review of email from Mr. Waggoner confirming same; work on [REDACTED], including research, conference with Becky Ferrell-Anton, and analysis of issue; multiple client and internal communications.	3.30
11/25/2019	HER	Work on bank cash collateral issues, including emails and telephone conference with Toby Gerber; conferences with Matt Hale and Edward Peterson regarding issues; conference call with Soneet Kapila and Kevin McCoy; work on reply to bank and circulation of draft; preparation for 11/26 call with bank.	2.50
11/25/2019	EJP	Calls and preparation for bank meeting	3.00
11/25/2019	SJ	Emails and review attachments regarding Bailey litigation	0.20
11/26/2019	MBH	Emails regarding settlement issues	0.20
11/26/2019	HER	Substantial work on settlement including communications by email and telephone with client and co-counsel and SRBP team, email to Dennis Waggoner accepting offer from Surgen; telephone contact with Mr. Waggoner.	2.00
11/26/2019	HER	Work on finalization of Pillsbury retention (H&K), including emails with Jennifer Altman and Soneet Kapila; review of fully-executed Pillsbury – H&K Engagement letter.	0.50
11/26/2019	HER	Final preparation for and participation in conference call with TCB; follow-up, including numerous communications internally and with client.	2.40
11/26/2019	SAS	Work on MedPro issues, including dictated email to Kapila regarding Albanese settlement; review of emails from Polit and Kapila; dictated response; review of email from Polit enclosing executed document; dictated email to Gerber regarding MedPro settlement letter; and dictated email to Alpert enclosing executed Albanese agreement	0.70
11/26/2019	EJP	Preparation for and time for Bank meeting	3.00
11/26/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate; emails and review of AG complaint	0.20
11/27/2019	MBH	Receive, review, and respond to emails regarding settlement agreements; conference with Harley Riedel regarding settlements; call with Mr. Riedel and Dennis Waggoner	0.40
11/27/2019	HER	Review of email from Kevin McCoy to TCB with attached final reconciliation from Centurion for the Tampa auction; review emails from Chris Pizzo, Soneet Kapila, Andrew Polit; review of email from Ryan Manns with attached agent's comments to the draft of the renewed cash collateral motion and his revisions thereto (forwarded to Soneet Kapila).	0.50
11/27/2019	HER	Work throughout the day on fraudulent transfer settlements, including review of settlement agreements with Prada Investments, Avery, Surgen, TKE, Allen, Gannon, Weiss Family, and the Coopers and work on terms of SLI settlement; email to Dennis Waggoner with attached documents with client signatures; conference with Matt Hale and telephone contact with Messrs. Waggoner and Hale (1:36 to 11:45 a.m.); multiple emails and telephone conferences with Soneet Kapila and Melissa Davis; further call with Mr. Waggoner; finalization of SLI settlement at \$220,000; review of further email from Mr. Waggoner with executed SLI Settlement Agreement; follow-up; internal communications regarding drafting of settlement motions.	3.40
11/27/2019	HER	Work on Assignee's Motion to Employ Pillsbury; circulation of draft to client and to Jennifer Altman ; review of Soneet Kapila comments to motion to employ Pillsbury.	0.50
11/27/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding Albanese settlement agreement; dictated response	0.10

11/27/2019	EJP	Work on issues with landlord and litigation	3.00
11/27/2019	SJ	Emails, review file, draft sale of intangible assets motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson, calls with Edward Peterson, review file regarding tolling agreement letters and forwarding to Edward Peterson, emails regarding settlements, organize executed settlements, conference with Harley Riedel, draft employment motion for Pillsbury and forwarding to Edward Peterson	2.20
11/27/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same	0.20
11/29/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Manns and Shilcutt regarding bank's consent to MedPro settlement letter; dictated response to Shilcutt's questions	0.40

Total Professional Services Rendered \$62,417.50

For Disbursements Incurred:

11/06/2019	Jimmy Johns.....Lunch meeting	\$114.62
11/07/2019	Faithful Process...Process Service on 11/5 to Mr. Ben Hom McKibbon Hospitality.	\$50.00

Total Expenses Incurred \$164.62

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Ferrell-Anton, Becky	5.40	\$2,025.00
Bachman, Michael	27.90	\$10,462.50
Fogarty, Dan R.	2.70	\$1,012.50
Peterson, Edward J.	38.90	\$16,532.50
Riedel, Harley E.	47.70	\$23,611.50
Whiteside, Khan	0.30	\$27.00
Hale, Matt B.	8.90	\$2,225.00
Hooi, Michael J.	0.20	\$60.00
Stichter, Scott A.	7.30	\$3,139.00
Sharp, Susan	4.70	\$1,762.50
Jeffcoat, Susan	7.80	\$1,560.00

Total For Professional Services Rendered 151.80 Hours \$62,417.50

Adjusted Services Total \$62,417.50

Professional Services \$62,417.50

Disbursements \$164.62

Less Prepaid Applied (\$5,300.82)

Total New Charges This Invoice \$57,281.30

Previous Balance \$776,775.32

Less Payments Received (\$413,476.11)

Outstanding Balance \$363,299.21

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

New Charges This Invoice

\$57,281.30

Bill # 44526

Total Due

\$420,580.51

Date Last Payment

May/18/2020

Last Payment Amount

\$5,300.82

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

DON M. STICHTER
1929-2019
RICHARD C. PROSSER
1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL DUBOSE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
SCOTT A. STICHTER

G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER
OF COUNSEL

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

June 04, 2020

Soneet Kapila
Kapila-Laser Spine
Kapila & Company
1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316
USA

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Kapila-Laser Spine
Client: 13857
For Professional Services Rendered:

12/02/2019	MBH	Work on memorandum regarding [REDACTED]	2.00
12/02/2019	HER	Substantial work on litigation issues, including multiple telephone contacts and emails with Jennifer Altman and Soneet Kapila, review and finalization of letter to Holland & Knight; left voice mail message for Doug Wright.	3.80
12/02/2019	BMB	Review of corporate materials	3.10
12/02/2019	SJ	Work on Pillsbury employment motion and order	0.30
12/02/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
12/03/2019	MBH	Receive and review emails regarding portfolio sale	0.20
12/03/2019	MBH	Work on memorandum regarding [REDACTED]; review of corporate documents	2.30
12/03/2019	HER	Work on and filing of Assignee's Motion To Employ Pillsbury Winthrop Shaw Pittman LLP As Special Litigation Counsel.	0.40
12/03/2019	HER	Work on fraudulent transfer issues, including telephone contact with Paul Battista and Greg Garno, follow-up, email to Dennis Waggoner regarding extension of tolling agreement regarding Gruber and review of his reply thereto; emails with Soneet Kapila regarding same; review of Gruber bank account records and email to Mr. Kapila and Melissa Davis regarding same.	0.70
12/03/2019	HER	Emails with Becky Ferrell-Anton regarding Bailey.	0.10
12/03/2019	SAS	Review of Highwood's motion to reject lease; dictated email to Edward Peterson; and review of response from Edward Peterson	0.20
12/03/2019	SAS	Review of notice from court rescheduling December hearings	0.10
12/03/2019	BMB	Review of correspondence from co-counsel; review of corporate materials	2.30

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

12/03/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
12/03/2019	SJ	Emails, review causes of action settlement agreements, draft Prada motion to approve and forwarding to Edward Peterson and Matthew Hale; emails, finalize and file motion to employ Pillsbury	1.30
12/04/2019	BFA	Review pleadings filed in Bailey collection matter to update chart of same	3.40
12/04/2019	MBH	Draft and revise draft settlement approval motion	1.50
12/04/2019	MBH	Review agreements and documents regarding sale of loan portfolio; call with Radha Bachman; conference with Scott Stichter; and emails with R. Bachman	3.30
12/04/2019	HER	Research and factual investigation regarding [REDACTED]; email to Paul Battista and Greg Garno regarding scheduling conference call regarding same.	0.50
12/04/2019	HER	Further analysis of Gruber documents and communications with client regarding same; email to Dennis Waggoner rejecting offer and countering.	0.50
12/04/2019	HER	Review of draft motion to approve settlement (Prada Investments).	0.30
12/04/2019	SAS	Review and revision of contract for sale of patient receivables; conference with Matt Hale regarding revisions to agreement	0.80
12/04/2019	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding potential sale of patient receivables	0.20
12/04/2019	BMB	Review of entity information, makeup of board and membership for all entities	2.10
12/04/2019	SJ	Emails regarding employment records for Robert Vidal, download and save	0.20
12/05/2019	BFA	Update chart in Bailey collection matter; review pleadings filed since October in same	3.80
12/05/2019	MBH	Call with Edward Peterson; receive and review email from Radha Bachman; conference with Scott Stichter; draft and send reply email regarding agreement	0.50
12/05/2019	MBH	Cash collateral motion review	0.90
12/05/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Doug Wright at 2:10 p.m.; follow-up; email to Soneet Kapila and Jennifer Altman regarding call with Mr. Wright; review email from Jennifer Altman regarding tolling agreement and reply thereto.	0.60
12/05/2019	HER	Further work on Gruber settlement, including telephone contact with Dennis Waggoner at 2:30 p.m.; review of email from Mr. Waggoner with additional documents.	0.50
12/05/2019	SAS	Review of email from Bachman enclosing questions as to sale of patient receivables; conference with Matt Hale regarding same	0.20
12/05/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding subpoena issues; conference with Susan McKee	0.30
12/05/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
12/05/2019	BMB	Review of prior email correspondence regarding settlement; review of settlement agreement and comments to same; follow up regarding sam	2.10
12/05/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download, email regarding service of same, conference with Scott Stichter regarding employee records subpoenas, review file and forwarding to Scott Stichter	0.40
12/06/2019	BFA	Continue updating chart and summary of new pleadings filed and status of Bailey collection matter; email same to Harley E. Riedel and Edward Peterson	2.80
12/06/2019	MBH	Work on corporate structure memo and review documents	1.20
12/06/2019	HER	Emails with Soneet Kapila and Melissa Davis regarding Gruber; emails with Dennis Waggoner regarding settlement, extension of tolling agreement; telephone contact with Mr. Kapila.	0.50
12/06/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence with Jennifer Altman.	0.20
12/06/2019	HER	Review of documents regarding possible fraudulent transfer claims; internal communications regarding same; review electronic correspondence regarding same; participation in 4:15 p.m. conference call with Paul Battista, Greg Garno, Bob Rocke and Edward Peterson; review of email from Mr. Battista regarding same.	1.50
12/06/2019	HER	Emails with Becky Ferrell-Anton regarding Bailey and review of chart and summary received from her.	0.50
12/06/2019	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy, Bachman, and Matt Hale regarding sale of patient receivables	0.20
12/06/2019	EJP	Work on issues with landlord	1.00
12/06/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
12/06/2019	SJ	Emails, review CT Service of Process and download	0.20
12/09/2019	BFA	Read Advanced Telecommunication Networks cases; further research about [REDACTED]	4.60

12/09/2019	MBH	Final review and revisions to operating agreement memorandum	0.50
12/09/2019	MBH	Review memo regarding collection efforts	0.20
12/09/2019	HER	Work on litigation matters, preparation for 8:45 a.m. call with client on 12/10.	0.60
12/09/2019	HER	Communications with Dennis Waggoner and client confirming Gruber settlement; began follow-up.	0.30
12/09/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding cash collateral.	0.30
12/09/2019	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding potential sale of patient receivables	0.20
12/09/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
12/09/2019	BMB	Review of corporate materials; revisions to memorandum addressing membership and manager makeup of subject entities	2.60
12/10/2019	MBH	Meeting with Edward Peterson regarding various issues	0.40
12/10/2019	MBH	Drafting of reply to landlord response on lease rejection motion; research of law	1.00
12/10/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Soneet Kapila and Paul Battista at 8:45 a.m.; further emails regarding litigation matters.	0.80
12/10/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding transfer of medical records to Florida Department of Health; review of follow-up emails	0.30
12/10/2019	EJP	Calls with J. Gusso	0.50
12/10/2019	EJP	Work on issues with landlord	2.00
12/10/2019	BMB	Finalize memorandum; email to co-counsel	0.70
12/10/2019	SJ	Emails, draft notice of transfer of medical records and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.60
12/11/2019	BFA	Continue research on [REDACTED]	3.10
12/11/2019	MBH	Drafting of reply; review of documents and pleadings; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	1.00
12/11/2019	HER	Telephone conference with Paul Battista (9:54 to 10:03 a.m.).	0.20
12/11/2019	HER	Review of and reply to email from Ryan Manns regarding cash collateral issues; review of emails from Kevin and Bruce Shilcutt, and Soneet Kapila regarding same; review of budget and attachment received from Mr. McCoy.	1.00
12/11/2019	DRF	Email to S. Stichter regarding TCB lien on intellectual property	0.20
12/11/2019	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	1.00
12/11/2019	SJ	Review emails regarding sale of assets in St. Louis and medical records transfer	0.20
12/11/2019	SJ	Review file, work on motion to approve rollover agreement and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.50
12/12/2019	MBH	Work on drafting reply to landlord claim; research of law regarding same; revise and edit same	2.40
12/12/2019	MBH	Call with bank counsel; conference with Edward Peterson	0.60
12/12/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding settlement motion; revisions to same	0.30
12/12/2019	HER	Work on cash collateral issues.	0.40
12/12/2019	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding new forms for medical requests; review of follow-up emails	0.20
12/12/2019	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	4.50
12/12/2019	BMB	Review of emails; conference with Edward J. Peterson; review of proposed settlement agreement provided by ClearOne; review of order allowing for settlement	0.90
12/12/2019	BMB	Review of prior correspondence regarding Highwoods lease issues and analysis; communications with Matthew B. Hale regarding same	0.20
12/12/2019	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
12/13/2019	MBH	Work throughout the morning on drafting and finalizing reply to landlord claim	3.50
12/13/2019	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.50
12/13/2019	BMB	Review of correspondence regarding account receivable and draft settlement agreement; draft and revise alternative form of settlement agreement	1.60
12/16/2019	MBH	Review cash collateral motion revisions	0.20
12/16/2019	MBH	Research of law on [REDACTED]	1.60

12/16/2019	MBH	Drafting of email regarding [REDACTED]; review of documents; review revised reply to landlord response to rejection	1.00
12/16/2019	HER	Work on cash collateral issues and use of cash reserve account; communications with Dan Fogarty and review email from Kevin McCoy regarding same; electronic correspondence.	1.00
12/16/2019	HER	Review of draft of amended complaint against EFO Laser Spine Institute; electronic correspondence regarding same.	0.50
12/16/2019	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding Havas Edge's claim and questions as to the claims allowance process; dictated response; and review of emails from McCoy and Edward Peterson	0.30
12/16/2019	DRF	Receive and respond to email from H. Riedel regarding request for information on cash reserve account; review documents regarding same	0.90
12/16/2019	DRF	Review loan and other documents re cash reserve account	1.00
12/16/2019	EJP	Work on landlord issues and issues involving accounts receivable; preparation for hearing	2.50
12/16/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
12/16/2019	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson; review and revise draft settlement agreement; follow up regarding same	0.70
12/16/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
12/17/2019	MBH	Meeting with Scott Stichter and Edward Peterson regarding potential claims and insurance policy; call with Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel with bank attorneys; conference with Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel regarding cash collateral	1.10
12/17/2019	MBH	Review issues surrounding [REDACTED]; conference with Scott Stichter; review policy	1.90
12/17/2019	HER	Internal conferences and conference call with Toby Gerber and Ryan Manns regarding cash collateral; emails regarding [REDACTED].	0.80
12/17/2019	HER	Review email from Dennis Waggoner with attached executed Gruber Agreement; follow-up with client; conference call with Paul Battista and others at approximately 3:30 p.m. regarding litigation issues; related electronic correspondence.	1.00
12/17/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Fenstmacher, Edward Peterson, and Matt Hale regarding claims under covered lawyers policy; conference with Matt Hale	0.40
12/17/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding access to patient claims information in Sharefile; review of emails from Edward Peterson and McCoy regarding same; and review of email from Edward Peterson to Alpert	0.20
12/17/2019	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale and Edward Peterson regarding [REDACTED] and response to Highwood's objection to motion to reject	0.40
12/17/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
12/17/2019	EJP	Work on motion to approve Millenium Agreement and work on issues related to Highwoods; calls with Bank	4.00
12/17/2019	BMB	Review of revised settlement agreement; review of prior correspondence, prior drafts, in connection with same	0.80
12/17/2019	SJ	Revise motion to approve Millennium service agreement and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.50
12/17/2019	SJ	Review and download CT Service of Process	0.10
12/18/2019	MBH	Revisions to reply to Highwoods objection	0.30
12/18/2019	MBH	Review tolling agreement; email regarding same	0.30
12/18/2019	HER	Revision of "template" settlement motion with Prada Investment Holdings; email to Dennis Waggoner attaching same.	0.30
12/18/2019	HER	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding upcoming December 20 hearings and other issues.	0.30
12/18/2019	SAS	Review and revision of response to Highwood's opposition to motion to reject; conference with Matt Hale; review of Matt Hale's further revisions; and dictated response enclosing further revisions	0.80
12/18/2019	SAS	Dictated extensive revisions to memo discussing claims under [REDACTED]	1.20
12/18/2019	EJP	Preparation for hearing	1.00
12/18/2019	BMB	Follow up regarding settlements	0.20

12/19/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding landlord issues and settlement motions	0.20
12/19/2019	MBH	Review memorandum on [REDACTED]	0.20
12/19/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding cash collateral.	0.20
12/19/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding memo discussing potential claim under policy; review of Edward Peterson's revisions; dictated further revisions; and dictated email to Fenstermacher enclosing draft	0.60
12/19/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Guso regarding Friday's hearings	0.10
12/19/2019	EJP	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Guso regarding Friday's hearings	0.50
12/19/2019	EJP	Work on memorandum regarding [REDACTED]	1.00
12/19/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
12/20/2019	HER	Communications with Edward Peterson regarding results of hearing.	0.30
12/20/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher regarding revisions to [REDACTED]; dictated revisions; exchange of emails with Fenstermacher; and dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing memo	0.80
12/20/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Shilcutt regarding MedPro settlement agreement; review of response; review of files and dictated email to Alpert regarding MedPro settlement letter	0.30
12/20/2019	EJP	Preparation for hearing and work on fee applications	3.00
12/20/2019	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
12/21/2019	SAS	Review of Lemieux's Notice of Serving Proposal for settlement in state court action	0.20
12/21/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding medical records requests	0.20
12/22/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding cash collateral.	0.20
12/23/2019	HER	Numerous emails regarding cash collateral and meeting with TCB.	0.40
12/23/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Dennis Waggoner; review email of from Mr. Waggoner with attached Summons served on Dr. Gruber; email to Soneet Kapila regarding Dr. Bereckzi.	0.50
12/23/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation issues.	0.30
12/23/2019	HER	Review and revision of draft tolling agreement and circulation of same to Jennifer Altman; follow-up and email to Doug Wright with attached tolling agreement.	0.60
12/23/2019	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral issues and pending matters; dictated response; and conference with Edward Peterson	0.40
12/24/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding meeting with TCB to discuss cash collateral issues; internal communications regarding same.	0.40
12/26/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding potential recovery of [REDACTED].	0.30
12/26/2019	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate to Department of Health	0.20
12/27/2019	HER	Multiple items of electronic correspondence; preparation and circulation of draft email to Jennifer Altman regarding Pillsbury transfer.	0.90
12/27/2019	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues and issues with Highwoods	1.00
12/27/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
12/27/2019	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
12/28/2019	HER	Review of and reply to email from Jennifer Altman.	0.10
12/30/2019	HER	Internal communications regarding litigation issues.	0.30
12/30/2019	HER	Email to Paul Battista, Bob Roche, Greg Garno, Soneet Kapila and Edward Peterson regarding litigation issues.	0.20
12/30/2019	SAS	Review of email from Flood regarding recently filed state court litigation; dictated response; and review of follow-up email from Flood	0.20
12/30/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
12/31/2019	BMB	Review of correspondence regarding lease issues	0.20

Total Professional Services Rendered \$49,677.50

For Disbursements Incurred:

12/04/2019	Westlaw Online Research for November, 2019.	\$857.98
12/09/2019	Federal Express Corporation; Overnight Courier to Soneet Kapila/Ft.	\$23.17

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

12/10/2019	Lauderdale. TransPerfect Translations Intl., Inc; Court Reporter fees/late cancellation of hearing 11/18/19.	\$250.00
12/11/2019	Postage NOH-Pillsbury	\$3.50
12/12/2019	Photocopies of NOH - Pillsbury Mot	\$1.95
Total Expenses Incurred		\$1,136.60

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Ferrell-Anton, Becky	17.70	\$6,637.50
Bachman, Michael	17.50	\$6,562.50
Fogarty, Dan R.	2.10	\$787.50
Peterson, Edward J.	29.50	\$12,537.50
Riedel, Harley E.	22.30	\$11,038.50
Hale, Matt B.	28.60	\$7,150.00
Stichter, Scott A.	8.80	\$3,784.00
Jeffcoat, Susan	5.90	\$1,180.00
Total For Professional Services Rendered		132.40 Hours
Adjusted Services Total		\$49,677.50

Professional Services	\$49,677.50
Disbursements	\$1,136.60
Total New Charges This Invoice	\$50,814.10

Previous Balance	\$420,580.51
Less Payments Received	(\$0.00)
Outstanding Balance	\$420,580.51
New Charges This Invoice	\$50,814.10

Bill # 44527 Total Due \$471,394.61

Date Last Payment May/18/2020

Last Payment Amount \$5,300.82

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

DON M. STICHTER
1929-2019
RICHARD C. PROSSER
1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL DUBOSE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
SCOTT A. STICHTER

G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER
OF COUNSEL

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

June 04, 2020

Soneet Kapila
Kapila-Laser Spine
Kapila & Company
1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316
USA

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Kapila-Laser Spine
Client: 13857
For Professional Services Rendered:

01/01/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding January 2 meeting.	0.10
01/02/2020	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding settlements, cash collateral, and landlord issues; review lease summary	0.50
01/02/2020	MBH	Receive and review email regarding [REDACTED]; review files regarding same	0.40
01/02/2020	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson following meeting with bank and landlord	0.30
01/02/2020	HER	Preparation for and participation in 11:30 a.m. out-of-office conference with Bruce Shilcutt, Lara Fernandez, Edward J. Peterson, Ryan Manns, Chris Pizzo, Soneet Kapila, and Kevin McCoy; follow-up meetings with client.	5.20
01/02/2020	HER	Email to Dennis Waggoner regarding status of his comments to settlement motion.	0.10
01/02/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding MedPro issues; dictated email to Alpert regarding MedPro letter; and review of email from Alpert	0.30
01/02/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral issues	0.20
01/02/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Garno, Edward Peterson, and Matt Hale regarding litigation issues	0.20
01/02/2020	EJP	Preparation for meeting with Bank and time for same; conferences following meeting	6.00
01/02/2020	BMB	Conference with Edward J. Peterson; review of Tampa lease and all amendments; review of file and correspondence regarding subject issue	2.90
01/02/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same	0.20
01/02/2020	SJ	Emails, revise Pillsbury employment order and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.20
01/03/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation issues and scheduling conference call for	0.30

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

Date	Initials	Description	Hours
		January 6.	
01/03/2020	HER	Conference with Edward J. Peterson re Highwoods.	0.20
01/03/2020	HER	Emails with Doug Wright regarding tolling agreement and legal files.	0.20
01/03/2020	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro issues; dictated email to Kapila enclosing MedPro letter to be executed	0.20
01/03/2020	EPK	Conference regarding lease rejection issue	0.20
01/03/2020	EJP	Work on dispute with Highwoods	1.50
01/03/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
01/03/2020	BMB	Review of lease and information in connection with same; brief discussion with Edward J. Peterson regarding same, removal of equipment	1.90
01/03/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT invoices, review and forwarding to KM for payment	0.30
01/06/2020	HER	Review of emails from Soneet Kapila and Bruce Shilcutt; drafting of memorandum for client on cash collateral issues; participation in 11:45 a.m. conference call with Kevin McCoy, Soneet Kapila, Andrea Polt, and Matt Hale; work on possible revised cash collateral motion, including review Cash Collateral Motion and Budget previously filed with Court.	2.50
01/06/2020	HER	Review of email from Dennis Waggoner with edits to settlement motion; review of SLI Settlement Agreement; electronic correspondence.	0.30
01/06/2020	HER	Telephone contact with Doug Wright (12:06 to 12:16 p.m.).	0.20
01/06/2020	HER	Emails with Jennifer Altman.	0.10
01/06/2020	HER	Preparation for and participation in 3:30 p.m. call with Paul Battista and litigation team; follow-up.	1.20
01/06/2020	EJP	Work on business interruption claim; work on cash collateral issues	1.50
01/06/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
01/06/2020	BMB	Continue review of lease and update to notes, memo; research regarding same re claim in proceeding	1.80
01/06/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
01/07/2020	HER	Emails and telephone call with Jennifer Altman regarding H & K.	0.40
01/07/2020	HER	Further work on cash collateral issues; telephone conference with Soneet Kapila, Kevin McCoy and Edward Peterson; drafting and circulation of letter and cash collateral proposal to Toby Gerber; follow-up.	1.60
01/07/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
01/07/2020	BMB	Analysis of lease; draft and revise memo addressing same, restoration	1.80
01/07/2020	BMB	Continue analysis of lease; draft and revise memo addressing same, restoration	2.30
01/08/2020	HER	Continued revision of cash collateral proposal and communications with Soneet Kapila regarding same.	0.50
01/08/2020	SAS	Review of American Express' voluntary dismissal of writ of garnishment	0.10
01/08/2020	SAS	Review of email from Kapila regarding claims under the [REDACTED]; review of files; and dictated email to counsel enclosing [REDACTED]	0.30
01/08/2020	SAS	Review of email from Battista regarding litigation issues; dictated response; and review of emails from Fenstermacher and Davis	0.20
01/08/2020	SAS	Review of email from Kapila enclosing executed MedPro letter; dictated email to Alpert enclosing letter; and review of email from Alpert	0.30
01/08/2020	SAS	Review of email from Kapila and Fenstermacher regarding expiration of coverage under various insurance policies	0.20
01/08/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.50
01/08/2020	BMB	Review of lease and amendments; draft memorandum addressing issues in connection with restoration of premises, rent issues; follow up with Edward J. Peterson regarding same	2.50
01/08/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
01/09/2020	MBH	Review cash collateral emails and documents; conference with Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel regarding same	0.60
01/09/2020	MBH	Call with Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel regarding settlement motions; work on drafting of settlement motions and review of documents regarding same	1.10
01/09/2020	HER	Work on cash collateral proposal, including emails with Soneet Kapila and Kevin; email to	1.50

		Edward Peterson and Matt Hale regarding same; review and analysis of updated budget through Jan. 5, 2020 received from Kevin McCoy.	
01/09/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	2.00
01/09/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
01/09/2020	BMB	Follow up with regard to lease issues	0.60
01/10/2020	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding settlements; call with Bob Rocke regarding information needed re initial disclosures	0.30
01/10/2020	MBH	Work on analysis and summary for Bob Rocke re initial disclosures; review and comment on same; draft and send email regarding same	1.30
01/10/2020	MBH	Work on settlement motions	1.40
01/10/2020	HER	Review of email from Soneet Kapila with attached updated budget; continued work on cash collateral proposal.	0.50
01/10/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila and Fenstermacher regarding insurance issues; dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding personal property insurance issues	0.30
01/10/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding cancellation of hearing	0.20
01/10/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	1.00
01/10/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
01/11/2020	HER	Communications with Dennis Waggoner regarding FT settlements; internal communications regarding same.	0.30
01/13/2020	MBH	Emails; work on settlement motions; revisions to same; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	2.00
01/13/2020	MBH	Review cash collateral correspondence	0.20
01/13/2020	HER	Emails with Dennis Waggoner and Soneet Kapila regarding settlements; email to Paul Battista regarding Gruber and Prada.	0.30
01/13/2020	HER	Review and revision of cash collateral proposal and letter and review of comments thereto.	0.60
01/13/2020	EJP	Work on settlement motion	2.00
01/13/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues and landlord issues	3.00
01/13/2020	BMB	Follow up discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding Tampa lease; review of subject memo	0.50
01/14/2020	MBH	Review and finalize settlement motions for filing; review settlement files	0.60
01/14/2020	MBH	Receive email from Ryan Manns regarding litigation status; review information regarding same	0.20
01/14/2020	HER	Final revision and sending of letter to Toby Gerber regarding cash collateral.	0.40
01/14/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
01/14/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral motions	1.00
01/14/2020	BMB	Follow up regarding lease issues	0.20
01/15/2020	MBH	Emails and communications regarding settlements; draft settlement motion	0.50
01/15/2020	HER	Conference with Edward Peterson and telephone conference regarding TCB position.	0.50
01/15/2020	HER	Work on settlement motions and communications with Matt Hale regarding same.	0.20
01/15/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues and issues with landlord	2.00
01/15/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
01/15/2020	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding Tampa lease; review of Tampa lease in connection with same	0.80
01/16/2020	MBH	Call with Soneet Kapila and team regarding lease issues and cash collateral	0.70
01/16/2020	MBH	Call with Edward Peterson and Eric Luden regarding lease issue	0.30
01/16/2020	DRF	Emails, conference with Dan Fogarty regarding Genovese amended employment motion, review file, draft amended motion and proposed order and forwarding to Dan Fogarty	0.60
01/16/2020	EJP	Work on issues with Highwoods	1.50
01/16/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
01/16/2020	BMB	Prepare for call regarding lease, additional issues; call with Edward J. Peterson, Matthew B. Hale and client regarding same; follow up regarding same	1.20
01/17/2020	HER	Telephone conference with Doug Wright regarding H & K; follow-up.	0.40

01/17/2020	EJP	Calls with Highwoods	0.30
01/17/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
01/17/2020	SJ	Review and download CT Service of Process (bankruptcy documents); receipt of Strohl complaint from KM and forwarding to Scott Stichter and Edward Peterson	0.20
01/20/2020	BMB	Review of communications regarding settlement and proposed documents; follow up regarding same	0.90
01/21/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
01/21/2020	BMB	Conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding Bonati settlement; review of case materials; draft settlement agreement; communications with assignee regarding claims; review of complaint	2.90
01/22/2020	MBH	Receive and review documents related to Merrick accounts receivable	0.20
01/22/2020	MBH	Call with Edward Peterson regarding various issues	0.20
01/22/2020	HER	Attendance at meeting with Doug Wright, Stacy Blank, and Dan Fogarty (9:55 to 11:18 a.m.); follow-up, including report to client.	1.90
01/22/2020	DRF	Conference with H. Riedel and Holland & Knight attorneys	1.30
01/22/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
01/22/2020	EJP	Work on issues with landlord	1.00
01/22/2020	BMB	Review of complaint; communications with assignee; revise settlement agreement with Bonati parties	2.40
01/23/2020	BFA	Review Bailey pleadings and update chart	3.20
01/23/2020	MBH	Conference with Dan Fogarty and Edward Peterson regarding various litigation issues and tasks; email Edward Peterson regarding settlement motions and hearing	0.60
01/23/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence with bank counsel regarding cash collateral.	0.30
01/23/2020	HER	Email to Doug Wright regarding tolling agreement.	0.10
01/23/2020	HER	Initial review of revised tolling agreement received from H&K; review of further email from Ms. Blank.	0.40
01/23/2020	DRF	Conference with E. Peterson and M. Hale re: litigation issues	0.50
01/23/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral matters	0.50
01/23/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
01/23/2020	BMB	Work on Bonati settlement; review of documents	1.40
01/23/2020	SJ	Receipt of claims, save to file and forwarding to Rachel Weiss	0.30
01/24/2020	BFA	Continue revising chart of Bailey collection efforts and dictated summary of pleadings filed	2.10
01/24/2020	HER	Work on cash collateral issues, including short conference with Edward Peterson and review of relevant files; participation in conference call with Toby Gerber, Ryan Manns and Edward Peterson (11:00 to 11:25 a.m.); review of annotated version of SRBP letter of January 14, 2020 and proposal received from Mr. Gerber; communications with client regarding same.	2.00
01/24/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence with Jennifer Altman regarding H&K Tolling agreement.	0.20
01/24/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	1.00
01/24/2020	SJ	Work on fee applications and forwarding to Edward Peterson; draft Bonati settlement approval motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson	1.10
01/27/2020	MBH	Receive and respond to emails regarding administrative claims issues; research and review claims and filings; draft and send analysis of same	0.70
01/27/2020	HER	Preparation of analysis of cash collateral issues and email to Soneet Kapila and Kevin McCoy with chart reflecting analysis; review of reply email from Mr. McCoy; call with Edward Peterson regarding same; participation in 10:00 a.m. call with client and Mr. Peterson.	2.40
01/27/2020	HER	Review of categories of H & K documents available and email to litigation counsel regarding same and possible areas of interest.	0.70
01/27/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	2.50
01/27/2020	SJ	Review and download CT Service of Process and circulate	0.20
01/28/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence with Paul Battista regarding H&K documents.	0.20
01/28/2020	RMB	Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding hearing on Genovese employment	0.40
01/28/2020	RMB	Conference with Daniel Fogarty regarding hearing on Genovese employment	0.40
01/28/2020	DRF	Review emails re: H&K files	0.20

01/28/2020	EJP	Work on settlements	2.50
01/28/2020	SJ	Review CT invoices and forwarding to Soneet Kapila and Kevin McCoy, emails; revise fee applications and forwarding to Edward Peterson; receipt of amended claims and forwarding to Rachel Weiss	1.10
01/28/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30
01/29/2020	RMB	Email regarding Genovese employment hearing; conference with Daniel Fogarty	0.20
01/29/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues and settlement	1.50
01/29/2020	BMB	Conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding settlement with Merrick; review of materials related to claim, and settlement	0.60
01/29/2020	SJ	Work on SRBP second fee application and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.40
01/29/2020	SJ	Receipt and download CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
01/30/2020	MBH	Work on motion to sell IP assets; research regarding same; call with Ryan Manns regarding same	1.10
01/30/2020	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro records request; conference with Susan McKee; conference with Edward Peterson; and dictated email to McCoy	0.30
01/30/2020	EJP	Work on sale of IP assets	0.50
01/30/2020	EJP	Work on settlements	1.00
01/30/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
01/30/2020	BMB	Review of contracts and correspondence; work on Marrick settlement and release	1.30
01/30/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
01/31/2020	MBH	Receive and review email from Kevin McCoy regarding IP assets; draft and send emails to Edward Peterson and Radha Bachman regarding same	0.20
01/31/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Kapila and Kastner regarding California patient and litigation issues	0.50
01/31/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding fee application issues and hearing on fee applications	0.20
01/31/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Kapila in preparation for call with Kastner	0.20
01/31/2020	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding patient files requested by MedPro; dictated email to Alpert; and review of email from Alpert	0.30
01/31/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Kastner and Kapila regarding California trademark and patent litigation; dictated responses; and review of further emails	0.30
01/31/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
01/31/2020	EJP	Work on fee applications	0.50
01/31/2020	BMB	Review of client materials, correspondence; draft, review and revise draft settlement agreement and release; follow up with Edward J. Peterson	3.20

Total Professional Services Rendered \$54,119.00

For Disbursements Incurred:

01/13/2020	TransPerfect Translations Intl., Inc.; Hearing transcript re LSI v. Soneet Kapila.	\$170.00
01/13/2020	Postage Motion Settlement Agreement	\$11.40
01/14/2020	Postage settlement motion	\$8.70
01/15/2020	Photocopies of Settlement Motions	\$33.30
01/17/2020	Photocopies of Settlement Motion - Gruber	\$11.85
01/17/2020	Postage Gruber settlement	\$3.90
01/21/2020	Westlaw Online research for December, 2019.	\$831.27
01/23/2020	Photocopies of NOH Settlement Motions	\$2.70
01/23/2020	Postage NOH - settlement motion	\$3.00
01/27/2020	Postage Pillsbury order	\$4.00
01/31/2020	Photocopies of Bonati Motion	\$11.85
01/31/2020	Photocopies of fee apps	\$210.75
01/31/2020	Postage Bonati motion	\$3.90

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

01/31/2020	Postage fee applications	\$65.40
Total Expenses Incurred		\$1,372.02

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Ferrell-Anton, Becky	5.30	\$1,987.50
Bachman, Michael	29.20	\$10,950.00
Fogarty, Dan R.	2.60	\$975.00
Peterson, Edward J.	48.30	\$20,527.50
Ketchum, Elena P.	0.20	\$85.00
Riedel, Harley E.	25.80	\$12,900.00
Hale, Matt B.	13.40	\$3,350.00
Blain, Russell M.	1.00	\$475.00
Stichter, Scott A.	4.30	\$1,849.00
Jeffcoat, Susan	5.10	\$1,020.00
Total For Professional Services Rendered		135.20 Hours \$54,119.00
Adjusted Services Total		\$54,119.00
Professional Services		\$54,119.00
Disbursements		\$1,372.02
Total New Charges This Invoice		\$55,491.02
Previous Balance		\$471,394.61
Less Payments Received		(\$0.00)
Outstanding Balance		\$471,394.61
New Charges This Invoice		\$55,491.02
Total Due		\$526,885.63

Bill # 44528

Date Last Payment May/18/2020
 Last Payment Amount \$5,300.82

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200 Tampa, Florida 33602 T 813.229.0144 F 813.229.1811	1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57 Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009 T 239.939.5518 F 239.939.5568	41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111 Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669 T 850.637.1836 F 850.791.6545	4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40 Destin, Florida 32541-9306 T 850.460.7676 F 850.424.6604
---	---	--	---

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

DON M. STICHTER
1929-2019
RICHARD C. PROSSER
1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL DUBOSE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
SCOTT A. STICHTER

G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER
OF COUNSEL

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

June 16, 2020

Soneet Kapila
Kapila-Laser Spine
Kapila & Company
1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316
USA

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Kapila-Laser Spine
Client: 13857
For Professional Services Rendered:

02/03/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding litigation matters and claims to be asserted against insurance policies	0.30
02/03/2020	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding uploading of information provided by MedPro; dictated email to Alpert; and review of email from Alpert	0.20
02/03/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
02/03/2020	EJP	Work on fee applications	1.50
02/03/2020	BMB	Work in connection with settlement with patient account receivable; review of materials, subject contracts	1.90
02/04/2020	MBH	Receive and review emails regarding IP auction and sale issues	0.20
02/04/2020	HER	Work on H & K tolling agreement, including communications with Jennifer Altman, Edward Peterson, and Doug Wright (with revised tolling agreement).	0.50
02/04/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding D&O litigation issues.	0.30
02/04/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Fenstermacher regarding potential defendants' request for information as to availability of insurance coverage for claims asserted in Langson's proposed amended claim	0.20
02/04/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila, Rocke, Battista, and Edward Peterson regarding litigation issues	0.30
02/04/2020	DRF	Conference with E. Peterson re: tolling; review docket, pleadings in referenced case	0.50
02/04/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
02/04/2020	BMB	Finalize draft settlement agreement; review of materials and correspondence regarding fact pattern	1.60

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

02/05/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Alpert and Edward Peterson regarding Langston motion to amend complaint; telephone conference with Alpert regarding same	0.30
02/05/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
02/05/2020	EJP	Emails with counsel for directors and officers	0.50
02/05/2020	EJP	Work on motion to sell IP	0.50
02/05/2020	BMB	Follow up regarding Marrick settlement; discussions with Edward J. Peterson	0.20
02/06/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding D&O litigation; review of amended pleadings and of Motions to Dismiss Amended Complaint filed by Dempsey and Lewis.	0.70
02/06/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Alpert regarding Langston's motion to amend; review of Langston's motion to amend; review of emails regarding scheduling of hearing on Langston's motion to amend; conference with Edward Peterson; and telephone conference with Alpert	1.30
02/06/2020	SAS	Exchange of emails with Battista regarding tomorrow's call	0.10
02/06/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
02/06/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.40
02/07/2020	HER	Brief conference with Edward Peterson and participation in conference call with litigation counsel (10:55 to 11:30 a.m.).	0.60
02/07/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Rocke, Battista, Edward Peterson, Garcia, and Harley Riedel regarding litigation issues	0.50
02/07/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
02/08/2020	SAS	Review of email from McKane regarding turnover of Kirkland and Ellis files	0.20
02/09/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding responses received by assignment estates from issues; dictated response	0.20
02/09/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Alpert and Edward Peterson regarding Sandee Edwards state court litigation	0.20
02/09/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding insurance policy requested by counsel for Langston matter; dictated response; and review of further emails regarding Langston state court issues	0.30
02/10/2020	MBH	Drafting of IP auction motion	1.40
02/10/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence.	0.20
02/10/2020	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson to Brooks enclosing insurance policy; review of email from Miller; and dictated email to Edward Peterson enclosing information regarding excess insurance; and review of follow-up email from Edward Peterson	0.40
02/10/2020	SAS	Review of attorney general complaints; dictated letters responding to complaints	0.40
02/10/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral matters	0.50
02/10/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
02/10/2020	EJP	Work on issues involving AR	0.50
02/10/2020	BMB	Discussions regarding Highwoods settlement; review of file in connection with same, terms; review of pleadings; begin draft release agreement	2.10
02/11/2020	BFA	Conference with Edward Peterson re nonBailey document production from Holland & Knight; Conference with Matt Hale re same	0.40
02/11/2020	MBH	Receive and review documents from Mark Miller related to employee claims; draft and send email to Hilda Sills regarding schedules; draft and send reply email to Mark Miller; email regarding cash collateral	0.60
02/11/2020	MBH	Review materials prior to meeting; meeting with team regarding various case items	0.70
02/11/2020	HER	Preparation for and participation in portion of 10:00 a.m. internal meeting regarding status and to-do list.	0.60
02/11/2020	HER	Email to Doug Wright following up on status of tolling agreement; electronic correspondence regarding sharing of legal documents and pursuit of causes of action.	0.50
02/11/2020	HER	Preparation for and participation in conference call with Ryan Manns, Toby Gerber, and Edward Peterson regarding bank issues and cash collateral.	0.70
02/11/2020	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing revised draft of email to Brooks Miller; dictated revisions; review of follow-up email; review of email from Edward Peterson to co-counsel enclosing draft; and review of follow-up emails	0.70
02/11/2020	SAS	Review of emails enclosing agenda and draft email to Brooks Miller; participated in portion of	0.70

		call with Edward Peterson, Harley Riedel, and Matt Hale; and follow-up conference with Kapila	
02/11/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	2.50
02/11/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
02/11/2020	BMB	Follow up regarding settlements and motions to approve same; revise settlement agreements	1.60
02/11/2020	BMB	Review of lease materials; draft form of settlement agreement; discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding filings; revise agreement	2.60
02/12/2020	MBH	Review IP issues for sale motion; emails regarding same; conferences with Edward Peterson; revisions to motion; further revisions	1.50
02/12/2020	HER	Communications with Doug Wright and Jennifer Altman regarding H & K.	0.40
02/12/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel regarding draft of email to Altman	0.20
02/12/2020	EJP	Work on motion to sell IP assets and settlement with Highwoods	2.00
02/12/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
02/12/2020	BMB	Review of pleadings; draft, review and revise form of Settlement Agreement	2.40
02/12/2020	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding settlement; review of draft agreement	0.50
02/12/2020	SJ	Review CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.50
02/13/2020	MBH	Review hearing materials	0.20
02/13/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation issues and access to legal files.	0.30
02/13/2020	SAS	Review of email from Miller regarding Bonati files	0.20
02/13/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
02/13/2020	BMB	Conference with Edward J. Peterson; review of client comments and correspondence; review and revise draft settlement agreement	0.80
02/14/2020	BFA	Conference with Harley E. Riedel; telephone call Stacy Blank re document production by Holland & Knight of LSI client files; e mail to Harley Riedel and Edward J. Peterson regarding same	0.80
02/14/2020	MJH	Conference with Matt Hale regarding discovery issues	0.20
02/14/2020	MBH	Work on motion to compel production of client files	1.20
02/14/2020	HER	Emails with Doug Wright and Jennifer Altman regarding H & K; telephone contact with Mr. Wright at 2:00 p.m.; follow-up.	0.60
02/14/2020	HER	Initial review of and internal conference regarding K & L Gates documents received.	0.70
02/14/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Alpert regarding Langston motion to amend issues; dictated response	0.20
02/14/2020	DRF	Conference with E. Peterson and H. Riedel re: documents received from K&L Gates; work on coordinating review issues	0.90
02/14/2020	EJP	Review of K&L Gates files	1.50
02/14/2020	BMB	Interoffice communications regarding Marrick settlement; review of draft agreement; follow up regarding same; revisions to draft agreement	1.10
02/14/2020	BMB	Meeting regarding review of documents received from K&L Gates	0.30
02/14/2020	SJ	Review file, draft Highwoods lease rejection and administrative claim order and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.40
02/16/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Fenstermacher and Edward Peterson regarding MedPro's certificate of insurance	0.20
02/16/2020	SAS	Review of District Court's order dismissing Ali v. Laser Spine action	0.20
02/17/2020	MBH	Research of law regarding assignee rights to client files of assignor	2.10
02/17/2020	MBH	Work on motion to compel turnover of H & K files	3.00
02/17/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding MedPro issues; participated in conference call with Edward Peterson and Alpert regarding same	0.40
02/17/2020	DRF	Coordinate on file review	0.20
02/17/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
02/17/2020	BMB	Follow up regarding settlement; review of draft settlement; draft language proposed by counsel for Marrick	0.60
02/17/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20

02/18/2020	BFA	Follow up e mail to Stacy Blank based upon our telephone conversation; telephone call Stacy Blank and e mail to Harley E. Riedel and Edward J. Peterson regarding status of same	0.80
02/18/2020	MBH	Work on motion to compel turnover of H & K files and research of law regarding same	3.70
02/18/2020	HER	Work on H & K issues.	0.50
02/18/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Alpert and Edward Peterson regarding Sandee Edwards insurance claim; conference with Edward Peterson; and follow-up conference regarding service of pleadings	0.40
02/18/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
02/18/2020	BMB	Follow up regarding confidentiality provisions; discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding same; review of proposed agreement in connection with same, opposing counsel's requests	0.80
02/18/2020	SJ	Review file and docket, draft February 27 hearing agenda and forwarding to Edward Peterson	1.20
02/19/2020	MBH	Review motion for turnover; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same; research of law	0.90
02/19/2020	MBH	Work on summary chart of settlements	0.70
02/19/2020	MBH	Finalize motion to compel H & K turnover	0.90
02/19/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Fenstermacher regarding insurance certificates from doctors	0.20
02/19/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Alpert regarding Sandee Edwards' insurance claim	0.20
02/19/2020	DRF	Review list of documents from K&L Gates, work on next level review issues	0.40
02/19/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
02/20/2020	MBH	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding document production issues; further conference with Edward Peterson and S. Stichter	0.60
02/20/2020	MBH	Revisions to motion for turnover of H & K files	0.30
02/20/2020	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding issues raised by motion to compel turnover of files and responses to motion	0.30
02/20/2020	SAS	Review of defendant's motion to require assignee to turnover files; dictated follow-up emails; and conference regarding extending issues	0.40
02/20/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Fenstermacher regarding MedPro certificates; review of email from Edward Peterson to Alpert enclosing MedPro certificates	0.20
02/20/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding MedPro issues	0.20
02/20/2020	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale and Edward Peterson regarding motion to compel turnover of files and motion to obtain access to Holland and Knight files	0.30
02/20/2020	DRF	Conference with E. Peterson re: K&L files	0.10
02/20/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	3.00
02/20/2020	BMB	Follow up regarding Marrick and Highwoods settlements; review of correspondence related to same	0.30
02/20/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
02/21/2020	MBH	Receive and review email from Edward Peterson regarding assignability of malpractice claims; research of law; draft and send email memo regarding same	0.70
02/21/2020	MBH	Exchange messages with Edward Peterson regarding motion to compel; email to E. Peterson regarding same	0.20
02/21/2020	HER	Telephone contact with Dennis Waggoner regarding FT settlements.	0.20
02/21/2020	EJP	Call with Jennifer Altman	1.00
02/21/2020	EJP	Preparation for hearings	1.00
02/23/2020	SAS	Review and revision of motion to compel turnover of Bailey client files	0.50
02/24/2020	MBH	Work throughout the day on drafting motion to establish file procedures for legal files in assignee possession; research of law regarding same	4.60
02/24/2020	SAS	Work on client file turnover issues, including brief conference with Edward Peterson; review of email from Battista regarding H&K turnover motion; review of emails regarding scheduling a hearing on co-defendants' motion to compel; and review of email from Edward Peterson to Battista regarding review of documents	0.40
02/24/2020	EJP	Preparation for hearing	1.00
02/24/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50

02/24/2020	SJ	Review revisions for hearing agenda	0.20
02/24/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
02/24/2020	SJ	Conference with Edward Peterson, work on hearing agenda and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.70
02/25/2020	BFA	E mail to Stacy Blank following up on scheduling time to review documents and on electronic document production; forward same to Edward J. Peterson and Harley Riedel	0.00
02/25/2020	MBH	Drafting of objection to request for turnover of Bonati files to assignee	1.20
02/25/2020	HER	Work on obtaining law firm documents.	0.40
02/25/2020	HER	Work on cash collateral issues, including brief conference with Edward Peterson (joined by Scott Stichter.	0.40
02/25/2020	SAS	Review and revision of revised motion for turnover of Holland & Knight's files	0.40
02/25/2020	SAS	Conference with Harley and Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral issues	0.20
02/25/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding motions to compel turnover and motion to establish procedures	0.30
02/25/2020	SAS	Review and revision of motion to establish procedures for turnover of files	1.40
02/25/2020	EJP	Preparation for hearing	1.00
02/25/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
02/25/2020	SJ	Receipt and download CT Service of process, circulate same	0.20
02/26/2020	BFA	Meeting at Holland & Knight with Stacy Blank to discuss electronic document production issues and to review boxes of nonBailey documents assembled by Holland & Knight for matters identified to be of interest to the Assignee thus far; begin drafting memo to Edward J. Peterson and Harley Riedel summarizing same	5.60
02/26/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding making claims on [REDACTED]; conference with Dan Fogarty	0.30
02/26/2020	SAS	Review of Kapila's revisions to motion to establish procedures for parties to obtain copies of files	0.20
02/26/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila and Edward Peterson regarding production of additional documents	0.10
02/26/2020	DRF	Review Katten documents (.6); conference with E. Peterson (.5); work on insurance claims letter (1.5)	2.60
02/26/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
02/27/2020	BFA	Continue memo to Edward J. Peterson and Harley Riedel re nonBailey document production by Holland & Knight	2.60
02/27/2020	HER	Review of and reply to email from Stacy Blank regarding Motion to Compel Turnover of Client Files; participation in conference call with Ms. Blank and Doug Wright at 2:35 p.m.; further call with Mr. Wright at 3:00 p.m.; review of memo from Becky Ferrell-Anton regarding status of document production and review; follow-up.	1.20
02/27/2020	SAS	Review of draft notice to insurance carriers; conference with Edward Peterson; and review of follow-up emails	0.30
02/27/2020	SAS	Review of revision of objection to motion to compel turnover of files in Bonati lawsuit; dictated email to Edward Peterson and Matt Hale enclosing revisions	0.50
02/27/2020	DRF	Edit claims notice letter for attorney coverage policy; email same to E. Peterson and S. Stichter	0.60
02/27/2020	EJP	Prep for hearing and time for same	6.00
02/27/2020	SJ	Emails, draft Bonati settlement order and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.20
02/27/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
02/28/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila, Fenstermacher, Edward Peterson, and Battista regarding sending notice to insurance company regarding claims under the Covered Lawyers Policy	0.30
02/28/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
02/28/2020	SJ	Review file regarding orders from February 27 hearing, emails, draft settlement order and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.60
02/28/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30

Total Professional Services Rendered \$50,399.00

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

For Disbursements Incurred:

02/03/2020	Photocopies of Amd RMS Fee App and NOH	\$14.40
02/03/2020	Postage RMS App and Notice of Hearing	\$3.90
02/04/2020	Photocopies of Millennium Motion	\$10.80
02/04/2020	Postage Millennium	\$3.90
02/10/2020	Postage Attorney General Compliance	\$1.50
02/27/2020	DIO Mediterranean....Lunch meeting Messrs. Peterson and Kapila.	\$47.75
02/28/2020	Pro Courier, Inc./West Hartford...hand delivery to Chubb Grp. Ins. Cos., Weatogue, CT	\$96.05
Total Expenses Incurred		\$178.30

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Ferrell-Anton, Becky	10.20	\$3,825.00
Bachman, Michael	16.80	\$6,300.00
Fogarty, Dan R.	5.30	\$1,987.50
Peterson, Edward J.	47.50	\$20,187.50
Riedel, Harley E.	8.80	\$4,400.00
Hale, Matt B.	24.70	\$6,175.00
Hooi, Michael J.	0.20	\$60.00
Stichter, Scott A.	14.80	\$6,364.00
Jeffcoat, Susan	5.50	\$1,100.00
Total For Professional Services Rendered		133.80 Hours \$50,399.00
Adjusted Services Total		\$50,399.00
Professional Services		\$50,399.00
Disbursements		\$178.30
Total New Charges This Invoice		\$50,577.30
Previous Balance		\$526,885.63
Less Payments Received		(\$0.00)
Outstanding Balance		\$526,885.63
New Charges This Invoice		\$50,577.30
Total Due		\$577,462.93

Bill # 44637

Date Last Payment May/18/2020

Last Payment Amount \$5,300.82

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

DON M. STICHTER
1929-2019
RICHARD C. PROSSER
1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL DUBOSE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
SCOTT A. STICHTER

G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER
OF COUNSEL

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

June 17, 2020

Soneet Kapila
Kapila-Laser Spine
Kapila & Company
1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316
USA

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Kapila-Laser Spine
Client: 13857
For Professional Services Rendered:

03/01/2020	HER	Multiple emails.	0.20
03/01/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding status of pre-assignment of professionals' turnover of files to Kapila; review of emails regarding TRS documents; dictated response; and review of follow-up emails	0.30
03/02/2020	SAS	Review of District Court's order vacating dismissal in Ali v. Laser Spine	0.20
03/02/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
03/03/2020	BFA	Meeting with Edward J. Peterson, Matt Hale and Dan Fogarty re review of documents and gathering documents	0.80
03/03/2020	MBH	Meeting regarding document review	0.80
03/03/2020	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing revised drafts of motion to compel turnover of Holland & Knight files and motion to establish procedures; review of emails from Kapila and Battista; dictated response; and telephone conference with Edward Peterson regarding further revisions to pleadings	0.50
03/03/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
03/04/2020	MBH	Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding electronic discovery	0.20
03/04/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding malpractice claims and documents at H & K.	0.30
03/04/2020	DRF	Follow up on documents from LSI counsel	0.40
03/04/2020	EJP	Work on sale of AR	0.50
03/04/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
03/04/2020	BMB	Review of correspondence related to settlement	0.20

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

03/04/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
03/05/2020	SAS	Conference regarding finalizing and filing objection to St. Louis' and Perry's motion on Bonati lawsuit	0.20
03/05/2020	BMB	Interoffice communications regarding Marrick settlement	0.20
03/06/2020	DRF	Review K&L files	0.90
03/06/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	3.00
03/06/2020	BMB	Follow up regarding settlement	0.20
03/06/2020	SJ	Emails, review file regarding employment of Pillsbury firm for auditor claims	0.60
03/07/2020	BFA	E mail to Stacy Blank about H&K document production to Assignee and search terms; e mail to Assignee's litigation group re search terms	0.40
03/07/2020	SAS	Dictated email to Barack regarding WARN Act issues; review of response; dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding request to attend mediation; review of email from Edward Peterson; and dictated email to Barack regarding request to participate in mediation	0.40
03/07/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
03/08/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Gano, Edward Peterson, Battista, and Kapila regarding WARN Act plaintiff's request to participate in mediation; dictated response to counsel	0.30
03/09/2020	HER	Work on cash collateral issues, including participation in conference call with Soneet Kapila, Kevin McCoy, Kevin McCoy and Edward Peterson (4:00 to 4:30 p.m.).	1.00
03/09/2020	SAS	Review of email from Miller regarding consolidating hearings on turnover of files; review of emails from Edward Peterson and Kapila; and dictated response	0.20
03/09/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
03/09/2020	BMB	Review of correspondence and prior comments to draft settlement from opposing counsel; review of revised agreement; interoffice communications regarding same, revisions and next steps; revisions to agreement	2.40
03/09/2020	SJ	Emails, review file, draft fee order and forwarding to Edward Peterson; draft Millennium agreement approval order and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.80
03/09/2020	SJ	Receipt and review CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30
03/10/2020	MBH	Receive and respond to email from Jennifer Altman regarding board composition; review prior memoranda	0.40
03/10/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence and analysis regarding cash collateral and budget issues (including review of email from Ryan Manns with attached letters and documentation).	0.70
03/10/2020	SAS	Review of further emails regarding WARN Act plaintiffs participating in mediation; dictated response; and review of email from Barack	0.20
03/10/2020	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson to Miller regarding scheduling of hearing on client file matters	0.10
03/10/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	0.70
03/10/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
03/10/2020	SJ	Revise orders and forwarding to Edward Peterson; draft third fee application and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.60
03/11/2020	MBH	Review documents and correspondence from bank; conference with Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral issues; review stipulation and order; call with Ryan Manns regarding cash collateral documents; further conference with Mr. Peterson	1.00
03/11/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding D&O claims.	0.20
03/11/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
03/11/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	2.50
03/11/2020	BMB	Follow up regarding settlement	0.20
03/11/2020	SJ	Work on fee orders, third fee applications, SRBP second fee application and forwarding to Edward Peterson; work on settlement orders and forwarding to Edward Peterson; review file regarding Pillsbury employment for Clifton and RMS actions;	3.40
03/12/2020	MBH	Call with Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral issues; review emails and draft documents regarding same; follow up call with Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral and drafting	0.40
03/12/2020	MBH	Work on cash collateral motion and issues; call with Edward Peterson regarding same; emails regarding same	2.50

03/12/2020	MBH	Call with Edward Peterson, Soneet Kapila, and Kevin McCoy regarding cash collateral issues	1.00
03/12/2020	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding cash collateral motion; review of cash flow documents received from Client.	0.40
03/12/2020	SAS	Review of orders granting compromise motions	0.20
03/12/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	4.50
03/12/2020	BMB	Interoffice communications regarding open issues, formalization of settlement	0.20
03/12/2020	SJ	Draft second fee orders and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.50
03/13/2020	MBH	Receive and review emails from Soneet Kapila and Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral; draft and send reply email; conference with Mr. Peterson regarding strategy	0.40
03/13/2020	MBH	Research on cash collateral issues	2.70
03/13/2020	HER	Communications with Jennifer Altman and Doug Wright regarding H & K tolling agreement.	0.20
03/13/2020	EJP	Calls with E Ludin	0.30
03/13/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
03/13/2020	SJ	Work on Pillsbury employment motions and NextGen rejection motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson; finalize and file third interim fee applications and NextGen motion	3.80
03/13/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT service of process, download and circulate	0.20
03/14/2020	HER	Initial review of Texas complaint filed by Bailey against Esping, Grammen, EFO.	0.30
03/14/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding Headley settlement agreement	0.20
03/16/2020	MBH	Review complaint by Bailey; receive and review emails regarding same	0.70
03/16/2020	MBH	Work on motion to approve settlement; review pleadings and documents regarding same; final revisions to settlement agreement; draft and send email to Eric Ludin regarding same; draft and send email to Soneet Kapila regarding same; emails with Edward Peterson regarding settlement and motion	2.30
03/16/2020	HER	Further review of Texas complaint filed by Bailey against Esping, Grammen, and EFO; email to Soneet Kapila, Bob Rocke, Greg Garno, and Paul Battista attaching copy; review of responses.	0.80
03/16/2020	HER	Telephone conference with Doug Wright.	0.40
03/16/2020	SAS	Work on matters related to scheduling of hearing on client file turnover motions, including review of emails; dictated draft of email to chambers regarding matters to be scheduled for hearing; conference regarding finalizing emails; review of email from chambers; conference regarding response; and review of follow-up emails	0.60
03/16/2020	SAS	Review of Miller's draft of Stipulation of Counsel; dictated email to Edward Peterson enclosing additional factual stipulations; further review and revision of stipulation of counsel; and dictated email to Miller enclosing revisions to stipulation of counsel	1.10
03/16/2020	SAS	Review of email from Miller enclosing further revisions to Stipulation of Counsel; review of email from Edward Peterson; and dictated email to Miller and Guso	0.20
03/16/2020	SAS	Review of Headley's withdrawal of claim	0.10
03/16/2020	EJP	Review of Bailey matters and emails	2.00
03/16/2020	SJ	Download and review CT Service of Process and circulate	0.20
03/16/2020	SJ	Review file, revise FisherBroyles third fee application and refile same; work on Highwoods settlement motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson; work on FFN employment motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson	2.30
03/17/2020	MBH	Receive and review emails regarding insurance issues and D&O issues; call with Edward Peterson	0.30
03/17/2020	MBH	Research of law on lien priority issues regarding insurance policy	1.30
03/17/2020	HER	Email to Jennifer Altman regarding H & K; email to Dennis Waggoner regarding Langston.	0.20
03/17/2020	HER	Review of Brandon Hill's Motion to appear at D&O mediation on behalf of Class Representatives; review of emails from Bob Rocke and Paul Battista.	0.30
03/17/2020	SAS	Dictated revisions to amended notice of hearing; dictated email to Guso and Miller regarding rescheduling of hearings; dictated email to Miller and Guso enclosing draft of amended notice; exchange of emails from Guso; and review of email from Miller	0.50
03/17/2020	SAS	Review of recently filed Bailey v. EFO complaint; review of emails from Harley Riedel, Battista, and Kapila	0.90

03/17/2020	SAS	Review of emails form Waggoner and Edward Peterson regarding Langston motion to amend; telephone conference with Waggoner; conference with Harley Riedel; and review of emails from Harley Riedel and Edward Peterson	0.50
03/17/2020	SAS	Review of WARN Act Plaintiffs' motion to attend mediation; review of emails from Roche and Battista; and telephone conference with Roche	0.30
03/17/2020	EJP	Work on cash collateral motion	0.50
03/17/2020	EJP	Work on litigation issues	2.00
03/17/2020	SJ	Receipt and review CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30
03/17/2020	SJ	Receipt of CT invoice and forwarding to Soneet Kapila and Kevin McCoy; receipt of late filed claim and forwarding to Rachel Weiss	0.40
03/18/2020	MBH	Analysis of lien issues related to business interruption insurance; drafting of email memorandum	1.30
03/18/2020	MBH	Call with Edward Peterson and Kevin McCoy regarding various items	0.30
03/18/2020	MBH	Work throughout the day on filing various matters; finalizing various motions; calls with Edward Peterson; receipt, review, and respond to emails	1.50
03/18/2020	MBH	Finalize Highwoods settlement motion; email to Soneet Kapila nd Kevin McCoy regarding same	0.50
03/18/2020	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding issues created by Florida Department of Health's delay in responding to records request	0.20
03/18/2020	SAS	Review of motion to approve compromise with Highwoods; conference with Matt Hale regarding same	0.30
03/18/2020	SAS	Review of email from Miller enclosing revisions to stipulation of counsel and discussing changes; telephone conference with Miller; dictated further revisions; dictated email to Miller enclosing revisions; and follow-up call with Miller	0.70
03/18/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with McCoy regarding issues related to production of client files	0.20
03/18/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
03/18/2020	SJ	Review file, draft motion to reject Infinitti lease and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.40
03/19/2020	MBH	Review and redact invoices for fee application	1.50
03/19/2020	MBH	Email to Ryan Manns regarding Highwoods settlement motion; email to Eric Ludin regarding same	0.20
03/19/2020	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding various items	0.30
03/19/2020	MBH	Research on Langston claim	2.20
03/19/2020	MBH	Review Infinity motion and statute; call with Kevin mcCoy	0.60
03/19/2020	SAS	Dictated email to Mueller regarding status of filing payroll tax returns	0.10
03/19/2020	SAS	Review of email from Matt Hale regarding Langston motion to amend issues; research regarding claims as being property of the assignment estates; and conference with Matt Hale	0.60
03/19/2020	SAS	Review of additional orders granting motions to approve compromises	0.20
03/19/2020	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson and Matt Hale regarding response to Langston motion to amend and issues related to turnover of files; review of follow-up emails from Edward Peterson and Alpert	0.40
03/19/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
03/20/2020	MBH	Review and summarize Langston complaint	0.90
03/20/2020	MBH	Work on motion to bar Langston claims	1.40
03/20/2020	MBH	Call with Adam Alpert and Edward Peterson regarding Langston motion; review Langston complaint	0.50
03/20/2020	SAS	Review of email from Miller enclosing executed stipulation of counsel; dictated response; conferences regarding filing and service of pleadings; review of follow-up email from Miller; and dictated response	0.40
03/20/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
03/20/2020	SJ	Finalize and file Highwoods settlement motion	0.30
03/21/2020	SAS	Review of emails regarding WARN Act plaintiff's request to have motion to appear at mediation scheduled for hearing	0.20
03/23/2020	HER	Conference with Edward J. Peterson and work on litigation matters.	0.80
03/23/2020	SAS	Review of email from Barak regarding WARN Act Plaintiff's request to schedule a hearing on	0.30

		motion to attend mediation; conference with Edward Peterson; and dictated response to Barak	
03/23/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
03/23/2020	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service o Process, download and circulate	0.20
03/24/2020	BFA	E mail with Edward J. Peterson regarding search items for Holland & Knight	0.20
03/24/2020	MBH	Research of law on issues related to injunction motion	2.50
03/24/2020	MBH	Review pleadings and state court filings in relation to motion for injunction	1.70
03/24/2020	MBH	Work throughout the day on motion for injunction	3.00
03/24/2020	HER	Participation in conference call at 3:30 p.m. with Jennifer Altman; conference call with client and co-counsel at 4:30 p.m. regarding same.	1.10
03/24/2020	HER	Communications regarding H & K.	0.20
03/24/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Valles regarding preparation of response to motion to attend mediation	0.30
03/24/2020	SAS	Dictated email to Edward Peterson and Matt Hale enclosing draft of a proposal to Brooks Miller to resolve client file turnover issues; conference with Edward Peterson; and finalized draft to be sent to Edward Peterson and Matt Hale	0.80
03/24/2020	SAS	Review of email from Valles enclosing draft of response in opposition to motion to allow WARN Act plaintiffs to participate in mediation; dictated revision to response; dictated email to Valles enclosing revisions to draft; and telephone conference with Valles	0.80
03/24/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
03/25/2020	BFA	Follow up re payment to H&K for requested client documents	0.20
03/25/2020	MBH	Work throughout the day on injunction motion	4.50
03/25/2020	MBH	Research of law on issues related to injunction motion	2.50
03/25/2020	HER	Conference call with Doug Wright, Joe Varner, and Stacy Blank at 2:00 p.m.; review of revised tolling agreement (clean and redlined) received from Ms. Blank; email to Soneet Kapila, Edward Peterson, Jennifer Altman, and Melissa Davis forwarding same; multiple follow-up communications and review of comments to tolling agreement.	1.20
03/25/2020	DRF	Conference with E. Peterson; follow up re: Katten documents	2.40
03/25/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
03/25/2020	BMB	Office conferences with Edward J. Peterson and Daniel R. Fogarty regarding review of K&L Gates documents	0.30
03/26/2020	BFA	E mail Edward J. Peterson regarding Holland & Knight searches and documents	0.30
03/26/2020	MBH	Research of law for issues related to injunction motion	1.50
03/26/2020	MBH	Work on drafting of injunction motion; review of various documents and pleadings regarding same	4.00
03/26/2020	HER	Email to Doug Wright, Stacy Blank, and Joe Varner with revised tolling agreement; follow-up, including participation in conference call with Mr. Wright, Ms. Blank, and Mr. Varner at 2:00; participation in conference call with Jennifer Altman, Soneet Kapila and Edward Peterson at 3:30 p.m.; review email from Ms. Altman with attached tolling agreement; review of and reply to emails from Mr. Kapila regarding tolling agreement.	0.90
03/26/2020	SAS	Review of correspondence from Rob-- enclosing complaint filed with the Pennsylvania Attorney General's office by Aaron Srefken; dictated response; dictated letter to Aaron Srefken; and conference with Susan McKee regarding sending Srefken's records request to State of Florida	0.40
03/26/2020	DRF	Continued review of K&L Gates documents	2.10
03/26/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
03/26/2020	BMB	Interoffice discussions regarding document review	0.20
03/26/2020	SJ	Receipt and review CT Service of Process, download and circulate; forwarding of attorney general letter to DOH	0.30
03/26/2020	SJ	Emails, review file regarding Pillsbury employment pleadings	0.20
03/27/2020	BFA	Coordinate with Edward J. Peterson regarding documents produced by H&K	0.70
03/27/2020	MBH	Finalize Langston injunction motion; draft and send email to Scott Stichter and Edward Peterson regarding same	4.30
03/27/2020	HER	Email to Jennifer Altman with her comments to the H & K tolling agreement; email to Stacy	0.30

		Blank with changes to tolliing agreement.	
03/27/2020	SAS	Review and revision of Langston motion for preliminary and permanent injunction; dictated email to Matt Hale and Edward Peterson enclosing revisions to motion	1.20
03/27/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
03/28/2020	SAS	Dictated email to Matt Hale and Edward Peterson regarding Langston issues	0.10
03/29/2020	BFA	E mail from Harley Riedel re H&K documents and review; locate prior memo and notes and review same; email to Harley Riedel regarding same	0.50
03/29/2020	HER	Work on litigation matters, emails with Becky Ferrell-Anton regarding document production.	0.40
03/30/2020	BFA	E mail Stacy Blank re hard copy and electronic document production for Matters 5,6,8 and 20; e mail Gary Hopper re same; e mail to Edward J. Peterson and Harley E. Riedel regarding same; receive e mail from Stacy Blank; respond to same	0.80
03/30/2020	MBH	Receive and review comments on motion for injunction; further revisions to motion; finalize motion	1.90
03/30/2020	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding bank no longer approving operating expenses	0.20
03/30/2020	SAS	Telephone conference with Matt Hale regarding status of draft of Langston motion; dictated email to Edward Peterson; and review of email from Edward Peterson	0.20
03/30/2020	SAS	Review of email from Matt Hale enclosing revised draft of Langston motion; dictated further revisions; dictated email to Matt Hale; telephone conference with Matt Hale; and review of email from Matt Hale to co-counsel enclosing draft	0.90
03/30/2020	SAS	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding client file issues	0.20
03/30/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
03/30/2020	BMB	Office conference with Daniel R. Fogarty regarding review of K&L Gates documents; review of D&O complaint; review of K&L Gates documents; discussions with Edward J. Peterson	4.20
03/30/2020	SJ	Review file, draft first interim fee order and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.50
03/31/2020	BFA	Coordinate retrieval of hard copy documents from H&K during pandemic	0.60
03/31/2020	MBH	Research of law regarding injunction issue	0.80
03/31/2020	SAS	Dictated email to counsel enclosing draft of email to Brooks Miller; review of email from McCoy; and dictated email to Edward Peterson	0.30
03/31/2020	SAS	Review and revision of order on compensation; dictated revisions; and dictated email enclosing revisions	0.30
03/31/2020	SAS	Review of emails from Garno, Rocke, and Wagoner regarding Langston issues; telephone conference with Harley Riedel and Matt Hale regarding Langston issues	0.40
03/31/2020	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
03/31/2020	BMB	Review of documents	0.50
03/31/2020	SJ	Receipt and review CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30

Total Professional Services Rendered \$56,178.50

For Disbursements Incurred:

03/02/2020	Photocopies of Bonati Order	\$1.80
03/02/2020	Federal Express Corporation; Overnight Courier to Edward J. Peterson, Esq. from Elizabeth Avina/Chicago.	\$193.77
03/02/2020	Postage Bonati order	\$3.00
03/03/2020	Photocopies of Mot Compel - Mot Determine Proce	\$26.10
03/03/2020	Postage Mot Compel	\$9.60
03/04/2020	Photocopies of NOH April 16	\$2.85
03/04/2020	Postage NOH - 0416	\$3.00
03/09/2020	Transperfect Translations Intl., Inc.; Hearing transcript from 2/27/20	\$170.00
03/18/2020	Photocopies of 02.27.2020 Hearing Orders	\$27.00
03/18/2020	Postage fee/settlement order	\$9.60
03/20/2020	Photocopies of NOH and Stipulation filed today	\$27.90
03/20/2020	Photocopies of M-Approve SA with Highwoods	\$21.90
03/20/2020	Postage Mot Approve	\$8.40

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

03/20/2020	Postage NOH & Stip.	\$9.60
03/24/2020	Photocopies of NOH	\$92.85
03/24/2020	Postage 2nd SRBP fee App & Notice	\$15.60
03/26/2020	Photocopies of attorney general response letter	\$1.50
03/26/2020	Postage Atty. Gen. Response	\$1.80
03/30/2020	Holland & Knight; Photocopies of Laser Spine Institute files	\$1,504.20
Total Expenses Incurred		\$2,130.47

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Ferrell-Anton, Becky	4.50	\$1,687.50
Bachman, Michael	8.60	\$3,225.00
Fogarty, Dan R.	5.80	\$2,175.00
Peterson, Edward J.	49.00	\$20,825.00
Riedel, Harley E.	9.90	\$4,950.00
Hale, Matt B.	51.90	\$12,975.00
Stichter, Scott A.	16.70	\$7,181.00
Jeffcoat, Susan	15.80	\$3,160.00

Total For Professional Services Rendered	162.20 Hours	\$56,178.50
--	--------------	-------------

Adjusted Services Total		\$56,178.50
-------------------------	--	-------------

Professional Services		\$56,178.50
-----------------------	--	-------------

Disbursements		\$2,130.47
---------------	--	------------

Total New Charges This Invoice		\$58,308.97
--------------------------------	--	-------------

Previous Balance		\$577,462.93
------------------	--	--------------

Less Payments Received		(\$0.00)
------------------------	--	----------

Outstanding Balance		\$577,462.93
---------------------	--	--------------

New Charges This Invoice		\$58,308.97
--------------------------	--	-------------

Total Due		\$635,771.90
-----------	--	--------------

Bill #	44640
--------	-------

Date Last Payment	May/18/2020
-------------------	-------------

Last Payment Amount	\$5,300.82
---------------------	------------

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604