

Laser Spine Institute, LLC
CLM Aviation, LLC
LSI HoldCo, LLC
LSI Management Company, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Arizona, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cincinnati, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Cleveland, LLC
Laser Spine Surgical Center, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Pennsylvania, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of St. Louis, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Warwick, LLC
Medical Care Management Services, LLC
Spine DME Solutions, LLC
Total Spine Care, LLC
Laser Spine Institute Consulting, LLC
Laser Spine Surgery Center of Oklahoma, LLC

Case No. 2019-CA-2762
Case No. 2019-CA-2764
Case No. 2019-CA-2765
Case No. 2019-CA-2766
Case No. 2019-CA-2767
Case No. 2019-CA-2768
Case No. 2019-CA-2769
Case No. 2019-CA-2770
Case No. 2019-CA-2771
Case No. 2019-CA-2772
Case No. 2019-CA-2773
Case No. 2019-CA-2774
Case No. 2019-CA-2775
Case No. 2019-CA-2776
Case No. 2019-CA-2777
Case No. 2019-CA-2780

Assignors,

Consolidated Case No.
2019-CA-2762

to

Soneet Kapila,

Division L

Assignee.

COMPOSITE EXHIBIT A

**SECOND INTERIM APPLICATION OF
STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A. FOR ALLOWANCE OF
COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL FOR
ASSIGNEE FOR THE PERIOD OF JULY 1, 2019 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2019**

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

DON M. STICHTER
1929-2019
RICHARD C. PROSSER
1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL DUBOSE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
SCOTT A. STICHTER

G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER
OF COUNSEL

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

October 16, 2019

Soneet Kapila
Kapila-Laser Spine
Kapila & Company
1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316
USA

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Kapila-Laser Spine
Client: 13857
For Professional Services Rendered:

07/01/2019	MBH	Review bank tolling agreement; research on [REDACTED]	1.40
07/01/2019	MBH	Review documents, dockets, and pleadings related to Bailey judgment hearing	0.40
07/01/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson and Dan Fogarty regarding [REDACTED] issues	0.40
07/01/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding orders from hearing; review and revise orders; call with Bill Hahn regarding order	1.60
07/01/2019	HER	Review of emails regarding tolling agreements	0.20
07/01/2019	HER	Multiple items of electronic correspondence; brief conference with Edward Peterson	0.90
07/01/2019	HER	Telephone conference with Ken Mather regarding fraudulent transfer litigation and retention of counsel; follow-up	0.50
07/01/2019	SAS	Review of email from Knopik regarding document requests in Oklahoma litigation; conference with Edward Peterson; and dictated email to Knopik	0.40
07/01/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Lucre, Edward Peterson, and McCoy regarding Kimball litigation; dictated response; review of follow-up emails; and dictated response	0.40
07/01/2019	CAP	Continued review of Horne term sheet; attorney conference with Edward Peterson; review of motion (and attachments) filed with the state court to sell the St. Louis assets of LSI Management Company to Centurion Service Group; emails with Edward Peterson regarding revisions to Horne term sheet	0.90
07/01/2019	DRF	Receive and respond to email from E. Peterson regarding tolling; conference with E. Peterson and M. Hale regarding litigation status; research regarding [REDACTED]	1.40
07/01/2019	SHS	Review and search documents on e-hounds	0.40
07/01/2019	EJP	Emails regarding complaints and tolling	4.00

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

07/01/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and invoice; receipt and organize D&O and FT complaints	1.00
07/01/2019	SM	Review emails and attachments, work on claims and upload, circulate invoice, draft employment order for GJB and RMS and forwarding to Matthew Hale	2.40
07/02/2019	MBH	Travel to, attend, and return from hearing on Bailey judgment	2.70
07/02/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence regarding assets sales, hearing in Bailey matter, cash collateral issues and budget, and MedPro	0.50
07/02/2019	HER	Review of letter from Kirby McDonough regarding David Pillsbury and related electronic correspondence	0.30
07/02/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Susan McKee and Matt Hale regarding MedPro issues	0.10
07/02/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Knopik regarding Oklahoma litigation and Kimball claim; dictated email to McKay regarding Pennsylvania board; and dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding Oklahoma litigation	0.50
07/02/2019	CAP	Review and extensive revision of term sheet with William Horne, including attorney conferences with Edward Peterson; final proofing of term sheet and email clean and redlined versions of revised term sheet to Edward Peterson for forwarding to client	3.30
07/02/2019	CAP	Review emails as to new purchase offer received from Bonati	0.20
07/02/2019	SHS	Office conference with Edward Peterson, receipt and review of emails from Edward Peterson regarding David Pillsbury and settlement agreement, begin search of documents related to same	0.70
07/02/2019	EJP	Work on various issues	2.00
07/02/2019	EJP	Work on various issues	2.00
07/02/2019	SM	Emails, draft Cigna motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson, conferences regarding fee application and monthly invoices, review claims	1.90
07/02/2019	SM	Receipt of CT Service of Process, review and circulate same, review executed tolling agreements and calendaring of deadlines	0.50
07/02/2019	LMF	Review term sheet; review additional revisions to term sheet	0.80
07/03/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding Scottsdale lease issues; review draft motion regarding same	0.30
07/03/2019	MBH	Drafting of proposed order on motion to compel and motion to determine self-insurance compliance; drafting of letter to judge regarding proposed orders; review and finalize proposed orders; review order submission procedures; confer with staff regarding same	2.10
07/03/2019	MBH	Receive and respond to emails regarding claims register and MedPro correspondence; conference with Scott Stichter and Edward Peterson regarding same; review of pleadings related to patient records; draft and send memorandum email to Soneet Kapila and team regarding same	1.00
07/03/2019	MBH	Drafting of letter regarding proposed order on motions to compel and motions to determine self-insurance compliance; finalize proposed order	0.50
07/03/2019	MBH	Receive email regarding Teleflex data; email to Kevin McCoy; review prior emails	0.20
07/03/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson and Scott Stichter regarding insurance issues	0.20
07/03/2019	HER	Participation in 9:00 a.m. telephone conference with Soneet Kapila and Edward Peterson regarding MedPro	0.40
07/03/2019	HER	Review of and reply to email regarding entry of judgment in favor of the Bailey parties; review of judgment, emails with Soneet Kapila regarding same	0.40
07/03/2019	HER	Review of and reply to email from Rick Fenstermacher regarding draft email to Jeff Warren regarding certificates of insurance; review of and reply to emails regarding update to website regarding medical malpractice coverage	0.40
07/03/2019	HER	Review of numerous emails regarding litigation	0.30
07/03/2019	HER	Review of emails regarding asset sales and [REDACTED] issues	0.30
07/03/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert requesting copies of medical malpractice claims filed in the assignment proceedings; dictated email to Kapila, Weis, Edward Peterson, and Matt Hale; exchange of emails with Matt Hale and Edward Peterson; telephone conference with Weiss; conference with Matt Hale; and conference with Matt Hale and Edward Peterson	0.90
07/03/2019	SAS	Review of email from Matt Hale regarding draft of order continuing hearings on motion to compel; exchange of emails with Edward Peterson and Matt Hale; and review of draft letter to	0.40

Date	Initials	Description	Hours
		court	
07/03/2019	SAS	Review of email from Knopik regarding Oklahoma litigation; telephone conference with Lewis regarding same	0.30
07/03/2019	SAS	Review of Matt Hale's draft email forwarding documents	0.20
07/03/2019	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding potential claims against brokers; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	0.20
07/03/2019	SAS	Review of draft email from Matt Hale responding to requests for claims	0.20
07/03/2019	EJP	Work on various issues	2.50
07/03/2019	EJP	Work on various issues.	2.50
07/03/2019	SM	Emails, review and organize attachments, work on pleadings, review file and invoices in preparation for fee application, conference with Matthew Hale regarding uploading orders in JAWS, conferences and emails with Scott Stichter regarding claims	1.60
07/03/2019	SM	Download and organize filed pleadings, upload to sharefile and circulate	0.40
07/04/2019	CAP	Emails regarding comments on Horne term sheet; follow-up	0.70
07/05/2019	CAP	Review emails and revised drafts of Horne term sheet; follow-up	1.00
07/05/2019	EJP	Work on Horne term sheet	1.50
07/06/2019	CAP	Review final form of Horne term sheet emailed by Edward Peterson to Joseph Kadow; email to Edward Peterson regarding additional change needed	0.70
07/06/2019	CAP	Review Bonati purchase terms; emails with Edward Peterson regarding preparation of new term sheet for Bonati	0.20
07/07/2019	CAP	Review draft of new term sheet for Bonati offer; email to Edward Peterson regarding comments to draft	0.60
07/07/2019	EJP	Work on revised term sheet	1.00
07/08/2019	MBH	Drafting of Arizona lease motion	2.00
07/08/2019	MBH	Finalize order and letter	0.30
07/08/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Martinez-Monfort regarding Kimball claims	0.20
07/08/2019	SAS	Review of complaint filed in state court to recover damages and set aside fraudulent transfers	0.60
07/08/2019	CAP	Exchange emails with Edward Peterson regarding changes to Bonati term sheet	0.20
07/08/2019	EJP	Work on Bonati term sheet and emails	2.50
07/08/2019	SM	Review emails and attachments, emails as to calls regarding receipt of claims	0.50
07/08/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate	0.20
07/09/2019	MBH	Receive and review claims spreadsheet; draft and send email to Adam Alpert regarding claims; receive and respond to email from Kevin McCoy regarding MedPro request	0.40
07/09/2019	MBH	Drafting Arizona lease motion to compel	2.90
07/09/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding Arizona motion; revisions to same	0.40
07/09/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding website, assets sales, invoices, WARN Act claims, and landlord turnover; review of orders entered by the Court	0.50
07/09/2019	HER	Review of correspondence from Jennifer Altman and Edward Peterson; emails regarding Pillsbury settlement	0.20
07/09/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Matt Hale, Edward Peterson, and McCoy regarding MedPro's request for claim information	0.20
07/09/2019	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding endorsement to insurance policy; review of files; and dictated email to Edward Peterson enclosing endorsement	0.30
07/09/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with creditor regarding class certification order	0.20
07/09/2019	EJP	Emails with creditors and calls with creditors	4.00
07/09/2019	SM	Emails, work on claims and upload to sharefile	1.10
07/10/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding Arizona motion; compile exhibits; email regarding same; review and revise same	0.50
07/10/2019	MBH	Receive email regarding employment order; revise and draft letter regarding same; further email regarding same	0.30
07/10/2019	HER	Work on and sending and redaction of SRBP invoice per interim compensation procedure; participation in portion of SRBP Internal Meeting; review of email	1.80
07/10/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence	0.10

07/10/2019	SAS	Review of further emails regarding granting class certification	0.20
07/10/2019	SAS	Review of email from Manns and Edward Peterson regarding class certification issues; participated in portion of call with Edward Peterson and Manns regarding same	0.40
07/10/2019	SAS	Review of order granting class certification	0.30
07/10/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding filing claims	0.20
07/10/2019	CAP	Emails with Edward Peterson regarding status of purchase offers	0.10
07/10/2019	EJP	Work on various issues	2.00
07/10/2019	EJP	Work on various issues	2.00
07/10/2019	SM	Emails, revise Landerhaven order and forwarding to Edward Peterson; revise motion to compel and forwarding to Edward Peterson; draft NOF affidavit of mailing and file same; emails regarding fee applications, work on SRBP fee application and forwarding to Edward Peterson; work on claims	2.50
07/10/2019	SM	Receipt, review and circulate CT Service of Process	0.20
07/11/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding [REDACTED] issues; review research regarding same	0.20
07/11/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence and documents regarding asset sales	0.40
07/11/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation issues, joint defense, and retention of counsel	0.40
07/11/2019	HER	Finalization and redaction of June invoice	1.20
07/11/2019	SAS	Review of Bone's complaint with Attorney General's Office; dictated response	0.60
07/11/2019	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding payroll records; review of files; and dictated email to Barack enclosing documents	0.40
07/11/2019	EJP	Work on various issues	2.00
07/11/2019	EJP	Work on various issues	2.00
07/11/2019	SM	Receipt and review of claims, emails, work on fee application	0.90
07/12/2019	MJH	Conference with K. Whiteside regarding orders on settlement agreements	0.40
07/12/2019	MBH	Review materials prior to meeting; internal meeting regarding case matters	0.90
07/12/2019	HER	Revision of Pillsbury engagement letter; email to Soneet Kapila regarding same; multiple items of electronic correspondence regarding litigation and retention issues; conference call at 4:30 p.m. with Mr. Kapila and Edward Peterson; review of audited statements and accountants' reports in connection with litigation.	2.50
07/12/2019	SAS	Participated in conference with attorneys regarding pending matters	0.70
07/12/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Warren, Alpert, and Edward Peterson regarding filed claims	0.20
07/12/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with purchaser of equipment; conference with Edward Peterson	0.20
07/12/2019	SAS	Emails from Acre and McCoy; dictated email to Barack; and review of email from Barack	0.30
07/12/2019	SHS	Participate in office conference regarding pending litigation and matters in case	1.00
07/12/2019	SHS	Work on timeline for CPAs and continue searching E-hound platform	6.00
07/12/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	3.50
07/12/2019	KW	Calls and emails with creditors regarding proofs of claims	1.00
07/12/2019	SM	Review claims, organize, update spreadsheet and upload to sharefile	6.90
07/12/2019	SM	Emails, receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate	0.60
07/14/2019	SHS	Review and respond to email from Edward Peterson	0.40
07/14/2019	EJP	Review issues involving auditors	1.00
07/15/2019	MBH	Review research on [REDACTED]; work on memorandum regarding same	2.60
07/15/2019	HER	Work on litigation issues and retention of counsel, including revision of engagement letter, internal communications, conference call with Jennifer Altman and Edward Peterson, and email to client	2.20
07/15/2019	SAS	Review and revision of draft of joint defense agreement; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	0.90
07/15/2019	SAS	Review of email from Flood regarding date of termination of MedPro contract; review of file; and dictated response	0.20
07/15/2019	SAS	Review of email regarding termination of MedPro contract; review of file; and dictated response	0.20

07/15/2019	SHS	Update timeline for CPA bullet point outline and continue searching E-hounds platform	4.50
07/15/2019	SHS	Search for documents related to [REDACTED]	0.80
07/15/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	5.50
07/15/2019	SM	Emails, work on claims, call with patient, finalize and file Cigna motion	3.10
07/15/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
07/16/2019	MBH	Review loan documents; draft and send email to Edward Peterson	0.30
07/16/2019	MBH	Call with Dan Fogarty regarding research memorandum	0.30
07/16/2019	MBH	Research regarding [REDACTED]	2.20
07/16/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding patient inquiry on filing proof of claim	0.10
07/16/2019	HER	Review of Bonati term sheet; electronic correspondence regarding same; review of emails regarding insurance	0.40
07/16/2019	HER	Emails with Soneet Kapila; review of email from Jennifer Altman requesting information; email to Susan Sharp regarding follow-up search of records; multiple items electronic correspondence regarding [REDACTED], fraudulent transfer and D & O cases	1.20
07/16/2019	SAS	Review of email from Barack regarding form of employee payroll recorder; dictated email to Acre; review of email from Acre; review of email from Edward Peterson; and dictated response	0.40
07/16/2019	DRF	Emails and follow up regarding litigation issues	0.20
07/16/2019	SHS	Continue search of E-hounds platform and review of documents	3.50
07/16/2019	SHS	Westlaw research related to [REDACTED] and forward case law to Matt Hale regarding the same	2.10
07/16/2019	SHS	Conference call with litigation team regarding strategy and litigation targets	1.20
07/16/2019	EJP	Work on various litigation issues	4.50
07/16/2019	SM	Revise Cigna motion and circulate, finalize, file and serve motion; review claims; work on fee applications	3.50
07/16/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30
07/17/2019	MBH	Review of [REDACTED] employment agreement and related emails	1.00
07/17/2019	MBH	Drafting of memorandum on [REDACTED]; research of law regarding same	3.30
07/17/2019	HER	Review of morning emails from Paul Battista, Jennifer Altman, and Edward J. Peterson regarding litigation issues	0.30
07/17/2019	HER	Participation in conference call with Bruce Shilcutt, Ryan Manns, Soneet Kapila, Joe Gillis, Karen Fugate, Edward J. Peterson and others (11:00 to 11:35 a.m.); follow-up with Mr. Peterson (11:35 to 11:45 a.m.)	0.80
07/17/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding Tampa lease; review of wind-down budget	0.40
07/17/2019	HER	Work on [REDACTED] and fraudulent transfer matters	0.40
07/17/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Schutz, Fenstermacher, insurance company, and Edward Peterson regarding notice of loss; dictated response	0.30
07/17/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Battista, Kapila, and Edward Peterson regarding litigation issues	0.40
07/17/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	5.00
07/17/2019	EJP	Work on fee applications	1.00
07/17/2019	KW	Call with attorney for patients regarding accessing medical records.	0.10
07/17/2019	SM	Work on fee applications and forwarding to Edward Peterson	2.80
07/17/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
07/18/2019	MBH	Revisions to letter submitting order regarding settlement motion with landlord; review notice statute; review proposed order; emails regarding same and order submission	0.30
07/18/2019	MBH	Research of law on [REDACTED]; work on memo	1.40
07/18/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation and letter terminating tolling agreement	0.40
07/18/2019	HER	Review of email from Bruce Shilcutt regarding status and issues	0.20
07/18/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher regarding Weiss litigation issues; review of documents; and telephone conference with Fenstermacher regarding same	0.50
07/18/2019	SAS	Review of draft of litigation hold letter; conference with Edward Peterson	0.40
07/18/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding fee application issues	0.20

07/18/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher regarding MedPro's refusal to issue refund; telephone conference with Edward Peterson and Fenstermacher; and conference with Edward Peterson	0.30
07/18/2019	EJP	Calls with landlord and emails	1.00
07/18/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
07/18/2019	SM	Work on fee applications, conference with Adrienne Napoli, forwarding of SRBP fee application to Edward Peterson; work on claims and upload to sharefile, emails	6.00
07/19/2019	MBH	Work on memo on [REDACTED]	0.80
07/19/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding potential litigation claims against Dr. Weiss	0.20
07/19/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Schutz regarding next week's hearings; review of files; and dictated email to Schutz enclosing insurance information and filed lawsuits	0.60
07/19/2019	SAS	Conferences regarding monitoring state court litigation; dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding same	0.20
07/19/2019	SAS	Review of MedPro's filed claim; dictated email to Fenstermacher regarding MedPro refund; exchange of emails with Fenstermacher regarding amounts owed under insurance premium financing agreement; dictated responses; review of emails from Edward Peterson and Kapila; and dictated email to Edward Peterson	0.70
07/19/2019	SHS	Continue searching E-hounds platform for documents related to Pillsbury	3.50
07/19/2019	EJP	Work on litigation issues	1.50
07/20/2019	SAS	Work on fee application	0.90
07/21/2019	MBH	Research of law regarding [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]	1.40
07/21/2019	SAS	Dictated draft of demand letter for return of MedPro refund	0.40
07/21/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Kastner regarding status of settlement discussions with regards to trademark litigation	0.10
07/21/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Edward Peterson and Matt Hale regarding conversations with Schutz regarding next week's hearings	0.30
07/21/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Pancrudo regarding offer to settle patient debt; review of email from Pancrudo; and dictated email to company forwarding Pancrudo's email	0.20
07/21/2019	SAS	Review of email from Acre enclosing payroll information; review of enclosures, and dictated email to Acre regarding providing documents to Barack	0.30
07/22/2019	SAS	Exchange of emails with McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding parameters for settling patient debts	0.20
07/22/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Acre regarding sending payroll information to Barack; exchange of emails with Acre; and review of emails from Acre and Barack	0.30
07/22/2019	CAP	Emails with Edward Peterson regarding acceptance of Bonati term sheet by assignee, and follow-up attorney conference with Edward Peterson; review term sheet; initial work on researching asset purchase agreement issues; further late night emails	1.50
07/22/2019	EJP	Preparation for meeting with Bank and review of term sheets	9.00
07/22/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate	0.20
07/23/2019	MBH	Work on [REDACTED] memo	1.00
07/23/2019	MBH	Conference with Charlie Postler regarding APA; review documents regarding recitals; email to Mr. Postler regarding same	0.30
07/23/2019	HER	Conference with Scott A. Stichter regarding insurance coverage and other issues; review of numerous items of electronic correspondence; email to Edward Peterson	0.60
07/23/2019	SAS	Review of email from Kastner regarding status of California patent litigation; review of email from Kapila	0.20
07/23/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Roland enclosing response to Bone's administrative complaint; review of email from Roland	0.20
07/23/2019	SAS	Dictated letter to Bone regarding Medline judgment and stay of actions against assets of the estates	0.20
07/23/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding MedPro demand letter	0.20
07/23/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Harley Riedel and Edward Peterson regarding Knopik litigation issues; conference with Harley Riedel; and exchange of emails with Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel regarding same	0.40
07/23/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Acre regarding payroll information requested by Barack; dictated follow-up email to Acre; and review of email from Acre to Barack enclosing payroll information	0.20

07/23/2019	SAS	Review of Dr. Weiss' counsel's motion to withdraw	0.10
07/23/2019	CAP	Work on asset purchase agreement with Bonati entity (buyer), including telephone call with Samuel Heller (counsel to Dr. Bonati) and Edward Peterson, review pleadings filed in state court, review entity documents, emails, and begin preparation of first draft of asset purchase agreement	6.70
07/23/2019	SHS	Draft email to litigation team	0.20
07/23/2019	EJP	Work on sales and meeting with Bank	9.00
07/23/2019	KW	Calls with creditors regarding proof of claim form and procedures	0.20
07/23/2019	SM	Emails, work on Centurion sale order and forwarding to Edward Peterson; work on fee applications and forwarding to Edward Peterson; work on agenda and forwarding to Edward Peterson	1.70
07/23/2019	LMF	Review emails; conference with C. Postler; draft email to E. Peterson	0.60
07/23/2019	LMF	Draft email to Kevin McCoy	0.10
07/23/2019	LMF	Review documents and intellectual property information in data room documents	1.90
07/24/2019	SAS	Exchange of Edward Peterson regarding MedPro demand letter; review of follow-up emails from Edward Peterson and Kapila	0.20
07/24/2019	CAP	Extensive work during the day and at night on drafting of asset purchase agreement with Bonati entity, including review of state court pleadings and data room documents in connection therewith.	4.00
07/24/2019	EJP	Work on sale issues and preparation for hearing	4.50
07/24/2019	SM	Emails, work on fee applications, conference with Edward Peterson	1.00
07/24/2019	LMF	Review NextGen documents; draft email to C. Postler.	0.70
07/24/2019	LMF	Review pleadings and orders and other documents related to the Tampa assets.	2.70
07/24/2019	LMF	Review emails regarding asset sale.	0.70
07/24/2019	LMF	Continue to review dataroom documents; review lease in Tampa and amendments.	2.30
07/24/2019	LMF	Review email regarding potential buyer reversal; draft emails to C. Postler.	0.50
07/25/2019	MBH	Conference call with Edward Peterson and Ryan Manns regarding hearing	0.50
07/25/2019	MBH	Research of law regarding jurisdictional issues	0.30
07/25/2019	SAS	Review of email from Knopik regarding False Claims Act lawsuit filed by Dr. Flood	0.40
07/25/2019	SAS	Continued work on MedPro demand letter, including review of Fenstermacher's revisions; dictated further revisions, exchange of emails with Edward Peterson; review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing revised letters; review of follow-up emails from Fenstermacher and Kapila; and dictated response	0.60
07/25/2019	CAP	Work on asset purchase agreement with Bonati entity (buyer), including emails during the day, attendance on 1:15 p.m. conference call as to intellectual property issues, and review company documents	3.50
07/25/2019	SHS	Review and respond to email from Greg Garno, receipt and review of email from Edward Peterson, E-hounds platform for documents related to [REDACTED]	1.50
07/25/2019	SHS	Work on outline for Chris Knopik and forward same to Edward Peterson	2.40
07/25/2019	EJP	Work on potential sale [Bonati] and preparation for hearings	5.00
07/25/2019	SM	Emails, work on fee applications, finalize and file same	1.80
07/25/2019	LMF	Review intellectual property charts	0.50
07/25/2019	LMF	Prepare for and attend conference call	0.50
07/25/2019	LMF	Review Sales Force contract	1.30
07/25/2019	LMF	Throughout the day review sale related documents and emails; continue to review documents in dataroom and files	2.30
07/26/2019	BFA	Conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding [REDACTED] Arizona landlord and begin research regarding same	1.50
07/26/2019	MBH	Meeting with Becky Ferrell-Anton and Edward Peterson regarding research for hearing; review pleadings for hearing prior to upload	0.70
07/26/2019	MBH	Receive and review agenda and status report for hearing	0.20
07/26/2019	MBH	Work on memo on [REDACTED] and review of [REDACTED]; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	3.00

07/26/2019	MBH	Compile documents and emails regarding [REDACTED]; draft and send email to co-counsel regarding same	0.40
07/26/2019	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing revised MedPro demand letter; dictated response; and review of email from Edward Peterson and Alpert	0.40
07/26/2019	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding attorney's intention to subpoena records; dictated email to Edward Peterson	0.20
07/26/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Khan Whiteside regarding pleadings in state court fraudulent transfer actions and D&O lawsuits	0.10
07/26/2019	SAS	Review of email from Barack requesting additional information regarding payroll; dictated response	0.20
07/26/2019	CAP	Continued drafting of asset purchase agreement; attendance on afternoon telephone call with Samuel Heller, Edward Peterson, and others	2.10
07/26/2019	SHS	Office conference with Matt Hale, and search E-hounds platform for [REDACTED] documents	1.50
07/26/2019	EJP	Work on Bonati sale and various calls	6.50
07/26/2019	SM	Emails, review file, forwarding of fee applications to parties	0.50
07/26/2019	LMF	Prepare for and attend telephone conference with Bonati's attorney; review emails and updated data room files	1.10
07/27/2019	SAS	Review of District Court order granting class certification motion and approving revised class certification notices	0.20
07/27/2019	CAP	Drafting of asset purchase agreement with Bonati entity (buyer), including review of company documents	1.20
07/28/2019	CAP	Work on asset purchase agreement with Bonati entity	1.50
07/29/2019	BFA	Continue research on [REDACTED] with regard to Arizona landlord; conference with Edward J. Peterson and Matt Hale regarding same; outline of arguments for upcoming hearing; review motion to dismiss filed by Arizona landlord	4.90
07/29/2019	MJH	Conference with Khank Whiteside regarding responses	0.20
07/29/2019	MBH	Research of law on [REDACTED]	2.50
07/29/2019	MBH	Review insurance related issues; conference with Scott Stichter regarding insurance claim motions and resolution	0.70
07/29/2019	MBH	Attempt calls and leave voicemails with movants related to self-insurance issues; draft and send emails to movants and joinder parties related to same; review pleadings regarding same	2.30
07/29/2019	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding tomorrow's hearings	0.30
07/29/2019	SAS	Dictated revisions to order on motion to compel compliance; conference with Matt Hale; and dictated email to Schutz	0.40
07/29/2019	SAS	Review of order continuing hearings on motion to compel and motion to determine compliance; conference with Matt Hale regarding same; and dictated follow-up email to Matt Hale	0.40
07/29/2019	SAS	Review of email from Schutz enclosing revisions to order on motion to determine compliance; conference with Matt Hale; conference with Edward Peterson; and dictated email to Kapila, Edward Peterson, and Matt Hale	0.40
07/29/2019	SAS	Review of Notice of withdrawal of motion to compel assignee to pursue causes of action	0.20
07/29/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding tomorrow's hearings; telephone conference with Schutz regarding pending motions; and conference with Edward Peterson regarding call with Schutz	0.40
07/29/2019	CAP	Review sale issues with Bonati	0.50
07/29/2019	EJP	Preparation for hearings	6.00
07/29/2019	SM	Review file and APA, work on Tampa asset sale motion and forwarding to Edward Peterson, emails	1.20
07/30/2019	BFA	Review motion to dismiss filed by landlord and review cases cited therein; additional research and brief conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding same	2.50
07/30/2019	MBH	Review motion to dismiss Arizona motion; brief research regarding same; receive and respond to email from Edward Peterson regarding research on [REDACTED]; review rules and research regarding same	1.20
07/30/2019	MBH	Call with John Gilbert regarding insurance motions; receive and respond to correspondence regarding insurance issues; call with Heather Barnes regarding self-insurance issues; work on	1.20

		order denying joinders as moot relating to self-insurance issues	
07/30/2019	MBH	Preparation for hearing; calls with movants and joinder filers related to insurance issues prior to hearing; review legal issues and pleadings prior to hearing	1.70
07/30/2019	MBH	Travel to, attend, and return from hearing; meeting with Edward Peterson and Soneet Kapila following hearing	1.50
07/30/2019	MBH	Meeting with bank lawyers and Soneet Kapila prior to hearing	1.50
07/30/2019	MBH	Drafting of term sheet for Arizona landlord settlement	1.10
07/30/2019	HER	Conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding hearings	0.50
07/30/2019	SAS	Further conference with Matt Hale regarding issues to be addressed during hearing	0.20
07/30/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher enclosing revisions to draft of order on motion to compel compliance; dictated email to Schutz enclosing revisions to order; review of email from Schutz; and conference with Matt Hale	0.40
07/30/2019	SAS	Review of Arizona landlord's motion to dismiss and motion to compel turnover	0.20
07/30/2019	CAP	Work on asset purchase agreement with Bonati entity, including review of data room documents, state court pleadings, and emails.	5.00
07/30/2019	EJP	Preparation for and attendance at hearings	6.00
07/30/2019	SM	Emails regarding patient letter and review letter	0.20
07/31/2019	MBH	Drafting of Scottsdale settlement agreement	0.80
07/31/2019	MBH	Work on term sheet for Scottsdale Settlement; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	2.10
07/31/2019	MBH	Research regarding [REDACTED]; drafting of memorandum regarding same	2.40
07/31/2019	HER	Review of and reply to email from Edward Peterson regarding MedPro refund; review of further emails from Adam Alpert and Scott Stichter; review of research materials regarding same	0.70
07/31/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation issues; work on lawyer retention agreement	0.90
07/31/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence and internal communications regarding cash collateral	0.40
07/31/2019	SAS	Review of email from Schaffer regarding contract	0.20
07/31/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Harley Riedel and Edward Peterson regarding MedPro refund and other claims issues; review of email from Alpert; and conference with Edward Peterson	0.30
07/31/2019	CAP	Extensive work on drafting asset purchase agreement with Bonati entity (buyer)	4.40
07/31/2019	SHS	Search for documents on E-hounds platform and brief office conference with Edward Peterson regarding the same	3.50
07/31/2019	EJP	Work on Bonati sale and litigation issues	5.00
07/31/2019	SM	Review emails and attachments, organize miscellaneous correspondence, return witness check to creditor, draft notice of assignment and letter, forwarding to Scott Stichter	1.10
07/31/2019	LMF	Review bill of sale from Pennsylvania sale; review internal documents; begin draft exhibits	1.70
07/31/2019	LMF	Review emails regarding asset purchase agreement	0.50

Total Professional Services Rendered

\$127,295.50

For Disbursements Incurred:

05/30/2019	Photocopies of May 23 Hearing Orders	\$22.50
05/30/2019	Photocopies	\$2.70
06/03/2019	Photocopies of Cash Collateral Response and HFD Motion	\$18.90
06/05/2019	Photocopies of Clary Motion	\$14.40
06/05/2019	Photocopies of Gulf Coast motion	\$16.80
07/01/2019	Samaria Cafe.....lunch for meeting.	\$105.79
07/10/2019	Postage for Motion to Compel Raintree	\$32.50
07/11/2019	Photocopies of Agenda	\$31.50
07/11/2019	Photocopies of notice of hearing on motion to compel	\$1.20
07/11/2019	Postage for Notice of Hearing on Motion to Compel	\$2.00

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

07/15/2019	Edward J. Peterson and Chris Pizzo...working lunch June 28, 2019.	\$47.65
07/16/2019	Photocopies of June 27 Orders	\$11.25
07/16/2019	Postage for June 27 Hearing Orders	\$5.35
07/22/2019	Samaria Cafe.....Lunch meeting.	\$143.33
07/24/2019	Chez Faby.....Lunch (5) meeting.	\$118.81
07/25/2019	Photocopies	\$0.90
07/25/2019	Transperfect Translations Intl.; Hearing transcript from June 27, 2019 in Tampa.	\$892.50
07/29/2019	Photocopies of Orders	\$8.10
07/29/2019	Paninoteca Inc.....client meeting in office/8 in attendance.	\$112.84
07/29/2019	Overnight Courier to David Pillsbury/Miami.	\$32.69
07/29/2019	Postage hearing order	\$3.60
07/31/2019	Public Access to Court Electronic Records for 2nd Quarter, 2019.	\$6.90
Total Expenses Incurred		\$1,632.21

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Ferrell-Anton, Becky	8.90	\$3,337.50
Postler, Charles A.	38.30	\$18,192.50
Fogarty, Dan R.	1.60	\$600.00
Peterson, Edward J.	105.50	\$44,837.50
Riedel, Harley E.	20.80	\$10,296.00
Whiteside, Khan	1.30	\$117.00
Ferris, Laura M	18.20	\$3,640.00
Hale, Matt B.	57.70	\$14,425.00
Hooi, Michael J.	0.60	\$180.00
Stichter, Scott A.	24.00	\$10,320.00
Sharp, Susan	33.20	\$12,450.00
McKee, Susan	44.50	\$8,900.00
Total For Professional Services Rendered	354.60 Hours	\$127,295.50
Adjusted Services Total		\$127,295.50
Professional Services		\$127,295.50
Disbursements		\$1,632.21
Total New Charges This Invoice		\$128,927.71
Previous Balance		\$542,403.82
Less Payments Received		(\$0.00)
Less Adjustments		\$128,927.71 CR

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

Outstanding Balance	\$413,476.11
New Charges This Invoice	\$128,927.71
	<hr/>
Total Due	\$542,403.82
	<hr/> <hr/>

Bill # 43494

Date Last Payment July/03/2019

Last Payment Amount \$5,300.82

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

DON M. STICHTER
1929-2019
RICHARD C. PROSSER
1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL DUBOSE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
SCOTT A. STICHTER

G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER
OF COUNSEL

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

December 10, 2019

Soneet Kapila
Kapila-Laser Spine
Kapila & Company
1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316
USA

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Kapila-Laser Spine
Client: 13857
For Professional Services Rendered:

08/01/2019	MBH	Drafting, revising, and finalizing of settlement agreement with Arizona landlord	1.90
08/01/2019	MBH	Review Tampa APA regarding negative notice and order entry conditions; conferences with Edward Peterson and Charlie Postler regarding same	0.30
08/01/2019	MBH	Internal meeting regarding various case matters	0.50
08/01/2019	MBH	Review emails with medical malpractice plaintiffs; draft and send email to Cameron Kennedy regarding outstanding orders	0.20
08/01/2019	MBH	Conference call with MedPro attorneys regarding premium refund and defense issues	0.50
08/01/2019	HER	Conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding results of court hearing, bank's and cash collateral issues and other general matters	0.30
08/01/2019	SAS	Review of email from Shaffer regarding requested contact information for witnesses in state court litigation	0.10
08/01/2019	SAS	Review of research regarding [REDACTED] issues; conference with Matt Hale	0.40
08/01/2019	SAS	Participated in attorney conference regarding pending matters	0.50
08/01/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Kapila regarding fee application issues	0.20
08/01/2019	CAP	Extensive drafting of asset purchase agreement with Bonati entity (buyer), and email draft of asset purchase agreement to Samuel Heller in the afternoon; follow-up emails with Samuel Heller; follow-up on sale motion; conferences with Michael Bachman	5.30
08/01/2019	DRF	Participate in attorney status meeting	0.50
08/01/2019	EJP	Conference with Harley Riedel regarding outcome of hearings	0.30
08/01/2019	EJP	Participated in attorney conference regarding pending matters	0.50

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

08/01/2019	LMF	Review asset purchase agreement and compare definitions; review related documents; draft exhibits	4.60
08/01/2019	HER	Conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding litigation issues	0.30
08/01/2019	HER	Telephone conference with Doug Wright regarding files on [REDACTED]; review of email from Edward J. Peterson regarding same	0.30
08/01/2019	HER	Editing and sending of letter to Doug Wright (including further brief conference with Susan H. Sharp)	0.20
08/01/2019	HER	Left voice mail message for, and dictation of letter to Doug Wright, regarding [REDACTED]; brief conference with Susan H. Sharp regarding same and review of background materials; emails with Susan Sharp	0.80
08/01/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence regarding fraudulent transfer action and attached payment summary.	0.40
08/01/2019	HER	Review of revised H & K retention letter and related email.	0.30
08/01/2019	SHS	Participated in attorney conference regarding pending matters and litigation issues	0.50
08/01/2019	SHS	Search and review documents on E-hounds platform and office conferences with Harley Riedel and Edward Peterson regarding documents found in [REDACTED]	6.60
08/01/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	4.70
08/02/2019	HER	Participation in conference call with Bruce Shilcutt, Toby Gerber, Soneet Kapila, Edward J. Peterson and others regarding pending issues	0.70
08/02/2019	HER	Review of motion regarding sale to Centurion.	0.20
08/02/2019	HER	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding scheduling of call; dictated email to McCoy	0.20
08/02/2019	HER	Review of emails from Scott Stichter and Edward Peterson regarding MedPro settlement issues; dictated response	0.20
08/02/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro settlement offer; review of emails from Harley Riedel and Edward Peterson; and conference with Edward Peterson	0.30
08/02/2019	SAS	Dictated email to McCoy regarding contact information for potential witnesses requested by Shaffer; exchange of emails with McCoy and Acre; and dictated email to Shaffer enclosing requested information	0.30
08/02/2019	CAP	Work on asset purchase transaction with Bonati entity (buyer), including work on sale motion, email wire transfer instructions for \$400,000 purchase price deposit to Samuel Heller, continued review and proofing of first draft of asset purchase agreement emailed to Samuel Heller, attorney conference with Edward Peterson, review drafts of exhibits to asset purchase agreement and provide comments to Laura Ferris, and emails	2.70
08/02/2019	EJP	Work on Bonati sale issues and calls with bank regarding pending matters	4.50
08/02/2019	SM	Emails, review file regarding Landerhaven MRI	0.20
08/02/2019	LMF	Draft exhibits to asset purchase agreement; draft email to Samuel Heller	4.80
08/02/2019	MBH	Review emails and documents related to Pillsbury separation agreement	0.90
08/02/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence and arbitration papers regarding [REDACTED]	0.30
08/02/2019	HER	Drafting and circulation of proposed email to Patrick Moseley regarding settlement of fraudulent transfer claims; internal communications regarding same and email to Soneet Kapila with draft	1.20
08/02/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence with Paul Battista and Jon Sbar regarding FT claims.	0.20
08/02/2019	HER	Review of emails from Jennifer Altman regarding possible engagement, information; follow-up.	0.30
08/02/2019	SHS	Search and review documents on E-hounds platform and draft email to Andrea Holder regarding issues with document search	3.50
08/02/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate	0.20
08/04/2019	CAP	Finish review of draft sale motion; email suggested changes to motion to Edward Peterson	0.60
08/04/2019	CAP	Review Salesforce contract emailed by Kevin McCoy as to right of LSI Management to assign; email to Laura Ferris regarding same	0.50
08/04/2019	LMF	Review and respond to email from C. Postler regarding sales force contract	0.20
08/05/2019	MBH	Emails regarding MedPro claims access; call with Adam Alpert	0.20
08/05/2019	HER	Review of email from Kapila regarding Bonati sale issues and dictated email regarding funding issues	0.40

08/05/2019	SAS	Review of MedPro's request for further information; review of emails from Matt Hale and McCoy	0.20
08/05/2019	SAS	Dictated email regarding fee application issues	0.10
08/05/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Pancrudo regarding patient payable; exchange of emails with McCoy; review of follow-up email from Pancrudo; and dictated email regarding acceptance of offer	0.30
08/05/2019	CAP	Work on asset purchase transaction, including emails during the day, review NextGen contracts regarding assignability, and review Chapter 727 of the Florida Statutes	2.50
08/05/2019	EJP	Work on Bonati sale	2.00
08/05/2019	SM	Emails, review and forwarding of CSI invoice for payment	0.20
08/05/2019	LMF	Review emails regarding status of sale; draft email; review NextGen contracts; draft email to C. Postler	1.20
08/06/2019	HER	Internal communications regarding cash collateral issues	0.20
08/06/2019	HER	Review of email from Ken Mather with attached Bailey Request for Production to Bank Lenders	0.20
08/06/2019	HER	Conferences with Susan McKee regarding fee application issues; work on same	1.00
08/06/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Warren, Alpert, and Edward Peterson regarding MedPro's request to settle personal injury claim; dictated email to Harley Riedel, Edward Peterson, and Kapila regarding same	0.50
08/06/2019	SAS	Review of email from Pancrudo regarding settling patient account; dictated email to Pancrudo and McCoy; review of email from McCoy; and dictated email to Pancrudo regarding consent to settle	0.40
08/06/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Myers regarding need to obtain documents in litigation; review of email from Myers enclosing subpoena	0.20
08/06/2019	SAS	Review of email regarding filing of recent medial malpractice lawsuit; review of document request; conference with Susan McKee; and review of follow-up email from Susan McKee	0.30
08/06/2019	CAP	Work on asset purchase transaction with Bonati entity, including preparation for call this afternoon with Samuel Heller, attendance on conference call with Samuel Heller, Edward Peterson, and Laura Ferris, follow-up emails, review Chapter 727 issues for sale motion and notice, follow-up telephone call with Samuel Heller, and review evening email from Samuel Heller with revised draft of asset purchase agreement containing his comments and draft of new Highwoods lease	2.50
08/06/2019	EJP	Work on Bonati sale, including participated in conference calls and follow-up conferences	2.00
08/06/2019	SM	Conferences with Harley Riedel, review May, June and July SRBP invoices, work on fee application	3.30
08/06/2019	LMF	Review emails	0.60
08/06/2019	LMF	Prepare for conference call; telephone conference with C. Postler, E. Peterson and Sam Heller; subsequent conference internally	1.50
08/06/2019	HER	Review of and reply to email from Paul Battista regarding [REDACTED]; follow-up	0.30
08/06/2019	HER	Review of and reply to emails from Edward Peterson regarding Jennifer Altman engagement issues; communications with Soneet Kapila regarding same	0.40
08/06/2019	HER	Review and analysis of email from Joe Varner and attached exhibits regarding potential claim [REDACTED]; email to client and litigation counsel regarding same.	0.50
08/06/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
08/07/2019	MBH	Receive and review email regarding Pennsylvania unemployment contribution claim; review priority rules; draft and send reply email to Edward Peterson	0.70
08/07/2019	MBH	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding insurance claimants; attempt call to Cameron Kennedy; and email regarding same	0.30
08/07/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding asset sales, document request from Ken Mather, and premium refunds; communications with Toby Gerber regarding same.	0.40
08/07/2019	HER	Review numerous emails	0.00
08/07/2019	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding status of orders on motion to compel and failure to receive consent from one attorney	0.20
08/07/2019	CAP	Work on asset purchase transaction with Bonati entity, including continued review of revised draft of asset purchase agreement emailed last night by Samuel Heller, mark-up new draft of	2.00

		asset purchase agreement, review emails from Soneet Kapila, and follow-up	
08/07/2019	SM	Review claims, update claims spreadsheet and forwarding of claims to Rachel Weiss	0.50
08/07/2019	LMF	Review and draft emails to K. Whiteside	0.30
08/07/2019	LMF	Draft email to C. Postler and E. Peterson	0.30
08/07/2019	LMF	Review emails; review comments to asset purchase agreement	1.60
08/07/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate; draft notice of assignment and forwarding to Scott Stichter	0.70
08/08/2019	MBH	Research on insurance issues; conference with Edward Peterson regarding insurance issues; review research regarding same	1.40
08/08/2019	MBH	Call with Cameron Kennedy regarding self-insurance issues	0.30
08/08/2019	HER	Brief conference call with Toby Gerber and Edward J. Peterson; follow-up with Soneet Kapila; and telephone conference with Sam Heller	0.80
08/08/2019	HER	Work on cash collateral/fee allocation issues.	0.50
08/08/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Fenstermacher, Edward Peterson and Kapila regarding MedPro refund; conference with Edward Peterson	0.40
08/08/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Mather and Gerber regarding bank lien analyses	0.20
08/08/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Fenstermacher regarding MedPro recoupment argument; review of email from Fenstermacher; and telephone conference with Fenstermacher	0.70
08/08/2019	CAP	Work on asset purchase transaction, including emails and internal conferences.	1.30
08/08/2019	EJP	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding MedPro issues	0.20
08/08/2019	EJP	Work on Bonati sale and insurance issues	1.00
08/08/2019	SM	Review monthly invoice and email regarding access reports	0.30
08/08/2019	LMF	Review emails and voicemail; conference with E. Peterson and C. Postler	0.70
08/08/2019	HER	Review of emails regarding claims against Jill St. Louis; review of emails regarding tolling agreement; participation in conference call with litigation co-counsel and client (1:00 to 1:45 p.m.)	1.10
08/08/2019	SHS	Review documents in advance of call with litigation team, telephone call with Andrea Holder regarding litigation issues and E-hounds platform, and participate in conference call with litigation team	2.40
08/08/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	3.50
08/08/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
08/08/2019	SM	Emails regarding tolling agreements	0.30
08/09/2019	MBH	Review of and drafting of insurance memorandum	1.00
08/09/2019	SAS	Continued review of documents and dictated further revisions to memo discussing insurance issues	2.30
08/09/2019	SAS	Review of claims tracker; begin claims analysis; and conferences with Susan McKee	1.60
08/09/2019	SAS	Exchange of emails with McCoy regarding claims analysis; conference with Edward Peterson; telephone conference with McCoy and Edward Peterson; and review of follow-up emails	0.50
08/09/2019	CAP	Follow up on Bonati sale issues	0.60
08/09/2019	EJP	Work on Scottsdale lien issues	1.70
08/09/2019	SM	Emails and conferences with Scott Stichter and Edward Peterson regarding claims, prepare various spreadsheets of claimants	2.80
08/09/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence and participation in telephone conferences regarding litigation issues.	1.00
08/09/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	4.00
08/11/2019	CAP	Review of buyer's revisions to my draft of asset purchase agreement and prepare detailed responsive email to Samuel Heller (email forwarded to Edward Peterson for handling)	2.00
08/12/2019	MBH	Continued research of law on [REDACTED]	1.70
08/12/2019	MBH	Drafting of letters to judge regarding proposed orders on self-insurance issues; review and finalize proposed orders; receive and respond to emails regarding proposed orders	1.40
08/12/2019	MBH	Work on memorandum regarding insurance issues	2.00
08/12/2019	HER	Review and reply to email from Edward Peterson regarding engagement letter for clawback claims	0.00

08/12/2019	HER	Review and reply to email from Edward Peterson regarding draft email to Altman regarding H&K contingency fee percentages	0.00
08/12/2019	HER	Review and reply to email from Edward Peterson regarding need to call Ken Mather before sending the engagement letter for clawback claims	0.00
08/12/2019	HER	Review and reply to email from Edward Peterson regarding draft email to Jennifer Altman regarding Holland & Knight contingency fee percentages for Soneet Kapila	0.00
08/12/2019	SAS	Review of email from McCoy enclosing summary of claims; dictated revisions to footnote discussing review methodology; dictated email to McCoy enclosing revised footnote; and review of follow-up emails	0.40
08/12/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Matt Hale and Schutz regarding status of submitting orders on motion to compel; review of email regarding submission of order	0.20
08/12/2019	SAS	Continued work on claims analysis; review of revised claims tracker; and dictated revisions to charts	1.10
08/12/2019	EJP	Work on budget and sale issues	1.00
08/12/2019	SM	Emails, review updated claims tracker, forwarding to Scott Stichter	0.50
08/12/2019	MJH	Conference with E. Peterson and review summons and waiver of service for compliance	0.40
08/12/2019	HER	Work on engagement letter for FT claims and electronic correspondence regarding same; electronic correspondence regarding pursuit of targets.	0.50
08/12/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
08/12/2019	EJP	Conference with Matt Hale regarding litigation issues	0.20
08/13/2019	MBH	Conference with Susan McKee regarding billing review; review billings for allocation; conference with Scott Stichter regarding insurance issues	0.70
08/13/2019	MBH	Research of law on [REDACTED]	1.10
08/13/2019	HER	Review email from Paul Battista regarding call with Jordi Guso regarding FT claims on EFO, Grammen, MM Perry and Perry (separate from D&O Claims)	0.00
08/13/2019	HER	Review email from Soneet Kapila regarding update on discussion with Jordi Guso	0.00
08/13/2019	HER	Review email from Edward Peterson attaching draft of memo on insurance issues	0.00
08/13/2019	HER	Email to Edward Peterson with proposed email to Kapila, Battista, Rocke and Sbar regarding requests for files from outside counsel	0.00
08/13/2019	HER	Email Edward Peterson with proposed email to Soneet Kapila, Doug Battista, Bob Rocke and Jon Sbar regarding demanding law firms to send us their files in order to track communications with outside counsel	0.00
08/13/2019	HER	Review and reply to emails; set up call with Jennifer Altman; participated in call with Altman, Hugh Ray, Ken Mather, and Edward Peterson	0.00
08/13/2019	HER	Review and reply to emails; set up call with Jennifer Altman; participation in 1:00 call with Jennifer Altman, Hugh M. Ray, III, Ken Mather, and Edward Peterson	0.00
08/13/2019	HER	Review email from Soneet Kapila with update on his discussion with Jordi Guso	0.00
08/13/2019	HER	Review email from Paul Battista regarding call with Jordi Guso about the possibility of settling the fraudulent transfer claims on EFO, Grammen, MM Perry and Perry (separate from the D&O claims)	0.00
08/13/2019	HER	Review email from Edward Peterson enclosing draft of a memo discussing various insurance issues	0.00
08/13/2019	SAS	Continued work on insurance memo, including conferences with Matt Hale; review of additional case law; dictated revisions; and dictated email to Fenstermacher enclosing draft and discussing open issues	1.40
08/13/2019	SAS	Review of email from Attorney General's office enclosing Mercers' administrative complaint; dictated email to Mercer	0.30
08/13/2019	CAP	Review emails	0.20
08/13/2019	DRF	Review invoices regarding billing issues	0.20
08/13/2019	EJP	Work on bank collateral issues	1.20
08/13/2019	SM	Draft order approving Cigna settlement and forwarding to Edward Peterson; conferences with Denise Clark regarding fee calculations, preparation of summary and circulate	0.90
08/13/2019	BFA	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding monitoring Bailey collection efforts	0.30
08/13/2019	HER	Work on litigation issues, including multiple items of electronic correspondence, internal conferences, and preparation for and participation in telephone conference with Jennifer	2.60

		Altman, Hugh Ray, Ken Mather, and Edward Peterson; follow-up.	
08/13/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	3.50
08/14/2019	MBH	Receive and review email memorandum from Rick Fenstermacher regarding insurance claims and issues; review memo regarding same	0.20
08/14/2019	HER	Work on cash collateral and fee application allocation issues .	0.60
08/14/2019	SAS	Review of DeLagoLandon complaint; dictated email to Susan McKee regarding preparation of assignment notice; and review of email from Susan McKee	0.20
08/14/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher enclosing revisions to insurance memo; and dictated email to Kapila and McCoy enclosing memo	1.40
08/14/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Mercer regarding claim against Laser Spine	0.10
08/14/2019	EJP	Calls with bank counsel and work on Scottsdale settlement	1.00
08/14/2019	BFA	Review court docket for Bailey collection matter and instructions to Joanne Ratliff regarding same	0.80
08/14/2019	HER	Multiple items of electronic correspondence regarding litigation issues.	0.50
08/14/2019	SAS	Review of assignment notice to be sent to claimant	0.20
08/14/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson, McCoy, and Kapila regarding California litigation; dictated response to Edward Peterson	0.20
08/14/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding filed lawsuits; conference with Susan McKee regarding notice of filing and response letter; and finalized documents	0.40
08/14/2019	SHS	Receipt and review of emails related to Pillsbury litigation and communication with Melissa Davis regarding same	0.30
08/14/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
08/14/2019	SM	Draft assignment notices for pending litigation, draft letter regarding complaint filed and forwarding to Scott Stichter, emails, finalize and file assignment notices, finalize and mail notice letter	1.10
08/15/2019	HER	Review Rick Fenstermacher's email with attached current loss runs	0.00
08/15/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence (Toby Gerber, Bruce Shilcutt, Soneet Kapila, Rick Fenstermacher, and Edward Peterson).	0.40
08/15/2019	HER	Review email from Toby Gerber regarding the Bailey parties	0.00
08/15/2019	HER	Review Rick Fenstermacher's email with attached current loss runs	0.00
08/15/2019	CAP	Emails with Edward Peterson regarding status of Bonati asset purchase transaction; review email from Edward Peterson to Samuel Heller	0.20
08/15/2019	HER	Review of emails.	0.10
08/15/2019	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Melissa Davis, and draft email to Edward Peterson in response	0.30
08/15/2019	SHS	Conference call with Melissa Davis and Suruchi Banez regarding Jennifer Altman's document request	0.70
08/16/2019	HER	Work on cash collateral and allocation of professional fees; communications with client and bank counsel regarding issues; review of comment by Texas Capital Bank filed in the Assignment Cases.	1.30
08/16/2019	HER	Review and reply to emails regarding allocation of professional fees	0.00
08/16/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Ken Mather	0.00
08/16/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Susan McKee regarding fee issues; dictated response	0.10
08/16/2019	SM	Emails regarding allocation of fees, review April and July entries	0.30
08/16/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Ken Mather; electronic correspondence with litigation counsel.	0.50
08/17/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence.	0.10
08/19/2019	HER	Preparation for and participation in call with bank counsel and client; follow-up	1.10
08/19/2019	HER	Review of email from Adam Alpert regarding insurance issues.	0.10
08/19/2019	HER	Emails to Edward Peterson regarding bank funding litigation investigation expenses and review of email from Edward Peterson	0.00
08/19/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding MedPro issues	0.20
08/19/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro issues; further conference with Edward	0.30

		Peterson	
08/19/2019	EJP	Work on sale matters	3.00
08/19/2019	EJP	Conference with Scott Stichter regarding MedPro issues	0.20
08/19/2019	BFA	Review of court filings regarding collection efforts of Bailey and Laserscopic against James St. Louis and EFO; prepare summary of and chart regarding same	5.80
08/19/2019	MBH	Receive and review email from Edward Peterson and Dan Fogarty regarding [REDACTED]; review memorandum regarding same; draft and send email to Mr. Peterson summarizing [REDACTED] issues	0.30
08/19/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Burt Wiand regarding James St. Louis; emails with Edward Peterson regarding same	0.50
08/19/2019	SHS	Brief office conference with Edward Peterson regarding research issues related to [REDACTED]	2.00
08/19/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
08/19/2019	SM	Emails, download and review CT Service of Process, circulate same	0.20
08/20/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding insurance, IT assets; review of recent entries on court docket.	0.30
08/20/2019	HER	Review email from Jimmy Parrish regarding compensation for Chris Knopik for preparation time for the meeting on Pillsbury and reply thereto to Edward Peterson	0.00
08/20/2019	HER	Review email from Jimmy Parrish regarding compensation for Chris Knopik for prep time for the meeting on Pillsbury and reply thereto to Edward Peterson	0.00
08/20/2019	SAS	Finalized correspondence to Court submitting Cigna Health compromise order	0.20
08/20/2019	SM	Review Raintree settlement agreement, draft motion to approve and forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.50
08/20/2019	HER	Review of and reply to email from Jimmy Parrish regarding compensation for Chris Knopik for prep time for the meeting on Pillsbury.	0.20
08/20/2019	HER	Review of files; email to Burt Wiand attaching complaint filed against Dr. St. Louis.	0.30
08/20/2019	HER	Email to Burt Wiand attaching complaint filed by Soneet Kapila's litigation counsel against Dr. St. Louis	0.00
08/20/2019	HER	Email to Burt Wiand attaching complaint filed by Soneet Kapila's litigation counsel against Dr. St. Louis	0.00
08/20/2019	SHS	Receipt and review of email from Jimmy Parrish, review file, and draft email to Edward Peterson regarding Chris Knopik emails	0.80
08/20/2019	SM	Receipt and download of CT Service of Process and circulate	0.30
08/21/2019	HER	Review of and follow-up on email from Bruce Shilcutt regarding lender issues; review of electronic correspondence regarding insurance.	0.30
08/21/2019	HER	Review email from Bruce Shilcutt regarding recent correspondence to the lenders	0.00
08/21/2019	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson forwarding Manns' regarding bank group's approval of waiver of accounts receivable in connection with MedPro settlement	0.10
08/21/2019	EJP	Work on landlord issues	1.00
08/21/2019	BFA	Continue working on summary of Bailey collection efforts and reviewing pleadings for same	1.30
08/21/2019	MBH	Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding memorandum for cause of action analysis	1.00
08/21/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation issues.	0.10
08/21/2019	DRF	Conference with E. Peterson re: Bank claims; conference with M. Hale and work on Bank claims memo	2.80
08/21/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.50
08/21/2019	SM	Receipt, review and download CT Service of Process, circulate same	0.20
08/22/2019	MBH	Review memorandum on insurance issues prior to call with Soneet Kapila and team; call regarding insurance recoveries	1.20
08/22/2019	MBH	Call with Edward Peterson and Ryan Manns regarding landlord and collateral issues; conference with Mr. Peterson regarding same	0.40
08/22/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence regarding financial information; follow-up response; review of emails regarding from potential purchaser of assets.	0.40
08/22/2019	HER	Review email from Kevin McCoy regarding Chris Pizzo asking for balance sheets for each individual entity and reply thereto	0.00

08/22/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher enclosing updated claims information for each policy period; dictated revisions to MedPro memo; and dictated email enclosing revised memo	0.60
08/22/2019	SAS	Preparation for insurance call; participated in call with Edward Peterson, Matt Hale, McCoy, Fenstermacher, and Kapila (portion); and dictated follow-up email to parties	0.90
08/22/2019	DRF	Work on [REDACTED] memo	6.00
08/22/2019	EJP	Work on Scottsdale lien issues	1.00
08/22/2019	BFA	Continue working on chart summarizing and detailing pleadings pulled and reviewed in Bailey collection matter	2.10
08/22/2019	MBH	Work on memorandum regarding causes of action	0.80
08/22/2019	SHS	Review E-hounds materials and forward same to Edward Peterson, and attend office conference with Bob Roche, Chris Knopik and Edward Peterson	5.20
08/22/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	4.00
08/22/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
08/23/2019	HER	Review email from Bruce Shilcutt with today's call	0.00
08/23/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence regarding bank issues and non-litigation items.	0.30
08/23/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Esquivel and McCoy regarding Albanese balance owed to LSI	0.20
08/23/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher regarding duty to cooperate under policies; dictated draft of response to Alpert's emails; dictated email to Edward Peterson and Matt Hale enclosing draft; exchange of emails with Edward Peterson; dictated email to Kapila, McCoy, and Fenstermacher enclosing drafts; exchange of emails with parties regarding finalizing email; and review of emails from Edward Peterson, Matt Hale and Alpert regarding MedPro issues	1.10
08/23/2019	SAS	Exchange of emails with Storfer regarding DeLage Landen pre-assignment lawsuit; telephone conference with Storfer	0.20
08/23/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Edward Peterson and Alpert regarding MedPro issues; dictated follow-up email to Kapila	0.40
08/23/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Jennifer regarding request for employee information; conference with Susan McKee; and dictated email to McCoy	0.20
08/23/2019	EJP	Preparation for and participate in bank call; work on landlord lien issues	4.00
08/23/2019	MBH	Research of law on legal theories and causes of action; drafting of insert for memorandum regarding causes of action; review and finalize memorandum; conferences with Dan Fogarty regarding same	4.40
08/23/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence regarding litigation issues.	0.20
08/23/2019	DRF	Continued work to finalize [REDACTED] memo; conferences with M. Hale regarding same; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	1.00
08/23/2019	SHS	Receipt and review of multiple emails regarding litigation matters	0.20
08/24/2019	HER	Review numerous emails regarding LSI bank claims memo	0.00
08/24/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila summarizing insurance issues	0.50
08/24/2019	SAS	Review of Class Representative's notice of mailing class notice	0.10
08/24/2019	HER	Receipt and review of numerous emails regarding possible causes of action.	0.50
08/25/2019	DRF	Review, revise draft executive summary to [REDACTED] memo	0.50
08/25/2019	EJP	Work on litigation issues	1.00
08/26/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding Arizona landlord settlement issues and hearing	0.20
08/26/2019	HER	Analysis of issues and internal communications, began work on open issues	0.40
08/26/2019	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding Stram's claim; dictated email to Edward Peterson; and review of email from Susan McKee	0.20
08/26/2019	SAS	Review of email from Attorney General's office forwarding administrative complaint from Moreland; dictated response	0.30
08/26/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert enclosing MedPro's counter-offer; review of emails from Kapila and Fenstermacher; conference with Edward Peterson; and dictated email to Kapila	0.40
08/26/2019	SAS	Review of email from Susan McKee regarding MedPro's summary judgment; dictated response	0.20
08/26/2019	CAP	Exchange emails with Edward Peterson regarding termination of Bonati sale transaction	0.20

08/26/2019	DRF	Conference with E. Peterson regarding memo summary; participate in call with litigation counsel	0.90
08/26/2019	EJP	Work on issue of health records and preparation for hearing; work on sale motions	3.50
08/26/2019	SM	Work on Scottsdale and Cincinnati pleadings	0.50
08/26/2019	MBH	Call regarding litigation issues and potential causes of action	0.70
08/26/2019	HER	Review of memo on causes of action; telephone contact with Dan Fogarty regarding same; participation in conference call with client and litigation counsel	1.60
08/26/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson, Dan Fogarty, and Kapila regarding litigation issues	0.20
08/26/2019	SHS	Prepare for litigation conference call and participate in call with litigation team regarding Pillsbury	1.20
08/26/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
08/26/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate	0.20
08/27/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding tomorrow's hearing	0.20
08/27/2019	HER	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding status; review of email from Sam Heller regarding proposed purchase; review of emails regarding insurance	0.50
08/27/2019	HER	Review and reply to emails from Edward Peterson regarding LSI monitoring collections regarding Bailey	0.00
08/27/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding MedPro issues; conference with Edward Peterson and Kapila regarding response to MedPro's counter	0.20
08/27/2019	CAP	Review draft email from Edward Peterson to Samuel Heller on termination of sale transaction and email comments to Edward Peterson; review final email sent to Samuel Heller; review reply email from Samuel Heller; email to Edward Peterson	0.50
08/27/2019	DRF	Conference with M. Hale	0.30
08/27/2019	EJP	Work on emails regarding Bonati sale and calls with landlord; preparation for hearing	3.50
08/27/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence regarding Pillsbury	0.20
08/27/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson, Dan Fogarty, and Kapila regarding litigation issues	0.20
08/27/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
08/28/2019	MBH	Drafting of insert for Radha Bachman for letter to health care agencies	0.40
08/28/2019	HER	Review of emails from Toby Gerber, Kevin McCoy, and Soneet Kapila regarding asset sales and payment to CIGNA; review of recent pleadings and orders.	0.50
08/28/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher regarding MedPro issues; dictated draft of email to bank's counsel discussing MedPro settlement offer; dictated email to Edward Peterson enclosing draft email; review of email from Edward Peterson; and finalized email to Mann	0.60
08/28/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding Stram's claims against LSI; dictated email to Edward Peterson and McCoy; and dictated letter to Stram	0.30
08/28/2019	CAP	Review and exchange emails on Bonati	0.30
08/28/2019	BFA	Update Bailey collections chart after review of newly filed pleadings	1.50
08/28/2019	MBH	Conference with Susan Sharp regarding organizational structure and asset ownership for research issue; locate and send documents to Susan Sharp	0.30
08/28/2019	SHS	Continue researching [REDACTED] issue and work on memo regarding same	5.50
08/28/2019	SHS	Telephone call with Melissa Davis related to [REDACTED] issues	0.40
08/29/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Burt Wiand; email to Soneet Kapila regarding same and review reply requesting meeting to discuss	0.00
08/29/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with claimant regarding denial on insurance benefits by Cigna; dictated email to McCoy and Kapila regarding Cigna issues	0.20
08/29/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
08/29/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Burt Wiand regarding claims against Dr. St. Louis; analysis of collectability of claims; emails with Soneet Kapila regarding same; review of emails regarding Pillsbury claim.	1.50
08/29/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
08/30/2019	HER	Receipt and review of electronic correspondence from Toby Gerber and follow-up.	0.30
08/30/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert enclosing cancellation notice; dictated email to Kapila and Fenstermacher enclosing notice; and review of email from Fenstermacher	0.20

08/30/2019	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy and Kapila regarding Cigna insurance policy; telephone conference with claimant regarding lapse in coverage; and dictated email to claimant enclosing proof of claim form	0.30
08/30/2019	SAS	Review of email enclosing draft of Albanese settlement agreement; brief review of agreement; and dictated email to Edward Peterson and Kapila regarding issues with agreement	0.40
08/30/2019	EJP	Work on sale matters	2.00
08/30/2019	BFA	Review newly filed pleadings and update Bailey chart and summary	0.80
08/30/2019	HER	Multiple communications with Burt Wiand regarding Dr. St. Louis; conference call and emails with Soneet Kapila and Edward Peterson regarding same	1.20
08/30/2019	HER	Review and analysis of memo/chart regarding Bailey collection efforts.	0.50
08/30/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.80
08/31/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Susan McKee regarding status of responding to subpoena; review of email from Susan McKee	0.10

Total Professional Services Rendered \$96,018.50

For Disbursements Incurred:

08/02/2019	Photocopies of Sale Motion	\$16.80
08/02/2019	Postage charges for sale motion	\$7.55
08/13/2019	Photocopies of orders	\$4.50
08/13/2019	Postage for hearing order	\$5.15
08/13/2019	Postage for response letter	\$0.50
08/14/2019	Postage for spoliation letter	\$88.40
08/26/2019	Postage for response letter	\$0.50
08/28/2019	Photocopies of Cigna order	\$1.80
08/28/2019	Postage for Cigna order	\$5.65
08/30/2019	Photocopies of Raintree Settlement Motion	\$18.75
08/30/2019	Postage for Settlement Agreement	\$6.50

Total Expenses Incurred \$156.10

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Ferrell-Anton, Becky	12.60	\$4,725.00
Postler, Charles A.	21.40	\$10,165.00
Fogarty, Dan R.	12.20	\$4,575.00
Peterson, Edward J.	64.80	\$27,540.00
Riedel, Harley E.	30.30	\$14,998.50
Ferris, Laura M	15.80	\$3,160.00
Hale, Matt B.	25.20	\$6,300.00
Hooi, Michael J.	0.40	\$120.00
Stichter, Scott A.	24.50	\$10,535.00
Sharp, Susan	29.60	\$11,100.00
McKee, Susan	14.00	\$2,800.00
Total For Professional Services Rendered	250.80 Hours	\$96,018.50
Adjusted Services Total		\$96,018.50

Professional Services	\$96,018.50
Disbursements	\$156.10
Total New Charges This Invoice	\$96,174.60
Previous Balance	\$542,403.82
Less Payments Received	(\$0.00)
Outstanding Balance	\$542,403.82
New Charges This Invoice	\$96,174.60
Total Due	\$638,578.42

Bill # 43718

Date Last Payment July/03/2019

Last Payment Amount \$5,300.82

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

SRBP STICHTER, RIEDEL, BLAIN & POSTLER, P.A.
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

DON M. STICHTER
1929-2019
RICHARD C. PROSSER
1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL DUBOSE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
SCOTT A. STICHTER

G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER
OF COUNSEL

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

December 10, 2019

Soneet Kapila
Kapila-Laser Spine
Kapila & Company
1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316
USA

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Kapila-Laser Spine
Client: 13857
For Professional Services Rendered:

09/01/2019	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding payment to Cigna under settlement order	0.20
09/02/2019	SAS	Dictated revisions to MedPro settlement agreement; dictated email to Edward Peterson enclosing revisions	0.60
09/03/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding sales, Cigna.	0.30
09/03/2019	SAS	Work on MedPro settlement issues, including conferences with Edward Peterson regarding issues with settlement agreement; review of email from Alpert enclosing draft of motion to approve compromise as to refunds; dictated revisions to compromise motion; dictated email to Edward Peterson enclosing revisions; review of email from Morris regarding bank's consent; dictated email to Edward Peterson regarding draft email to Alpert; review of email from Fenstermacher regarding issues with draft; and dictated response	1.10
09/03/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson enclosing revisions to MedPro settlement agreement and compromise motion; dictated response; review of emails from McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding segregating refunds; and dictated response	0.60
09/03/2019	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy, Kapila, Edward Peterson, Manns, and Alpert regarding MedPro issues; dictated email to Kapila	0.60
09/03/2019	CAP	Attorney conference (C.A. Postler) with E.J. Peterson re: sale status update and strategy.	0.20
09/03/2019	EJP	Work on Centurion sale and settlement of insurance refund	2.50
09/03/2019	EJP	Work on issues regarding health records	0.50
09/03/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT invoices for statutory representation and circulate; work on SRBP claims chart	0.80

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

09/03/2019	HER	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding St. Louis and attendance at 3:00 p.m. hearing before Judge Stephens	0.30
09/03/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	3.50
09/03/2019	SM	Draft notice of assignment for litigation in Pennsylvania and forwarding to Scott Stichter	0.20
09/04/2019	HER	Review of email from Ryan Manns and initial review and analysis of draft stipulation regarding interim cash collateral; internal emails regarding same.	0.70
09/04/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Kapila, Edward Peterson, Fenstermacher, and McCoy regarding refund issues; review of email from Edward Peterson regarding outcome of call with Manns	0.40
09/04/2019	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing draft email to bank regarding lien on refunds; review of emails from McCoy, Fenstermacher, and Kapila; and dictated response	0.30
09/04/2019	EJP	Work on issues related to insurance refund	1.50
09/04/2019	EJP	Work on sale matters	1.50
09/04/2019	SM	Review late filed claim, update claims spreadsheet and forwarding to Rachel Weiss	0.30
09/04/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
09/05/2019	HER	Communications with client and bank group counsel regarding non-litigation issues.	0.40
09/05/2019	SAS	Review of email from Manns regarding bank's approval of MedPro compromise motion	0.10
09/05/2019	EJP	Work on issue of insurance refund.	0.50
09/05/2019	SM	Conference with Edward Peterson, calculate fee allocation for March and April, forwarding to Edward Peterson	0.30
09/05/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding St. Louis and other litigation issues.	0.50
09/05/2019	EJP	Work on litigation issues	3.00
09/06/2019	HER	Review and analysis of cash collateral budget; communications with Edward Peterson regarding same; review of emails with bank counsel regarding discovery requests.	1.00
09/06/2019	EJP	Work on lien stipulation and calls with Ryan Manns	1.00
09/06/2019	EJP	Work on sale issues	0.50
09/06/2019	HER	Internal communications and analysis regarding litigation issues; review of emails from Paul Battista.	0.40
09/06/2019	SAS	Review of Starr Indemnity letter requesting documents; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	0.30
09/06/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
09/06/2019	SM	Finalize assignment notice for pending litigation and mail; receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate	0.30
09/08/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding workers' compensation audit and refund; dictated response	0.20
09/09/2019	HER	Review of recent pleadings; participation in 4:00 p.m. conference call adequate protection	0.80
09/09/2019	SAS	Review of filed MedPro compromise motion	0.10
09/09/2019	EJP	Work on Scottsdale sale	0.30
09/09/2019	EJP	Work on lien stipulation	1.50
09/09/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
09/09/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
09/10/2019	HER	Work on cash collateral and other non-litigation matters, including review of report of receipt and disbursements and initial review of letter from Ken Mather regarding bank claims	1.10
09/10/2019	EJP	Work on landlord issues and filing of receipts and disbursements	1.50
09/10/2019	SM	Receipt and review of settlement letter regarding receivable and circulate same	0.20
09/11/2019	HER	Further review and analysis of letter from Ken Mather; work on cash collateral issues, including review of summary of arguments made by Bailey Group; internal communications; electronic correspondence regarding the foregoing and other non-litigation matters	1.60
09/11/2019	SAS	Review of email from California counsel regarding actions needed to maintain patent; dictated email to Edward Peterson and Kapila; and review of follow-up emails	0.20
09/11/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding California trademark litigation and patent issues; telephone conference with Edward Peterson, McCoy, Gillis, and Kapila regarding same and litigation and patent marketing options	0.40
09/11/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding compromise of accounts receivable	0.20
09/11/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Fenstermacher, Kapila, and Edward Peterson regarding broker refunds	0.20

09/11/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding [REDACTED] issues and [REDACTED] concerns	0.20
09/11/2019	EJP	Emails with landlords and work on budget	0.70
09/11/2019	SM	Receipt of amended claim, update spreadsheet and forwarding of claim to Rachel Weiss	0.20
09/11/2019	BFA	Continue reviewing transcript of hearing and prepare summary for Edward Peterson and HER of Mathers' arguments on use of cash collateral	2.90
09/11/2019	HER	Review of status report from Paul Battista regarding D & O and fraudulent transfer litigation or claims; follow-up electronic correspondence	0.50
09/11/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
09/12/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding state court litigation	0.10
09/12/2019	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding petition to adjudicate liens; review of email from Edward Peterson; dictated email to Edward Peterson; dictated email to McCoy regarding information needed; and conference with Dan Fogarty	0.40
09/12/2019	DRF	Emails and follow-up re: illinois lien issue	0.20
09/12/2019	EJP	Calls with landlord	1.00
09/12/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
09/13/2019	SAS	Review of email from Locke regarding patent issues; dictated response	0.10
09/13/2019	SAS	Review of order granting Weiss' counsel withdrawal	0.10
09/13/2019	SAS	Exchange of emails with Susan McKee regarding subpoenas for employment records	0.20
09/13/2019	BFA	Review pleadings re Bailey collection efforts and update chart	2.40
09/13/2019	SM	Emails regarding employment records subpoena	0.20
09/16/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding letter from Bailey plaintiffs and response	0.20
09/16/2019	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding medical lien issues; dictated response; review of emails from Dan Fogarty and McCoy; telephone conference with Dan Fogarty and McCoy; and review of follow-up emails	0.60
09/16/2019	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy regarding patents; dictated response	0.20
09/16/2019	DRF	Receive and respond to email from K. McCoy re: Illinois A/R issue; research re same	1.40
09/16/2019	EJP	Work on sales efforts	0.50
09/16/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
09/16/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
09/17/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Locke regarding patent issues; dictated email to McCoy and Kapila; and review of email from Kapila	0.40
09/17/2019	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson, Walling, and Kapila regarding outstanding invoice in Schafer litigation	0.20
09/17/2019	SAS	Review of orders entered by District Court WARN Act litigation	0.20
09/17/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding [REDACTED]	0.20
09/17/2019	SAS	Review of email from Longbrake regarding recently filed lawsuit	0.20
09/17/2019	DRF	Receive and review emails re: Illinois A/R issues; telephone call with K. McCoy; telephone call with S. Kernan, opposing counsel; email to K. McCoy	1.00
09/17/2019	EJP	Work on sale issues	0.50
09/17/2019	BFA	Continue reviewing pleadings for Bailey collection efforts and summarizing same	2.70
09/17/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
09/17/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
09/18/2019	MBH	Work on response to Bailey group correspondence	1.80
09/18/2019	HER	Review of email from Kevin McCoy and review of attached agenda for September 19 lender call; review of ShareFile notifications; internal communications and analysis regarding Mather letter	1.20
09/18/2019	SAS	Review of further emails regarding Linda Perko medical lien settlement issues; review of email from opposing counsel rejecting settlement offer; conference with Dan Fogarty regarding litigation options; and review of emails from Dan Fogarty and Kapila	0.90
09/18/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding Linda Perko medical lien issues	0.30
09/18/2019	SAS	Review of email regarding covered lawyers policy; dictated email to Dan Fogarty and Matt	0.20

		Hale; and review of email from Matt Hale	
09/18/2019	DRF	Work on Illinois medical lien issues	2.20
09/18/2019	EJP	Calls with Ryan Manns	0.50
09/18/2019	BFA	Continue working on updating Bailey chart	1.60
09/18/2019	HER	Emails with litigation counsel regarding pending actions and strategy	0.20
09/18/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
09/18/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, circulate same	0.20
09/19/2019	MBH	Review auction procedures order; drafting of auction notice for Tampa assets	0.50
09/19/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding Braho medical lawsuit and production of records	0.30
09/19/2019	EJP	Work on auction process and calls	3.00
09/19/2019	MBH	Review emails and documents regarding litigation status report	0.20
09/19/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation.	0.20
09/20/2019	MBH	Work throughout the day on drafting response to letter from K. Mather; review of pertinent documents; review of memoranda	4.80
09/20/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding litigation matters, including of letter sent to counsel for Starr Insurance.	0.40
09/20/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding Med-Pro's request to enter into settlement discussions; dictated response; review of email from Alpert; conference with Edward Peterson and review of email from Edward Peterson to Alpert	0.30
09/20/2019	EJP	Work on auction	3.00
09/20/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
09/20/2019	SM	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate	0.20
09/23/2019	MBH	Review and revise response to K. Mather letter	0.70
09/23/2019	MBH	Receive and review order on cash collateral	0.30
09/23/2019	HER	Review of and began editing of draft letter in response to Ken Mather letter of September 10, 2019 letter; review and analysis of Judge Stephens' order denying the cash collateral motion; internal communications and electronic correspondence regarding same.	2.20
09/23/2019	SAS	Review of email from Matt Hale regarding covered lawyers policy; dictated email to Fenstermacher; and review of email from Fenstermacher	0.20
09/23/2019	SAS	Review of email from Dan Fogarty regarding petition to adjudicate medical liens	0.10
09/23/2019	CAP	Review emails on possible sale.	0.20
09/23/2019	EJP	Emails with Soneet and Bank about the auction; work on notice of auction	1.20
09/23/2019	BFA	Work on updating Bailey chart re collection efforts	2.20
09/23/2019	MBH	Review covered attorneys' policy regarding potential claims against insurance; review documents regarding pre-assignment insurance structure; review further documents regarding potential claims	3.60
09/23/2019	HER	Work on litigation matters, including review of proposed agenda for lunch meeting, preparation for and attendance at meeting with litigation counsel, and follow-up.	2.80
09/23/2019	SAS	Review of RJPT's motion to dismiss; review of email from Edward Peterson enclosing research issues	0.40
09/23/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	4.00
09/23/2019	SM	Receipt of CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
09/24/2019	MJH	Review order on cash collateral and advise on response	0.60
09/24/2019	MBH	Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding claims and response letter	0.20
09/24/2019	MBH	Internal conference regarding research issues and action items	0.40
09/24/2019	HER	Further review of cash collateral order; multiple emails and participation in conference call with Edward J. Peterson, Ryan Manns, and Toby Gerber.	1.40
09/24/2019	SAS	Participated in meeting with counsel regarding pending matters	0.40
09/24/2019	CAP	Telephone conference (C.A. Postler) with E.J. Peterson re: potential buyer; review follow-up emails between E.J. Peterson and Charlene Worrall of Suncoast Retail and with client; follow-up telephone call with E.J. Peterson; prepare and send email to Charlene Worrall re: terms of offer.	0.60

09/24/2019	DRF	Conference with SRBP team re: research issues, cash collateral items (.5); review and revise draft letter re: bank claim investigation (.3)	0.80
09/24/2019	EJP	Work on sales	3.00
09/24/2019	LMF	Review emails regarding new purchaser.	0.30
09/24/2019	BFA	Attend meeting re research and strategy on motion to dismiss in RJPT, Ltd. Supplemental Proceeding; brief conference with EDWARD PETERSON [REDACTED]	0.90
09/24/2019	MBH	Review research memorandum from Paul Battista regarding statute of limitations	0.50
09/24/2019	MBH	Research on [REDACTED]; conference with Scott Stichter regarding covered attorneys' policy claims	0.60
09/24/2019	HER	Drafting of email memo regarding [REDACTED]; electronic correspondence regarding same; review of research materials furnished by Paul Battista.	1.30
09/24/2019	SAS	Conference with Matt Hale regarding covered lawyer insurance policy	0.20
09/24/2019	SHS	SRBP team Conference regarding litigation, open action items, and related research issues	0.60
09/24/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
09/25/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding upcoming asset sales and non-litigation matters.	0.60
09/25/2019	SAS	Review of order denying motion to use cash collateral	0.40
09/25/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding Wednesday's hearing; dictated response	0.20
09/25/2019	CAP	Review several emails on financing of Dr. Bonati purchase by Windsor Capital; send emails.	0.50
09/25/2019	DRF	Research and work on memo on arbitration issues	5.30
09/25/2019	SHS	Begin research on arbitration issue, and office conference with Dan Fogarty regarding the same	1.70
09/25/2019	EJP	Preparation for auction	2.00
09/25/2019	LMF	Review and draft emails regarding new buyer.	0.70
09/25/2019	BFA	Research on [REDACTED] for response to RJPT. LTD Motion to Dismiss	2.30
09/25/2019	HER	Work on issues related to D & O litigation and the FT actions.	0.50
09/26/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding upcoming auction, cash collateral issues; review of order.	0.40
09/26/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Fenstermacher, Kapila, and McCoy regarding status of broker refunds	0.20
09/26/2019	SAS	Review of emails from court, Alpert and Edward Peterson regarding cancellation of next week's hearing	0.20
09/26/2019	CAP	Receipt and review of term sheet emailed by Charlene Worrall of Suncoast Retail as to offer from Brian Pallone; review follow-up emails from client and E.J. Peterson.	0.50
09/26/2019	CAP	Review and exchange early morning emails re: Windsor Capital request; receipt and review of commitment letter from Woodforest Commercial Bank emailed by Beth Cahill; attendance (C.A. Postler) on 9:00 a.m. conference call with Windsor Capital team, Soneet Kapila and E.J. Peterson; follow-up telephone conference (C.A. Postler) with Soneet Kapila and E.J. Peterson; late afternoon telephone call with Beth Cahill.	1.50
09/26/2019	ADH	Review COS for filing.	0.10
09/26/2019	EJP	Calls with Bonati and preparation for auction	4.00
09/26/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding experts and other litigation issues.	0.40
09/26/2019	SHS	Office conference with Dan Fogarty regarding [REDACTED]	0.50
09/27/2019	MBH	Call with Centurion and Texas Capital Bank regarding auction	0.40
09/27/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro Compromise order; exchange of emails with Edward Peterson; and dictated email to Alpert	0.30
09/27/2019	CAP	Review and exchange several emails today on offers from Brian Pallone and Windsor Capital.	0.50
09/27/2019	EJP	Preparation for auction and calls	2.00
09/27/2019	BFA	Conference with Edward Peterson re review of hearing transcript on cash collateral and outline of Mathers arguments; begin review of transcript	1.30
09/30/2019	MBH	Review draft stipulation; work on renewed motion to approve use of cash collateral	1.60
09/30/2019	MBH	Review and edit letter; draft and send email regarding same; receive and review revisions; further revisions	1.70
09/30/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Fenstermacher and McCoy regarding collection issues	0.20

09/30/2019	SAS	Review and revision of response to Mather regarding claims against Bank and objecting to bank's claim; conference with Matt Hale regarding same	0.70
09/30/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Fenstermacher regarding patient receivables collection issues	0.60
09/30/2019	EJP	Work on auction	1.50
09/30/2019	HER	Work on cash collateral and response to Mather letter.	1.80
09/30/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
09/30/2019	SM	Receipt and review CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20

Total Professional Services Rendered \$59,153.00

For Disbursements Incurred:

09/03/2019	Transperfect Translations Intl., Inc.; Hearing transcript LSI vs. Soneet Kapila before Judge Steven Stephens, 7/30/19, Tampa.	\$305.00
09/05/2019	Photocopies of Scottsdale Motion	\$18.90
09/05/2019	Postage Scottsdale M	\$3.90
09/06/2019	Postage M-Medpro Ref	\$3.00
09/23/2019	Photocopies of Cash Collateral Order	\$4.50
09/23/2019	Postage cash collate	\$3.50
09/23/2019	Postage cincy order	\$4.15
09/25/2019	Postage not of auction	\$3.00
09/26/2019	Postage o-settle wit	\$3.00
09/30/2019	Federal Express Corporation; Overnight Courier to Kevin McCoy/Ft. Lauderdale.	\$27.65

Total Expenses Incurred \$376.60

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Harris, Amy Denton	0.10	\$39.50
Ferrell-Anton, Becky	16.30	\$6,112.50
Postler, Charles A.	4.00	\$1,900.00
Fogarty, Dan R.	10.90	\$4,087.50
Peterson, Edward J.	55.70	\$23,672.50
Riedel, Harley E.	21.00	\$10,395.00
Ferris, Laura M	1.00	\$200.00
Hale, Matt B.	17.50	\$4,375.00
Hooi, Michael J.	0.60	\$180.00
Stichter, Scott A.	14.70	\$6,321.00
Sharp, Susan	2.80	\$1,050.00
McKee, Susan	4.10	\$820.00

Total For Professional Services Rendered 148.70 Hours \$59,153.00

Adjusted Services Total \$59,153.00

Professional Services \$59,153.00

Disbursements \$376.60

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200 Tampa, Florida 33602 T 813.229.0144 F 813.229.1811	1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57 Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009 T 239.939.5518 F 239.939.5568	41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111 Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669 T 850.637.1836 F 850.791.6545	4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40 Destin, Florida 32541-9306 T 850.460.7676 F 850.424.6604
---	---	--	---

Total New Charges This Invoice		\$59,529.60
Previous Balance		\$638,578.42
Less Payments Received		(\$0.00)
Outstanding Balance		\$638,578.42
New Charges This Invoice		\$59,529.60
	Total Due	\$698,108.02

Bill # 43720

Date Last Payment July/03/2019
Last Payment Amount \$5,300.82

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

DON M. STICHTER
1929-2019
RICHARD C. PROSSER
1950-2017

B. MICHAEL BACHMAN, JR.
RUSSELL M. BLAIN
JODI DANIEL DUBOSE
BECKY FERRELL-ANTON
DANIEL R. FOGARTY
MATTHEW B. HALE
AMY DENTON HARRIS
BARBARA A. HART

MICHAEL J. HOOI
ELENA PARAS KETCHUM
STEPHEN R. LESLIE
EDWARD J. PETERSON, III
CHARLES A. POSTLER
HARLEY E. RIEDEL, II
MARK F. ROBENS
SUSAN HEATH SHARP
SCOTT A. STICHTER

G. CHRISTOPHER MEYER
OF COUNSEL

REMIT PAYMENT TO TAMPA

March 11, 2020

Soneet Kapila
Kapila-Laser Spine
Kapila & Company
1000 South Federal Highway, Suite 200

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316
USA

INVOICE

Matter: 1
Kapila-Laser Spine
Client: 13857
For Professional Services Rendered:

10/01/2019	MBH	Final review of response letter to K. Mather; send email regarding same	0.20
10/01/2019	MBH	Work throughout the day on drafting of renewed cash collateral motion and procedures; review of pleadings and documents regarding same	4.40
10/01/2019	MBH	Research of law regarding [REDACTED]	1.50
10/01/2019	HER	Review of revised draft response to Ken Mather letter incorporating additional comments; related communications; review of pleadings; communications and review of materials regarding budget; communications regarding auction.	1.00
10/01/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert enclosing draft of MedPro settlement letter; dictated revisions to letter; conference with Edward Peterson; and review of email from Edward Peterson to Kapila enclosing revisions to letter	0.40
10/01/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding pending matters; further review of order on motion to use cash collateral; and conferences with Matt Hale and Edward Peterson	0.50
10/01/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding patient receivables issues	0.20
10/01/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with creditor regarding status of case	0.20
10/01/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding allocation of professional fees	0.20
10/01/2019	SAS	Review of Matt Hale's latest revisions to Mather response letter; dictated response; conference with Edward Peterson; review of email from Matt Hale enclosing Edward Peterson's changes; and conference with Matt Hale	0.60
10/01/2019	EJP	Work on refund claim	0.50
10/01/2019	EJP	Preparation for auction	2.00
10/01/2019	SJ	Emails regarding request for employment records, review documents	0.30

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

10/01/2019	BFA	Research regarding [REDACTED]	4.30
10/01/2019	HER	Review of electronic correspondence with Patrick Moseley.	0.10
10/01/2019	EJP	Work on litigation claims	1.50
10/02/2019	MBH	Review documents and prepare statement for auction; travel to and attend auction	1.80
10/02/2019	MBH	Work throughout the day on drafting of renewed cash collateral motion and revisions to stipulation	4.10
10/02/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding cash collateral.	0.20
10/02/2019	SAS	Review of files and dictated email to Kapila, McCoy and Fenstermacher regarding patient receivable issues; review of email from Fenstermacher; conference with Edward Peterson; and dictated email to Fenstermacher	1.40
10/02/2019	EJP	Time for auction	5.00
10/02/2019	BFA	Continue [REDACTED] research on [REDACTED]	4.50
10/02/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
10/03/2019	MBH	Conference with Dan Fogarty regarding cash collateral issues; work on cash collateral motion	2.00
10/03/2019	MBH	Revisions to letter in response to K. Mather	0.40
10/03/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence and brief conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding auction.	0.40
10/03/2019	HER	Review of revised response letter to Ken Mather; review of pleadings.	0.40
10/03/2019	SAS	Review of email regarding Cigna policy	0.20
10/03/2019	SAS	Conference with firm attorneys regarding pending matters	0.40
10/03/2019	SAS	Review of files; telephone conference with Fenstermacher, Kapila, Edward Peterson (portion), and McCoy regarding patient receivables	0.90
10/03/2019	SAS	Exchange of emails with Khan Whiteside regarding MedPro order; exchange of emails with Alpert regarding uploading the order	0.20
10/03/2019	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding Bart & Nelson's invoice; dictated response	0.10
10/03/2019	DRF	Conference with group re: research projects; conference with M. Hale re: cash collateral motion	0.70
10/03/2019	EJP	Work on auction matters	1.50
10/03/2019	BFA	Meeting with internal litigation team regarding [REDACTED]; follow up research and e mail to Edward Peterson re same on [REDACTED]	4.50
10/03/2019	MBH	Meeting regarding research issues for litigation support	0.40
10/03/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
10/04/2019	MBH	Work on drafting and revisions to cash collateral motion	3.80
10/04/2019	HER	Multiple items of electronic correspondence regarding auction.	0.30
10/04/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Fenstermacher regarding Cigna issues	0.20
10/04/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with creditor regarding status of case	0.20
10/04/2019	SAS	Further review of emails regarding Cigna issues	0.20
10/04/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro issues; dictated response; and exchange of emails with Alpert	0.20
10/04/2019	DRF	Revise and circulate arbitration memo	0.90
10/04/2019	HER	Review of email from Dan Fogarty with draft of the memo on arbitration issues.	0.30
10/07/2019	MBH	Call with Soneet Kapila and team regarding cash collateral; conference with Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel following call regarding same	0.40
10/07/2019	HER	Participation in conference call (10:30 to 10:45 a.m.); conference with Edward Peterson following call.	0.40
10/07/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro issues; dictated response	0.20
10/07/2019	DRF	Revise arbitration memo; conference with S. Stichter re: same	0.40
10/07/2019	EJP	Calls with Soneet Kapila and emails regarding auction; work on renewed cash collateral motion	2.00
10/07/2019	BFA	Research on [REDACTED]	1.30
10/07/2019	SAS	Review of memo from Dan Fogarty discussing [REDACTED]; conference	1.10

		with Dan Fogarty regarding same	
10/07/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
10/07/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.30
10/08/2019	MBH	Receive email from Edward Peterson regarding response letter; draft and send email to Soneet Kapila regarding same; revisions to same	0.70
10/08/2019	MBH	Receive and review emails throughout the morning regarding cash collateral motion and client comments; conference with Scott Stichter regarding same; review and incorporate revisions	2.30
10/08/2019	MBH	Call with Soneet Kapila and team regarding cash collateral and budget issues	0.30
10/08/2019	HER	Review of and revision to draft response to Ken Mather's letter; electronic correspondence regarding same; electronic correspondence regarding cash collateral and lien challenge deadline motion; conference call regarding same.	1.20
10/08/2019	SAS	Work on cash collateral issues, including review and revision of draft of motion; conference with Matt Hale; review of emails from Kapila and McCoy; dictated further revisions; further conference with Matt Hale; and participated in conference call with Kapila, McCoy, Edward Peterson, and Matt Hale	2.30
10/08/2019	SAS	Review of revised draft of Mather response letter; dictated further revisions	0.60
10/08/2019	CAP	Review email from Beth Cahill today re: purchase of remaining LSI assets; follow-up email to E.J. Peterson.	0.20
10/08/2019	EJP	Work on cash collateral motion; calls regarding sales and budget	2.00
10/08/2019	BFA	Continue research for [REDACTED]	2.30
10/08/2019	BFA	Continue research on [REDACTED]	1.90
10/09/2019	MBH	Receive and review Edward Peterson revisions to motion; draft and send email regarding same; call with Soneet Kapila regarding cash collateral motion	0.40
10/09/2019	HER	Substantial work on wind-down and coordination of meeting with TCB, including emails and telephone conferences with client; left message for and email to Toby Gerber regarding same.	2.00
10/09/2019	SAS	Work on fee application	0.60
10/09/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Fenstermacher and Edward Peterson regarding refund issues	0.10
10/09/2019	CAP	Review emails exchanged today by Soneet Kapila and Beth Cahill on sale of remaining LSI assets after auction; follow-up.	0.30
10/09/2019	EJP	Work on general matters	0.50
10/09/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
10/09/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same	0.20
10/10/2019	MBH	Review draft; email Ryan Manns regarding cash collateral motion	0.20
10/10/2019	MBH	Call with Toby Gerber and Soneet Kapila; conference with Edward Peterson regarding cash collateral	0.30
10/10/2019	HER	Telephone contact with Toby Gerber at 2:45 to 3:01 p.m.; follow-up with client and Edward Peterson.	0.50
10/10/2019	HER	Work on response letter to Ken Mather.	0.30
10/10/2019	SAS	Further review of Mather response letter; dictated follow-up email	0.40
10/10/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert regarding MedPro issues; review of draft of waiver; and dictated response	0.30
10/10/2019	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	1.00
10/10/2019	BFA	Review pleadings and update chart on Bailey collection efforts; continue research on [REDACTED]	4.80
10/10/2019	SAS	Review of Edward Peterson's revisions to [REDACTED]	0.30
10/10/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same	0.20
10/11/2019	HER	Further coordination of TCB wind-down meeting, including communications with bank counsel and emails with Soneet Kapila.	0.70
10/11/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Matt Hale regarding cash collateral issues; review of email from Matt Hale	0.10
10/11/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher regarding Cigna issues; dictated response	0.10
10/11/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Susan McKee regarding Albanese issues; telephone conference with Susan McKee regarding claims filed by Albanese in assignment cases	0.20
10/11/2019	DRF	Revise and circulate [REDACTED]	0.30

10/11/2019	SJ	Emails and review SRBP July invoice; emails regarding claim withdrawal, call with Scott Stichter, review file and forwarding of claim information to Scott Stichter	0.50
10/11/2019	BFA	Revising memo on [REDACTED]	0.50
10/11/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate same	0.20
10/14/2019	HER	Further work on wind-down and cash collateral issues, including circulation, revision and sending of email to Toby Gerber with proposal.	2.00
10/14/2019	SAS	Review of memo from Fenstermacher regarding Cigna claims and SunLife stop loss policy; and exchange of emails with McCoy, Kapila, and Fenstermacher; and conference with Harley Riedel	0.70
10/14/2019	SAS	Review of email from attorney general's office enclosing consumer complaint; dictated response	0.30
10/14/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Kapila, McCoy, and Fenstermacher regarding Cigna issues and stop loss insurance	0.50
10/14/2019	EJP	Work on preserving medical records and vacating Tampa.	1.50
10/14/2019	SJ	Receipt of checks served to CT, email to Kevin McCoy regarding same, forwarding of checks to LSI lockbox	0.20
10/14/2019	BFA	Continue drafting memo on [REDACTED]	4.50
10/14/2019	MBH	Receive and review memorandum regarding [REDACTED]	0.20
10/14/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding professional negligence claims; conference with Edward Peterson regarding same	0.30
10/14/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	3.00
10/15/2019	HER	Review of and circulation of email from Toby Gerber; conference with Edward Peterson; review and revision of draft letter to Ken Mather.	0.60
10/15/2019	SAS	Exchange of emails with Battista regarding insurance issues	0.20
10/15/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding pending matters, including Cigna policy, MedPro issues, and open issues with bank	0.30
10/15/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Fenstermacher enclosing revised Cigna memo; dictated revisions; and dictated email to Fenstermacher enclosing revised draft	0.40
10/15/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding [REDACTED]; dictated email to McCoy, Fenstermacher, and Kapila regarding same	0.20
10/15/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Edward Peterson and Harley Riedel enclosing drafts of responses to Bailey Group's request for copies of tolling agreements; dictated response	0.20
10/15/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher regarding follow-up question as to revisions to Cigna memo; dictated response; and response; and review of email from Fenstermacher	0.30
10/15/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Battista regarding insurance issues	0.20
10/15/2019	BMB	Office conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding sale to Centurion, credit to buyer	0.20
10/15/2019	BFA	Continue drafting [REDACTED]; updating Bailey collections chart	4.10
10/15/2019	SAS	Review of email from Becky Ferrell Anton enclosing draft of memo discussing [REDACTED]	0.40
10/15/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	3.00
10/16/2019	MBH	Receive and review email from Soneet Kapila; review attachments; confer with Edward Peterson regarding turnover issues	0.30
10/16/2019	HER	Wind-down and cash collateral issues.	0.30
10/16/2019	DRF	Conference with E. Peterson re: [REDACTED]; revise same	0.30
10/16/2019	EJP	Calls with T. Gerber	0.50
10/16/2019	BFA	Conference with Edward Peterson re [REDACTED]	0.30
10/16/2019	HER	Email to Jennifer Altman.	0.10
10/16/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	2.00
10/17/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Matt Hale and Edward Peterson regarding state court discovery issues	0.20
10/17/2019	SAS	Review of emails from Fenstermacher and McCoy regarding refunds; email from Edward Peterson enclosing documents for call	0.20
10/17/2019	EJP	Preparation for calls with bank and time for same	1.00
10/17/2019	EJP	Work on settlement with Centurion	0.30

10/17/2019	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding settlement, credit	0.20
10/17/2019	BMB	Review of correspondence and bill of sale; review of file in connection with Centurion (Scottsdale) transaction; draft, review and revise draft settlement agreement in connection with same	2.80
10/17/2019	BFA	Additional research on [REDACTED]	5.70
10/17/2019	HER	Work on [REDACTED]	0.40
10/17/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
10/18/2019	SAS	Dictated email to McCoy and Fenstermacher regarding insurance refunds	0.20
10/18/2019	SAS	Dictated email to Kapila and McCoy regarding refund issues	0.20
10/18/2019	EJP	Work on settlement with Centurion	1.50
10/18/2019	EJP	Calls with Bob Rocke	0.50
10/18/2019	BMB	Conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding Centurion settlement; review and revise draft settlement agreement (Scottsdale)	0.90
10/18/2019	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
10/20/2019	HER	Communications regarding 10/21 meeting with TCB.	0.20
10/20/2019	BFA	Continue research on [REDACTED]	2.60
10/21/2019	MBH	Email to Susan McKee regarding med mal plaintiff claim	0.10
10/21/2019	HER	Attendance at meetings with client and bank representatives ((9:20 a.m. to 2:20 p.m.).	5.00
10/21/2019	HER	Electronic correspondence regarding James Pomeroy.	0.10
10/21/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding cash collateral issues	0.30
10/21/2019	CAP	Review emails.	0.30
10/21/2019	EJP	Preparation for and time for meeting with Bank; emails regarding Tampa auction	5.00
10/21/2019	BMB	Review of file and correspondence related to settlement; revisions to same	0.40
10/21/2019	BFA	Continue work on [REDACTED]; begin revising memo on same	5.70
10/21/2019	SAS	Review of memo from Rock and Sbar regarding meeting with Pillsbury	0.50
10/22/2019	MBH	Conference with Edward Peterson regarding wind-down process and cash collateral	0.20
10/22/2019	HER	Review of email and notes received from Chris Pizzo following up on bank meeting yesterday; follow-up.	0.50
10/22/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert enclosing draft of withdrawal of Albanese claim and inquiring as to status of bank's approval of settlement letter; dictated response	0.20
10/22/2019	SAS	Review of email from Kapila enclosing executed Albanese settlement; and dictated email to Alpert enclosing executed settlement agreement	0.20
10/22/2019	SAS	Conference with Edward Peterson and Matt Hale regarding pending matters	0.30
10/22/2019	SAS	Review of emails regarding cash collateral issues	0.20
10/22/2019	SAS	Review of email from Edward Peterson regarding excess insurance issues	0.10
10/22/2019	SAS	Review of files regarding last draft of Albanese settlement agreement; dictated email to Kapila enclosing settlement agreement to be executed	0.30
10/22/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher enclosing final draft of Cigna memo	0.20
10/22/2019	SAS	Review of email from Fenstermacher enclosing Cigna non-disclosure agreement; dictated response; brief review of agreement; and exchange of emails with Fenstermacher	0.40
10/22/2019	EJP	Emails regarding fee allocation and auction; calls regarding medical records	1.00
10/22/2019	BFA	Continue revising [REDACTED]	3.70
10/22/2019	HER	Preparation for and participation in 2:00 p.m. call with Jennifer Altman, Soneet Kapila, Hugh Ray, III, Ken Mather, Kevin McCoy and Edward Peterson.	1.20
10/22/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
10/23/2019	SAS	Work on fee application	0.60
10/23/2019	SAS	Review of email from Alpert enclosing MedPro refund check; review of emails from Edward Peterson and Kapila regarding handling of check	0.30
10/23/2019	SAS	Telephone conference with Alpert regarding revisions to Albanese settlement agreement	0.20
10/23/2019	SAS	Review of email regarding cash collateral issues	0.10
10/23/2019	SAS	Review of email from Longbrake regarding Dr. Brocha's claims against LSI	0.20

10/23/2019	SAS	Review of emails from McCoy, Cole, and Longbrake regarding status of state court litigation; review of email from Radha Bachman regarding medical record request	0.30
10/23/2019	SAS	Review of email from McCoy regarding basis for large patient receivables; exchange of emails with McCoy; and telephone conference with McCoy regarding same	0.40
10/23/2019	BMB	Review of correspondence; review and revise release agreement	1.50
10/23/2019	BMB	Review and revise draft release agreement; discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding same	0.90
10/23/2019	SJ	Emails regarding records request, review same and forwarding to Kevin McCoy	0.20
10/23/2019	HER	Review of email from Jennifer Altman and review of attached draft of proposed retention agreement; email to Soneet Kapila regarding same.	0.30
10/23/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.00
10/23/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
10/24/2019	HER	Review of email from Kevin McCoy with attached professional fee allocation analysis, budget, and summary of overlap expenses.	0.80
10/24/2019	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson; review and revise draft settlement and release agreement; follow up with Edward J. Peterson	0.90
10/24/2019	SJ	Emails regarding creditor demand letter and review of file	0.20
10/24/2019	SAS	Review of email regarding state court litigation	0.20
10/24/2019	BFA	Work on [REDACTED]	1.30
10/24/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
10/24/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process, circulate same	0.20
10/25/2019	HER	Participation in 11:30 a.m. conference call with Kevin McCoy and Edward Peterson regarding budget and allocation analysis; review of and reply to email from Mr. McCoy with attached revised summary of overlap expenses.	0.80
10/25/2019	EJP	Work on issues with landlord and work on allocations	1.00
10/25/2019	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding release; review and revise form of draft agreement; follow up with Edward J. Peterson; revisions to agreement	1.20
10/25/2019	BFA	Work on [REDACTED]	4.30
10/25/2019	HER	Work on Jennifer Altman engagement letter.	0.60
10/25/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	0.50
10/25/2019	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate same	0.30
10/27/2019	HER	Numerous items of electronic correspondence regarding revised summary of overlap expenses, budget and cash collateral.	0.70
10/28/2019	HER	Communications with client and Edward Peterson regarding allocations and budget.	0.40
10/28/2019	SAS	Dictated draft of response to Longbrake's letter; dictated email to Kapila enclosing draft of response	0.50
10/28/2019	EJP	Work on cash collateral issues	1.00
10/28/2019	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding Tampa lease obligations; review of Tampa lease; draft email to Edward J. Peterson summarizing relevant lease provisions; follow up regarding same	1.90
10/28/2019	SJ	Receipt and review of CT Service of Process and circulate	0.20
10/28/2019	BFA	Finalizing research memorandum to Edward Peterson on [REDACTED]	2.50
10/28/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50
10/29/2019	SAS	Review of email from Kapila approving Longbrake response; finalized response for mailing	0.20
10/29/2019	EJP	Work on issues with Tampa landlord	0.50
10/29/2019	BMB	Review of correspondence related to lease issues; review of lease in connection with same	0.80
10/29/2019	HER	Communications with Jennifer Altman and Soneet Kapila; work on engagement.	0.80
10/30/2019	EJP	Calls with S. Lieb	0.50
10/30/2019	HER	Review email from Soneet Kapila regarding H & K.	0.20
10/30/2019	SJ	Receipt of CT Service of Process, download and circulate	0.20
10/31/2019	EJP	Work on issues with Highwoods	1.00
10/31/2019	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding settlement with Centurion, next steps; email	0.50

		correspondence regarding same	
10/31/2019	BMB	Discussions with Edward J. Peterson regarding Tampa lease issues and next steps; email correspondence regarding same	0.40
10/31/2019	BMB	Email correspondence regarding form of settlement agreement; conference with Edward J. Peterson regarding same; review of order granting assignee's motion for authority to compromise accounts receivables with the consent of Texas Capital Bank as administrative agent and additional pleadings; follow up with Edward J. Peterson; revise settlement agreement; follow up with Edward J. Peterson	2.30
10/31/2019	HER	Email to Jennifer Altman, Hugh Ray, Soneet Kapila, and Edward Peterson enclosing draft retention letter re H&K; review email from Soneet Kapila with changes to engagement letter and incorporation of changes into letter and reply email regarding same; further emails with Ms. Altman.	1.00
10/31/2019	HER	Coordination of settlement conference with defendants represented by Dennis Waggoner.	0.30
10/31/2019	EJP	Work on litigation matters	1.50

Total Professional Services Rendered \$78,481.50

For Disbursements Incurred:

10/03/2019	Photocopies of Medpro Refund and Scottsdale Sal	\$3.60
10/03/2019	Postage 10-3 orders	\$6.00
10/22/2019	Public Access to Court Electronic Records for September, 2019.	\$6.20
10/29/2019	TransPerfect Translations Intl., Inc.....Auction taken, 10/2/2019.	\$170.00

Total Expenses Incurred \$185.80

Recapitulation

Name	Hours	Amount
Ferrell-Anton, Becky	58.80	\$22,050.00
Bachman, Michael	14.90	\$5,587.50
Postler, Charles A.	0.80	\$380.00
Fogarty, Dan R.	2.60	\$975.00
Peterson, Edward J.	49.30	\$20,952.50
Riedel, Harley E.	24.10	\$11,929.50
Hale, Matt B.	24.00	\$6,000.00
Stichter, Scott A.	22.90	\$9,847.00
Jeffcoat, Susan	3.80	\$760.00

Total For Professional Services Rendered 201.20 Hours \$78,481.50

Adjusted Services Total \$78,481.50

Professional Services \$78,481.50

Disbursements \$185.80

Total New Charges This Invoice \$78,667.30

Previous Balance \$698,108.02

110 East Madison Street-Suite 200
Tampa, Florida 33602
T 813.229.0144
F 813.229.1811

1342 Colonial Boulevard-Suite H57
Fort Myers, Florida 33907-1009
T 239.939.5518
F 239.939.5568

41 North Jefferson Street-Suite 111
Pensacola, Florida 32502-5669
T 850.637.1836
F 850.791.6545

4475 Legendary Drive-Suite 40
Destin, Florida 32541-9306
T 850.460.7676
F 850.424.6604

Less Payments Received	(\$0.00)
Outstanding Balance	\$698,108.02
New Charges This Invoice	\$78,667.30
Total Due	\$776,775.32

Bill # 44158

Date Last Payment July/03/2019
Last Payment Amount \$5,300.82

Please reference our Bill #: and Matter #: upon remittance - Thank You